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A B S T R A C T 

 

he bloom of genomic data has revealed a vast amount of gene losses across all life 

kingdoms. However, the impact of gene loss on the evolution of the mechanisms of 

embryo development remains an important challenge. In this work, we have used the 

successful gene loser Oikopleura dioica, to study the impact of gene loss on the evolution 

of the cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network (GRN), and we have extrapolated our 

results to decipher the ancestral condition of tunicates as free-living or sessile, a hot topic 

of discussion. 

To address this question, we have searched for gene losses by combining best reciprocal 

blast hit (BRBH) with exhaustive phylogenetic reconstructions of the gene family of interest. 

We have also performed expression analyses of the present orthologs to test for their 

cardiac function as well as, in the case of lost orthologs, with paralogs trying to detect 

potential events of function shuffling. Finally, we performed functional analyses by inhibiting 

the FGF and BMP signaling pathways and started the implementation of a microinjection 

facility for future functional analyses by gene targeting. 

Our results show a clear deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN with the loss of many 

genes (Mesp, Ets1/2a, Gata4/5/6, Mek1/2, Tbx1/10, and RA- and FGF-signaling related 

genes) and cardiac subfunctions (FoxF, Islet, Ebf, Mrf, Dach, and Bmp signaling) crucial for 

cardiopharyngeal development in ascidians and vertebrates. All these losses have led to 

the dismantling of two genetic modules related to the maintenance of multipotency in the 

cardiopharyngeal precursors. This has been accompanied by the loss of the second heart 

field and pharyngeal muscles in appendicularians, which has been phenotypically translated 

into an open bilaminar heart with an accelerated development compared to the tubular 

heart present in the rest of chordates. The deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN in 

appendicularians can therefore be interpreted as an evolutionary adaptation to the transition 

from a sessile to a free-living lifestyle based on the innovation of the filter-feeding house. 

Therefore, our results show O. dioica as a paradigmatic example of the advantages of using 

species that along their evolution has lost many genes (evolutionary knockout models, eKO) 

to better understand the evolution of GRNs, mechanisms of embryo development, or any 

physiological adaptation in the absence of any given gene of interest
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I N T R O D U C T I O N 

 

1 EVODEVO  

ne of the main challenges in biology 

is to decipher the evolutionary 

mechanisms that have favored the 

emergence of such vast range of living 

organisms. The answer to this matter 

brings together many different fields of 

biology as paleontology, comparative 

anatomy, comparative embryology, 

development and evolution. The last two 

areas, development and evolution, have 

gone together since 1866 when Ernst 

Haeckel put forth the theory of 

recapitulation inspired by the publication of 

The Origin of Species by Darwin (1859) and 

the idea, exposed by Karl Ernst Von Baer, 

that embryos look much more similar than 

adults. This theory, stating that ontogeny 

recapitulates phylogeny, has helped to 

phylogenetically reclassify many metazoan 

groups just by studying their embryo 

development. For example, tunicates were 

moved from the Phylum Mollusca to the 

Phylum Chordata after Kowalevsky 

discovered the presence of the notochord 

in the ascidian larvae (Kowalevsky A., 

1866). During the 20th century, the 

connection between development and 

evolution became even stronger, and both 

fields were finally combined on a new area 

of biology known as EvoDevo. The 

EvoDevo studies how evolution has 

affected the developmental mechanisms to 

produce the diversification of the species. 

Among those evolutionary changes, gene 

duplication has traditionally been 

considered one of the main mechanisms 

governing evolution (Force et al., 1999; 

Ohno, 1970). However, the recent 

discovery of a significant amount of gene 

losses among all life kingdoms is revealing 

gene loss as a major mechanism 

generating genetic diversity, and therefore, 

with a great potential to generate 

phenotypic diversity (Albalat and Cañestro, 

2016; Fernández and Gabaldón, 2020; 

Guijarro-Clarke et al., 2020; Miller et al., 

2005; Simakov et al., 2013). 

1.1 THE PARADOX OF EVODEVO 

During the last decades of the 20th century, 

the discovery that homologs of Drosophila 

developmental genes were present and 

had the same function in evolutionarily 

distant species revealed what can be 

considered one of the first paradox of 

EvoDevo (Jacob, 1977; Lewis, 1978; 

Nüsslein-volhard and Wieschaus, 1980). 

This paradox brought to attention that 

phylogenetically distant organisms, despite 

showing different characteristics 

(phenotypic diversity), shared similar 

O 
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genetic developmental toolkits (genotypic 

unit) (Jacob, 1977; King and Wilson, 1975). 

For instance, the transcription factor 

eyeless in Drosophila and its Pax-6 

homolog in the mouse is essential in both 

organisms for eye development (Quiring et 

al., 1994), and their function is so 

conserved that expression of the mouse 

Pax-6 in atypical organs of Drosophila 

causes the appearance of ectopic eyes 

(Halder et al., 1995). The conservation of 

the Hox cluster to organize the anterior-

posterior body axis across bilaterians 

(Garcia-Fernàndez, 2005) and the 

presence of homologs of the 

tinman/Nkx2.5 transcription factor in all 

developing hearts (Evans et al., 1995; Lints 

et al., 1993; Tonissen et al., 1994) are other 

examples corroborating that phenotypically 

different organisms share very similar 

“toolkits” of developmental genes.  

If distant species use the same genetic 

toolkits, one of the main questions in 

EvoDevo has been to discover how the 

phenotypical variability between species 

has evolved. Numerous investigations have 

established that these differences between 

species result from minor changes in 

genetic toolkits that accumulate through 

evolution. Therefore, although, in general, 

genetic toolkits are conserved, they suffer 

mutations in coding and regulatory regions, 

gene duplications, and gene losses that, 

ultimately, cause phenotypic alterations. 

For example, mutations in the coding 

sequence of developmental genes can 

change the function of the protein and 

transform an activator into a repressor. This 

happened with the Ultrabithorax gene 

during arthropod evolution. A mutation in 

the coding region of this abdominal gene in 

some crustacean/insect ancestor 

uncovered a limb-repression function that 

culminated with the origin of the hexapods 

(Galant and Carroll, 2002; Ronshaugen et 

al., 2002). However, alterations in 

regulatory regions of a gene, or different 

enhancers, usually have a more substantial 

effect on animal diversification due to their 

ability to evolve independently. Mutations in 

enhancers, moreover, can produce a wider 

variety of phenotypes, such as changes in 

transcription levels or temporal or spatial 

alterations (Fig. I1 A-D). Therefore, changes 

in gene regulatory elements are postulated 

to contribute more to morphological 

evolution than changes in coding regions 

(Carroll, 1995). 

Gene duplication also plays a fundamental 

role in the generation of genetic diversity. 

Ever since in 1970 Susumo Ohno 

published “Evolution by gene duplication,” 

numerous studies have supported gene 

duplication as one of the main driving 

forces of evolution (Lynch, 2002; Pastor-

Satorras et al., 2003; Teichmann and Babu, 

2004). The classical model for the evolution 

of duplicate genes predicts that sometimes 

rare beneficial mutations provide a novel 

function to one of the duplicates 
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(neofunctionalization) while the second 

copy maintains the original function (Ohno, 

1970) (Fig. I1 E). However, as beneficial 

mutations are unusual, this model is unable 

to explain the abundant preservation of 

gene duplicates across evolution. To 

address this problem, Force et al. (1999) 

proposed the duplication-degeneration-

complementation (DDC) model. This model 

states that degenerative mutations in 

regulatory regions, much more likely than 

beneficial mutations, can partition the 

ancestral gene function by forcing the 

maintenance of both duplicates 

(subfunctionalization) (Fig. I1 F). Although 

neo and subfunctionalization are possible, 

the most common fate for a duplicate copy 

is the fixation of a loss-of-function mutation 

and its subsequent loss 

(nonfunctionalization) (Fig. I1 G). However, 

loss-of-function mutations are not exclusive 

of duplicated genes, but also, they can 

affect any gene on the genome. In fact, 

during the last years, the increasing 

availability of genome data has elucidated 

that gene losses are pervasive in all life 

kingdoms and that, in many groups of 

organisms, their incidence is over the 

amount of novelty (Albalat and Cañestro, 

2016; Guijarro-Clarke et al., 2020). 

Therefore, despite the vast amount of gene 

losses have rested hidden on unsequenced 

genomes, they have recently arisen as one 

of the main evolutionary forces that can 

generate genetic diversity. 

Fig. I1. Alterations in coding and regulatory 
sequences generate diversity. The yellow (y) 
gene in drosophila produces black pigment in 
different body parts. Various yellow enhancers 
control y expression in different body parts like the 
abdominal stripes, the posterior abdominal 
segments, or the wings (A). A mutation in the y 
coding region prevents y expression in all three 
body parts, wings, posterior abdomen, and 
abdomen strips (B). Mutations in different 
enhancers produce the absence of pigmentation 
in wings (C) or posterior abdomen (D). When a 
gene duplicates, one of the copies can change its 
fate. In non-functionalization, one of the copied 
genes accumulates mutations in coding and 
regulatory sequences, resulting in the loss of the 
gene (E). In sub-functionalization, mutations in the 
enhancers segregate the ancestral function 
between both genes (F). In neo-functionalization, 
one copy acquires new tasks by the gain of new 
regulatory elements (G). Asterisks represent 
mutations. Regulatory and coding regions in grey 
represent sequences that have lost their function. 
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1.2 GENE LOSS, BREAKING ASSUMPTIONS 

During the 20th century, the pre-Darwinian 

concept of scala naturae, in which a series  

of organisms progresses from simple to 

complex, still had defenders. Although 

Darwin had already recognized that 

“becoming more complex did not 

necessarily mean progress and that 

simplification was a common state of 

affairs” (Darwin, 1876 p.176), the 

complexification idea used to hide in the 

background of many evolutionary 

hypotheses. This complexification idea was 

assumed to correlate with an increase in 

gene number, which presupposed that 

eukaryotes contained more genes than 

bacteria, animals more genes than plants, 

and vertebrates more genes than 

invertebrates (reviewed in Szathmáry et al., 

2001). This perspective lost its credence 

after the sequencing of the genome of 

various cnidarian species. Cnidarian 

genomes uncovered that the ancestral 

eumetazoan genome was much more 

complex than initially expected and 

included many genes previously 

considered to be vertebrate innovations. 

The result was the revelation that gene 

losses do not seem to be occasional or 

insignificant, but a process that has widely 

occurred across all animal phyla (Kortschak 

et al., 2003; Putnam et al., 2007; Suga et 

al., 2013; Technau et al., n.d.). 

Although mutations that cause gene losses 

are random events, the patterns of gene 

loss do not appear to be stochastic but 

show obvious biases depending on the 

genomic position, or the gene function 

(Albalat and Cañestro, 2016; Holland et al., 

2017) Regarding genomic position, after 

whole-genome duplications, there is an 

asymmetric distribution of gene loss 

between ohnologons (e.g. chromosomic 

regions originated after genome 

duplication). However, the forces that 

influence these losses remain unknown 

(Albalat and Cañestro, 2016; Makino and 

McLysaght, 2012). Concerning gene 

function, there exist significant differences 

in gene retention between different groups 

of organisms according to Gene Ontology 

categories. For example, categories such 

as “protein modification,” “protein 

metabolism,” and “catabolism” are more 

prone to be lost in fish than in vertebrates, 

whereas genes involved in “catalytic 

activity” show the opposite trend (Blomme 

et al., 2006; Koonin et al., 2004). 

A particular and exciting case of functional 

bias is the co-elimination of functionally 

connected genes that, progressively, 

dismantle a pathway after the relaxation of 

environmental constraints (Fig. I2). 

Numerous examples of gene losses due to 

co-elimination have been discovered in 



 5 

different organisms, such as spliceosome 

components in yeast (Aravind et al., 2000), 

the ubiquitin-proteasome-signalosome 

system in nematodes (Koonin et al., 2004), 

or proteins related to the metabolism and 

signaling of retinoic acid (RA) in Oikopleura 

dioica (Martí-Solans et al., 2016). In this last 

example, the co-elimination affected a 

broad array of enzymes related to the 

synthesis, degradation, and signaling of 

this metabolic pathway making the 

development of this chordate independent 

of this morphogen (Martí-Solans et al., 

2016). 

1.3 EVOLUTION BY GENE LOSS 

One of the most surprising findings of the 

post-genomic era has been to what extent 

organisms can tolerate the inactivation of a 

significant number of genes (Papp et al., 

2011). Large single-gene deletion screens 

on multiple organisms have demonstrated 

that from 65 to 90% of their protein-coding 

genes can be lost without altering the 

organism viability under laboratory 

conditions (Baba et al., 2006; Dietzl et al., 

2007; Giaever et al., 2002; Kamath et al., 

2003; Kim et al., 2010; Korona, 2011). This 

fact, referred to as the knockout paradox 

(Papp et al., 2011), may indicate that the 

organisms have high mutational robustness 

with alternative genes supplying the lost 

ones, but also that under some 

environmental conditions, many genes 

become dispensable and prone to be lost 

(Albalat and Cañestro, 2016). When a gene 

becomes dispensable, it can be lost 

without affecting the fitness of the organism 

and favoring a scenario of regressive 

evolution (neutral loss), or it can be 

adaptatively lost as a frequent evolutionary 

response to environmental change 

(adaptative loss) (Fig. I3). 

 ADAPTATIVE GENE LOSSES: THE 
LESS-IS-MORE HYPOTHESIS 
The less-is-more hypothesis proposes that 

gene loss can be a significant evolutionary 

adaptive strategy with great potential to 

rapidly occur after, for example, drastic 

shifts of environmental conditions (Olson 

and Varki, 2003; Olson, 1999). There exist 

reports of adaptative non-functional 

mutations in a vast range of organisms, 

from bacteria to vertebrates, including 

some paradigmatic cases in humans. For 

example, the loss-of-function mutation of 

DUFFY makes the carrier resistant to vivax 

malaria, which has become this allele 

variant predominant in sub-Saharan African 

populations as a result of natural selection 

(Howes et al., 2011). The loss-of-function 

mutation of the CCR5 membrane receptor, 

which confers resistance to HIV, also 

Fig. I2. Co-elimination of a gene pathway. The 
loss of the central gene of a pathway made the 
related genes to become useless and 
subsequently lost. 
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shows a wide distribution, but in this case, 

across the European population. However, 

as HIV is a new disease, other viral 

infections could be the reason for its actual 

high frequency in Europe (Novembre et al., 

2005). 

 NEUTRAL GENE LOSSES: 
REGRESSIVE EVOLUTION 
Classically, gene losses have been studied 

in a scenario of regressive evolution in 

which losses of useless characteristics 

happen over time. There are several 

examples of regressive evolution such as 

the loss of genes related to vitamin C 

biosynthesis in different vertebrate lineages 

that have adopted vitamin C rich diet 

(Drouin et al., 2011), or the absence of 

genes related to vision in the Mexican 

cavefish after colonization of dark 

environments (Jeffery, 2009). Those gene 

losses related to regressive evolution have 

been usually considered evolutionary 

neutral and driven by genetic drift since the 

loss of the dispensable characteristic does 

not offer a biological advantage. However, 

recent studies are questioning the neutrality 

of some regressive evolution examples. 

Back to the Mexican cavefish, for instance, 

recent analyses have suggested that the 

loss of vision could be adaptative because 

it reduces the amount of energy spent on 

the development and maintenance of 

expensive neural tissue. That decrease in 

energy waste could represent a selected 

advantage in the poor nutrient 

Fig. I3. Conceptual framework for gene loss. The probability of the fixation of a gene loss depends on 
how its non-functionalization affects the fitness of the organism. Mutational robustness, alternative 
pathways, or genes that become useless after an environmental change, are highly dispensable (cross out 
figures) and might be lost, without affecting the fitness of the organism as a case of regressive evolution 
(e. g. the loss of the eyes and pigmentation on the Mexican cavefish that lives in dark caves without light). 
These neutral non-functional mutations are fixed by genomic drift. The less-is-more hypothesis states that 
the loss of a gene after an environmental change can improve the fitness of the organism, making this loss 
adaptive and evolutionarily selected (e. g. the loss of the flavonoid 3’hydroxylase on Ipomoea quamonlit 
derived on a change of the color of the flower as an adaptation to bird pollination (Zufall and Rausher, 
2004). The potential of a gene to be lost, apart from its dispensability, is also influenced by its position on 
the genome or its function (genomic bias). 
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environments where it lives (Moran et al., 

2015). 

1.4 GENE LOSSES ACROSS THE TREE OF 
LIFE 

Gene losses affect all life kingdoms and 

might have had a great impact on most of 

them. For example, in some archaea and 

prokaryote species, gene loss has a three-

times higher rate than gene gains 

(Koskiniemi et al., 2012; Nelson-Sathi et al., 

2015; Puigbò et al., 2014), and in the case 

of plants and fungi, gene loss has been 

more frequent after whole-genome 

duplication events. The evolution of 

protostomes has experienced an extensive 

process of gene loss with the removal of 

17% of the ancestral eumetazoan gene 

families (Albalat and Cañestro, 2016; 

Guijarro-Clarke et al., 2020). In 

deuterostomes, gene loss may have played 

a fundamental role in the evolution of the 

different body plans (Albalat and Cañestro, 

2016; De Robertis, 2008), although it has 

had a lower general impact, except for 

tunicates (a.k.a. urochordates). Tunicates 

are a subphylum of the chordates, our 

phylum, whose genomes appear to have a 

“liberal” evolutionary pattern of gene loss 

(Dehal et al., 2002; Holland and Gibson-

Brown, 2003; Hughes and Friedman, 2005; 

Somorjai et al., 2018), which contrasts with 

the “conservative” pattern of 

cephalochordates and vertebrates 

(Somorjai et al., 2018). 
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2 OIKOPLEURA DIOICA, AN 
ANIMAL MODEL TO STUDY 
THE IMPACT OF GENE LOSS 
ON THE EVOLUTION OF 
MECHANISMS OF 
DEVELOPMENT IN 
CHORDATES 

unicates are cosmopolitan marine filter 

feeders distributed around many 

marine habitats that have undergone rapid 

evolution and speciation together with 

numerous gene losses (Holland, 2016).  

Tunicates have been classically divided into 

three classes (Fig. I4): Appendicularia 

(a.k.a. Larvacea), Ascidiacea, and 

Thaliacea. Appendicularians are free-living 

planktonic organisms that maintain the 

larval morphology and the chordate 

synapomorphies throughout the entire life 

cycle, and comprise 70 species distributed 

in three families (Oikopleuridae, Fritillariidae, 

and Kowalevskiidae) (Christen and 

Braconnot, 1998). The Ascidians 

(commonly known as sea squirts) have 

free-living larvae with a typical chordate 

body plan, but in contrast to 

appendicularians, at the end of the juvenile 

phase suffer a drastic metamorphosis that 

transforms them into sessile adults 

attached to a substrate and loose most of 

the chordate synapomorphies (i.e. postanal 

tail, notochord, dorsal nerve cord, 

endostyle, and gill slits). Ascidians have 

gone success radiation and they account 

for more than 3000 species. The Thaliacea 

class is composed of approximately 100 

species with a free-living planktonic 

lifestyle. Recent phylogenomic analyses 

classify Thaliacea within ascidians as the 

sister group of Phlebobranchia, which 

transforms Ascidiacea into a paraphyletic 

group (Delsuc et al., 2018). The discovery 

that tunicates are the sister group of 

vertebrates, and therefore that the 

cephalochordate branching is basal within 

chordates (Bourlat et al., 2006; Delsuc et 

al., 2006), has provided a novel view of the 

last common ancestor of chordates as a 

free-living organism similar to 

cephalochordates or appendicularians (Fig. 

I4). This idea contrast with the traditional 

view proposed by Garstang (1928) in which 

the chordate ancestor had a sessile 

ascidian-like adult lifestyle (Garstang, 

1928). According to this novel scenario, 

free-living appendicularians might 

represent the ancestral condition of 

tunicates (Berrill, 1950; Braun et al., 2020; 

Swalla et al., 2000). However, theories 

supporting an ascidian sessile tunicate 

ancestor have also been proposed (Stach, 

2007; Stach et al., 2008; Stach and 

Turbeville, 2002). Therefore, whether the 

lifestyle of the last common ancestor of 

tunicates was sessile like in ascidians or 

free-living as in appendicularians remains 

unsolved (Fig. I4). 

Despite tunicates, in general, are 

characterized by their “liberal” pattern of 

genome evolution, appendicularians, as 

T 
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revealed by the sequencing of O. dioica, 

has likely undergone the most drastic 

alteration of genome-organization features 

accompanied by genome compaction and 

prevalent gene losses (Denoeud et al., 

2010). These characteristics have 

prompted us to develop O. dioica as a 

model in the field of EvoDevo to decipher 

the mechanisms that lead to gene loss, as 

well as, the impact of gene losses on the 

evolution of mechanisms of embryo 

development in chordates and their impact 

on the divergence of phyla. Moreover, O. 

dioica has a simple and accessible 

morphology, a short generation time and 

life span, affordable culture in the 

laboratory, and amenable experimental 

manipulation (Albalat and Cañestro, 2016; 

Ferrández-Roldán et al., 2019). 

2.1 O. DIOICA HAS A COMPACT GENOME 
ACCOMPANIED BY MASSIVE GENE LOSSES 

 GENOME COMPACTION AND 
MALLEABILITY IN O. DIOICA 
With only 70 Mb, the genome of O. dioica 

is the smallest chordate genome and one 

of the smallest genomes in chordates 

(Danks et al., 2013; Denoeud et al., 2010; 

Seo et al., 2001). The small size of the 

genome of O. dioica is the result of a vast 

compaction process (Berna and Alvarez-

Valin, 2014; Chavali et al., 2011; Denoeud 

Fig. I4. Phylogenetic relationship between different members of the chordate phylum. 
Appendicularians, ascidians, and Thaliacea group inside the Tunicata subphylum, which is the sister group 
of vertebrates. Therefore, cefalochordates branching is basal inside the chordate phylum. The fact that 
ascidians are sessile and appendicularians are free-living cast doubt on how was the ancestor of tunicates. 
Tunicates have suffered massive gene losses with the loss of 15% of ancestral gene families. Ascidians 
have lost an additional 12%, while appendicularians have lost an additional 20% becoming the chordate 
group in which gene loss has had the most significant impact. 
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et al., 2010). One of the reasons for this 

compaction is the reduction of the 

intergenic and intron regions. Concerning 

the intergenic regions, 53% of these 

sequences are smaller than 1 kb, and 27% 

of the genes lack intergenic regions as they 

enclose in 1800 polycistronic transcription 

units or operons (Denoeud et al., 2010). In 

the case of the introns, 62% of the intronic 

regions are smaller than 50 nucleotides, 

and only 2.4% are larger than 1 kb 

(Denoeud et al., 2010; Seo et al., 2001). 

Transposable elements or transposons 

have also decreased their quantity and 

diversity (Cañestro and Albalat, 2012; 

Chalopin et al., 2015; Denoeud et al., 2010; 

Volff et al., 2004) contributing, together with 

the intragenic and intron reduction, to the 

compaction of O. dioica genome. 

Besides being highly compacted, the 

genome of O. dioica is an extreme case of 

animal genome malleability, with negligible 

synteny to other animal genomes and the 

disintegration of the Hox cluster, generally 

conserved in all bilaterians (Fig. I5) 

(Cañestro et al., 2007; Denoeud et al., 

2010; Seo et al., 2004). All these 

chromosomal rearrangements and 

genomic compaction may be the 

consequence of the high evolutionary rate 

of this species, which is supported by a 

high population mutation rate and a 

reduced purifying selection (Denoeud et al., 

2010; Edvardsen et al., 2005). 

 GENE LOSSES IN O. DIOICA 
Among tunicates, O. dioica appears to 

have pushed gene losses to its limits. This 

species has lost many genes related to 

genetic structure and expression, cellular 

and physiological functions, and embryonic 

development (Ferrández-Roldán et al., 

2019; Ferrier, 2011). 

Regarding the losses associated with 

cellular and physiological functions, 

Denoeud et al., 2010 identified the lack of 

the non-homologous end joining repair 

system that is in charge of fixing double-

strand breaks of the DNA in all eukaryotes. 

The epigenetic machinery has also 

Cephalochordates

Vertebrates

Ascidians

Appendicularians

Fig. I5. Evolution of the Hox cluster in 
chordates. Cephalochordates contain a copy of 
14 Hox genes grouped in a unique cluster. In 
vertebrates, the Hox cluster was multiplied and 
some paralogs were lost in some clusters. The Hox 
cluster in tunicates has been dramatically 
degenerated and ultimately disappeared in 
appendicularians, which besides, have lost all the 
central Hox genes. 
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encountered the effects of gene loss and 

lacks histone acetyltransferases, many 

core components of the canonical 

Polycomb complexes, genes for several 

proteins of the trithorax group, and some 

methyltransferases (Albalat et al., 2012; 

Cañestro et al., 2007; Navratilova et al., 

2017). Finally, the minor spliceosome, in 

charge of removing introns with 

noncanonical AT-AC boundaries across 

most eukaryotic lineages, is missing in O. 

dioica (Denoeud et al., 2010). Overall, these 

losses might have contributed to increasing 

the malleability of the O. dioica genome by 

accumulating rearrangements and 

changing the genome architecture. 

Many losses of genes related to cellular and 

physiological functions have also been 

reported in O. dioica. For example, its 

immune system has suffered and extreme 

simplification. It has lost almost all genes 

with domains corresponding to typical 

immune receptors or effectors and lacks 

interleukins and cytokines involved in the 

immunity response in other chordates 

(Denoeud et al., 2010). Caspases have a 

crucial role in the maturation of immune 

system proteins as well as in apoptosis. 

The caspase family has also experienced a 

significant reduction with the presence of 

only three members compared to more 

than ten present in other chordates (Weill et 

al., 2005). Not only the immune machinery 

for the elimination of invaders has suffered 

from gene losses, but also the machinery 

for removing toxic compounds. 

Cytochrome P450 genes, which participate 

in the elimination of xenobiotics (Goldstone 

et al., 2006), show the smallest repertoire 

among sequenced metazoan genomes in 

O. dioica (Yadetie et al., 2012). Moreover, 

O. dioica is so far the only aerobic non-

parasitic organism without peroxisomes, 

organelles in charge of the elimination of 

toxic compounds produced in the cells 

(Žárský and Tachezy, 2015). The loss of the 

machinery to remove invaders or toxic 

substances has accompanied the loss of 

proteins in charge of intracellular traffic 

amongst organelles. Thereby, O. dioica has 

lost 50% of the Rab toolkit, being the 

metazoan species with the smallest 

number of Rab subfamilies described to 

date (Coppola et al., 2019). 

Gene losses have also affected essential 

pathways for chordate embryonic 

development in O. dioica. Homeobox and 

Sox families, encoding transcription factors 

related to development, have lost many of 

their families (Edvardsen et al., 2005; 

Heenan et al., 2016; Torres-Águila et al., 

2018). Noteworthy, O. dioica has lost Hox3 

and all the central Hox genes (Seo et al., 

2004), and the remaining Hox genes are 

dispersed on the genome and have lost 

their cluster organization. Despite the 

crucial role of retinoic acid in chordate axial 

patterning, O. dioica has lost most of the 

genes for retinoic acid production, 

degradation, and signaling becoming the 



 12 

first and only chordate able to develop 

without this morphogen (Cañestro et al., 

2007; Cañestro and Postlethwait, 2007; 

Martí-Solans et al., 2016). miRNAs have 

also suffered from gene loss in O. dioica 

with the absence of 18 highly conserved 

families (Fu et al., 2008; Wang et al., 2017). 

Despite the vast amount of gene losses 

found in O. dioica, the genome of this 

species contains 18,020 predicted genes a 

similar number to other tunicates (e.g., C. 

robusta ≈15,300 genes) and only slightly 

below other chordates (e.g., the 

cephalochordate B. floridae ≈22,000 

genes; the vertebrate Fugu rubripes 

≈18,300 genes). This astonishing number 

of genes is the result of a balance between 

gene losses and gene gains because the 

genome of O. dioica is prone to lose genes, 

but also to gain them. 

2.2 O. DIOICA, FROM A DETERMINATIVE 
DEVELOPMENT TO A FREE-LIVING 
LIFESTYLE 

O. dioica is a semi-cosmopolite species 

that can be found in almost all marine 

coasts. O. dioica and other appendicularian 

species are the second most abundant 

species, after copepods, in marine 

mesozooplankton (Capitanio et al., 2008; 

Gorsky and Fenaux, 1998). 

Appendicularians have a crucial ecological 

relevance because they graze about ten 

percent of the ocean’s primary production 

(Acuna et al., 2002), they serve as 

sustenance for fish larvae, and they 

significantly contribute to vertical carbon 

transport (Davoll and Youngbluth, 1990; 

Robison et al., 2005; Troedsson et al., 

2013). 

Although being so small, O. dioica has a 

simple but typical chordate body plan, 

which includes: a notochord anchoring 

muscle cells along the post-anal tail, a 

hollow neural tube which becomes in the 

central nervous system, a pair of gill slits, 

and an endostyle. Those chordate 

synapomorphies remain throughout the 

whole life cycle because O. dioica suffers 

only a mild metamorphosis in contrast to 

the drastic metamorphosis that undergoes 

in ascidian tunicates. 

 EMBRYO DETERMINATIVE 
DEVELOPMENT 
The determinative development of O. dioica 

is speedy, and at 19ºC only takes 10 hours 

from fertilization to a juvenile. As O. dioica 

is the only dioecious species so far reported 

in the tunicate subphylum (Fol, 1872; 

Nishida, 2008), the development begins 

after the external fertilization between the 

sperm released by males and the eggs 

spawned by females. Those gametes are 

produced in the gonads during the last 

hours of O. dioica’s life (Ganot et al., 2007; 

Nishino and Morisawa, 1998). Both 

spermatogenesis and oogenesis, have a 

syncytial nuclear proliferation phase. During 
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male gonad development, all the nuclei are 

identical and become individual 

spermatozoa, whereas in the ovary, half of 

the syncytial nuclei become polyploid nurse 

nuclei, and the other half enter meiosis, 

surround by actin filaments, and begin to 

grow until they differentiate into mature 

eggs (Ganot et al., 2007; Martinucci et al., 

2005; Onuma et al., 2017) (Fig. I6 A, B). 

Following egg fertilization, the determinative 

development of O. dioica has been well 

described (Fujii et al., 2008; Stach et al., 

2008). The first division takes place after 20 

minutes. At 60 minutes post-fertilization, 

the 32-cell stage embryo gastrulates, 

which consists of the ingression of the 

vegetal blastomeres (Fujii et al., 2008; 

Stach et al., 2008). Neurulation starts when 

the embryo arrives at the 64-cell stage 80 

minutes post-fertilization (mpf). Throughout 

neurulation, eight cells from the anterior 

region align in two rows of four cells, 

forming a matrix that internalizes. Tailbud 

starts 135 mpf when the tail and the trunk 

start becoming distinguishable. During the 

tailbud stage until the hatchling of the larva, 

at 3.6 hours post-fertilization, the tail 

elongates, and the embryo bents ventrally 

(Ferrández-Roldán et al., 2019; Fujii et al., 

2008; Stach et al., 2008) (Fig. I7). 

Larval development lasts 6 hours at 19ºC. 

During the first hours, the tail starts moving, 

and the organ primordia begin to develop. 

Towards the end of development, the water 

starts flowing inside the digestive tract of 

the larva, and eventually, the larva suffers a 

mild metamorphosis called tailshift. This 

process only consists of a change of 

orientation of the tail 120º, which completes 

the development of the embryo and begins 

the juvenile phase (Delsman, 1910; R 

Fig. I6. Mature female of O. dioica, the gonad is full of eggs (A). Mature male of O. dioica the gonad is full 
of sperm (B). Dorsal (C) and lateral (D) views of a house of O. dioica. T, trunk. Immature adult specimen of 
O. dioica showing the main organs (E). Differential interference contrast (DIC) micrographs show the right 
lateral view of the animal with anterior to the left and ventral down. 
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Fenaux, 1998; Galt and Fenaux, 1990; 

Nishida, 2008) (Fig. I7) 

 FROM JUVENILE TO ADULT FREE-
LIVING PHASE 
After tailshift, juveniles start soon to inflate 

the first house and feeding. The house is a 

filter-feeding device made of 

polysaccharides, proteins, and cellulose 

that traps unicellular algae and guides them 

into the mouth (Fig. I6 C, D) (Hosp et al., 

2012; Kimura et al., 2001; Spada et al., 

2001; Thompson et al., 2001). The house 

is synthesized by the epidermis of the trunk, 

known as oikoblast or oikoplastic 

epithelium, which contains a fixed number 

of cells organized in different domains 

defined by the shape of the cells and the 

morphology of the nuclei. Each of these 

domains shows a bilateral symmetric 

pattern and correlate with the different 

structures of the house (Kishi et al., 2017; 

Mikhaleva et al., 2018; Spada et al., 2001; 

Thompson et al., 2001). After 4-5 hours of 

filtering material, the house gets 

obstructed, O. dioica abandons it and, 

immediately after, inflates a new one. 

While O. dioica filtrates water, the food 

particles captured by the house arrive at the 

mouth, they enter the pharynx thanks to the 

water flux generated by the spiracles, a pair 

of gill slits with beating cilia (R. Fenaux, 

1998). In the pharynx, the mucous secreted 

by the endostyle, homologous to the 

thyroid of vertebrates, traps the food 

particles and conducts them to the 

Fig. I7. Schematic representation of O. dioica life cycle. Embryonic development starts with the 
fertilization of the oocyte and ends when a larva hatches breaking the chorion (3.6 hpf at 19°C). Larval 
development lasts 6 hours (at 19°C) and ends when the tail of the larva changes its orientation 120˚ in a 
process called tailshift, comparable to metamorphosis in other tunicates. Notice that in the juvenile animal, 
the position of the mouth (asterisk) relative to the tail has changed. During the next 4.5 days (at 19°C), 
juvenile animals grow and become mature males or females to close the life cycle. Scale bar represents 
100 μm for all stages except for day 2 and mature adults (1 mm). 
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digestive tract (Cañestro et al., 2008; 

Olsson, 1963). This tract comprises the 

esophagus, two stomach lobes, and the 

intestine which digest the food and absorb 

the nutrients (Burighel et al., 2001; Cima et 

al., 2002) (Fig. I6 E). 

The movement of the food particles 

through the house to the mouth, as well as 

the process of inflating a new house, 

require a continuous water flow inside the 

house. This water current is created by tail 

beating, which are also used for 

locomotion, and demands a huge amount 

of energy. The tail is stiff and flexible thanks 

to the notochord, and its movements are 

driven by two strips of ten striated muscle 

cells on dorsal and ventral sides of the 

notochord (Nishino et al., 2000; Nishino 

and Satoh, 2001; Olsson, 1965; Soviknes 

et al., 2007). Muscle cells are innervated by 

small ganglia distributed along the nerve 

cord that extends through the left side of 

the tail. This nerve cord connects to the 

caudal ganglion at the anterior region of the 

tail, and continues into the trunk until the 

cerebral ganglion, that with only 70 

neurons, is the most complex part of the 

central nervous system, and processes 

sensory stimuli provided by the statocyst, 

the mouth, the pharynx, and the ventral 

organ (Bollner et al., 1986; Cañestro et al., 

2005; Holmberg, 1984). The movement of 

the tail has also been described to 

participate in hemolymph circulation 

helping the only muscular structure present 

in the trunk of O. dioica, the heart (Fig. I8 

A). 

2.3 THE HEART OF O. DIOICA 

At the beginning of this thesis, the 

knowledge about the heart of 

appendicularians was scarce and restricted 

to some descriptions published in the early 

20th century. In these descriptions, 

Salensky represented the heart as an organ 

constituting of two closed pouches lying 

behind the posterior wall of the stomach 

(Salensky. W, 1903; Salensky, 1904). 

During my thesis, a modern scanning 

Fig. 8. Anatomy of the adult heart of O. dioica. 
Left DIC micrography of the trunk of O. dioica. The 
white square indicates the amplificated region of 
the trunk in which the striated muscle of the heart 
is showed (A). Ventral image of the trunk showing 
the bilaminar structure of the heart (B). The 
pericardium (blue arrows) beats against the 
stomach wall. The myocardium (yellow arrows) 
protects the myocardium. Discontinuous white 
lines delimit the shape of the heart during 
organogenesis. Red line indicate the section 
amplified in B. Discontinuous green lines delimit 
the notochord. Asterisk indicates the lumen of the 
heart. Intestine (In), Notochord (N), Stomach (St). 
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microscopy study has been published 

describing the morphology of the body of 

adult specimens of O. dioica, including the 

heart (Onuma et al., 2017) and 

corroborating the original bilaminar 

description made by Salensky. 

The heart of O. dioica consists of a 

posterior ventral bag wedged between the 

left stomach wall and the intestine. This bag 

is lined by two types of flat mesodermal 

tissues, the myocardium and the 

pericardium (Fig. I8 B). The myocardium 

includes striated muscle cells connected by 

cell junctions with the cytoplasm full of actin 

filaments (Onuma et al., 2017). The 

pericardium is not muscular and protects 

the myocardium. The heart of O. dioica 

produces peristaltic contractions that 

periodically reverse, which together with tail 

movements, contribute to the circulation of 

the hemolymph between the ectoderm and 

the internal organs in an open circulatory 

system (R. Fenaux, 1998). The heart of O. 

dioica adults, therefore, can be considered 

the simplest heart described on a chordate 

(Ferrández-Roldán et al., 2019). The 

development of the heart in O. dioica or any 

other appendicularian species remains 

totally unknown, and as a case study, it will 

become the main subject of this PhD 

project.  
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3 EVOLUTIONARY 
CONSERVATION OF THE 
CARDIAC GENETIC NETWORK  

he presence of hearts is widespread 

throughout the animal kingdom. 

Hearts are often characterized by being a 

muscle-powered pumping organ 

consisting of various cell types that work 

together to propel fluid inside the animal 

facilitating the uniform access to oxygen 

and nutrients for all the cells in the 

organism, as well as the elimination of 

carbon dioxide and excreta. Throughout 

the evolution, hearts have developed an 

impressive array of morphologies, from 

simple vessels that propel fluid by peristaltic 

contractions to multi-chambered 

architectures that coordinately beat to 

efficiently propel the blood circulation 

throughout the body (Xavier-Neto et al., 

2007). 

A central question in the study of the 

evolution of hearts is if all these cardiac 

structures are homologous evolving from a 

common organ present in the last common 

ancestor of metazoans, or on the contrary 

if hearts are analogous and they have 

independently evolved in different lineages 

although converging in similar structures. 

The fact that hearts appear in members of 

all the major bilaterian groups 

(Deuterostomes, Ecdysozoans and 

Lophotrochozoans) and all of them share a 

surprising number of genetic circuits, 

supports a common origin of the circulatory 

pumps. However, the similarities in 

morphology and functionality in the hearts 

of very distantly related animals such as the 

chambered hearts of vertebrates and 

mollusks, or the pulsating peristaltic vessels 

of annelids and cephalochordates suggest 

that, although having a similar design, 

hearts were independently created to 

perform analogous essential functions 

(Xavier-Neto et al., 2007). These disparate 

views were integrated on a new hypothesis 

that proposes that all hearts derive from 

parallel improvements of an ancestral, 

peristaltic design represented by a layer of 

myocytes at the external walls of primitive 

vessels (Bishopric, 2005; Xavier-Neto et al., 

2007) (Fig. I9). 

The assumption that all the hearts derive 

from an ancestral layer of myocytes present 

in the common ancestor of protostomes 

and deuterostomes agrees with the 

existence of a shared cardiac regulatory 

genetic kernel. This handful of orthologs –

Gata4/5/6, Nk4, Hand1/2, Tbx– control 

cardiac cell fates, the expression of genes 

encoding contractile proteins, and the 

morphogenesis of cardiac structures in all 

studied metazoans (Davidson and Erwin, 

2006; Olson, 2006; Poelmann and 

Gittenberger-de Groot, 2019; Wijesena et 

al., 2017) (Fig. I9). Cardiogenesis starts with 

the transcription of Gata4/5/6 and Nkx4 

orthologs in the mesodermal precardiac 

tissue. This tissue is simultaneously 

prompted by different inductive signals as 

T 
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retinoic acid (RA), fibroblast growth factor 

(FGF), Wnt, Hedgehog, bone 

morphogenetic proteins (BMP), or Notch, 

with different roles in different species. 

Then, this genetic environment regulates 

the activation of Tbx and Hand orthologs, 

followed by various sets of patterning and 

muscle genes. (Olson, 2006) (Fig. I10). 

Although all metazoans share the same 

genetic kernel during the first steps of 

cardiac development, differences in pattern 

and timing of gene expression and co-

option of upstream and downstream 

regulators have been the major forces 

responsible for the many different heart 

designs (Diogo et al., 2015). 

3.1 CARDIOPHARYNGEAL DEVELOPMENT 
IN CHORDATES 

During chordate evolution, the duplication 

of many cardiac kernel genes and the co-

option of new transcription factors have 

favored cardiac genetic complexity. This 

genetic complexity has been translated into 

the emergence of the branchiomeric or 

pharyngeal muscles from the same 

mesodermal progenitors that give rise to 

the heart. Therefore, in chordates, cardiac 

progenitors are included in a larger 

mesodermal population called 

cardiopharyngeal progenitors, which 

contributes to both, the heart and the 

skeletal muscles of the head and neck 

(Diogo et al., 2015). 

 VERTEBRATES 
Vertebrates are the only animal group, 

together with mollusks, that develop a heart 

with different chambers. This distinctive 

characteristic was used by Haeckel in 1866 

to designate vertebrates as the 

Fig. I9. Origin and evolution of the hearts. The 
new hypothesis of the origin of the heart suggests 
that the bilaterian ancestor already had a simple 
heart that evolved parallelly in the different 
bilaterian lineages. The numbers of cardiac kernel 
genes known to be expressed in the cardiac 
structures of each organism are shown. Red lines 
indicate the loss of the heart in that lineage. BA; 
bilaterian ancestor. Modified from Xavier-Neto 
2007. 

 

Fig. I10. Schematic representation of the 
conserved heart regulatory kernel. A core set of 
regulatory orthologs participate in the induction of 
the cardiac tissue in evolutionarily distant 
organisms. The interactions between them are 
also highly conserved. In blue orthologs of D. 
melanogaster, in green orthologs of chordates. 
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pachycardia, referring to them as the group 

of animals with a skull and a thick heart. The 

cardiopharyngeal field in vertebrates 

includes two adjacent mesodermal 

populations the first heart field (FHF) and 

the second heart field (SHF). The lateral 

anterior splanchnic mesoderm generates 

the FHF that produces the linear heart tube 

in the embryo and the ventricle and parts of 

the atria in the adult. After the formation of 

the linear heart tube, the pharyngeal 

mesoderm adds SHF precursors that 

generate the myocardium from the outflow 

tract, the right ventricle, and parts of the 

atria (Kelly and Evans, 2010). SHF 

precursors share a clonal relationship with 

branchiomeric progenitors that give rise to 

the craniofacial skeletal muscles, a group of 

muscles that were crucial for evolutionary 

innovations in vertebrates as the 

emergence of the tetrapod neck (Diogo et 

al., 2015; Lescroart et al., 2010). 

 CEPHALOCHORDATES 
Cephalochordates have a close circulatory 

system that proper the hemolymph with 

the help of peristaltic pulsating vessels 

surrounded by smooth muscle (Hirakow 

and Kajita, 1994; Xavier-Neto et al., 2010). 

In contrast to vertebrates, amphioxus 

presents a decentralized cardiac domain 

likely correlated to the absence of a central 

heart (Holland et al., 2003; Panopoulou et 

al., 1998; Pascual-Anaya et al., 2013). 

However, although lacking a central heart, 

amphioxus pterygial muscles seem to be 

homologs to the vertebrate branchiomeric 

muscles, suggesting that an ancestral 

configuration of these muscles were 

already present in the common ancestor 

of the extant chordates (Sambasivan et al., 

2011). 

3.2 ASCIDIANS, A MODEL TO STUDY THE 
BASES OF CHORDATE CARDIAC 
DEVELOPMENT 

For more than 20 years, the tunicate Ciona 

robusta has emerged as a simple model to 

study the basis of cardiopharyngeal 

development in chordates. Its low number 

of cells, its remarkably reduce gene 

redundancy, and the ability to accurately 

manipulate its genetic components provide 

high spatiotemporal resolution throughout 

development (Beh et al., 2007; Christiaen 

et al., 2010; Davidson, 2007; Wang et al., 

2019). Studies using C. robusta have 

profoundly increased our understanding of 

the origin and evolution of the heart and the 

branchiomeric muscles by revealing 

interactions between genes, and the 

activity of regulatory elements. 

In C. robusta, the heart starts beating just 

after metamorphosis, 2 or 3 days after 

fertilization. However, the heart requires 

two more weeks to acquire its fully 

functional adult morphology (Davidson, 

2007). The Ciona adult heart is located just 

posterior to the pharynx and anterior to the 

stomach and consists of a valve-less, U-
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shaped myocardial tube encased in a 

pericardial sac (Fig. I11A, B) (Davidson, 

2007). The raphe, a dense extracellular 

matrix, connects the one cell layer thick 

myocardium and pericardium. The heart of 

Ciona alternates pump direction, driving the 

fluid through two large vessels that are 

attached to both its ends and branch out 

throughout the body of the adult animal 

(Davidson, 2007). 

 MORPHOGENESIS OF THE 
CARDIOPHARYNGEAL LINEAGE IN CIONA 
ROBUSTA 
Cardiopharyngeal progenitors develop 

during embryonic and larval stages, before 

the profound metamorphosis that makes 

C. robusta to lose the chordate 

synapomorphies and give rise to the adult. 

The B7.5 pair of blastomeres constitute the 

cardiopharyngeal precursors in the 64-cell 

stage embryo (Davidson, 2007; Razy-

Krajka and Stolfi, 2019). Those 

blastomeres undergo two rounds of 

mitosis, resulting in two clusters of 4 cells 

at the border between the future trunk and 

tail regions. As the tail extends, the four 

posterior daughters separate, becoming 

into the anterior tail muscle cells (ATMs), 

and the anterior ones give rise to the trunk 

ventral cells (TVCs) (Davidson, 2007). 

Throughout the tailbud stage, the right and 

left TVCs migrate as pairs until they meet in 

the ventral midline of the trunk. Then, 

cardiopharyngeal progenitors divide and 

generate the first heart precursors (FHP) 

and the second heart precursors (SHP) that 

contribute to the heart, and the atrial siphon 

muscle field (ASMF) or pharyngeal 

precursors, which are homologous to the 

branchiomeric muscles of vertebrates and 

gives rise to the atrial siphon muscles and 

longitudinal muscles of the body wall in the 

adult (Hirano and Nishida, 1997; Stolfi et al., 

2010) (Fig. I11 C). After dividing, 

cardiopharyngeal precursors arrest their 

development until metamorphosis, when 

they complete both cardiac and pharyngeal 

muscle development. 

 THE CARDIOPHARYNGEAL GENETIC 
PATHWAY IN CIONA 
The cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory 

network (GRN) in Ciona can be divided into 

three parts: (1) induction of the 

cardiopharyngeal lineage, (2) migration of 

cardiopharyngeal precursors, and (3) 

specification of cardiac and pharyngeal 

precursors. 

3.2.2.1 INDUCTION OF THE 
CARDIOPHARYNGEAL LINEAGE 

The induction of the cardiopharyngeal 

lineage in ascidians occurs early in 

development when B7.5 blastomeres, in 

response to the maternal effectors macho-

1 and ß-catenin, activate Tbx6 and Lhx3, 

respectively (Christiaen et al., 2010). The 

simultaneous expressions of these 

transcription factors upregulate Mesp, a 

bHLH transcription factor that acts as a 
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master regulator for heart development in 

olfactores (Davidson et al., 2005; Saga et 

al., 2000; Satou et al., 2004). Although 

Mesp is expressed in the cardiac 

progenitors of vertebrates, its specific role 

is unclear (Devine et al., 2014; Kitajima et 

al., 2000; Lescroart et al., 2014; Saga et al., 

2000). In C. robusta, however, Mesp is 

known to upregulate Ets1/2, a 

transcriptional effector of the FGF-MAPK 

pathway (Christiaen et al., 2010; Davidson 

et al., 2006). 

Fibroblast growth factor (FGF) and retinoic 

acid (RA) signaling pathways have a crucial 

role in the induction of the chordate 

cardiopharyngeal development (Krieg and 

Warkman, 2015; Perl and Waxman, 2019; 

Reifers et al., 2000). In vertebrates, RA 

plays an essential role in delineating the 

posterior border of the emerging heart field 

(Simões-Costa et al., 2005). This function is 

conserved in ascidians where RALDH2 –

enzyme that catalyzes the synthesis of RA– 

is expressed in the progeny of B7.5. 

However, the RALDH2 expression is only 

maintained in the prospective tail muscle 

cells (Nagatomo and Fujiwara, 2003). The 

precursors destined to be TVCs 

downregulate RALDH2 expression 

(Bernard et al., 1998; Simões-Costa et al., 

2005), while activating the FGF-MAPK 

signaling pathway. FGF-MAPK signaling 

pathway phosphorylates Ets, previously 

transcribed as a result of Mesp activation. 

Finally, phosphorylated Ets (pEts) triggers 

Fig. I11. Heart development in C. robusta. 
Scheme of a C. robusta adult, the heart is 
represented in blue on the left side of the organism 
(A). Cartoon and cross-sectional diagram of the U-
shaped Ciona heart. The myocardium, in blue, is 
protected by the pericardium, in grey. The raphe 
connects myocardium and pericardium (B). Early 
cardiopharyngeal development in Ciona from 10 to 
16 hpf. Cardiopharyngeal-lineage cells are shown 
for only one side and different precursors are 
differentially colored. Green, Trunk ventral cells 
(TVCs); Red, Second trunk ventral cells (STVCs); 
Orange, First heart field (FHF); Yellow, Atrial 
siphon muscle field (ASMF); Purple, Second heart 
field (SHF) (C). Cardiopharyngeal-linage cells are 
shown for only one side. Cell-type-specific marker 
genes are indicated inside each cell, as well as the 
inductive signals (D). 
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the expression of the heart regulatory 

kernel and migratory factors (Fig. I11D). 

3.2.2.2 MIGRATION OF THE 
CARDIOPHARYNGEAL LINEAGE 

Downstream of the FGF/MAPK signaling, 

pEts upregulates FoxF and Ddr, which, 

simultaneously, activates other cardiac 

transcription factors (Beh et al., 2007; 

Christiaen et al., 2008). FoxF is required for 

FGF-induced cardiac cell migration, but not 

for heart muscle specification (Beh et al., 

2007).  TVCs migrate as a polarized pair of 

cells with one anterior or leader and one 

posterior or trailer. This distinct polarized 

state of the TVCs is established by Ddr, 

which also maintains their adhesion to the 

cell-matrix (Bernadskaya et al., 2019). 

During migration, TVCs are thought to 

follow a localized cue of BMP2/4 ligand 

originated in the trunk ventral epidermis 

(Christiaen et al., 2010) that also 

participates in the induction of Gata4/5/6 

and Nk4, genes from the heart regulatory 

kernel. Gata4/5/6 is upregulated at the 

beginning of the migration when TVCs are 

far from the ventral epidermis, and the 

levels of BMP2/4 ligand are low. Gata4/5/6 

is supposed to maintain FoxF expression 

during migration, and together with high 

levels of BMP2/4 ligand, Gata4/5/6 

upregulates Nk4 at the end of the migration 

(Christiaen et al., 2010; Tolkin and 

Christiaen, 2012; Wang et al., 2013) (Fig. 

I11 D). 

3.2.2.3 SPECIFICATION OF 
CARDIOPHARYNGEAL LINEAGE 

Following the migration, TVCs divide 

asymmetrically to create secondary trunk 

ventral cells (STVCs) and first heart 

precursors (FHPs). STVCs maintain Nk4 

expression and the FGF-MAPK signaling 

pathway activated, promoting the 

expression of Hand-r, Tbx1/10, and Ebf 

(Wang et al., 2019). By contrast, FGF-

MAPK signaling stops in FHPs, where Nk4 

reactivates Gata4/5/6 expression and 

upregulates Hand and other cardiac-

specific genes (Wang et al., 2019). 

Subsequent division of the STVCs 

generates the second heart precursors 

(SHPs) and the atrial siphon muscle 

founder cells (ASMFs). The antagonism 

Nk4 versus Tbx1/10 and the activation of 

the FGF pathway govern the distinction 

between cardiac and pharyngeal muscle 

(Wang et al., 2019, 2013). In SHPs both, 

Tbx1/10 inactivation by Nk4, the onset of 

Dach and the cease of the FGF-MAPK 

signaling allow the expression of cardiac-

specific genes. In contrast, in ASMFs, the 

FGF-MAPK signaling and Tbx1/10 keep 

activated, allowing the expression of 

muscle-specific genes as MyoD, Ebf or 

Islet1  (Wang et al., 2019) (Fig. I11 D). 

In this thesis, we will analyze the impact of 

gene loss in the cardiopharyngeal GRN in 

the tunicate O. dioica, and the results will 

be discussed on the context of the 
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evolution of free-living lifestyle of 

appendicularians. 
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O B J E C T I V E S 

 

he overall aim of this PhD project was to 

better understand the impact of gene 
loss in the evolution of the mechanisms of 

development, particularly in the context of 
chordate evolution, which is the main area of 
interest of the lab where this project has taken 

place. In particular, this project aimed to 
study the impact of the loss of developmental 
genes on the evolution of the free-living 

appendicularians in contrast to other sessile 
tunicates such as ascidians. Among 
appendicularians, we aim to develop the 

study of Oikopleura dioica as an eKO model 
among chordates, in particular considering 
previous results from our laboratory showing 

that O. dioica appears as the only chordate 
so far known to have lost the RA signaling 
pathway. Thus, considering the fundamental 

role of RA signaling in cardiac development in 
ascidians and vertebrates, and the relevance 
of the cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory 

network in the evolution of free-living styles, 
the primary focused of this PhD project was 
to study heart development in 

appendicularians using O. dioica as a RA 
eKO model system. Second, in line with our 
interest to develop the study of O. dioica as 

an eKO model, and taking advantage of the 
uniqueness of O. dioica as a RA eKO model, 
we became interested in a better 

understanding of the developmental genetic 
response of chordate embryos to 
environmental threats, such for instance 

diatom bloom-derived biotoxins such as 

PUAs, which in other organisms have been 
suggested to affect the development of 

structures regulated by RA during 
development, including mesodermal 
derivatives such muscle and heart. Thus, the 

specific objectives of the PhD are: 

- Objective 1: To generate an anatomical 

atlas of the development of the heart of O. 
dioica and to describe its morphology. 

- Objective 2: To characterize the origin and 

map the lineage of the cardiac cells. 

- Objective 3: To perform a comprehensive 

genome survey in O. dioica and a 

phylogenetic analysis to characterize its 
homologs to the components of the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN in ascidians and 

vertebrates. 

- Objective 4: To perform an expression 

analysis of cardiopharyngeal genes in O. 
dioica to characterize the cardiac expression 

dynamics during development. 

- Objective 5: To perform functional analyses 

by inhibitory treatments or gene knockdown 

approaches to understand cardiogenic fate 
cell differentiation. 

- Objective 6: To further develop the study of 

O. dioica as an eKO model, we investigated 

genetic responses to environmental threats 
such as diatom bloom-derived biotoxins in 
the absence of RA signaling.

T 
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Thesis supervisors’ report about authorship and impact factor of the publications of 
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Dr. Cristian Cañestro and Dr. Jordi García-Fernàndez, supervisors of the PhD thesis entitled 

“Deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network in 

appendicularians, a paradigmatic study of Oikopleura dioica as an evolutionary 

knockout model” by Alfonso Ferrández Roldán, certify that the results obtained have been 

or will be submitted to peer-reviewed international journals. The entire thesis comprises four 

articles: three of them already published, and one finished and ready to be submitted. None 

of the articles have been used for the elaboration of other PhD thesis. The details of the 

papers, journal and their impact factor (Journal Citation Reports) are detailed below:  

 

Publication 1: Developmental atlas of appendicularian Oikopleura dioica actins 

provides new insights into the evolution of the notochord and the cardio-paraxial 

muscle in chordates. Almazán* A, Ferrández-Roldán* A, Albalat R, Cañestro C. (2019) 
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Rank: 31/309; Quartile: Q1 
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methodology, participated and co-supervised the first author TFG project on the Actin 
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Publication 2: Adaptive evolution by modular deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

gene regulatory network in appendicularians reveals that ancestral tunicates were 

sessile Ferrández-Roldán A., Fabregà-Torrus M., Sánchez-Serna G., Durán-Bello E., 

Joaquín-Lluís M., Bujosa P., Plana-Carmona M., Garcia-Fernàndez J., Albalat R., Cañestro 
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This manuscript collects the main body of the results of the project of the PhD candidate, 
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nuclei reconstruction and the cardiopharyngeal cell lineage fate map, performed the BMP 

inhibitory treatments, co-supervised the contribution of six other co-authors during their 

TFG or Master projects, and contributed to the writing and making of the figures of the 

manuscript. 

 

Publication 3: Oikopleura dioica: An Emergent Chordate Model to Study the Impact 

of Gene Loss on the Evolution of the Mechanisms of Development. Ferrández-Roldán* 

A, Martí-Solans* J, Cañestro C, Albalat R. Results Probl Cell Differ. (2019) 68:63-105. doi: 
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Impact factor (JCR2018): 0.650 

Category Scopus: Biochemistry, Genetics and Molecular Biology; Cell Biology 

Rank:  204/274; Quartile: Q3 

*The first two authors equally contributed. The PhD candidate contributed to design of the 

review, and contributed to the writing and making of the figures of the manuscript. 

 

Publication 4: Diatom bloom-derived biotoxins cause aberrant development and 

gene expression in the appendicularian chordate Oikopleura dioica. Torres-Águila NP, 

Martí-Solans J, Ferrández-Roldán A, Almazán A, Roncalli V, D'Aniello S, Romano G, 

Palumbo A, Albalat R, Cañestro C. Commun Biol. (2018) 1:121. doi: 10.1038/s42003-018-

0127-2. 

Impact factor (JCR2019): 4.165 

Category JCR: Biology-Sciences 

Rank:  18/93; Quartile: Q1 

The PhD candidate contributed to identification, cloning and expression analyses of cardiac 

markers, and contributed to the conceptualization of the use of evolutionary knockout 
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A B S T R A C T

Locomotion by tail beating powered by a system of bilateral paraxial muscle and notochord is likely one of the
key evolutionary innovations that facilitated the origin and radiation of chordates. The innovation of paraxial
muscle was accompanied by gene duplications in stem chordates that gave rise to muscular actins from
cytoplasmic ancestral forms, which acquired contractile capability thanks to the recruitment of the myosin
motor-machinery. To better understand the role of actin diversification during the evolution of chordates, in this
work we have characterized the complete actin catalogue of the appendicularian Oikopleura dioica, an
urochordate that maintains a chordate body plan throughout its life, including the notochord in a muscled tail
that confers an active free-living pelagic style. Our genomic survey, phylogenetic analyses and Diagnostic-Actin-
Values (DAVs) reveal that O. dioica has four muscular actins (ActnM1–4) and three cytoplasmic actins
(ActnC1–3), most of which originated by independent gene duplications during the evolution of the
appendicularian lineage. Detailed developmental expression atlas of the complete actin catalogue of O. dioica
reveals differences in the temporal-regulation and tissue-specificity of different actin paralogs, suggesting
complex processes of subfunctionalization during the evolution of urochordates. Our results suggest the
presence of a “cardio-paraxial”muscular actin at least in the last common ancestor of Olfactores (i.e. vertebrates
+urochordates). Our results reveal highly dynamic tissue-specific expression patterns for some cytoplasmic
actins, including the notochord, ciliated cells and neurons with axonal projections, which challenge the classic
housekeeping notion ascribed to these genes. Considering that previous work had demonstrated the existence of
notochord-specific actins in cephalochordates, the tissue-specific expression of two cytoplasmic actins in the
notochord of O. dioica suggests that this pattern plausibly reflects the ancestral condition of chordates, and
provides new insights to better understand the evolutionary origin of the notochord.

1. Introduction

Actins are highly conserved globular proteins, and many of their
biological functions derive from their ability to form filaments by linear
polymerization (reviewed in Dominguez and Holmes, 2011). Actin
microfilaments are one of the major components of the cytoskeleton,
being involved in providing structural strength to cellular architecture,
ordering and shaping intracellular compartments and organelles, as
well as contributing to physically distribute molecules within the cell
(Blanchoin et al., 2014; Gunning et al., 2015). Thus, actins have been
described to play important roles in cell-cycle control (Heng and Koh,
2010; Tripathi, 1989), chromosome segregation (Ramkumar and

Baum, 2016), cell membrane dynamic modulation (Bezanilla et al.,
2015; Chang et al., 2017; Fritzsche et al., 2016), regulation of mRNA
transport and translation (Besse and Ephrussi, 2008; Vidaki et al.,
2017; Zarnack and Feldbrugge, 2010), protein transport and activity
modulation (Farwell et al., 1990; Kondrikov et al., 2010; Silva et al.,
2016) and regulation of steady-state length of cilia (Avasthi et al.,
2014). In addition, the nuclear fraction of actins has been involved in
the maintenance of the architecture of the nucleus (Hofmann, 2009), as
well as in the regulation of gene transcription either by direct
interaction with RNA-polymerases (Philimonenko et al., 2004), by
chromatin remodeling (Kapoor et al., 2013), or by direct regulation of
the activity of transcription factors (Vartiainen et al., 2007).
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One of the most dramatic specializations that cytoskeleton actin
filaments have acquired is contractility thanks to the recruitment of
myosin II motor proteins (Lodish et al., 2000). Vertebrate striated
muscle cells represent the evolution of one of the most sophisticated
actomyosin contractile complexes, in which bundles of filaments
organized in sarcomeres can contract quickly, repetitively through long
distance and with enough force to drive movement (Lodish et al.,
2000). The acquisition of contractility by the recruitment of myosin II
motors into actin filaments has not only occurred in muscle cells, but
other non-muscle cells have also evolved analogous systems (Conti and
Adelstein, 2008; Vicente-Manzanares et al., 2009; Zaidel-Bar et al.,
2015). For instance, actin filaments and myosin-II assemble into a
contractile ring during cytokinesis that provides mechanical forces for
cell cleavage at the end of mitosis (Pollard, 2010). Similarly, other ring-
like or circumferential belt contractile structures of actomyosin in the
inner surface of cell membranes are fundamental for cell-cell adhesion,
wound healing and epithelial extrusions (Nakajima and Tanoue, 2012;
Schwayer et al., 2016).

Actins are one of the most conserved proteins in eukaryotes, with a
97% conserved sequence identity across distant species such as sea
anemone and human. Classically, actins have been classified into
muscle actins and cytoplasmic (or non-muscle) actins, depending on
whether they were specialized in muscle contraction or, on the
contrary, they form part of the cytoskeleton and were involved in
many other cellular functions (Hightower and Meagher, 1986;
Vandekerckhove and Weber, 1978). In mammals, for instance, from
the six major actin genes that have been identified, four are muscle-
specific (alpha-skeletal ACTA1, alpha-cardiac ACTC1, alpha-smooth
muscle ACTA2, gamma-smooth muscle ACTG2), and two are cytoplas-
mic (beta-cytoplasmic ACTB and gamma-cytoplasmic isoactin ACTG1)
(Vandekerckhove and Weber, 1978). Muscle-specific actin genes have
also been described in non-chordate deuterostomes and protostomes
(see Hooper and Thuma, 2005 for an extensive review). In Drosophila
melanogaster, for instance, four out of its six actin genes (act57A,
act87E, act88F and act79B) are expressed in muscle tissues of different
structures during different times of the life cycle (Fyrberg et al., 1983).
Recent phylogenetic analysis based on accurate tree-based orthology
estimation has shown that despite their conserved muscular expres-
sion, chordate and non-chordate muscle actin genes are not ortholo-
gous, but they have a polyphyletic origin due to independent duplica-
tions from cytoplasmic genes in different lineages (Inoue and Satoh,
2018). This finding is consistent with previous analyses that based on
comparisons of diagnostic positions and exon-intron structures had
classified muscle-specific genes of non-chordate animals together with
the cytoplasmic actin genes (Chiba et al., 2003; Fyrberg et al., 1981; T.
Kusakabe et al., 1997; Vandekerckhove and Weber, 1984).

In cephalochordates, in addition to muscle and cytoplasmic actins,
a third group has been described as notochord-type actin genes (N-
actin) because of their specific expression in the notochord (Suzuki and
Satoh, 2000). The notochord of amphioxus has the peculiarity to be
formed by muscle fibers, which in 1870, Muller already described as
arranged birefringent myofilaments capable of contracting and altering
its mechanical properties upon nervous stimulation (Flood et al., 1969;
Müller, 1870). Large scale analysis of notochord ESTs revealed indeed
that 11% of its cDNAs was related to muscle genes –including N-actin
and many other muscle genes such as tropomyosin, troponin I, myosin
regulatory light and heavy chains (Suzuki and Satoh, 2000). The study
of the actin gene family has become useful to investigate the origin and
evolution of the notochord and the paraxial muscle, and thus, to better
understand the origin of the fish-like ancestral chordate body plan that
probably was characterized by its swimming capability powered by tail
beating (Satoh, 2016). In this work, we focus on the characterization of
actin gene family in the appendicularian Oikopleura dioica.
Appendicularians (a.k.a. larvaceans), ascidians and thaliaceans belong
to the urochordate phylum (Satoh et al., 2014), which is the sister
group of vertebrates, and together with cephalochordates constitute the

chordate superphylum. Appendicularians, in contrast to other urochor-
dates, do not suffer a drastic metamorphosis and maintain their body
plan, including an actively motile tail that confers them a free-living
pelagic style during their entire life cycle (Mikhaleva et al., 2015;
Nishida, 2008; Soviknes et al., 2007; Soviknes and Glover, 2008). Our
work reveals how muscle and cytoplasmic actin genes have undergone
extensive gene duplications during the evolution of the appendicularian
lineage, and reveals cardio-paraxial and notochord-specific expression
domains of some muscular and cytoplasmic actin genes that help to
better understand the role of actins during the origin and evolution of
chordates.

2. Material and methods

2.1. Biological material

O. dioica specimens were obtained from the Mediterranean coast of
Barcelona (Catalonia, Spain), and cultured in our animal facility at the
University of Barcelona, in which embryos have been collected as
described (Marti-Solans et al., 2015).

2.2. Genome survey, phylogenetic analysis, Diagnostic-Actin-Value
(DAV) and exon-intron organization

To identify O. dioica actin homologs, we made BLAST searches
(Altschul et al., 1997) in the genome database of O. dioica (Oikobase,
http://oikoarrays.biology.uiowa.edu/Oiko) using as queries known
actin sequences from ascidians, amphioxus and two cDNAs described
in Oikopleura longicauda (Nishino et al., 2000). Gene annotations
were manually corrected using ESTs and sequences from PCR
fragments we have cloned during our analyses.

Phylogenetic trees were made by maximum-likelihood inferences
calculated with PhyML v3.0 using automatic Akaike Information
Criterion for the substitution model and aLRt SH-like for branch
support (Lefort et al., 2017), and by Bayesian inferences calculated by
MrBayes 3.2.6 using invgamma model for among-site rate variation,
WAG amino acid rate matrix, 2 million generations, in two parallel
runs sampling every 1000 generations, and discarding 0.25 of sampled
values as burnin to calculate branch support for posterior probabilities
(Ronquist et al., 2012).

To analyze the muscular or cytoplasmic nature of actin genes, we
have developed an algorithm that calculates the “Diagnostic-Actin-
Value” (DAV) according to the conservation of previously described
diagnostic positions (Nishino et al., 2000; Vandekerckhove and Weber,
1984) (for details see Sup. File 1). Briefly, according to the classifica-
tion as muscular or cytoplasmic actins in the phylogenetic tree
(branching support = 0.98), first we calculated the frequency of residue
conservation of each diagnostic position among all 95 analyzed actins
of vertebrates and ascidians. Then, to calculate the DAV, each position
contributed with +1 or -1 if the residue was conserved in at least 20% of
the muscular or cytoplasmic sequences, respectively. In case that a
conserved residue for a group of actins was also found in sequences of
the other group, the absolute value of the contribution for each position
(i.e. +1 or -1) was corrected by subtracting the frequency of that
residue in the other group. According to this algorithm, DAV can range
from +16 to -16 depending on the total conservation of muscular or
cytoplasmic diagnostic positions, respectively.

To analyze the exon-intron structure of actin genes we used the
software GECA (Fawal et al., 2012), defining at least 70% of similarity
in the 20 amino acids surrounding the intron position.

2.3. Cloning and expression analysis

Probes for whole-mount in situ hybridization (WMISH) of O. dioica
actins were PCR amplified and cloned with the Topo TA Cloning® Kit of
Invitrogen (primers are listed in Sup. File 2 Table S1). Probes were
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designed on the 3′ untranslated regions in order to avoid cross-
hybridization among paralogs. Cloning, sequencing, and WMISH
experiments on fixed embryos at selected developmental stages were
performed as previously described (Marti-Solans et al., 2015).

2.4. Nuclear and phalloidin staining

For nuclear and phalloidin staining, embryos were fixed in 4%
paraformaldehyde in fixation buffer (0.1M MOPS, 0.5M NaCl, 2mM
MgSO4, 1mM EGTA). After 1 h at room temperature, fixation buffer
was replaced by washing twice in PBST (PBS Tween-20, 0,2%).
Phalloidin and nuclei stainings were performed incubating the embryos
in staining solution (1 µM Hoeschst-33342 Invitrogen-62249, 0.1 µM
TRITC-Phalloidin Sigma-P-1951 in PBST) for 1 h at 37 °C in the dark.
Stained embryos were washed in PBST and mounted in glycerol 80% in
PBS, and photographed in a Fluorescent microscope (Zeiss Aixophot).

3. Results

3.1. Characterization and evolutionary history of Oikopleura dioica
actin genes

Our survey of genomic and transcriptomic databases of O. dioica
identified seven actin genes (labeled in red in Fig. 1A and Sup. Fig. S1)
distributed in six scaffolds, whose annotations were manually curated
and fixed according to available ESTs and our PCR clones (Sup. File 2
Table S2). Phylogenetic analysis suggested that four O. dioica actin
genes were homologs to chordate muscle actin genes (namely ActnM1,
ActnM2, ActnM3 and ActnM4), whereas the other three grouped with
the cytoplasmic ones (ActnC1, ActnC2 and ActnC3). The fact that all O.
dioica ActnM grouped in a single cluster together with a cDNA actin
previously described in Oikopleura longicauda (Nishino et al., 2000),
but without including any muscular actin from other urochordate
species, suggested that ActnMs of O. dioica were paralogs that have
been originated by independent gene duplications during the evolution
of appendicularians, after their split from ascidians. Cytoplasmic ActnC
genes of O. dioca, on the other side, grouped in two different clusters
with moderate support (i.e. 0.91 and 0.88), one including ActnC1 and
ActnC2, and the other ActnC3 (red circles in Fig. 1A). The fact that
these two clusters also included actins from phlebobranchia and
stolidobranchia ascidian species (dark and light blue circles, respec-
tively, in Fig. 1A) suggested that their origin might come from ancient
duplications that occurred at least before the split of the appendicular-
ian and the ascidian lineages, followed by further duplications in the
appendicularian lineage that gave rise to ActnC1 and ActnC2.

Amino-acid sequence identity within the muscular and cytoplasmic
actins of O. dioica was high, being > 99.5% among ActnMs and > 95%
among ActnCs (Sup. File 2 Table S2). The fact that ActnM2 and
ActnM3 were identical, and that the other O. dioica ActnMs did not
differ in more than two amino acids was compatible with either the
possibility that duplications that originated these paralogs were recent,
or that all ActnM sequences were so similar because they have shared
high functional redundancy and have been evolving under the same
selective restrictions. Among cytoplasmic actins, ActnC1 and ActnC2
differed in 4 amino acids, while ActnC3 was the most divergent,
showing up to 18 amino acid differences. Comparison between O.
dioica muscle and cytoplasmic actins revealed that their lengths
differed in 6 amino acids, due to a 18 nucleotides expansion of the
first exon in the muscle actins during the evolution of the O. dioica
lineage, absent in O. longicauda. O. dioica muscle and cytoplasmic
actins showed 28–33 amino acid differences, suggesting differential
selective restrictions for sequence variability between the two groups.

The high sequence similarity among O. dioica actins prompted us to
analyze their exon-intron structures to look for further support that
they were different genes rather than allelic variants. Differences in the
exon-intron structures (Sup. File 2 Fig. S2), together with the lack of

sequence similarity between introns or untranslated regions (Sup. File
2 Table S3), discarded the possibility that the small number of amino
acid differences among genes could be polymorphic variants, and
corroborated therefore that the actin catalogue in O. dioica is made
of seven genes. The exon-intron organization of most O. dioica actin
genes was, indeed, considerably divergent from the structure that is
broadly conserved in actin genes of other species (Sup. File 2 Fig. S2),
which was consistent with the high intron turnover described for most
genes in O. dioica (Edvardsen et al., 2004). Interestingly, the four
muscle actin genes (ActnM1–4) shared a synapomorphic intron 1,
absent in cytoplasmic actins, which corroborated their paralogy and
that all ActnM genes originated by gene duplication during the
appendicularian evolution (intron 1 in red Sup. File 2 Fig. S2).
Likewise, the presence of at least two introns in O. dioica ActnC1
and ActnC2 that were synapomorphically conserved in other chordate
cytoplasmic actin genes supported their position in the phylogenetic
tree. The absence of introns in ActnC3 could be explained either by
events of intron loss, a common phenomena observed in many O.
dioica genes (Denoeud et al., 2010), or by an evolutionary origin
related to retrotranscription and integration of a transcript from an
ancestral ActnC gene. The presence of an intron in ActnM1 in the same
position that in the ActnC genes prompted us to analyze the possibility
of gene conversion by unequal crossing-over between the two groups of
actins. Comparisons of the sequences of the intron and surrounding
exons, however, revealed no evidence of gene conversion, concluding
that the origin of that intron in ActnM1 might be due to a convergent
intron gain, a phenomenon also observed in several O. dioica genes
(Denoeud et al., 2010).

To further corroborate the muscular and cytoplasmic nature of O.
dioica ActnM and ActnC genes, we also analyzed the diagnostic
positions that had been previously described to differentiate muscle
and cytoplasmic actins (Vandekerckhove and Weber, 1984). To per-
form this analysis, we developed a novel algorithm that calculates the
“Diagnostic-Actin-Value” (DAV) according to the conservation of
diagnostic positions across an extended list of vertebrates and uro-
chordate actins, adopting more positive or negative values, between +
16 and -16, according to the more muscle or more cytoplasmic
characteristics of their sequences, respectively (Sup. File 1). In O.
dioica, all muscular ActnM shared a DAV of +15.38, while the
cytoplasmic actins ActnC1 and ActnC2 had a DAV of -15.42, and
ActnC of -9.1 (Fig. 1B). These values strongly supported the assign-
ment of their muscle or cytoplasmic nature reflected in the phyloge-
netic tree (Fig. 1A).

Results from our phylogenetic analysis, in which we included new
actins from a broad panel of ascidian species, corroborated previous
work showing how muscle actins experienced a gene duplication that
originated two paralogous groups during the evolution of ascidians,
classically referred as “larval” and “adult body-wall” ascidian actins
(reviewed in Kusakabe, 1997), and recently renamed as ascidian-P
(for Paraxial) or ascidian-B (for Body-wall) actins, respectively (Inoue
and Satoh, 2018). However, none of our phylogenetic analyses,
neither using maximum likelihood nor Bayesian approaches, unfortu-
nately, provided robust support to clarify the relationship between O.
dioica and ascidian-P and -B groups, in many cases collapsing in a
trichotomy (Fig. 1A and Sup. File 2 Fig. S3). Interestingly, the DAV of
all O. dioica ActnM paralogs (average 15.38) was closer to those of
ascidian-P actins (average 14.69 ± 0.78) than those of ascidian-B
actins (average of 12.41 ± 0.56), suggesting therefore that O. dioica
ActnMs had a closer structural and likely functional relationship to
ascidian-P actins than to ascidian-B actins (Fig. 1B). Further sequen-
cing of actin genes in additional urochordate groups, especially in
doliolids and salps as well as in other appendicularian species, will be
necessary to solve the evolution of muscle actin genes in urochor-
dates, and to clarify whether the duplication that gave rise to the
P and B paralogs occurred before or after the appendicularian-
ascidian split.
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Fig. 1. Evolutionary history and analysis of diagnostic positions of muscular and cytoplasmic actins in chordates. (A) Phylogenetic tree inferred by maximum-
likelihood of muscular (in red background) and cytoplasmic (in blue background) actins in chordates. Appendicularian ActnM1–4 and ActnC1–3 are labeled in red. For the sake of
clarity, sequence species are depicted as circles with sizes proportional to the number of represented sequences and color coded according to species taxonomy as indicated in the legend
(vertebrates in ochre, cephalochordate species in three different green tones, Phlebobranchia and Stolidobranchia ascidians in dark and light blue tones, respectively). Major actin groups
are indicated, and values for the approximate likelihood-ratio test (aLRT) are shown in main nodes. Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Fully detailed tree with all sequence
names and branch supports are provided in Sup. File 2 Fig. S1. (B) Gradient colored representation from totally muscular (+16 in red) to totally cytoplasmic (-16 in blue) DAVs
(Diagnostic-Actin-Values) of vertebrate, ascidian, O. dioica, and cephalochordate actins. Bars represent the number of sequences (y-axis) included in DAV ranges (x-axis on top). O.
dioica ActnMs and ActnCs, ascidian-P and -B actins, and amphioxus-P and -N actins are labeled on top of the bars. Asterisks indicate that in addition to -P or -N actins, other
cytoplasmic actins having the same DAV are included in the bar.
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3.2. Developmental expression atlas of Oikopleura dioica actin genes

In order to create a detailed developmental atlas of actin expression
in O. dioica, we investigated the expression patterns of the seven actin
genes by whole mount in situ hybridization (WMISH) throughout eight
developmental stages from egg to late hatchling (Fig. 2A-BD). The high
sequence similarity among the seven actin genes, however, hampered
these analyses since we noticed that probes designed in coding regions
could cross-hybridize among different actins (Sup. File 2 Table S2). To
avoid cross-hybridization, therefore, we were forced to design all actin
probes in regions of the 3′ untranslated regions that showed lower
similarity to other actin genes (Sup. File 2 Table S3), which in some
cases rendered small probes (< 100 bp) that required long staining
periods up to three weeks in order to detect the signal.

WMISH results revealed that ActnM genes had tissue specific
expression, which consistent with their ‘phylogenetic’ muscular nature
appeared to be restricted to the muscle cell lineage (Fig. 2A-AF).
Despite ActnM paralogs showed important overlap in their expression
domains, they also displayed noticeable dissimilarities that suggested
differences in their spatio-temporal regulation, confirming the specifi-
city of the probes used in our WMISH experiments. Temporal
differences were shown, for instance, by the time of the expression
onset, in which ActnM1 signal was the earliest to be observed by the
64-cell stage (Fig. 2B), followed by ActnM2 and ActnM3, which did not
show obvious signal up until the 200-cell stage and early-tailbud stage,
respectively, in all cases labeling paraxial muscle cells (Fig. 2K, S, T,
orange arrowheads). From the late tail-bud up to mid-hatchling stage,
the signal of ActnM1, ActnM2, and ActnM3 remained constant. By late
hatchling stage, however, ActnM2 seemed to downregulate as its
expression signal appeared to be fainter (Fig. 2P). Spatial differences
in the expression of ActnM genes were shown by ActnM1, which
besides paraxial muscle, it was also expressed in the cardiac cell lineage
(Fig. 2C-H). We did not observe any signal of ActnM4 in any of the

many WMISH experiments we performed, not even decreasing the
stringency of the conditions of the hybridization nor after long staining
periods. It is possible that ActnM4 might be expressed during adult
stages, although we cannot discard that the limited small size of the
specific probe of this paralog (i.e. 96 nucleotides) might be hampering
the detection of signal, especially if this gene was lowly expressed
during development in comparison with the other ActnM paralogs.

In the case of cytoplasmic genes (Fig. 2AG-BD), only one of the three
paralogs, namely ActnC3, showed a generalized broad expression pattern
after long staining periods. The expression of this gene therefore, could be
consistent with a basic housekeeping function, which is expected from
ubiquitously expressed cytoplasmic actins related to components of the
cytoskeleton (Fig. 2AX-BD). However, the other two ActnC paralogs,
namely ActnC1 and ActnC2, showed highly dynamic tissue-specific
expression patterns changing over time in different organs (Fig. 2AG-
AV). Thus, unfertilized eggs displayed strong signal for ActnC1 and
ActnC2, suggesting that these two paralogs were maternally transcribed
(Fig. 2AG, AO). By the 64-cell stage, most cells still showed ActnC1 and
ActnC2 signal, but weaker than in eggs, suggesting that it likely was part
of the still remaining maternal component (Fig. 2AH, AP). By the 200-
cell stage, while the maternal signal of ActnC1 and ActnC2 was not
detected anymore, the entire notochord appeared obviously stained by
both paralogs, suggesting that the first zygotic expression of these two
paralogs was notochord specific (Fig. 2AI, AQ blue arrowheads). This
strong signal remained in the notochord throughout tailbud and early-
hatchling stages, but in mid-hatchlings, while ActnC2 signal was still
obvious in the entire notochord, ActnC1 signal appeared to have fainted in
most of the notochord except in the first most rostral cell (Fig. 2AM blue
arrowhead). By the 200-cell stage, in addition to the notochord, the
ActnC2 expression signal was also detected in an ectodermal domain
restricted to the most distal cells of the tail, corresponding to the
developing tailbud region (Fig. 2AI, AQ yellow arrowhead). This
ActnC2 expression domain in the tailbud remained strongly labeled

Fig. 2. Expression atlas of muscular and cytoplasmic actins during Oikopleura dioica development. Developmental (columns from egg to late-hatchling stage, )
expression analysis by whole-mount in situ hybridization of O. dioicamuscular (A-H, ActnM1; I-P, ActnM2;Q-X, ActnM3; Y-AF, ActnM4) and cytoplasmic (AG-AN, ActnC1; AO-AV,
ActnC2; AW-BD, ActnC3) actin paralogs. Arrowheads: heart (red), paraxial muscle (orange), notochord (blue), epidermis (yellow), nervous system (pink), endoderm (white). Scale bars
for eggs to late-tailbud (A, 50 µm), from early- to late-hatchling (BD, 100 µm).
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during tailbud and hatchling stages, but disappeared by late-hatchling
stage coinciding with the time at which the tail stops elongating
(Fig. 2AV). By the late-tailbud stage, ActnC2 signal showed a new
expression domain broadly extended in the trunk, including endodermal-,
neural- and epidermal-derived tissues, which remained throughout all
analyzed hatchling stages (Fig. 2AS-AV white, pink and yellow arrow-
heads for endodermal, neural and epidermal domains, respectively; for
details see below next result section). By the late-hatchling stage, in
addition to ActnC2, the expression signal of ActnC1 and ActnC3 also
appeared for the first time throughout the trunk (Fig. 2AN, BD).

Overall, the developmental atlas of actin expression revealed that
both muscle and cytoplasmic actin genes have gone through a complex
process of sub-functionalization and/or neofunctionalization after
extensive gene duplications during the evolution of appendicularians,
in which different paralogs would have acquired notorious differences
in their spatio-temporal regulation.

3.3. Detection of actin filaments during Oikopleura dioica
development

To visualize actin filaments we used phalloidin staining. While in
stages prior to tailbud phalloidin stained most cells (data not shown), by
tailbud stage, phalloidin signal was specially obvious in the membranes of
notochordal cells, as well as in the membranes of internal cells of the
trunk, the internal part of the trunk-tail junction, and in a very restricted
area in the most distal part of the tail corresponding to the tailbud
(Fig. 3A). Most regions that were stained for phalloidin recapitulated the
observed expression domains of ActnC1 and ActnC2 (Fig. 3B and
Fig. 2AG-AV). Muscle cells at tailbud stage, however, despite the strong
expression of three ActnM paralogs (namely ActnM1, M2 and M3), did
not show any phalloidin staining, suggesting therefore that actin had not
polymerized yet, and myofilaments had not been formed at this develop-
mental stage (Fig. 3C,D).

After hatching, phalloidin staining revealed the typical “striated”
organization of actin myofilaments of the skeletal muscle throughout
the tail (Fig. 3E-G). The fact that the tail switches 90° respect to the
trunk during O. dioica development (Cañestro et al., 2005) makes the
muscle cells lie in the dorsal and ventral sides of the tail. Thus, from a
ventral view, phalloidin-labeled myofilaments displayed a striated
pattern spanning the width of the notochord (Fig. 3E), whereas from
a lateral view, they appeared as two dense lines close to the membrane
near the notochord (Fig. 3G). In late hatchling stages, phalloidin
staining revealed dark and bright bands of the striated pattern
corresponding to the presence of sarcomeres in the paraxial muscle
in the tail, as well as a clear dark demarcation corresponding to the
border of muscle cells (Fig. 3K). The actin of myofilaments likely
corresponded to the products of ActnM paralogs (Fig. 2).

In late hatchlings, in addition to the broad phalloidin signal labeling
most of the cytoskeleton attached to cell membranes, we observed
strong signal in different parts of the digestive system (i.e. the mid-
dorsal part of the endostyle, the floor and roof of the esophagus, the
internal membranes of stomach lobules, the rectum and the ciliary
rings within the gills), the nervous system (i.e. rostral paired nerves n1,
the sensory vesicle, the ciliary funnel, the ventral organ and some cells
in the anterior third of the caudal ganglion), as well as the base of the
placode derived structures of the Langerhans receptors (Fig. 3G-K). All
these rich actin domains expressed ActnC2, and all of them have in
common either the presence of cilia (Fig. 3K) or axonal projections.

4. Discussion

The present study identifies the complete catalogue of actin genes in
O. dioica, which based on phylogenetic analyses, intron positions,
DAVs and expression patterns is made of four muscular ActnM1–4 and
three cytoplasmic ActnC1–3 genes. Our work also suggests that the
multiple paralogs that belong to each group of actins have been mostly

originated by lineage-specific duplications during the evolution of the
appendicularians. Our results corroborate the muscular and cytoplas-
mic homologies assigned to two actin cDNAs that had previously been
isolated in O. longicauda (Nishino et al., 2000), as well as to six O.
dioica actins predicted by an automatic orthology pipeline designed to
identify muscle genes in deuterostome genomes (Inoue and Satoh,
2018). Previous analyses of ascidian actins (Beach and Jeffery, 1990;
Chiba et al., 2003; Kovilur et al., 1993; Kusakabe et al., 1995, 1992,
1996; Swalla et al., 1994; Tomlinson et al., 1987) together with our
genomic survey and phylogenetic analyses suggest that different
ascidian lineages seem to have also expanded their actin catalogues
independently (i.e. at least 14 in Ciona robusta –formerly C. intesti-
nalis–, 9 in Ciona savignyi, 16 in Phallusia mammillata, 8 in Molgula
oculata, 9 in Molgula occidentalis, 16 in Halocynthia roretzi, and 11
in Botryllus schlosseri) (Sup. File 2 Fig. S2 and S3).

4.1. Ancestral “cardio-paraxial” muscular actin in stem olfactores

In the case of ascidian muscle actins, our phylogenetic study shows
that ascidian-P and -B paralogous groups are present in all ascidian
species analyzed in both Phlebobranchia and Stolidobranchia orders.
This fact reinforces results from previous work that had suggested that
the origin of these paralogous groups was due to an ancient gene
duplication that occurred during early ascidian evolution (Inoue and
Satoh, 2018). Unfortunately, current available sequences do not
contain enough phylogenetic signal to provide robust enough support
to determine if that duplication occurred before or after the appendi-
cularian-ascidian split. Our findings, however, favor the scenario that
the duplication occurred after the appendicularian-ascidian split
because O. dioica ActnMs seem to share a mix of characteristics with
both ascidian-P and -B groups, which may represent the ancestral
urochordate condition. On one side, the DAVs of O. dioica ActnMs are
closer to those of ascidian-P than to those of ascidian-B actins. The
sequence resemblance with ascidian-P may be due to similar molecular
interactions with specific actin-binding proteins of the myosin motor
machinery (Perrin and Ervasti, 2010), which are necessary to drive tail
movement in both O. dioica and ascidian larvae. On the other side, the
expression pattern of O. dioica ActnM1 shares expression domains
with ascidian-P and -B in paraxial muscle and heart (see a summary of
C. robusta actin expression data Sup. File 2 Fig. S4 from ANISEED
(www.aniseed.cnrs.fr); although cross-hybridization between probes of
ascidian-P and -B actin genes, which share an overall 87% of identity,
cannot be discarded (Brozovic et al., 2018)). Our results, therefore, are
consistent with an evolutionary scenario in which stem urochordates
had an ancestral “cardio-paraxial” actin gene that was involved both in
heart and paraxial muscle development (Fig. 4). Then, in agreement
with recent work by Inoue and Satoh (Inoue and Satoh, 2018), after the
split between the appendicularian and ascidian lineages, the ancestral
“cardio-paraxial” actin was duplicated in ascidians, experiencing a
process of subfunctionalization in which ascidian-P actins mostly
evolved under selective restrictions related to motor-tail movement,
and ascidian-B actins mostly evolved under the selection of post-
metamorphic innovations, such as adult body-wall muscle and adult
heart slow paced contractility (Fig. 1B). Studies of further actins in
additional urochordate groups, especially in doliolids and salps and
other appendicularians species, will be necessary to corroborate or
disprove this hypothesis. To our knowledge, appendicularians do not
have any tissue homologous to the body-wall muscle present in
ascidians or some thaliaceans, so further studies of the phylogeny
and expression of actins from these different groups will possibly help
to better understand the origin and evolution of body-wall muscle in
urochordates (Degasperi et al., 2009).

Analyses in vertebrates had hypothesized that the last common
ancestor of vertebrates also had an actin that was expressed both in
paraxial muscle and heart (Vandekerckhove and Weber, 1984). Our
work comparing urochordates and vertebrates points to an older origin
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of the “cardio-paraxial” actin present at least in the last common
ancestor of olfactores (urochordates + vertebrates), since ActnM1 in O.
dioica, the ascidian-B Ci-Ma2 in C. robusta, and the alpha-cardiac
ACTC1 and the alpha-skeletal ACTA1 in vertebrates share expression
in both cardiac and paraxial muscle cell precursors during embryo
development (Fig. 4) (Mayer et al., 1984; Ordahl, 1986; Schwartz et al.,
1986). While ActnM1 seems to be the only ActnM paralog expressed
during heart development in O. dioica, in vertebrates, three alpha
muscle actins are sequentially expressed during cardiac development.
ACTA2 expression starts marking the onset of cardiomyocyte differ-
entiation, which is sequentially replaced first by ACTA1 and later by
ACTC1. This process has been related to the regulation of the specific
functional activities of each actin isoforms in different developmental
stages (Bertola et al., 2008; Ruzicka and Schwartz, 1988; Woodcock-
Mitchell et al., 1988). During skeletal muscle development, sequential
expression of different actins is also observed in vertebrates and O.

dioica. First ACTC1 and next ACTA1 are expressed in vertebrates
(Mayer et al., 1984; Schwartz et al., 1986), and ActnM1 expression is
followed by ActnM2 and ActnM3 in O. dioica. Altogether, our work
highlights similarities as well as differences in the parallel evolution
that actin paralogs have experienced after being independently dupli-
cated in both urochordates and vertebrates, including subfunctionali-
zation leading to temporal regulation (i.e. differential expression
onsets) and tissue specificity (i.e. paraxial vs cardiac) specializations.

Our phylogenetic analysis corroborates that muscular actins were
originated by a gene duplication from an cytoplasmic actin at the base
of chordates, before the split between cephalochordates and olfactores,
which was followed by the recruitment of the myosin motor-machinery
that conferred contractile capability to muscle cells (Inoue and Satoh,
2018). During the evolution of cephalochordates, muscular actins
followed complex and divergent evolutionary histories as proposed by
previous works describing lineage-specific duplications and events of

Fig. 3. Correlation between actin-filament detection by phalloidin-staining and actin paralog gene expression. (A-D) At tailbud stage (lateral views), phalloidin staining
(A, C, magenta) labeled cells in the trunk, specially of the internal membrane of the epidermal cells and the cells in the internal area of the trunk-tail junction (yellow arrowhead),
notochord (n) and the tailbud (tb), consistently with ActnC2 expression (B), but it did not label muscle (m) cells (white dots on Hoeschst-stained nuclei in blue) despite the strong
expression of ActnM genes (D). (E-F) After hatching, however, phalloidin-stained myofilaments in muscle cells could be observed from a ventral view displaying a striated pattern (E),
and forming two lines near the notochord from a lateral view (F). (G-J) In late hatchling stages, phalloidin labeled endodermal tissues such the endostyle (en), esophagus (es), stomach
lobes (sl), the ciliary rings in the gills (gs) and anus (a), neural derivatives such as the paired nerves 1 (n1), ciliary funnel (cf), sensory vesicle (sv), ventral organ (vo), caudal ganglion (cg),
and the placode derived Langerhans receptors (lr). The presence of actin in these organs was consistent with the expression of ActnC2. All these structures had in common either the
presence of cilia or axonal projections. In tail shift stage (K), phalloidin-stained cilia were easily observed within the stomach lobe. At this stage, phalloidin staining also revealed the
presence of dark and light bands typical of sarcomeres of the striated muscle, and it also labeled the limits of each muscle cell (white arrowheads).
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gene conversion in cephalochordates (Fig. 1A) (Inoue and Satoh, 2018;
R. Kusakabe et al., 1997a, 1999; Suzuki and Satoh, 2000). Our analysis
of DAVs supports a distinctive evolutionary pattern of cephalochordate
actins in which none of the muscular actins of amphioxus shows the
characteristic high positive values of muscle actins in olfactores
(Fig. 1B and Sup. File 1), but they have lower positive DAVs close
to a “neutral” region, in which actins likely share characteristics of both
muscular and cytoplasmic actins (Fig. 1B). Overall, our results suggest
that the evolutionary restrictions of muscle actins related to interac-
tions with motor actin-binding proteins differ between cephalochor-
dates and olfactores.

4.2. Ancestral notochord-specific cytoplasmic actin in stem chordates

Cephalochordates have a third type of actins, named amphioxus-N
(notochord) actins that are expressed in the notochord together with
many other motor-proteins that confer contractile capability to the
notochord (Fig. 4) (Suzuki and Satoh, 2000; Urano et al., 2003). Our
phylogenetic analyses and relatively not too negative DAV results of
amphioxus-N actins are compatible with the work by Inoue and Satoh
that suggested that these actins originated from a duplication of a
cytoplasmic actin gene (Inoue and Satoh, 2018), and likely suffered a
convergent selective process towards contractile muscular actins.
Considering the notochord-specific expression of amphioxus-N actins,
our finding that O. dioica ActnC1 and ActnC2 are tissue-specific with a
prominent expression in the notochord, allow us to infer that the
expression of cytoplasmic actins in the notochord likely represents the
ancestral condition already present at least in stem chordates (Fig. 4).
In ascidians, several studies have shown a fundamental role of actin
filaments in notochord convergent extension processes during mor-
phogenesis as well as providing stiffness to notochord structure (Jiang
and Smith, 2007; Munro and Odell, 2002a, 2002b). Our results
detecting actin filaments in the notochord (Fig. 3) are compatible with
a potential conservation of actin functions between O. dioica and
ascidians. To our knowledge, however, no evidence has been found
supporting the expression of muscle genes in the notochord of
ascidians or appendicularians (Hotta et al., 2000; Jiang and Smith,
2007; Kugler et al., 2011; Takahashi et al., 1999 an our unpublished
data). Our findings, therefore, are consistent with the recently postu-
lated hypothesis by Inoue and Satoh, in which the evolution of the
amphioxus-N actin and recruitment of muscle genetic machinery in the
notochord of cephalochordates would be an innovation of this lineage

(Inoue and Satoh, 2018), whereas the urochordate non-contractile
actin-expressing notochord, as it is currently found in O. dioica, would
reflect the ancestral condition of stem chordates (Fig. 4).

In the last years, the evolutionary origin of the notochord has been a
hot topic of discussion (Annona et al., 2015; Brunet et al., 2015; Hejnol
and Lowe, 2014), especially after the axochord hypothesis suggesting
that the notochord could have evolved by modification of a ventrome-
dian muscle axochord present in stem bilaterians (Lauri et al., 2014).
During the characterization of the axochord in different bilaterians,
phalloidin staining has shown the presence of actin expression in this
structure (Lauri et al., 2014). In the light of our new data showing that
the notochord-specific expression of cytoplasmic actins is an ancestral
chordate condition, future comparative studies of the regulatory
mechanisms of actin expression in the axochord and in the notochord,
as well as investigations on whether homologous actins are responsible
for the process of midline convergence of both axochord (Lauri et al.,
2014) and notochord (Jiang and Smith, 2007) could shed some light on
the evolution of the notochord, and therefore in the origin of chordates.

4.3. Tissue-specificity and temporal regulation of cytoplasmic actins
related to cilia and axonal projections

The notion that cytoplasmic actins are housekeeping genes with
constitutive and ubiquitous expression patterns is an extended idea
that lately has been challenged, for instance, by cases in which actin
expression has been shown not to be appropriate to normalize RNA or
protein quantification (Lin and Redies, 2012; Ruan and Lai, 2007). Our
results show that from the three ActnC paralogs of O. dioica, only
ActnC3 displays a broad non-tissue specific expression pattern con-
sistent with a housekeeping role. Its ubiquitous expression could be
related to its possible retrotranscriptional origin and subsequent
insertion in a genomic location driving its transcription in a non-
tissue-specific manner. In contrast to ActnC3, the other two paralogs
ActnC1 and ActnC2 show remarkable tissue-specific and temporally-
regulated expression patterns, not compatible with housekeeping roles
(Figs. 2 and 3). In O. dioica, the expression domains of these two ActnC
paralogs –besides the notochord– correlates with regions characterized
by either the presence of cilia or axonal projections, as well as regions
with presumptive high cell proliferation. In the endostyle, for instance,
the expression domain of ActnC2 is restricted to the central part of the
endostyle (mostly dorsal, but also ventral; Fig. 3H, J). This region is
characterized by the presence of ciliated cells that project giant cilia

Fig. 4. Schematic representation of the actin evolution in chordates. Muscular actins were originated by an ancestral duplication from a cytoplasmic gene at the base of the
chordate superphylum, followed by the acquisition of contractility by the recruitment of the myosin motor-machinery in muscle cells. The ancestral muscle actin of olfactores already
played “cardio-paraxial” roles, as currently reflected by ActnM1 in O. dioica. Extensive gene duplications independently expanded muscular actins in vertebrates, appendicularians and
ascidians, in the latter originating two paralogous groups, ascidian-P and -B actins. Cytoplasmic actins in chordates show tissue-specific expression patterns, challenging the
housekeeping notion classically ascribed to these cytoplasmic (C) actins. Interestingly, our results showing notochord-specific cytoplasmic actins in O. dioica likely represents the
ancestral condition of chordates. During the evolution of cephalochordates, the recruitment of the myosin motor-machinery to the ancestral cytoplasmic-N actins led also to the
acquisition of contractility of the notochord in this lineage. DAV analysis likely reflects the different selective restrictions that apply to the evolution of diagnostic positions according to
protein-protein interactions of each group of actins (color code is labeled as in Fig. 1B).
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that can be easily observed with phalloidin staining towards the
corridor of this organ (Fig. 3G,I), in which they wind the food trapping
secretions towards the pharynx lumen. In the digestive system, ActnC2
is highly expressed in the esophagus, left and right stomach lobes,
vertical and mid intestine, and rectum, which all of them are
characterized by the presence of ciliated cells (Burighel and Brena,
2001)(Fig. 3G-J). In the pharyngo-branchial region, the expression
domains of ActnC1 and ActnC2 also correlates with the presence of
cilia in the pharynx and the ciliary rings in the gills, the beating of
which induce water circulation from the mouth to the gill slits, or in
opposite direction depending on the orientation of the beating
(Fig. 3G-J). In the epidermis, the expression domains of ActnC2
correlates with the presence of ciliated sensory cells, including the
mechanosensory cells in the circumoral organ, the ventral organ and
the mechanoreceptors of the Langerhans cells (Fig. 3G-J). These
sensory structures have been described to be evolutionary related to
placodes, which have been hypothesized to be key innovations for the
origin and evolution of sensory organs in olfactores (Bassham and
Postlethwait, 2005; Manni et al., 2004). In the nervous system, the
expression domains of ActnC2 correlates with either the presence of
cilia (i.e. coronet cells in the sensory vesicle whose cilia touch the
statocyte likely related to responses to positional cues such as vibration,
acceleration or gravity (Bone, 1998; Olsson, 1975)) or axonal projec-
tions, such as those forming the rostral paired nerves n1, nerves
innervating the ventral organ or neurons in the caudal ganglia
projecting towards the motor system (Bollner et al., 1986; Burighel
et al., 2011; Cañestro et al., 2005; Soviknes et al., 2007; Soviknes and
Glover, 2007). Interestingly, most of these ActnC2 expression domains
with cilia and axonal projections also express one of the two Pax2/5/8
paralogs of O. dioica (Bassham et al., 2008; Cañestro et al., 2008;
Cañestro and Postlethwait, 2007), suggesting a potential role of this
transcription factor upstream of ActnC2 during the development of
cilia and axonal projections. Finally, we observe ActnC2 expression in
the most distal part of the tail (Fig. 2AQ-AU), a region in which
presumably high cell proliferation and cell differentiation may be
occurring related to the process of tail elongation. Our finding of
non-ubiquitous expression of ActnC genes in O. dioica is consistent
with the tissue-specificity already described for a cytoplasmic actin
gene in the ascidian Halocynthia roretzi, which showed prominent
expression in mesenchymal cells of the trunk, in epidermal mechan-
oreceptor cells, neurons, cells with cytoplasmic extensions, as well as
faint expression in the notochord (Araki et al., 1996). We can conclude,
therefore, that the tissue-specificity of cytoplasmic actin genes is likely
an ancestral condition of urochordates.

Overall, our results highlight that during the evolution of chordates,
cytoplasmic actins did not simply play housekeeping roles, but they
also displayed tissue-specific and temporally-regulated expression
patterns during a complex evolutionary history with extensive gene
duplications. The role of actins in axon projections and the formation
of cilia and flagella seems to be of ancient origin (Quarmby, 2014;
Roblodowski and He, 2017). However, the recruitment of cytoplasmic
actin genes for the development of ciliated cells present in placode-like
sensory organs and pharyngo-branchial structures, the recruitment of
cytoplasmic actin genes for the development of the notochord, and the
duplication of cytoplasmic genes that gave rise to muscular actins
involved in cardio-paraxial development appear as crucial events
associated to key evolutionary innovations of the chordate body plan.
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Summary of the excel file:
The first tab calculates the Matrix of DAVs per poition according to ascidian and vertebrate actins
The second tab calculates the DAV values for all analyzed sequences
The third tab shows a list of all chordate actins according to their DAVs from muscular to cytoplasmic

Correspondence between the ϭϲ positions and those used to differentiate between
muscular and citoplasmatic actins in chordates ;in parenthesisͿ after Kusakabe et al., ϭϵϵϵ
ϭ ;ϱͿ Ϯ;ϲͿ ϯ;ϭϬͿ ϰ;ϭϲͿ ϱ;ϭϳͿ ϲ;ϳϲͿ ϳ;ϭϬϯͿ ϴ;ϭϮϵͿ ϵ;ϭϲϮͿ ϭϬ;ϭϳϲͿ ϭϭ;ϮϬϭͿ ϭϮ;ϮϲϬͿ ϭϯ;ϮϲϳͿ ϭϰ;ϮϴϳͿ ϭϱ;ϮϵϳͿ ϭϲ;ϯϲϱͿ
Reference sequence: BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϰͲBbCAϭͲKusakabeϵϵͲCYTO
KXVakabe, R., SaWRh, N., HRlland, L.Z., KaVakabe, T., 1999. GenRmic RUgani]aWiRn and
eYRlXWiRn Rf acWin geneV in Whe amShiR[XV BUanchiRVWRma belcheUi and BUanchiRVWRma flRUidae. Gene 227, 1-10

Supplemetary File 1. Algorithm to calculate the Diagnostic aminoacid values 

(DAV) according to the conservation of diagnostic positions. 
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OaŶͺENSOANTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϵϭͺENSOANPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϴϵT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϲϲͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϱϴT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϭϰϯͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϬϵϳT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
SclͺXϲϭϬϰϮͺSƉMAϭͲKŽǀilƵƌϵϯͲadƵlƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϯͺBƐMAϮaͲDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲbŽdǇWallCaƌdiacQ T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϭϬϴϳϱgϭϬϯϱϲͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϵϰϬϯgϮϳϯϬϴͺCCͺmƵƐcleͲACTQ T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϬϴϯϵ͘gϭϭϳϴϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T T N A V T I I N S
GgaͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϴϭϭϴϵͺͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϵϬͲENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϯϱϮϯT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϯϳϯϯϭ͘gϮϴϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉX X X X X X T V N S V T I I N A
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV P V M C V T T X I T T I V X S
OdiͺScϱϬͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϴϬϬϬϭΎcǇƚŽV A I M C V T T T I T T I V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϮ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI T V M C V I T T I T T I V T S
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϮͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTV A V M C V V T T L T T I V T S
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϳϵϬϯͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϯͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V V T T I T T I V T S
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϭϳϱͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTT V V M C V V A T I T V I V T S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϱϮϯϬϭ͘gϯϬϱϯϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI T I M C V V T T L T A L V A A
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T V M C V I T T L T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϲ͘ϬϮ͘ƉS P V M C V V T T M T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϬͺCCͺE A V M C V C S T I T T I V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϮͺCCͺV A V M C V C T T I T T I V T S
HƐaͺACTBLϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϰϭϲϳϬϲL S V M C V I T I L T A L V T A
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϮͺDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲCYTOS A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϯϲϲϭgϴϰϮϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTS A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϳϯϭϬϵgϮϵϬϴϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTS S V M C V C S T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϴϳϳϰϴgϯϴϭϭϯͺCCͲcŽŶƚigͺϵϯϳϲͺgϮϰϲϰϭCCͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTV A V M C V C A T I T A I V T S
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϬϳϴϭ͘gϬϬϯϮϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV T I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϮϳ͘gϬϳϯϭϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT A V M C V V C T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϭϱϭϰgϳϯϴϳͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϰϱϲϯgϮϰϲϰϭͺCCX X X X X V C A T I T A I V T S
HƐaͺACTBͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϰϵϵϲϬͺacƚiŶͲbeƚaI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
OlŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϲͺOilCAϭͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
OdiͺScϭ͘ϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϯϳϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
OdiͺScϰϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϭϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
HƐaͺACTGϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϯϭϱϭϰͺacƚiŶͲgammaͲϭI A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϯϵϭϳϲͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲƚǇƉeͲϱI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
GgaͺACTBͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϲϱϳͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲϭͲAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲϭͲI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϮϲϴϬͺacƚiŶͲgammaͲϭI A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
LchͺACTBͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϮϳϬI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
PmaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϭϭϯͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϬϲϳI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
PmaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϴϲͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϲϳI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϵϳϵϰϱ͘gϬϴϯϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϭϰϬϲͺgϮϳϰϲͺCCͺX X X X X V C S T L T A L V T S
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϯϴͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϭϳͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϰϴϱͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
CƌŽͺGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϮͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V I T T L T A L V T S
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϱϬ͘gϬϵϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϯϴϳϮϬ͘gϬϮϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V A T S T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϯ͘ϬϮ͘ƉA A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮϮ͘gϬϱϯϲϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
CƌŽͺGRAILϮͲϯϭͲϭͺNONEI A I M C V V A T L T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϮϯϱϲ͘gϬϭϭϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI S V M C V V X T L T S L V T S

Maƚƌiǆ A͗  aŵiŶŽ acidƐ iŶ ƚhe ϭϲ ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶƐ Žf ŵƵƐcƵůaƌ ;ƌedͿ aŶd cǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic ;bůƵeͿ acƚiŶƐ iŶ ŽůfacƚŽƌeƐ
accŽƌdiŶg ƚŽ ƉhǇůŽgeŶeƚic aŶaůǇƐiƐ ƵƐed ƚŽ caůcƵůaƚe ƚhe fƌeƋƵeŶcǇ Žf each aŵiŶŽ acid iŶ each ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ

NaŵeͰƉŽƐiƚiŽŶƐ ϭ Ϯ ϯ ϰ ϱ ϲ ϳ ϴ ϵ ϭϬ ϭϭ ϭϮ ϭϯ ϭϰ ϭϱ ϭϲ
HƐaͺACTCϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϬϯϳϴͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcůeͲϭT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A CŽƵŶƚ Žf aŵiŶŽ acid fŽƌ each ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ iŶ Maƚƌiǆ A fŽƌ ŵƵƐcƵůaƌ acƚiŶƐ
HƐaͺACTAϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϱϱϲϰϱͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϭͲƐkeůeƚaůͲŵƵƐcůeT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A MƵƐcƵůaƌ ƐeƋƵeŶceƐ  ;ϲϮ ƐeƋƵeŶceƐͿ ƚhreshold ǀalƵe ;ƚo be presenƚ in aƚ leasƚ ϮϬй of ƚhe seqƵencesͿ ϭϮ͕ϰ
OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϱͺOiůMAϭͲBAAϴϲϮϭϳͺOiůMAϮͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϮϰT ϲϭT ϲϭC ϲϭL ϰϵV ϲϬI ϰϳT ϲϭV ϲϮN ϯϲM ϲϮV ϲϮT ϲϬI ϲϮI ϲϮN ϰϳA
OdiͺScϭ͘ϮͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϳϱϲϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϯϱQ X X X ϭϮC X ϭϱV ϭT ϮϯA ϮV X
OdiͺScϯϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϭϭϰϭϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϮS X ϭQ ϴS
OdiͺScϰϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϮϰϬϬϬϬϭΎͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A X ϮS
OdiͺScϳϱͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϲϴϭϳϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A Seůecƚ aŵiŶŽ acid N Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϲϮ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϲϮ Ϭ CŽƵŶƚeƌ Žf aŵiŶŽacid Ɛeůecƚed iŶ Sϭϭ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϴϬϰϮͺAcƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲƐkeůeƚaůͲŵƵƐcůeT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A
LchͺacƚaϭaͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϲϴϳT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A CŽƵŶƚ Žf aŵiŶŽ acid fŽƌ each ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ iŶ Maƚƌiǆ A fŽƌ cǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic acƚiŶƐ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϵϴϴͺAcƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcůeͲϭT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A CǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic ;ϰϮ ƐeƋƵeŶceƐͿ ƚhreshold ǀalƵe ;ƚo be presenƚ in aƚ leasƚ ϮϬй of ƚhe seqƵencesͿ ϴ͕ϰ
LchͺACTCϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϰϬϮT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϴV ϮP ϯϯV ϰϬM ϰϬC ϰϮV ϮT ϯϮT X ϵI ϰϮT ϳT ϭϬI ϰϮV X ϰϬS
LŽcͺǌgcͺϴϲϳϬϵͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϱT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϮI ϯϬA ϳI X X ϰI ϱA ϰϬT ϯϭL ϭV ϯϮL ϰϬT ϮA
LŽcͺacƚcϭaͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϱϱϳͲENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϳϮͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϰϬT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϯT ϰT X ϯϬV ϯS ϭI ϭM ϯϯA ϭA
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϰϵͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϭT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϰS ϭV ϲC ϭC ϭS ϭS  
HƐaͺACTGϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϱϭϯϳͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲeŶƚeƌicT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭE ϯS X
HƐaͺACTAϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϮϰϳϴϰͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲaŽƌƚaS T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭL X
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϰϴϬͺŵƵƐcůeͲGRAILϯϮͲϱϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϮͲadƵůƚHeaƌƚͲbŽdǇWaůůQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A X
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϴϱϯͺŵƵƐcůeͲACTQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭA
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰ͘gϬϴϴϱϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺBACϱϯϳϲϲͺHƌMAaͲKaǁahaƌaϬϮͲadƵůƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A Seůecƚ aŵiŶŽ acid N Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ CŽƵŶƚeƌ Žf aŵiŶŽacid Ɛeůecƚed iŶ SϮϯ 
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮ͘gϬϯϮϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϴϲͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϲϲϬͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϱϭϵͲŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A Maƚƌiǆ Žf DAVƐ Ɖeƌ ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ͗
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϳϴϳͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϵϴϭͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϳϭϴENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϵϰϳͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A If ƚhe fƌeƋƵeŶcǇ Žf aŶ aa iŶ a giǀeŶ ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ iƐ gƌeaƚeƌ ƚhaŶ ϮϬй ;ϭϮ͘ϰ fŽƌ ŵƵƐcƵůaƌ acƚiŶ aŶd ϴ͘ϰ fŽƌ cǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͿ͕ ƚhe DAV Ɖeƌ ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ iƐ нϭ fŽƌ ŵƵƐcƵůaƌ aŶd Ͳϭ fŽƌ cǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰϱϯ͘gϭϰϴϯϬͬgϭϰϴϯϯͬgϭϰϴϯϰͲSϰϯϵ͘gϬϴϳϰϳͲSϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A If ƚhe aa iƐ aůƐŽ ƉƌeƐeŶƚ iŶ ƚhe Žƚheƌ gƌŽƵƉ͕ ƚhe DAV iƐ cŽƌƌecƚed bǇ ƐƵbƚƌacƚiŶg ƚhe fƌeƋƵeŶcǇ Žf ƚhe aa iŶ ƚhe Žƚheƌ gƌŽƵƉ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϲϵϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A aa ŵƵƐcƵůaƌ͗ ϭͲ;cŽƵŶƚ Žf ƚhe aa iŶ cǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͬϰϮͿ͖  aa cǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic͗ Ͳϭн;cŽƵŶƚ Žf ƚhe aa iŶ ŵƵƐcƵůaƌͬϲϮͿ
CƌŽͺGRAILϮϮϳͲϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϯͲeŵbƌǇŽŶicLaƌǀaůQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A If ƚhe aa fƌeƋƵeŶcǇ iŶ a giǀeŶ ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ iƐ ůŽǁeƌ ƚhaŶ ϮϬй͕ ƚhe DAV Ɖeƌ ƉŽƐiƚiŽŶ iƐ ǌeƌŽ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϱͬgϭϯϯϭϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A PŽƐϭ PŽƐϮ PŽƐϯ PŽƐϰ PŽƐϱ PŽƐϲ PŽƐϳ PŽƐϴ PŽƐϵ PŽƐϭϬ PŽƐϭϭ PŽƐϭϮ PŽƐϭϯ PŽƐϭϰ PŽƐϭϱ PŽƐϭϲ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϳϭϴͬgϬϲϴϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A R Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺDϮϵϬϭϰͺHƌMAϭaͲKƵƐakabeϵϱͲůaƌǀaQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A H Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺDϭϬϴϴϳͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϬϳϮϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϭϯϲϱϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺHƌMAϰaͲKƵǁakabeϵϮͲůaƌǀaT T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A K Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϯϰϴ͘gϬϵϵϵϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A D Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϱϬϭϲ͘gϬϭϴϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A E Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϲϲϯϰϴ͘gϭϱϳϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A S Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϴϵϬϰϱ͘gϬϳϭϰϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A T Ϭ͕ϵϮϵ Ϭ͕ϵϬϱ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ͕ϴϯϯ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ
ScůͺXϲϭϬϰϬͺScTbϭͲKŽǀiůƵƌϵϯͲůaƌǀaQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A N Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϳϬϲͺŵƵƐcůeͲACTQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A Q ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϱϰϱϵ͘gϬϰϮϱϴͲSϳϰϮϲϰ͘gϬϱϭϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A C Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ ͲϬ͕ϴϬϲ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
MŽcƵůͺDϳϴϭϵϬͺMŽcƵMAϭͲKƵƐakabeϵϲͲůaƌǀaQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A U Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
GgaͺACTGϮͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϴϭϬϯͺƉeƉͺƉƌŽƚeiŶͺcŽdiŶgT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A G Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϯϵͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϱϯͺacƚiŶͲaŽƌƚicͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeS T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A P Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϮϯͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϭϱT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A A Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϵϱϮ
XƚƌͺAcƚϯͺNPͺϵϴϵϬϳϲ͘ϭͺacƚiŶͺͺaůƉhaͺƐaƌcŽŵeƌicͬƐkeůeƚaůT T C L V I T V N Q V T I I N A I Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϳϲϮ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϰϳϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X L Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮ͘gϬϰϬϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X M Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϵϳϲ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϬ͘gϭϭϳϳϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X F Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϱ͘gϭϱϳϲϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X W Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰ͘gϬϮϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X Y Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϮϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϴϮT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N X V Ͳϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ ϭ Ͳϭ ͲϬ͕ϳϱϴ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϲϮϬͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϱϳϭT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N X X Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϰϰϬϰϵ͘gϬϮϯϭϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲBAAϭϮϴϲϬͺMŽcƵMAϮͲKƵƐakabeϵϳͲbŽdǇWaůůQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S
MŽcƵůͺLϮϭϵϭϱͺMcMAϭͲSǁaůůaϵϰͲadƵůƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϵϱϭϱϵ͘gϭϴϱϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϲϬϮϴϮ͘gϬϲϬϳϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V X T V N S V T I I N A
PƐiͺENSPSITϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϰϵͺENSPSIPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϭϰT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
OaŶͺENSOANTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϵϭͺENSOANPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϴϵT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϲϲͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϱϴT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϭϰϯͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϬϵϳT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A
SclͺXϲϭϬϰϮͺSƉMAϭͲKŽǀilƵƌϵϯͲadƵlƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϯͺBƐMAϮaͲDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲbŽdǇWallCaƌdiacQ T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϭϬϴϳϱgϭϬϯϱϲͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϵϰϬϯgϮϳϯϬϴͺCCͺmƵƐcleͲACTQ T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϬϴϯϵ͘gϭϭϳϴϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T T N A V T I I N S
GgaͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϴϭϭϴϵͺͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϵϬͲENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϯϱϮϯT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϯϳϯϯϭ͘gϮϴϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉX X X X X X T V N S V T I I N A
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV P V M C V T T X I T T I V X S
OdiͺScϱϬͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϴϬϬϬϭΎcǇƚŽV A I M C V T T T I T T I V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϮ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI T V M C V I T T I T T I V T S
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϮͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTV A V M C V V T T L T T I V T S
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϳϵϬϯͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϯͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V V T T I T T I V T S
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϭϳϱͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTT V V M C V V A T I T V I V T S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϱϮϯϬϭ͘gϯϬϱϯϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI T I M C V V T T L T A L V A A
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T V M C V I T T L T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϲ͘ϬϮ͘ƉS P V M C V V T T M T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϬͺCCͺE A V M C V C S T I T T I V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϮͺCCͺV A V M C V C T T I T T I V T S
HƐaͺACTBLϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϰϭϲϳϬϲL S V M C V I T I L T A L V T A
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϮͺDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲCYTOS A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϯϲϲϭgϴϰϮϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTS A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϳϯϭϬϵgϮϵϬϴϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTS S V M C V C S T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϴϳϳϰϴgϯϴϭϭϯͺCCͲcŽŶƚigͺϵϯϳϲͺgϮϰϲϰϭCCͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTV A V M C V C A T I T A I V T S
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϬϳϴϭ͘gϬϬϯϮϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV T I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϮϳ͘gϬϳϯϭϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT A V M C V V C T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϭϱϭϰgϳϯϴϳͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϰϱϲϯgϮϰϲϰϭͺCCX X X X X V C A T I T A I V T S
HƐaͺACTBͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϰϵϵϲϬͺacƚiŶͲbeƚaI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
OlŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϲͺOilCAϭͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
OdiͺScϭ͘ϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϯϳϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
OdiͺScϰϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϭϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
HƐaͺACTGϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϯϭϱϭϰͺacƚiŶͲgammaͲϭI A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϯϵϭϳϲͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲƚǇƉeͲϱI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
GgaͺACTBͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϲϱϳͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲϭͲAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲϭͲI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϮϲϴϬͺacƚiŶͲgammaͲϭI A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
LchͺACTBͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϮϳϬI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
PmaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϭϭϯͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϬϲϳI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
PmaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϴϲͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϲϳI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϵϳϵϰϱ͘gϬϴϯϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϭϰϬϲͺgϮϳϰϲͺCCͺX X X X X V C S T L T A L V T S
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϯϴͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϭϳͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϰϴϱͺcǇƚŽƉlaƐmicͲACTV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
CƌŽͺGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϮͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V I T T L T A L V T S
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϱϬ͘gϬϵϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϯϴϳϮϬ͘gϬϮϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V A T S T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϯ͘ϬϮ͘ƉA A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮϮ͘gϬϱϯϲϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S
CƌŽͺGRAILϮͲϯϭͲϭͺNONEI A I M C V V A T L T A L V T S
Pmamm͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϮϯϱϲ͘gϬϭϭϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI S V M C V V X T L T S L V T S
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MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϵϳϵϰϱ͘gϬϴϯϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϵϳϵϰϱ͘gϬϴϯϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϮͺDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲCYTOS A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϮ BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϮͺDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲCYTOϬ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϯϲϲϭgϴϰϮϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTS A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϮ BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϯϲϲϭgϴϰϮϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTϬ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϭϰϬϲͺgϮϳϰϲͺCCͺX X X X X V C S T L T A L V T S Ͳϴ͕ϴϳ BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϭϰϬϲͺgϮϳϰϲͺCCͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϳϯϭϬϵgϮϵϬϴϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTS S V M C V C S T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϲϴ BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϳϯϭϬϵgϮϵϬϴϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϯϴͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϭϳͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϯϴͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϭϳͲϭͲCYTOͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϰϴϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϰϴϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƌŽͺGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϮͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V I T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϲϲ CƌŽͺGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϮͲϭͲCYTOͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϮͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTV A V M C V V T T L T T I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϴϮ CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϮͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϱϬ͘gϬϵϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϱϬ͘gϬϵϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϯϴϳϮϬ͘gϬϮϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V A T S T A L V T S Ͳϭϯ͕ϰϰ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϯϴϳϮϬ͘gϬϮϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϳϵϬϯͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϯͲϭͲCYTOV A V M C V V T T I T T I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϴϮ CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϳϵϬϯͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϯͲϭͲCYTOͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϭϳϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTT V V M C V V A T I T V I V T S Ͳϴ͕ϳϱ CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϭϳϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
OdiͺScϱϬͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϴϬϬϬϭΎcǇƚŽV A I M C V T T T I T T I V T S Ͳϵ͕ϭϭ OdiͺScϱϬͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϴϬϬϬϭΎcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϯ͘ϬϮ͘ƉA A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϮ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϯ͘ϬϮ͘ƉϬ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϭϱϭϰgϳϯϴϳͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϰϱϲϯgϮϰϲϰϭͺCCX X X X X V C A T I T A I V T S Ͳϳ͕ϭϭ BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϭϱϭϰgϳϯϴϳͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϰϱϲϯgϮϰϲϰϭͺCCϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϴϳϳϰϴgϯϴϭϭϯͺCCͲcŽŶƚigͺϵϯϳϲͺgϮϰϲϰϭCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTV A V M C V C A T I T A I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϵϮ BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϴϳϳϰϴgϯϴϭϭϯͺCCͲcŽŶƚigͺϵϯϳϲͺgϮϰϲϰϭCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮϮ͘gϬϱϯϲϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮϮ͘gϬϱϯϲϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϮϬϮϳϬϬFͲƚϭͺNONEV A V M C V V S T L T A L I A S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰ BbeͺBRBEϮϬϮϳϬϬFͲƚϭͺNONEͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϮϬϭϲ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϰϱϯϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTV A V M C V V S T I T A L I T S ͲϭϮ͕ϰϰ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϮϬϭϲ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϰϱϯϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϮϬϭϴ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϳϵϲϬϳͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTV A V M C V V S T L T T I I S S Ͳϳ͕ϴϰ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϮϬϭϴ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϳϵϲϬϳͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϵϱϴϮϭͺeǀŵϭͺgeŶeсACTBV A V M C V V S T L T T I I T S Ͳϴ͕ϴϰ BůaͺBLϵϱϴϮϭͺeǀŵϭͺgeŶeсACTBͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϵϱϴϮϬͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBV A V M C V V S T L T T I I T S Ͳϴ͕ϴϰ BůaͺBLϵϱϴϮϬͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϴϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C I V T T M V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϱ BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϴϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϭϱϴ͘ϭͺV A V M C I V T T M V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϱ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϭϱϴ͘ϭͺͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϭϵϴϰϲͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсENSGϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϳϴϬϳV A V M C I V T T M V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϱ BůaͺBLϭϵϴϰϲͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсENSGϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϳϴϬϳͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϮϭϱϴϳϬRͲBRBEϮϵϰϭϯϬFͲBRBEϮϭϱϴϵϬRͲBAAϵϲϱϰϱͬϲͬϳͺBbNAϯBbNAϭͬϮͬϯͲSƵǌƵŬiϬϬͲŶŽƚŽchŽƌdV A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BbeͺBRBEϮϭϱϴϳϬRͲBRBEϮϵϰϭϯϬFͲBRBEϮϭϱϴϵϬRͲBAAϵϲϱϰϱͬϲͬϳͺBbNAϯBbNAϭͬϮͬϯͲSƵǌƵŬiϬϬͲŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϱϮϱ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϱϮϯϳͲBRAFLϭϭϰϵϲϲͲBRAFLϭϭϰϵϲϳͺŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲACTV A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϱϮϱ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϱϮϯϳͲBRAFLϭϭϰϵϲϲͲBRAFLϭϭϰϵϲϳͺŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϬϴϯϴϯͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTGϮͺScϬϬϬϬϯϮϮсϮϲϴϳϱϮͲϮϳϬϬϱϯͲBLϬϱϱϯϱͲBLϭϮϬϮϵͲBLϭϮϭϬϵͲNŽƚŽchŽƌdV A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BůaͺBLϬϴϯϴϯͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTGϮͺScϬϬϬϬϯϮϮсϮϲϴϳϱϮͲϮϳϬϬϱϯͲBLϬϱϱϯϱͲBLϭϮϬϮϵͲBLϭϮϭϬϵͲNŽƚŽchŽƌdͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϮϱϱϲϰͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTGϮV A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BůaͺBLϮϱϱϲϰͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTGϮͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϯϭϯϯ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϲϵϰϴͺŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲACTV A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϯϭϯϯ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϲϵϰϴͺŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲACTͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƌŽͺGRAILϮͲϯϭͲϭͺNONEI A I M C V V A T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϯ͕ϰϰ CƌŽͺGRAILϮͲϯϭͲϭͺNONEͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϮ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϱϮϯϬϭ͘gϯϬϱϯϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI T I M C V V T T L T A L V A A Ͳϵ͕ϲϵ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϱϮϯϬϭ͘gϯϬϱϯϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϬϳϴϭ͘gϬϬϯϮϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV T I M C V V T T L T A L V T S ͲϭϮ͕ϱϭ MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϬϳϴϭ͘gϬϬϯϮϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T V M C V I T T L T A L V T S ͲϭϬ͕ϴϯ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϮ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI T V M C V I T T I T T I V T S Ͳϵ͕ϭϲ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϮ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϯͺBƐMAϮaͲDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲbŽdǇWaůůCaƌdiacQ T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S ϭϭ͕Ϭϵ BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϯͺBƐMAϮaͲDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲbŽdǇWaůůCaƌdiacϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϭϬϴϳϱgϭϬϯϱϲͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϵϰϬϯgϮϳϯϬϴͺCCͺŵƵƐcůeͲACTQ T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S ϭϭ͕Ϭϵ BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϭϬϴϳϱgϭϬϯϱϲͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϵϰϬϯgϮϳϯϬϴͺCCͺŵƵƐcůeͲACTϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϰϴϬͺŵƵƐcůeͲGRAILϯϮͲϱϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϮͲadƵůƚHeaƌƚͲbŽdǇWaůůQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳ CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϰϴϬͺŵƵƐcůeͲGRAILϯϮͲϱϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϮͲadƵůƚHeaƌƚͲbŽdǇWaůůϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϴϱϯͺŵƵƐcůeͲACTQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳ CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϴϱϯͺŵƵƐcůeͲACTϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰ͘gϬϴϴϱϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺBACϱϯϳϲϲͺHƌMAaͲKaǁahaƌaϬϮͲadƵůƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰ͘gϬϴϴϱϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺBACϱϯϳϲϲͺHƌMAaͲKaǁahaƌaϬϮͲadƵůƚϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϰϰϬϰϵ͘gϬϮϯϭϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲBAAϭϮϴϲϬͺMŽcƵMAϮͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϳͲbŽdǇWaůůQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϴϱ MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϰϰϬϰϵ͘gϬϮϯϭϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲBAAϭϮϴϲϬͺMŽcƵMAϮͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϳͲbŽdǇWaůůϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮ͘gϬϯϮϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮ͘gϬϯϮϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcƵůͺLϮϭϵϭϱͺMcMAϭͲSǁaůůaϵϰͲadƵůƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϴϱ MŽcƵůͺLϮϭϵϭϱͺMcMAϭͲSǁaůůaϵϰͲadƵůƚϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϵϱϭϱϵ͘gϭϴϱϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϳϴ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϵϱϭϱϵ͘gϭϴϱϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϴϲͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϲϲϬͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϱϭϵͲŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϴϲͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϲϲϬͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϱϭϵͲŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϳϴϳͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϵϴϭͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϳϭϴENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϵϰϳͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϳϴϳͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϵϴϭͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϳϭϴENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϵϰϳͺŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰϱϯ͘gϭϰϴϯϬͬgϭϰϴϯϯͬgϭϰϴϯϰͲSϰϯϵ͘gϬϴϳϰϳͲSϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰϱϯ͘gϭϰϴϯϬͬgϭϰϴϯϯͬgϭϰϴϯϰͲSϰϯϵ͘gϬϴϳϰϳͲSϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ

SƵŵŵaƚŝŽŶ ŽĨ ƚŽƚaů DAVƐ ĨŽƌ aůů cŚŽƌĚaƚĞ aŶaůǇǌĞĚ ƐĞƋƵĞŶcĞƐ DAVƐ ƉĞƌ ƉŽƐŝƚŝŽŶ ĨŽƌ aůů cŚŽƌĚaƚĞ aŶaůǇǌĞĚ ƐĞƋƵĞŶcĞƐ
NaŵeͰƉŽƐiƚiŽŶƐ ϭ Ϯ ϯ ϰ ϱ ϲ ϳ ϴ ϵ ϭϬ ϭϭ ϭϮ ϭϯ ϭϰ ϭϱ ϭϲTŽƚaů DAVƐ NaŵeͰƉŽƐiƚiŽŶƐ ϭ Ϯ ϯ ϰ ϱ ϲ ϳ ϴ ϵ ϭϬ ϭϭ ϭϮ ϭϯ ϭϰ ϭϱ ϭϲ
HƐaͺACTCϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϬϯϳϴͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcůeͲϭT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ HƐaͺACTCϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϬϯϳϴͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcůeͲϭϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƐaͺACTAϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϱϱϲϰϱͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϭͲƐŬeůeƚaůͲŵƵƐcůeT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ HƐaͺACTAϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϱϱϲϰϱͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϭͲƐŬeůeƚaůͲŵƵƐcůeϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϱͺOiůMAϭͲBAAϴϲϮϭϳͺOiůMAϮͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴ OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϱͺOiůMAϭͲBAAϴϲϮϭϳͺOiůMAϮͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
OdiͺScϭ͘ϮͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϳϱϲϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴ OdiͺScϭ͘ϮͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϳϱϲϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
OdiͺScϯϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϭϭϰϭϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴ OdiͺScϯϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϭϭϰϭϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
OdiͺScϰϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϮϰϬϬϬϬϭΎͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴ OdiͺScϰϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϮϰϬϬϬϬϭΎͺŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
OdiͺScϳϱͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϲϴϭϳϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeQ T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴ OdiͺScϳϱͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϲϴϭϳϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůeϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƐaͺACTGϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϱϭϯϳͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲeŶƚeƌicT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϱϬ HƐaͺACTGϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϱϭϯϳͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲeŶƚeƌicϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƐaͺACTAϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϮϰϳϴϰͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲaŽƌƚaS T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϮ͕ϱϳ HƐaͺACTAϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϮϰϳϴϰͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲaŽƌƚaϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƐaͺACTBͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϰϵϵϲϬͺacƚiŶͲbeƚaI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ HƐaͺACTBͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϰϵϵϲϬͺacƚiŶͲbeƚaͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϲͺOiůCAϭͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϲͺOiůCAϭͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
OdiͺScϭ͘ϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϯϳϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ OdiͺScϭ͘ϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϯϳϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
OdiͺScϰϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϭϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽV A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ OdiͺScϰϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϭϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
HƐaͺACTGϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϯϭϱϭϰͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϭI A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϮ HƐaͺACTGϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϯϭϱϭϰͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϭͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
HƐaͺACTBLϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϰϭϲϳϬϲL S V M C V I T I L T A L V T A Ͳϵ͕ϴϰ HƐaͺACTBLϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϰϭϲϳϬϲϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϯϵϭϳϲͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲƚǇƉeͲϱI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϯϵϭϳϲͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲƚǇƉeͲϱͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
GgaͺACTBͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϲϱϳͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭͲAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭͲI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ GgaͺACTBͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϲϱϳͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭͲAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭͲͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϮϲϴϬͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϭI A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϮ GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϮϲϴϬͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϭͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
LchͺACTBͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϮϳϬI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ LchͺACTBͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϮϳϬͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
PŵaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϭϭϯͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϬϲϳI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ PŵaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϭϭϯͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϬϲϳͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
PŵaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϴϲͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϲϳI A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϮ PŵaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϴϲͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϲϳͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϱͺBbMAϭͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϵͲŵƵƐcůeA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϱͺBbMAϭͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϵͲŵƵƐcůeϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BbeͺBAAϭϯϯϱϭͲKƵƐaŬabeRͲŵƵƐcůeA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BbeͺBAAϭϯϯϱϭͲKƵƐaŬabeRͲŵƵƐcůeϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϳ͘ϭͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϴ͘ϭA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϳ͘ϭͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϴ͘ϭϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϵ͘ϭͺA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϵ͘ϭͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϭ͘ϭͺA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϭ͘ϭͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BůaͺBLϭϴϬϭϳͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BůaͺBLϭϴϬϭϳͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BůaͺBLϮϰϱϭϮͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭA T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϲ BůaͺBLϮϰϱϭϮͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϬ͘ϭͺA T C L V V T S T L V A L I N S ϭ͕ϵϵ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϬ͘ϭͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϮ͘ϭͺA T V L V V S A V L V A L I N A ϭ͕ϴϲ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϮ͘ϭͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϯ͘ϭͺA T V L V V S A V L V A L I N A ϭ͕ϴϲ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϯ͘ϭͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϲϰϵϳ͘ϭͺNWͺϬϬϯϭϬϭϰϰϭ͘ϭA T V M C V T T V L I A L I T C Ͳϱ͕ϵϯ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϲϰϵϳ͘ϭͺNWͺϬϬϯϭϬϭϰϰϭ͘ϭϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
BůaͺBLϬϴϴϵϵͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBA T V M C V T T V L I A L I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϬ BůaͺBLϬϴϴϵϵͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϭϵϯϳ͘ϭͺA T C M C V T S T L V A L I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϭϵϯϳ͘ϭͺϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϬϯϮϲϴͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсENSGϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϳϴϬϳA T C M C V T S T L V A L I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮ BůaͺBLϬϯϮϲϴͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсENSGϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϳϴϬϳϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϭϵϵϭϭͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭA T C L V V T S V L T A L I I S ͲϬ͕Ϭϭ BůaͺBLϭϵϵϭϭͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϲϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽI A V M C V V C T L V T I I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϰ BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϲϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϳϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽV A I M C V V T T L V T I I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϮ BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϳϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϭϵϬϬϱͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBV A I M C V V T T L V T I I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϮ BůaͺBLϭϵϬϬϱͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϮϰϵϰϭϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicV A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰ BbeͺBRBEϮϰϵϰϭϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϲϬϳϮ͘ϭͺBAAϭϯϯϱϬͺBRAFLϱϲϲϴϳͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϳͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicV A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰ BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϲϬϳϮ͘ϭͺBAAϭϯϯϱϬͺBRAFLϱϲϲϴϳͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϳͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BůaͺBLϭϬϬϳϮͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBV A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰ BůaͺBLϭϬϬϳϮͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTBͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϰͲBbCAϭͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϵͲCYTOV A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰ BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϰͲBbCAϭͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϵͲCYTOͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
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CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϲϵϭͺŵƵƐcleQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϲϵϭͺŵƵƐcleϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
CƌŽͺGRAILϮϮϳͲϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϯͲeŵbƌǇŽŶicLaƌǀalQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ CƌŽͺGRAILϮϮϳͲϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϯͲeŵbƌǇŽŶicLaƌǀalϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϱͬgϭϯϯϭϰ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϱͬgϭϯϯϭϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϰϳϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϰϱ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϰϳϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϳϭϴͬgϬϲϴϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϳϭϴͬgϬϲϴϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƌŽͺDϮϵϬϭϰͺHƌMAϭaͲKƵƐakabeϵϱͲlaƌǀaQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ HƌŽͺDϮϵϬϭϰͺHƌMAϭaͲKƵƐakabeϵϱͲlaƌǀaϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮ͘gϬϰϬϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϰϱ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮ͘gϬϰϬϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϬ͘gϭϭϳϳϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϯϴ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϬ͘gϭϭϳϳϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϱ͘gϭϱϳϲϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϯϴ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϱ͘gϭϱϳϲϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
HƌŽͺDϭϬϴϴϳͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϬϳϮϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϭϯϲϱϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺHƌMAϰaͲKƵǁakabeϵϮͲlaƌǀaT T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϯ HƌŽͺDϭϬϴϴϳͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϬϳϮϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϭϯϲϱϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺHƌMAϰaͲKƵǁakabeϵϮͲlaƌǀaϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰ͘gϬϮϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϰϱ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰ͘gϬϮϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϯϰϴ͘gϬϵϵϵϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϯϰϴ͘gϬϵϵϵϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϱϬϭϲ͘gϬϭϴϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϱϬϭϲ͘gϬϭϴϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϲϲϯϰϴ͘gϭϱϳϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϲϲϯϰϴ͘gϭϱϳϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϯϳϯϯϭ͘gϮϴϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉX X X X X X T V N S V T I I N A ϴ͕ϱϬ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϯϳϯϯϭ͘gϮϴϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϴϵϬϰϱ͘gϬϳϭϰϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϴϵϬϰϱ͘gϬϳϭϰϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
SclͺXϲϭϬϰϬͺScTbϭͲKŽǀilƵƌϵϯͲlaƌǀaQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ SclͺXϲϭϬϰϬͺScTbϭͲKŽǀilƵƌϵϯͲlaƌǀaϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϳϬϲͺŵƵƐcleͲACTQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϳϬϲͺŵƵƐcleͲACTϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϬϴϯϵ͘gϭϭϳϴϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T T N A V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϲϬ MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϬϴϯϵ͘gϭϭϳϴϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϱϰϱϵ͘gϬϰϮϱϴͲSϳϰϮϲϰ͘gϬϱϭϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ MŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϱϰϱϵ͘gϬϰϮϱϴͲSϳϰϮϲϰ͘gϬϱϭϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcƵlͺDϳϴϭϵϬͺMŽcƵMAϭͲKƵƐakabeϵϲͲlaƌǀaQ T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬ MŽcƵlͺDϳϴϭϵϬͺMŽcƵMAϭͲKƵƐakabeϵϲͲlaƌǀaϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϲϬϮϴϮ͘gϬϲϬϳϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉQ T C L V X T V N S V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϰϬ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϲϬϮϴϮ͘gϬϲϬϳϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
GgaͺACTGϮͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϴϭϬϯͺƉeƉͺƉƌŽƚeiŶͺcŽdiŶgT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϱϬ GgaͺACTGϮͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϴϭϬϯͺƉeƉͺƉƌŽƚeiŶͺcŽdiŶgϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϴϬϰϮͺAcƚiŶͲalƉhaͲƐkeleƚalͲŵƵƐcleT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϴϬϰϮͺAcƚiŶͲalƉhaͲƐkeleƚalͲŵƵƐcleϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LchͺacƚaϭaͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϲϴϳT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ LchͺacƚaϭaͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϲϴϳϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϵϴϴͺAcƚiŶͲalƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcleͲϭT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϵϴϴͺAcƚiŶͲalƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcleͲϭϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LchͺACTCϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϰϬϮT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ LchͺACTCϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϰϬϮϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LŽcͺǌgcͺϴϲϳϬϵͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϱT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ LŽcͺǌgcͺϴϲϳϬϵͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϱϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LŽcͺacƚcϭaͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϱϱϳͲENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϳϮͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϰϬT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ LŽcͺacƚcϭaͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϱϱϳͲENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϳϮͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϰϬϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϯϵͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϱϯͺacƚiŶͲaŽƌƚicͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcleS T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϮ͕ϱϳ GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϯϵͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϱϯͺacƚiŶͲaŽƌƚicͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcleϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϮϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϴϮT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N X ϭϮ͕ϱϱ LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϮϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϴϮϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϮϯͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϭϱT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϱϬ LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϮϯͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϭϱϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϲϮϬͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϱϳϭT T C L C I T V N M V T I I N X ϭϮ͕ϱϱ LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϲϮϬͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϱϳϭϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϰϵͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϭT T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϭ LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϰϵͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϭϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
XƚƌͺAcƚϯͺNPͺϵϴϵϬϳϲ͘ϭͺacƚiŶͺͺalƉhaͺƐaƌcŽŵeƌicͬƐkeleƚalT T C L V I T V N Q V T I I N A ϭϰ͕ϯϯ XƚƌͺAcƚϯͺNPͺϵϴϵϬϳϲ͘ϭͺacƚiŶͺͺalƉhaͺƐaƌcŽŵeƌicͬƐkeleƚalϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
GgaͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϴϭϭϴϵͺͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϵϬͲENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϯϱϮϯT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N S ϵ͕ϵϳ GgaͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϴϭϭϴϵͺͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϵϬͲENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϯϱϮϯϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
PƐiͺENSPSITϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϰϵͺENSPSIPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϭϰT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵ PƐiͺENSPSITϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϰϵͺENSPSIPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϭϰϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
OaŶͺENSOANTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϵϭͺENSOANPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϴϵT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵ OaŶͺENSOANTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϵϭͺENSOANPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϴϵϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϲϲͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϱϴT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵ LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϲϲͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϱϴϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϭϰϯͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϬϵϳT T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵ LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϭϰϯͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϬϵϳϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ
SclͺXϲϭϬϰϮͺSƉMAϭͲKŽǀilƵƌϵϯͲadƵlƚQ T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϴϱ SclͺXϲϭϬϰϮͺSƉMAϭͲKŽǀilƵƌϵϯͲadƵlƚϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϮϭϯϳϯϬFͲƚϭͺŵƵƐcleT T C L C V C V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϭϯ BbeͺBRBEϮϭϯϳϯϬFͲƚϭͺŵƵƐcleϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϵ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϮϲϯϮϴͺŵƵƐcleͲACTT T C L C V C V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϭϯ BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϵ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϮϲϯϮϴͺŵƵƐcleͲACTϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BbeͺBRBEϮϭϯϳϲϬFͲƚϭͲBRBEϮϭϯϳϰϬFͲƚϭͺŵƵƐcleT T V L V V T V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϴϵ BbeͺBRBEϮϭϯϳϲϬFͲƚϭͲBRBEϮϭϯϳϰϬFͲƚϭͺŵƵƐcleϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϴ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϱϯϰϱͺŵƵƐcleͲACTT T V L V V T V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϴϵ BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϴ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϱϯϰϱͺŵƵƐcleͲACTϬ͕ϵϯ Ϭ͕ϵϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϲ͘ϬϮ͘ƉS P V M C V V T T M T A L V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϲ͘ϬϮ͘ƉϬ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϮϯϱϲ͘gϬϭϭϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉI S V M C V V X T L T S L V T S ͲϭϮ͕ϰϰ MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϮϯϱϲ͘gϬϭϭϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϮϳ͘gϬϳϯϭϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉT A V M C V V C T L T A L V T S ͲϭϮ͕ϱϭ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϮϳ͘gϬϳϯϭϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉϬ͕ϵϯ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉV P V M C V T T X I T T I V X S Ͳϳ͕ϭϭ Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϴϯ Ϭ͕ϳϲ Ͳϭ͕ϬϬ Ϭ͕ϬϬ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϳ.ϭͺA T I L C V I A A M X T I I N S ϯ͕ϴϬ BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϳ.ϭͺϬ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϵϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϵϴ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϴϯ Ϭ,ϳϲ ϭ,ϬϬ ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BlaͺBLϭϬϲϰϰͺevmϬͺgeneсACTAϮA T I L C V I A A M V T I I N S ϰ͕ϴϬ BlaͺBLϭϬϲϰϰͺevmϬͺgeneсACTAϮϬ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϵϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϵϴ ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϴϯ Ϭ,ϳϲ ϭ,ϬϬ ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BscͺbotctgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϬͺCCͺE A V M C V C S T I T T I V T S Ͳϵ͕Ϭϴ BscͺbotctgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϬͺCCͺϬ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϴϯ Ϭ,ϳϲ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BscͺbotctgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϮͺCCͺV A V M C V C T T I T T I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕Ϭϳ BscͺbotctgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϮͺCCͺ-ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϵϴ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϴϯ Ϭ,ϳϲ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϴϴϬϬϳ.ϭͺD I V M C V V S T E V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϰ BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϴϴϬϬϳ.ϭͺϬ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϳϲ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϴϯ Ϭ,ϳϲ ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BlaͺBLϭϭϱϱϭͺevmϬͺgeneсACTBD I V M C V V S T E S T I M T S Ͳϱ͕ϴϰ BlaͺBLϭϭϱϱϭͺevmϬͺgeneсACTBϬ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϳϲ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϴϯ Ϭ,ϳϲ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϭϲϬ.ϭΎͺNWͺϬϬϯϭϬϭϯϳϰ.ϭͺϯϯϮϮϰϵ..ϯϳϯϭϵϲͺX X X X X V I S T E A A I I V S ͲϮ͕ϭϭ BflͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϭϲϬ.ϭΎͺNWͺϬϬϯϭϬϭϯϳϰ.ϭͺϯϯϮϮϰϵ..ϯϳϯϭϵϲͺϬ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϳϲ ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ
BlaͺBLϬϲϴϮϳͺevmϬͺgeneсACTBV S V M C V I S T Q V A I I I S Ͳϰ͕ϵϮ BlaͺBLϬϲϴϮϳͺevmϬͺgeneсACTB-ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϭ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ ϭ,ϬϬ -ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϳϲ ϭ,ϬϬ Ϭ,ϬϬ -Ϭ,ϴϳ

MĂƚƌŝǆ ŽĨ DAsƐ ƉĞƌ ƉŽƐŝƚŝŽŶ͗ ;ŵŝƌƌŽƌͿ
PŽƐϭ PŽƐϮ PŽƐϯ PŽƐϰ PŽƐϱ PŽƐϲ PŽƐϳ PŽƐϴ PŽƐϵ PŽƐϭϬ PŽƐϭϭ PŽƐϭϮ PŽƐϭϯ PŽƐϭϰ PŽƐϭϱ PŽƐϭϲ

R Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
H Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
K Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
D Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
E Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
^ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ͲϬ͕ϴϳ
d Ϭ͕ϵϮϵ Ϭ͕ϵϬϱ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϵϱ ͲϬ͕ϵϴ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ͕ϴϯϯ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ
N Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ
Q ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
C Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ ͲϬ͕ϴϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
h Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
G Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
P Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
A Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϵϱϮ
I Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϳϲϮ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
L Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
M Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ͕ϵϳϲ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
F Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
t Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
z Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
s Ͳϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ ϭ Ͳϭ ͲϬ͕ϳϲ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ͳϭ Ϭ Ϭ
y Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ Ϭ
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LiƐƚ Žf chŽƌdaƚe acƚiŶƐ ƐŽƌƚed fƌŽm gƌeaƚeƌ ƚŽ Ɛmalleƌ DAVƐ
ŶaŵeͰƉŽƐiƚiŽŶƐ ϭ Ϯ ϯ ϰ ϱ ϲ ϳ ϴ ϵ ϭϬ ϭϭ ϭϮ ϭϯ ϭϰ ϭϱ ϭϲ CŽlŽƌ cŽded DAVƐ

CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϴϲͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϲϲϬͲENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϱϭϵͲŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϳϴϳͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϵϴϭͲENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϳϭϴENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϵϰϳͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰϱϯ͘gϭϰϴϯϬͬgϭϰϴϯϯͬgϭϰϴϯϰͲSϰϯϵ͘gϬϴϳϰϳͲSϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϲϵϭͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
CƌŽͺGRAILϮϮϳͲϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϯͲeŵbƌǇŽŶicLaƌǀaů Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮϰ͘gϭϯϯϭϱͬgϭϯϯϭϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϳϭϴͬgϬϲϴϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
HƌŽͺDϮϵϬϭϰͺHƌMAϭaͲKƵƐakabeϵϱͲůaƌǀa Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϯϰϴ͘gϬϵϵϵϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϱϬϭϲ͘gϬϭϴϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϲϲϯϰϴ͘gϭϱϳϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϴϵϬϰϱ͘gϬϳϭϰϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
ScůͺXϲϭϬϰϬͺScTbϭͲKŽǀiůƵƌϵϯͲůaƌǀa Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϳϬϲͺŵƵƐcůeͲACT Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϱϰϱϵ͘gϬϰϮϱϴͲSϳϰϮϲϰ͘gϬϱϭϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
MŽcƵůͺDϳϴϭϵϬͺMŽcƵMAϭͲKƵƐakabeϵϲͲůaƌǀa Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϱͺOiůMAϭͲBAAϴϲϮϭϳͺOiůMAϮͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
OdiͺScϭ͘ϮͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϳϱϲϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
OdiͺScϯϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϭϭϰϭϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
OdiͺScϰϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϮϰϬϬϬϬϭΎͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
OdiͺScϳϱͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϲϴϭϳϬϬϭͺŵƵƐcůe Q T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
HƌŽͺDϭϬϴϴϳͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϬϳϮϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺMTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϳϱ͘gϭϯϲϱϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺHƌMAϰaͲKƵǁakabeϵϮͲůaƌǀa T T C L V I T V N A V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϯϯϯϯϯϯ
HƐaͺACTCϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϬϯϳϴͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcůeͲϭ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
HƐaͺACTAϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϱϱϲϰϱͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϭͲƐkeůeƚaůͲŵƵƐcůe T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϴϬϰϮͺAcƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲƐkeůeƚaůͲŵƵƐcůe T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
LchͺacƚaϭaͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϲϴϳ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϵϴϴͺAcƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲcaƌdiacͲŵƵƐcůeͲϭ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
LchͺACTCϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϯϰϬϮ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
LŽcͺǌgcͺϴϲϳϬϵͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϱ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
LŽcͺacƚcϭaͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϱϱϳͲENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϳϮͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϬϰϬ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϰϵͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϭ T T C L V I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϱ͕ϯϬϵϱϮϯϴ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭ͘gϬϲϰϳϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϰϱϮϯϴϭϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮ͘gϬϰϬϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϰϱϮϯϴϭϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϰ͘gϬϮϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϰϱϮϯϴϭϬ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϬ͘gϭϭϳϳϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ T T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϱ͘gϭϱϳϲϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ T T C L V I T V N A V T I I N X ϭϰ͕ϯϴϬϵϱϮϰ
XƚƌͺAcƚϯͺNPͺϵϴϵϬϳϲ͘ϭͺacƚiŶͺͺaůƉhaͺƐaƌcŽŵeƌicͬƐkeůeƚaů T T C L V I T V N Q V T I I N A ϭϰ͕ϯϯϯϯϯϯϯ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϰϴϬͺŵƵƐcůeͲGRAILϯϮͲϱϵͲϭͺCiͲMAϮͲadƵůƚHeaƌƚͲbŽdǇWaůů Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳϬϱϬϲϵ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϴϱϯͺŵƵƐcůeͲACT Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳϬϱϬϲϵ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰ͘gϬϴϴϱϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺBACϱϯϳϲϲͺHƌMAaͲKaǁahaƌaϬϮͲadƵůƚ Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳϬϱϬϲϵ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮ͘gϬϯϮϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϲϳϬϱϬϲϵ
HƐaͺACTGϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϵϱϭϯϳͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲeŶƚeƌic T T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϱϬϯϬϳϮϮ
GgaͺACTGϮͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϴϭϬϯͺƉeƉͺƉƌŽƚeiŶͺcŽdiŶg T T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϱϬϯϬϳϮϮ
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϮϯͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϳϯϭϱ T T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϱϬϯϬϳϮϮ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϲϬϮϴϮ͘gϬϲϬϳϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V X T V N S V T I I N A ϭϯ͕ϰϬϰϳϲϭϵ
HƐaͺACTAϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϮϮϰϳϴϰͺacƚiŶͲaůƉhaͲϮͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůeͲaŽƌƚa S T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϮ͕ϱϳϰϱϬϬϴ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϯϵͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϬϮϱϯͺacƚiŶͲaŽƌƚicͲƐŵŽŽƚhͲŵƵƐcůe S T C L C I T V N M V T I I N A ϭϮ͕ϱϳϰϱϬϬϴ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϮϭͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϴϮ T T C L C I T V N M V T I I N X ϭϮ͕ϱϱϬϲϵϭϮ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϲϮϬͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϱϳϭ T T C L C I T V N M V T I I N X ϭϮ͕ϱϱϬϲϵϭϮ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϰϰϬϰϵ͘gϬϮϯϭϵ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͲBAAϭϮϴϲϬͺMŽcƵMAϮͲKƵƐakabeϵϳͲbŽdǇWaůů Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϴϰϳϭϱϴϮ
MŽcƵůͺLϮϭϵϭϱͺMcMAϭͲSǁaůůaϵϰͲadƵůƚ Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϴϰϳϭϱϴϮ
ScůͺXϲϭϬϰϮͺSƉMAϭͲKŽǀiůƵƌϵϯͲadƵůƚ Q T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϴϰϳϭϱϴϮ
PƐiͺENSPSITϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϰϵͺENSPSIPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϬϭϰ T T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵϮϲϮϲϳ
OaŶͺENSOANTϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϵϭͺENSOANPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϳϴϵ T T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵϮϲϮϲϳ
LŽcͺENSLOCTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϲϲͺENSLOCPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϲϯϱϴ T T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵϮϲϮϲϳ
LchͺENSLACTϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϭϰϯͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϱϬϵϳ T T C L C I V V N M V T I I N A ϭϭ͕ϳϵϮϲϮϲϳ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϰϵϱϭϱϵ͘gϭϴϱϴϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ T T C L V I V V N M V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϳϳϱϳϮϵϲ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϬϴϯϵ͘gϭϭϳϴϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ Q T C L V I T T N A V T I I N S ϭϭ͕ϱϵϳϱϰϮϮ
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϯͺBƐMAϮaͲDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲbŽdǇWaůůCaƌdiac Q T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S ϭϭ͕ϬϴϱϮϱϯϱ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϭϬϴϳϱgϭϬϯϱϲͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϵϰϬϯgϮϳϯϬϴͺCCͺŵƵƐcůeͲACT Q T C L V I V V N M V T V I N S ϭϭ͕ϬϴϱϮϱϯϱ
GgaͺENSGALTϬϬϬϬϬϬϴϭϭϴϵͺͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϰϭϵϬͲENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϮϯϱϮϯ T T C L C I V V N M V T I I N S ϵ͕ϵϲϵϮϳϴϬ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϯϳϯϯϭ͘gϮϴϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ X X X X X X T V N S V T I I N A ϴ͕ϱϬϬϬϬϬϬ
BůaͺBLϭϬϲϰϰͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTAϮ A T I L C V I A A M V T I I N S ϰ͕ϳϵϴϳϳϭϭ
BbeͺBRBEϮϭϯϳϲϬFͲƚϭͲBRBEϮϭϯϳϰϬFͲƚϭͺŵƵƐcůe T T V L V V T V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϴϵϬϵϯϳϬ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϴ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϱϯϰϱͺŵƵƐcůeͲACT T T V L V V T V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϴϵϬϵϯϳϬ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϳ͘ϭͺ A T I L C V I A A M X T I I N S ϯ͕ϳϵϴϳϳϭϭ
BbeͺBRBEϮϭϯϳϯϬFͲƚϭͺŵƵƐcůe T T C L C V C V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϭϯϮϭϬϰϱ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϵ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϮϲϯϮϴͺŵƵƐcůeͲACT T T C L C V C V T M V A L I N S ϯ͕ϭϯϮϭϬϰϱ
BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϱͺBbMAϭͲKƵƐakabeϵϵͲŵƵƐcůe A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BbeͺBAAϭϯϯϱϭͲKƵƐakabeRͲŵƵƐcůe A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϳ͘ϭͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϴ͘ϭ A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϳϵϵ͘ϭͺ A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϭ͘ϭͺ A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BůaͺBLϭϴϬϭϳͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭ A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BůaͺBLϮϰϱϭϮͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭ A T C L V V C S T L V A L I N A Ϯ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϬ͘ϭͺ A T C L V V T S T L V A L I N S ϭ͕ϵϴϲϭϳϱϭ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϮ͘ϭͺ A T V L V V S A V L V A L I N A ϭ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϴϬϯ͘ϭͺ A T V L V V S A V L V A L I N A ϭ͕ϴϱϳϭϰϮϵ
BůaͺBLϭϵϵϭϭͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTCϭ A T C L V V T S V L T A L I I S ͲϬ͕ϬϭϯϴϮϰϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϭϲϬ͘ϭΎͺNWͺϬϬϯϭϬϭϯϳϰ͘ϭͺϯϯϮϮϰϵ͘͘ϯϳϯϭϵϲͺ X X X X X V I S T E A A I I V S ͲϮ͕ϭϬϵϬϲϯϬ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϭϵϯϳ͘ϭͺ A T C M C V T S T L V A L I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϬϮϳϲϱ
BůaͺBLϬϯϮϲϴͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсENSGϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϳϴϬϳ A T C M C V T S T L V A L I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϬϮϳϲϱ
BbeͺBRBEϮϭϱϴϳϬRͲBRBEϮϵϰϭϯϬFͲBRBEϮϭϱϴϵϬRͲBAAϵϲϱϰϱͬϲͬϳͺBbNAϯBbNAϭͬϮͬϯͲSƵǌƵkiϬϬͲŶŽƚŽchŽƌd V A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϱϮϱ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϱϮϯϳͲBRAFLϭϭϰϵϲϲͲBRAFLϭϭϰϵϲϳͺŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲACT V A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
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BůaͺBLϬϴϯϴϯͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTGϮͺScϬϬϬϬϯϮϮсϮϲϴϳϱϮͲϮϳϬϬϱϯͲBLϬϱϱϯϱͲBLϭϮϬϮϵͲBLϭϮϭϬϵͲNŽƚŽchŽƌd V A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BůaͺBLϮϱϱϲϰͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTGϮ V A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϯϭϯϯ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϲϵϰϴͺŶŽƚŽchŽƌdͲACT V A V M C V V T N L V T I I N S Ͳϯ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϴϴϬϬϳ͘ϭͺ D I V M C V V S T E V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϰϬϮϰϱϴ
BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϴϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽ V A V M C I V T T M V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϰϳϵϮϲϯ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϭϱϴ͘ϭͺ V A V M C I V T T M V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϰϳϵϮϲϯ
BůaͺBLϭϵϴϰϲͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсENSGϬϬϬϬϬϮϲϳϴϬϳ V A V M C I V T T M V T I I T S Ͳϯ͕ϴϰϳϵϮϲϯ
BůaͺBLϬϲϴϮϳͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTB V S V M C V I S T Q V A I I I S Ͳϰ͕ϵϭϱϱϭϰϲ
BůaͺBLϭϭϱϱϭͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTB D I V M C V V S T E S T I M T S Ͳϱ͕ϴϰϬϮϰϱϴ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϲϰϵϳ͘ϭͺNWͺϬϬϯϭϬϭϰϰϭ͘ϭ A T V M C V T T V L I A L I T C Ͳϱ͕ϵϯϯϭϳϵϳ
BůaͺBLϬϴϴϵϵͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTB A T V M C V T T V L I A L I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϬϰϭϰϳϱ
BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϳϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽ V A I M C V V T T L V T I I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BůaͺBLϭϵϬϬϱͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTB V A I M C V V T T L V T I I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BbeͺBRBEϬϮϱϴϲϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽ I A V M C V V C T L V T I I T S Ͳϲ͕ϴϰϬϮϰϱϴ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϭϱϭϰgϳϯϴϳͺCCͺbŽƚcƚgϬϲϰϱϲϯgϮϰϲϰϭͺCC X X X X X V C A T I T A I V T S Ͳϳ͕ϭϬϵϬϲϯϬ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V P V M C V T T X I T T I V X S Ͳϳ͕ϭϭϯϲϳϭϯ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϮϬϭϴ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϳϵϲϬϳͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT V A V M C V V S T L T T I I S S Ͳϳ͕ϴϰϬϮϰϱϴ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϮϭϳϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT T V V M C V V A T I T V I V T S Ͳϴ͕ϳϰϱϬϬϳϳ
BůaͺBLϵϱϴϮϭͺeǀŵϭͺgeŶeсACTB V A V M C V V S T L T T I I T S Ͳϴ͕ϴϰϬϮϰϱϴ
BůaͺBLϵϱϴϮϬͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTB V A V M C V V S T L T T I I T S Ͳϴ͕ϴϰϬϮϰϱϴ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϭϰϬϲͺgϮϳϰϲͺCCͺ X X X X X V C S T L T A L V T S Ͳϴ͕ϴϳϬϵϲϳϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϬͺCCͺ E A V M C V C S T I T T I V T S Ͳϵ͕ϬϴϮϭϴϭϯ
OdiͺScϱϬͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϴϬϬϬϭΎcǇƚŽ V A I M C V T T T I T T I V T S Ͳϵ͕ϭϭϯϲϳϭϯ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ I T V M C V I T T I T T I V T S Ͳϵ͕ϭϲϭϮϵϬϯ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϱϮϯϬϭ͘gϯϬϱϯϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ I T I M C V V T T L T A L V A A Ͳϵ͕ϲϵϭϮϰϰϮ
HƐaͺACTBLϮͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϰϭϲϳϬϲ L S V M C V I T I L T A L V T A Ͳϵ͕ϴϯϳϵϰϭϲ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ T T V M C V I T T L T A L V T S ͲϭϬ͕ϴϮϳϵϱϳϬ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϮϱϰϳϰgϰϱϭϮͺCCͺ V A V M C V C T T I T T I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϬϲϲϬϱϮϮ
BbeͺBRBEϮϰϵϰϭϬRͲƚϭͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic V A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϲϬϲϬϳϮ͘ϭͺBAAϭϯϯϱϬͺBRAFLϱϲϲϴϳͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϳͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵic V A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
BůaͺBLϭϬϬϳϮͺeǀŵϬͺgeŶeсACTB V A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
BbeͺBAAϭϯϰϰϰͲBbCAϭͲKƵƐaŬabeϵϵͲCYTO V A V M C V V S T L T S L I T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
BbeͺBRBEϮϬϮϳϬϬFͲƚϭͺNONE V A V M C V V S T L T A L I A S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϲ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ S P V M C V V T T M T A L V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϰϰϯϭϲϰϰ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϳϯϭϬϵgϮϵϬϴϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT S S V M C V C S T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϲϳϳϰϭϵϰ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϵϳϮͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT V A V M C V V T T L T T I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϳϵϬϯͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϯͲϭͲCYTO V A V M C V V T T I T T I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϴϮϰϭϭϲϳ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϴϳϳϰϴgϯϴϭϭϯͺCCͲcŽŶƚigͺϵϯϳϲͺgϮϰϲϰϭCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT V A V M C V C A T I T A I V T S Ͳϭϭ͕ϵϭϱϱϭϰϲ
BfůͺXPͺϬϬϮϱϵϮϬϭϲ͘ϭͺͺBRAFLϭϭϰϱϯϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT V A V M C V V S T I T A L I T S ͲϭϮ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϮϯϱϲ͘gϬϭϭϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ I S V M C V V X T L T S L V T S ͲϭϮ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϮϳ͘gϬϳϯϭϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ T A V M C V V C T L T A L V T S ͲϭϮ͕ϱϬϲϵϭϮϰ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϬϳϴϭ͘gϬϬϯϮϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V T I M C V V T T L T A L V T S ͲϭϮ͕ϱϭϰϱϵϮϵ
MŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϯϴϳϮϬ͘gϬϮϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V A V M C V V A T S T A L V T S Ͳϭϯ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
CƌŽͺGRAILϮͲϯϭͲϭͺNONE I A I M C V V A T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϯ͕ϰϯϱϰϴϯϵ
HƐaͺACTGϭͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϯϭϱϭϰͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϭ I A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϮϲϴϬͺacƚiŶͲgaŵŵaͲϭ I A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
BƐcͺCAXϰϴϵϴϮͺDegaƐƉeƌiϬϵͲCYTO S A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
BƐcͺbŽƚcƚgϬϯϯϲϲϭgϴϰϮϱͺCCͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT S A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϯ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ A A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
Pŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϵ͘gϬϲϰϮϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V A I M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
CƌŽͺGRAILϭϳϲͲϮϮͲϭͲCYTO V A V M C V I T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϰ͕ϲϲϭϮϵϬϯ
HƐaͺACTBͺENSPϬϬϬϬϬϯϰϵϵϲϬͺacƚiŶͲbeƚa I A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
OůŽͺBAAϴϲϮϭϲͺOiůCAϭͲNiƐhiŶŽϬϬͺcǇƚŽ V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
OdiͺScϭ͘ϭͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϬϬϯϳϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽ V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
OdiͺScϰϵͺGSOIDTϬϬϬϭϯϬϭϮϬϬϭͺcǇƚŽ V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
GgaͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϯϵϭϳϲͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲƚǇƉeͲϱ I A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
GgaͺACTBͺENSGALPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϲϱϳͺAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭͲAcƚiŶͲcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲϭͲ I A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
LchͺACTBͺENSLACPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϵϮϳϬ I A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
PŵaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϭϭϯͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϭϬϲϳ I A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
PŵaͺENSPMATϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϴϲͺENSPMAPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϱϲϳ I A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
MŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϵϳϵϰϱ͘gϬϴϯϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
CƌŽͺENSCINPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϱϯϴͲGRAILϭϳϲͲϭϳͲϭͲCYTO V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
CƐaͺENSCSAVPϬϬϬϬϬϬϭϰϰϴϱͺcǇƚŽƉůaƐŵicͲACT V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϱϬ͘gϬϵϯϴϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
HƌŽͺCG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮϮ͘gϬϱϯϲϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ V A V M C V V T T L T A L V T S Ͳϭϱ͕ϰϭϵϯϱϰϴ
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Supplementary Figure S1. Full detailed maximum-likelihood tree corresponding to Figure 1 in 
Nexus Format, including species names and sequence references identifications and databses 
as indicated in Inoue and Satoh (2018). Full resolution image https://www.sciencedirect.com/s-
cience/article/pii/S0012160617308886
Bbe Branchiostoma belcheri
Bfl Branchiostoma floridae
Bla Branchiostoma lanceolatum
Bsc Botryllus schlosseri
Gga Gallus gallus
Cro Ciona robusta (former Ciona intestinalis)
Csa Ciona savignyi
Hro Halocynthia roretzi
Hsa Homo sapiens
Lch Latimeria chalumnae (coelacanth)

Pma Petromyzon marinus (lamprey)
Loc Lepisosteus oculatus (spotted gar)
Mocul Molgula oculata
Mocci Molgula occidentalis
Odi Oikopleura dioica
Olo Oikopleura longicauda
Pmamm Phallusia mammillata
Psi Pelodiscus sinensis (Chinese softshell turtle)
Oan Ornithorhynchus anatinus (Platypus)
Scl Styela clava
Xtr Xenopus tropicalis
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C H A P T E R  II 

ADAPTIVE EVOLUTION BY MODULAR DECONSTRUCTION OF THE CARDIOPHARYNGEAL GENE 
REGULATORY NETWORK IN APPENDICULARIANS REVEALS THAT ANCESTRAL TUNICATES 
WERE SESSILE 
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A B S T R A C T 
 
The discovery that cephalochordates, rather than tunicates, diverged at the base of 
the chordates challenged the traditional view in which the ancestral chordate had 
a biphasic ascidian-like lifestyle with a pelagic larva and a sessile adult, and 
suggested that the ancestral chordate was entirely free-living as modern amphioxus 
or appendicularians. A key problem in understanding tunicate evolution has been 
the origin of sessility of ascidians, and whether the appendicularian free-living style 
represents a primitive or derived condition of tunicates. To address this problem, 
we have performed comprehensive developmental and genomic comparative 
analyses of the cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network (GRN) between 
appendicularians and ascidians. Our results reveal that the cardiopharyngeal GRN 
has suffered a process of evolutionary deconstruction with massive ancestral losses 
of genes (Mesp, Ets1/2, Gata4/5/6, Mek1/2, Tbx1/10, and RA- and FGF-signaling 
related genes) and subfunctions (e.g. FoxF, Islet, Ebf, Mrf, Dach and Bmp 
signaling). These losses have led to the dismantling of two modules that in ascidians 
are related to early and late multipotent state cells involved in lineage fate 
determination towards first and secondary heart fields, and siphon muscle. Our 
results allow us to propose an evolutionary scenario, in which the evolutionary 
deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN has had an adaptive impact on the 
acceleration of the developmental cardiac program, the redesign of the cardiac 
architecture into an open-wide laminar structure, and the loss of siphon muscle. 
Altogether, these adaptations have facilitated the transition from a sessile ascidian-
like ancestral condition to a pelagic free-living style connected to the innovation of 
the house in appendicularians. 
 

 
 INTRODUCTION 

A key problem in the field of Evolutionary 
Developmental Biology (EvoDevo) is 
understanding the origin and radiation of our own 
phylum, the chordates (Gee, 2018; Satoh, 2016). 
The discovery that tunicates (a.k.a. urochordates) 
are the sister group of vertebrates, and therefore 
that the branching of cephalochordates is basal 
within chordates (Bourlat et al., 2006; Delsuc et 
al., 2006), has provided a novel view of the last 
common ancestor of chordates as a free-living 
organism, in contrast to the traditional view 
proposed by Garstang (1928) in which it had a 
sessile ascidian-like adult lifestyle (Garstang, 
1928). This novel view has brought renewed 
interest in appendicularians, whose complete 
free-living style could parsimoniously represent 

the ancestral condition of tunicates (Berrill, 1950; 
Braun et al., 2020; Swalla et al., 2000) considering 
their most accepted position as the sister group of 
the remaining tunicates (Braun et al., 2020; 
Delsuc et al., 2018; Kocot et al., 2018; Wada, 
1998). In such evolutionary scenario, sessility in 
tunicates would be a derived ascidian trait that 
could have evolved during the acquisition of their 
dramatic larval to adult metamorphosis, an event 
that is absent in appendicularians (Braun et al., 
2020; Giribet, 2018). Certain developmental 
features of appendicularians that resemble 
Aplousobranchiata ascidians, however, have been 
argued to represent traces of sessility, which 
therefore would favor the hypothesis that 
appendicularians have evolved from a tunicate 
ancestor with a sessile adult lifestyle and a larval 

A R T I C L E  I N F O 
 

Keywords: 

Gene loss and adaptive evolution 

Evolutionary modular deconstruction 

Heart development 

Cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network 

Appendicularian and ascidian tunicates 
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dispersal stage similar to ascidians (Stach, 2007; 
Stach et al., 2008; Stach and Turbeville, 2002). 
Thus, the problem of the lifestyle of the last 
common ancestor of tunicates remains unsolved. 

The evolution of the cardiopharyngeal gene 
regulatory network appears to be a pivotal aspect 
to understand the evolution of ascidian and 
vertebrate lifestyles (Diogo et al., 2015; Razy-
Krajka and Stolfi, 2019; Stolfi et al., 2010). The 
hypothesis of “a new heart for a new head” about 
the origin of vertebrates (Diogo et al., 2015), in 
addition to the evolution of placode and neural 
crest derivatives as proposed by Gans and 
Northcutt (Gans and Northcutt, 1983; Horie et al., 
2018; Martik et al., 2019), points to the 
development of a chambered heart and elaborated 
branchiomeric muscles as key evolutionary 
innovations that facilitated the transition from a 
peaceful filter-feeder lifestyle of ancestral 
olfactores to a blistering predatory lifestyle of 
vertebrates. The cardiopharyngeal field is the 
developmental domain that gives rise to the heart 
and branchiomeric muscles from a common pool of 
early cardiopharyngeal progenitors, that after a 
binary-stepwise process of fate choices gives rise 
to the first heart field (FHF), the second heart 
field (SHF) and to branchiomeric muscles (BM), 
the later including arch muscles involved in 
mandibular, facial, and branchial functions in the 
head and neck of vertebrates –reviewed in (Diogo 
et al., 2015). In ascidians, the pharyngeal muscles 
are considered homologous to vertebrates BM, 
and their cardiopharyngeal GRN is highly 
conserved in comparison to vertebrates using a 
homologous model of binary-stepwise fate choices, 
thus becoming an attractive system to study heart 
development at unprecedented spatiotemporal 
single-cell resolution (Christiaen et al., 2010; 
Davidson, 2007; Racioppi et al., 2019; Stolfi et al., 
2010; Wang et al., 2019). Consistent with this 
model, the pre-cardiac master regulator Mesp is 
expressed in multipotent progenitor cells both in 
vertebrates and in ascidians (Devine et al., 2014; 
Lescroart et al., 2014; Saga et al., 1999; Satou et 
al., 2004). During ascidian gastrulation, the 
Mesp+ precardiac cells divide asymmetrically, to 
give rise to the anterior tail muscles (ATM) under 
the influence of RA-signaling (Christiaen et al., 
2008a; Nagatomo and Fujiwara, 2003) and to 
multipotent cardiopharyngeal progenitors (trunk 
ventral cells, TVCs) under the influence of FGF-
signaling (Davidson et al., 2006). TVCs divide and 
migrate to the ventral part of the trunk where 
they will be specified to become first heart 
progenitors (FHP), second heart progenitors 
(SHP) and pharyngeal muscle under the influence 

of FGF and BMP signaling, and the upregulation 
of cardiac and muscular factors including Nk4, 
Hand1/2, Gata4/5/6, Dach and Tbx1/10 as some 
of the crucial members of the cardiopharyngeal 
GRN also conserved in vertebrates (Beh et al., 
2007; Christiaen et al., 2010; Davidson et al., 
2006; Davidson and Levine, 2003; Hutson et al., 
2010; Razy-Krajka et al., 2014; Satou et al., 2004; 
Tirosh-Finkel et al., 2010; Tolkin and Christiaen, 
2016; Wang et al., 2013). 

In contrast to ascidians, as far as we know, the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN in appendicularians has 
never been studied, and therefore whether 
evolutionary differences between the 
cardiopharyngeal GRNs of appendicularians and 
ascidians reflect evolutionary adaptations to the 
active free-living and adult sessile lifestyles of 
these two groups of tunicates, respectively, 
remains unknown. To address this problem, we 
have performed a genome survey of the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN in seven appendicularian 
species, and studied Oikopleura dioica as a model 
to investigate heart development in this group of 
tunicates. Our work reveals that 
appendicularians have suffered an evolutionary 
“deconstruction” of their cardiopharyngeal GRN, 
including numerous losses of essential genes and 
cardiopharyngeal subfunctions of GRN 
components that are crucial in ascidians and 
vertebrates. The term “deconstruction”, originally 
coined in Philosophy and later applied in 
disciplines such as Literature, Architecture, 
Fashion and Cookery, or even in Developmental 
Biology (Hogan, 2004) is not synonymous with 
destruction, but it generally refers to the process 
of dismantling or breaking apart elements that 
traditionally are combined, and whose analysis 
facilitate the recognition of structural modules. In 
the field of EvoDevo, our work shows how the 
evolutionary deconstruction by co-elimination of 
genes and subfunctions during the evolution of 
appendicularians highlights the modular 
organization of the cardiopharyngeal GRN. This 
deconstruction unveils “evolvable modules” that 
can be related to the evolution of multipotent 
cellular states that favored the diversification of 
cardiopharyngeal structures in ascidians and 
vertebrates, but the loss of pharyngeal muscle and 
the simplification of the heart in 
appendicularians. Our results suggest an 
evolutionary scenario in which the deconstruction 
of cardiopharyngeal GRN in appendicularians 
facilitated the transition from an ancestral adult 
ascidian-like sessile style to a pelagic free-living 
style based on the evolutionary innovation of the 
house as the filter-feeding apparatus. Overall, our 



 59 

 

 

work provides an example of the “less is more” 
hypothesis (Olson, 1999) illustrating how the 
study of particular gene losses helps to better 
understand the evolution of adaptations of certain 
groups of animals (Albalat and Cañestro, 2016), 
and supports the notion that O. dioica is a 
successful gene loser among chordates that can be 
used as an attractive evolutionary knockout 
model to understand the impact of gene loss in the 
evolution and modular structure of the 
mechanisms of development in our own phylum 
(Albalat and Cañestro, 2016; Ferrández-Roldán et 
al., 2019). 
 

 MATERIALS AND METHODS 
2.1 Biological material 

O. dioica specimens were obtained from the 
Mediterranean coast of Barcelona (Catalonia, 
Spain). Culturing of O. dioica and embryos 
collections have been performed as previously 
described in Martí-Solans et al., 2015.  
2.2 Genome databases searches and phylogenetic 
analysis 

Protein sequences from the tunicate C. robusta 
and the vertebrate Homo sapiens were used as 
queries in BLASTp and tBLASTn searches in 
genome databases of selected species: 
https://blast.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/Blast.cgi for 
Branchiostoma floridae, Branchiostoma belcheri, 
Gallus gallus, Lepisosteus oculatus, and  
Latimeria chalumnae; http://www.aniseed.cnrs. 
fr/ for ascidian species (Ciona savignyi, Phallusia 
fumigata, Phallusia mammillata, Halocynthia 
roretzi, Halocynthia aurantium, Botryllus 
schlosseri, Botryllus leachii, Molgula occulta, 
Molgula oculata, and Molgula occidentalis); 
http://oikoarrays.biology.uiowa.edu/Oiko/ for O. 
dioica, and a local blast server for six other 
larvacean species (Oikopleura albicans, 
Oikopleura vanhoeffeni, Oikopleura longicauda, 
Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus, Bathochordaeus 
stygius, Fritillaria borealis) with public genomes 
(Naville et al., 2019) and Branchiostoma 
lanceolatum. The orthology between cardiac 
genes was initially assessed by blast reciprocal 
best hit (BRBH) (Wall et al., 2003) and 
subsequently corroborated by phylogenetic 
analysis based on ML inferences calculated with 
PhyML v3.0 and an automatic substitution model 
(Guindon et al., 2010) using protein alignment 
generated by the MUSCLE (Edgar, 2004) 
program and reviewed manually. Accession 
numbers are provided in Sup. Table 1. 

 

2.3 Cloning and expression analysis 
O. dioica genes were PCR amplified from cDNA 

obtained as described in Martí-Solans et al., 2016. 
Then, they were cloned using the Topo TA 
Cloning® Kit (K4530-20, Invitrogen) to 
synthesize antisense digoxigenin (DIG) and 
fluorescein (FITC) riboprobes for whole-mount in 
situ hybridization (WMISH) and double 
fluorescent whole-mount in situ hybridization 
(FWMISH) (Sup. Table 2). The WMISH were 
performed as previously described (Bassham and 
Postlethwait, 2000; Cañestro and Postlethwait, 
2007; Martí-Solans et al., 2016) with minor 
modifications. 

For FWMISH, fixed embryos were rehydrated 
in PBT (PBS/0.2%Tween-20), treated with 50 mM 
DTT in PBT (10 min at room temperature), 
washed in 0.1 M triethanolamine in PBT (2 x 5 
min at room temperature), treated with two 
successive dilutions of acetic anhydride (0.25% 
and 0.5%) in 0.1 M triethanolamine (10 min at 
room temperature), and washed in PBT (2 x 5 min 
at room temperature). Prehybridization and 
hybridization solutions were carried out as for 
WMISH. Prehybridization incubation lasted 2 
hours at 63ºC and hybridization incubation with 
the two probes, at between 0,5-1 ng/µL each, was 
conducted overnight at 63ºC. The next day, 
embryos were washed in successive dilution of 
SSC (2 x 10 min at 65ºC of 2xSSC/0.2%Tween-20; 
2 x 10 min at 65ºC of 0.2xSSC/0.2%Tween-20; 1 x 
5 min at room temperature of 
0.1xSSC/0.2%Tween-20) and twice with MABT 
(0.1 M maleic acid, 0.15 M NaCl, 0.1% Tween 20, 
pH 7.5) for 5 min. Blocking was performed as for 
WMISH and, finally, Anti-fluorescein antibody 
conjugated with POD (1:1000 in blocking solution) 
(11426346910, Roche) was added to the samples 
for overnight incubation at 4ºC. The day after, 
samples were washed in MABT (8 x 15 min at 
room temperature) and then in TNT (0.1 M Tris-
HCl pH7, 0.15M NaCl, 0.3% TritonX-100) for 10 
minutes. For the staining, embryos were 
incubated in TSA-tetramethylrhodamine 
(NEL742001KT, Perkin Elmer) for 10 min. Then, 
they were washed in TNT for 10 min, in PBT for 
10 min, once in 2%H2O2/PBT (45 min at room 
temperature), in PBT (2 x 5 min at room 
temperature), and in MABT (2 x 5 min at room 
temperature). Then, a second blocking step was 
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performed followed by the addition of an anti-
Digoxigenin-POD (11207733910, Roche) antibody 
that was incubated overnight at 4ºC. The morning 
after, as the previous day, the samples were 
washed and the coloration reaction was added, 
that in this case included TSA-Fluorescein 
system-green (NEL741E001KT, Perkin Elmer) 
for 1 hour 30 min. After coloration, embryos were 
washed in TNT (2 x 5 min at room temperature) 
and PBT (2 x 5 min at room temperature). 
Mounting was made in 80%glycerol/PBS with 
Hoechst-33342 1µM (Invitrogen-62249). A 
confocal microscopy LSM880 (Zeiss) was used for 
imaging of samples and FIJI (Schindelin et al., 
2012) was used to compose the confocal series and 
adjust the brightness and contrast. 
2.4 Pharmacological treatments 

For FGF inhibition, animals were treated with 
50 µM and 100 µM of SU5402 (SML0443, Merk) 
from 2-cell stage (30 minutes post fertilization, 
mpf) and from 32-cell stage (70 mpf), respectively, 
to hatchling stage (4 hours post fertilization, hpf) 
in darkness. For BMP inhibition, animals were 
treated with 10µM of LDN (SML1119, Merk) from 
2-cell stage and from 32-cell stage until hatchling 
stage. To perform these treatments, eggs were 
pooled in 4mL of SSW and fertilized with 200 µL 
of sperm dilution (the sperm of 3 males in 5 mL of 
SSW). At the desired time, embryos were 
transferred to a 3 mm Petri dish plate with 4 mL 
of treatment solution at 19ºC. Control embryos 
were incubated in DMSO 0,2% or 0,3% (v/v) 
depending on the treatment. The effects of the 
treatments were scored by in situ hybridization. 
For tailbud embryos, we used cross-hybridizing 
ActnM1, Nk4 and Brachyury probes (Almazán et 
al., 2019; Torres-Águila et al., 2018), while for 
hatchling embryos we used the specific ActnM1 
probe (Almazán et al., 2019) (Sup.Table. 2). 
 

 RESULTS 
3.1 Developmental atlas of the heart in O. dioica 

The anatomy of the heart has been thoroughly 
described in adults of O. dioica and some other 
appendicularian species (Fenaux, 1998; Fol, 1872; 
Lankester, 1882; Onuma et al., 2017; Savelieva 
and Temereva, 2020). Due to its chamber-less 
structure made of two layers (the myocardium 
and the pericardium) ventrally located between 
the left stomach and the intestine, it could be 
probably considered one of the simplest hearts of 
chordates (Fig. 1A-A’). The development of the 
heart in appendicularian embryos, to the best of 
our knowledge, had never been investigated and 

therefore remained unknown. Thus, we first 
performed a morphological study by DIC 
microscopy of O. dioica embryos to provide the 
first developmental atlas of the appendicularian 
heart (Fig. 1B-E'). Up to the early hatchling stage 
(4.5 hpf) (Fig. 1B), no morphological evidence 
could be distinguished to recognize the position of 
the cardiac precursor cells. By mid-hatchling 

Fig 1. Developmental atlas of heart development in O. 
dioica. (A) Anatomy of the adult heart of O. dioica. The 
pericardium (blue arrows) beats against the stomach wall. 
The myocardium (yellow arrows) protects the myocardium. 
(B-B’) In early-hatchling embryos (4.5 hpf) the heart 
progenitors are still unrecognizable. (C-C’) In mid hatchling 
1 embryos (6 hpf) heart progenitors are recognizable for the 
first time. (D-D’) In mid-hatchling 2 embryos (7.5 hpf) the 
internal cavity of the heart is already recognizable. (E-E’) In 
late-hatchling embryos (9.5 hpf) the cavities of the trunk are 
fully expanded and the heart has already started beating. 
Capital letters represent left optical sections at the level 
indicated by white squares. Prime letters represent ventral 
optical sections at the level indicated by red lines. 
Discontinuous white lines delimit the shape of the heart 
during organogenesis. Discontinuous green lines delimit the 
notochord. Asterisks indicate the internal cavity of the heart. 
Intestine (In), Notochord (N), Stomach (St). Scale bar 
represent 20µm in big images and 60µm in small images. 
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stage (6 hpf), when the borders delineating organ 
primordia started to appear throughout the 
trunk, a striated morphology distinguished from 
a left-side view allowed us to recognize the heart 
primordium for the first time located in a ventral 
position close to the ventral midline anterior to 
the notochord and between the already apparent 
stomach lobes and intestine (Fig. 1C). By 7.5 hpf, 
ventral view revealed the beginning of the 
expansion of an internal cavity separating the 
prospective myocardium and pericardium (Fig. 
1D’). By 8.5 hpf, the heart started beating 
suggesting that its contractile properties were 
already functional (Sup. video 1). By late-
hatchling stage (9.5 hpf), the internal cavity of the 
heart was fully expanded, and the position of the 
heart had asymmetrically displaced towards the 
left side trunk (Fig. 1E-E’).  

To study the development of the heart at stages 
at which its precursor cells could not be 
recognized by their morphology (i.e. early- and 
pre-hatchling stages), we first attempted to use 
the expression of Mesp as the preferred marker 
used in ascidians to trace the development of the 
cardiac cell lineage (Davidson, 2007). We 
surprisingly found, however, that O. dioica had 
lost its Mesp homolog (see section 1.2 below), and 
therefore we used muscular Actin 1 (ActnM1) as 
an alternative cardiac marker since we had 
previously found that it was expressed in the 
heart during O. dioica development (Almazán et 
al., 2019). ActnM1 helped us to trace back and 
describe the cardiac cell lineage in reverse 
temporal order from hatchlings to 16-cell stage 
embryos, and therefore to identify the early 
blastomeres that give rise to the heart (Fig 2A-

G). Thus, in the ventral area of the trunk, 
adjacent to the tip of the notochord at early-
hatchling stage, we observed one single domain of 
ActnM1 expression in which we counted 8 
prospective cardiac cells (Fig. 2A). While one 
single ActnM1 expression domain was still 
observed at late-tailbud stage (Fig. 2B), two 
distant bilateral domains were distinguished at 
mid- and early-tailbud stages, in which we 
counted 3 and 2 prospective cardiac cells in each 
domain, respectively (Fig. 2C-D). At Incipent 
tailbud stage, the bilateral ActnM1 expression 
domains were made of one single cell adjacently 
located to the first anterior tail muscle (ATM) cell 
(Fig. 2E). Integration of the expression data of 
ActnM1 with the 4D-nuclear tracing (Sup. Fig. 1) 
(Stach et al., 2008) from tailbud up to the 16-cell 
stage revealed that cardiac cells shared lineage 
with the first three ATM cells (B8.9, B8.10, and 
B8.11; Fig. 2G), and allowed us to identify B8.12 
blastomere as the first cardiac progenitor cell 
(FCP) in O. dioica (Fig. 2E, G). We noticed that 
the onset and temporal progression of the ActnM1 
expression occurred earlier in the left than in the 
right side, suggesting an asynchronous bilateral 
asymmetry on the development of the FCP cells. 
At 64-cell stage, we observed ActnM1 expression 
in cells of the vegetal hemisphere compatible with 
B7.5 and B7.6, which are the precursor cells of the 
ATM and the FCP (Fig. 2F-G). At 32-cell stage, 
according to the 4D cell fate map reconstruction 
(Sup. Fig. 1) we inferred that B6.3 should be 
considered the first precardiac precursor that will 
give rise to both the heart and ATM lineages (Fig. 
2G), but no ActnM1 signal was distinguished over 
background levels at this stage. B6.3 is the sister 
cell of the germline precursor B6.4, both of which 

Fig 2. Integration of ActnM1 expression with the fate map of the tail muscle, the heart, and the germline in O. 
dioica. (A-F) Dorsal sections of different embryo stages stained with ActnM1 to detect the cardiac progenitors throughout 
development. Nuclei are stained with Hoechst (blue). (G) Cell lineage diagram of B5.2 blastomere that originates the three 
anterior muscle cells of the tail, the heart, and the germline (Modified from Stach et al., 2008). To facilitate comparisons, the 
nomenclature of the blastomeres is according to that of Conklin for ascidians (1905). Fates are color-coded. Close shapes 
encircle cardiac progenitors. White dashed lines enclose the embryo. Red dots indicate the nuclei of the cardiac precursors. 
FCP, first cardiac progenitor; ATM, anterior tail muscle cell. 
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descended from B5.2 located in the vegetal 
hemisphere at the 16-cell stage (Fig. 2G). Thus, 
our findings allowed us to infer that the cardiac 
precursors of appendicularians and ascidians 
shared cell lineage fate maps and origin from the 
same early blastomeres. Moreover, our 
observations in O. dioica suggested that the FCP 
was also originated from an asymmetric division 
in the tail-trunk interface that also gives rise to 
the anterior tail muscles in the same way as it 
occurs in ascidians, in both cases ending in a final 
ventral distant position of the trunk from the 
anterior muscle cells of the tail. These findings, 
therefore, provide solid ontogenetic evidence that 
the heart of ascidians and appendicularians were 
homologous. 
3.2 Loss of an early multipotent state module 
during the deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 
GRN 

To investigate the evolution of the 
cardiogenetic toolkit of O. dioica, we performed a 
comprehensive in silico survey of conserved 
components of the GRN responsible for the 
development of the cardiac progenitor cells in 
ascidians and vertebrates (Diogo et al., 2015; 
Razy-Krajka and Stolfi, 2019). In order to map 
gene losses in the context of tunicate evolution, we 
included in the survey the genomes of six other 
appendicularian species (Naville et al., 2019) as 
well as eleven ascidian species (Brozovic et al., 
2018). 

First, we started by searching the O. dioica 
homolog of Mesp, which is the earliest known 
marker of pre-cardiac progenitors in ascidians 
and vertebrates (Bondue and Blanpain, 2010; 
Davidson et al., 2005; Satou et al., 2004). Using 
ascidian Mesp and vertebrate Mesp1 and Mesp2 
proteins as tBLASTn queries, however, none of 
the resulting hits returned Mesp in best reciprocal 
blast hits (BRBH), but members of other bHLH 
gene families such as Math, Achaete scute, 
Neurogenin, and Hand (Sup. Table 3). Analyses 
by tBLASTn of the other six appendicularian 
species also revealed the absence of Mesp 
homologs in all their genomes, which contrasted 
with its presence in all eleven ascidian species 
analyzed (Fig. 3). The apparent absence of Mesp 
among BLAST hits was confirmed by phylogenetic 
analyses, suggesting that appendicularians had 
lost the homolog of Mesp (Fig. 3 and Sup. Fig. 
2A). To test for the possibility of ‘function 
shuffling’ among bHLH genes upon the loss of 
Mesp, we checked for the expression of the gene 
that gave the most significant blast hits, but we 
did not observe any expression domain compatible 

with the position of the cardiac progenitors (Sup. 
Fig. 2B-G). These findings, therefore, suggested 
that the loss of Mesp occurred at the base of the 
appendicularian clade after its split from the 
ascidian lineage, and therefore, the activation of 
the cardiac pathway in appendicularians became 
Mesp-independent. 

We continued our survey with the search of 
homologs of Ets1/2, the direct downstream target 
of Mesp in the TVCs of ascidians, whose 
phosphorylation by the FGF/MAPK pathway 
results in the upregulation of the primary 
cardiogenic transcription factors (Davidson et al., 
2006). BLAST searches revealed the presence of 
two Ets1/2 homologs in O. dioica as well as in all 
other appendicularians, and interestingly, our 
gene survey also revealed the presence of a 
previously unnoticed second Ets1/2 gene in all 
ascidian species (Sup. Fig. 3A). Phylogenetic 
analyses revealed that Ets1/2 was duplicated at 
the base of the tunicates, giving rise to two 
paralogs that we have named as Ets1/2a and 
Ets1/2b, being the former the direct target of 
Mesp involved in the specification of the 
cardiopharyngeal lineage in ascidians. Our 
phylogenetic tree, however, suggested that the 
two Ets1/2 genes of appendicularians were co-
orthologs to the ascidian Ets1/2b and that they 
had been generated by a gene duplication 
occurred within the appendicularian lineage 
(Ets1/2b1 and Ets1/2b2), while no Ets1/2a 
homolog was present in appendicularians (Fig. 
3B). Experiments by whole-mount in situ 
hybridization with Ets1/2b1 and Ets1/2b2 in O. 
dioica revealed no expression domains compatible 
with cardiac precursors but expression in the 
notochord, the tail muscle cells, the migratory 
endodermal strand, the ventral organ, and the 
oikoplastic epithelium (Sup. Fig. 3B-M). Our 
findings, therefore, suggested that Ets1/2a was 
lost in appendicularians, and none of the Ets1/2b 
paralogs played any similar role to Ets1/2a in the 
cardiogenic pathway in ascidians. Moreover, we 
also analyzed the components of the FGF/MAPK 
pathway, since in ascidians this is responsible for 
Ets1/2a phosphorylation in the TVCs (Davidson 
et al., 2006). Our results revealed the absence of 
many of the key components of the FGF/MAPK 
pathway, including the absence of the homolog of 
the MEK1/2, which in ascidians, through a 
kinase cascade mediated by ERK, is responsible 
for Ets1/2a phosphorylation in the cardiogenetic 
pathway (Sup. Fig. 4A). Whole-mount in situ 
hybridization revealed that ERK was expressed in 
the oikoplastic epithelium, but no specific signal 
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domain was observed in the cardiac region (Sup. 
Fig. 3B-H). 

Next, we searched for O. dioica homologs of 
Gata4/5/6, FoxF, Nk4, and Hand1/2 families 
since in ascidians phosphorylated Ets1/2a 
activates FoxF and Gata4/5/6, two members of 
the primary cardiac transcription factors (CTF) in 

charge of cardiopharyngeal migration and 
specification, respectively (Beh et al., 2007), and 
other downstream members of the 
cardiopharyngeal kernel as Nk4, Hand1/2, and 
Hand-r (Davidson, 2007; Ragkousi et al., 2011; 
Wang et al., 2019). Blast searches and 
phylogenetic analyses revealed the absence of 
Gata4/5/6 homologs in O. dioica, but the 

Fig. 3. ML phylogenetic trees of Mesp and Ets families revealing the loss of Mesp and Ets1/2a in appendicularians. 
(A) ML phylogenetic tree of Mesp, Math and Neurogenin protein families showed a high bootstrap value separating these protein 
families and corroborating the loss of Mesp in appendicularians. (B) ML phylogenetic tree of Ets and Erg protein families showed 
a high bootstrap value separating both protein families and revealed that the ancestor of tunicates duplicated Ets1/2, and the 
ancestor of appendicularians lost Ets1/2a but duplicated Ets1/2b. Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Bootstrap values 
are shown in the nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), Lepisosteus oculatus 
(Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. (Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona 
savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis (Fbo), Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi (Hro), Mesochordaeus 
erythrocephalus (Mer), Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), Oikopleura albicans 
(Oal), Oikopleura dioica (Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura vanhoeffeni (Ova), Phallusia fumigata (Pfu), Phallusia 
mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: Branchiostoma belcheri (Bbe), Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum 
(Bfl). 
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presence of four paralogs of the closely related 
Gata1/2/3 (Sup. Fig. 5). The absence of 
Gata4/5/6 homologs in all six appendicularians, 
but their presence in all ascidians, suggested that 
the loss of Gata4/5/6 occurred at the base of the 
appendicularian lineage, which was accompanied 
by an expansion of the Gata1/2/3 subfamily 
(Sup. Fig. 5). In the case of FoxF and Nk4, we did 
find a single copy of each one in O. dioica and all 
appendicularian species (Sup. Fig. 6 and 7). 
Finally, blast searches revealed the presence of a 
single Hand1/2 homolog in O. dioica, as well as 
in all other six appendicularian species, and the 
presence of a second paralog Hand-r in all 
ascidian species. Phylogenetic analyses suggested 
that Hand-r was originated by an ascidian-
specific duplication, and therefore its absence 
from appendicularians was not due to a gene loss, 
but to an innovation of the ascidian group (Sup. 
Fig. 8). 

In an initial expression analysis by colorimetric 
WMISH of members of the Gata1/2/3, FoxF, 
Nk4, and Hand1/2 gene families, we observed 
expression domains that were in the nearby of the 
presumptive cardiac region. Therefore, we 
performed double fluorescent in situ 
hybridization with ActnM1 to test if any of these 
genes were expressed in the cardiac progenitors 
(Fig. 4). At the incipient tailbud stage, we 
observed that Nk4 was the first CTF to be 
expressed in the FCP, as soon as B8.12 was 
originated from the division of B7.6 but, we did 
not observe any signal in the daughter cell B8.11 
that remained positioned posteriorly as the first 
ATM (Fig. 4A). Expression of Nk4 was also visible 
earlier on the left than on the right side, 
consistently with the asynchronous bilateral 
asymmetry on the development of the FCP also 
revealed by ActnM1 expression (Fig. 4A, A’). By 
mid/late-tailbud stage, we observed that Nk4 
signal faded and was more difficult to detect (Fig. 
4A’’). At that stage, we observed Hand1/2 signal 
for the first time in some embryos in the cardiac 
progenitors localized in the ventral midline of the 
trunk (Fig. 4B’’). However, we did not observe 
FoxF signal in the cardiac precursors (Fig 4 C-
C’’’), but in adjacent epidermal cells that 
continued positive for FoxF to finally become 
restricted to the fol domain of the oikoplastic 
epithelium (Fig. 4C’’’). Despite the absence of 
Gata4/5/6 homolog in O. dioica, we tested for the 
possibility of function shuffling among paralogs 
by checking the expression of two of the four 
Gata1/2/3 paralogs that seemed to have 
expression in the nearby of the cardiac area. 
Double fluorescent experiments, however, 

revealed that the Gata1/2/3b and Gata1/2/3d 
were not co-expressed with ActnM1 in the FCP, 
but in an adjacent epidermal cell (Fig. 4D-D’ and 
E-E’). At late-tailbud and hatchling stages, the 
expression of Gata1/2/3b and Gata1/2/3d had 
expanded in lateral epidermal domains and 
anterior prospective placodal populations, 
respectively, but were never detected in the heart 
primordium (Fig. 4D’’-D’’’ and E’’-E’’’). These 
results, therefore, suggest that FoxF and Gata 
factors did not participate in the specification or 
migration of the cardiac progenitors in O. dioica, 
in contrast to their roles in ascidians and 
vertebrates. Overall, our findings of the gene co-
elimination of Mesp, Ets1/2a, MEK1/2, 
Gata4/5/6 and RA signaling, and the loss of the 
cardiac subfunctions of FoxF, highlight a process 
of evolutionary deconstruction of the 
cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network in O. 
dioica with the loss of what can be considered an 
“early multipotent” (EM) module that in ascidians 
is related to the early maintenance of the 
multipotent state of the TVCs after their split 
from the ATM lineage. In O. dioica, the cells 
resulting from the split of the ATM lineage 
rapidly activated the onset of the cardiac kernel 
(i.e. Nk4 and Hand1/2), the reason why we have 
termed them first cardiac precursors (FCP), 
rather than TVCs as in ascidians. 
3.3 Loss of a late multipotent state module during 
the deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN 

In ascidians, the TVCs undertake a series of 
asymmetric cell divisions and regulatory 
transient states through a process of binary fate 
decisions that do not only give rise to first and 
second heart precursors, but also to the atrial 
siphon muscle founder cells (ASMF) (Stolfi et al., 
2010). In our work, we then investigated O. dioica 
homologs of Hand-r, Tbx1/10, Islet1 and Ebf 
(Coe), which in ascidians become activated in a 
FGF/MAPK-dependent manner to determine the 
trajectory towards the ASMF including the 
activation of MyoD (Mrf) (Stolfi et al., 2010; Wang 
et al., 2013, 2019). Our genome survey and 
phylogenetic analysis revealed that in addition to 
the absence of Hand-r (see above), none of the Tbx 
genes of O. dioica belonged to the Tbx1/10 family 
(Sup. Fig. 9A). The absence of Tbx1/10 in all 
examined appendicularian species suggested that 
this gene was lost at the base of the 
appendicularian clade after its split from the 
ascidian lineage (Sup. Fig. 9A). In the case of 
Islet1 and Ebf, despite the existence of one 
homolog of each in O. dioica, our results by 
WMISH revealed that the two of them were 
expressed in the nervous system, but no 
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expression was found that could suggest the 
presence of presumptive muscle cells in the gill 
slits homologous to the atrial muscle cells of 
ascidians (Sup. Fig. 9B-L). Finally, we have 
identified the MyoD homolog in O. dioica which 
did not appear to be expressed in muscle cells, but 
its expression domains were restricted to some 
fields of the oikoplastic epithelium during late 
hatchling stages (Sup. Fig. 9M-Q). Our results, 
therefore, revealed that the loss of pharyngeal 
muscle during the evolution of appendicularians 
was accompanied by the loss of Tbx1/10 and the 
loss of the muscle subfunctions of Islet1, Ebf and 
MyoD.  

To test for the presence of presumptive second 
heart field in O. dioica, we investigated the 
expression of the homolog of Dach, which in 

ascidians is activated by Tbx1/10 in the absence 
of FGF/MAPK-signaling, and it is sufficient to 
determine the second heart precursors identity 
(Wang et al., 2019). Our genome survey revealed 
the presence of a single homolog of Dach in O. 
dioica (Sup. table 3). Experiments of WMISH 
revealed, however, that Dach was expressed in 
the nervous system, the endostyle, and the trunk 
epidermis, but not in the heart of O. dioica (Sup. 
Fig. 10). The absence of Dach expression in the 
heart could suggest that O. dioica might lack a 
homolog to the second heart field of ascidians. In 
addition to Dach, single-cell transcriptomic 
analysis in ascidians has revealed a total of 18 
cell-specific gene markers for the first heart 
precursors and 7 for the second (Wang et al., 
2019). Our gene survey by BRBH revealed that 12 

Fig. 4. Developmental expression patterns of O. dioica ActnM1 and prospective cardiac transcription factors. 
Double fluorescent in situ hybridization of ActnM1 with Nk4, Hand1/2, FoxF, Gata1/2/3b, and Gata1/2/3d. Nk4 expression 
signal was detected in ventral epidermis and the FCP (B8.12) from the inipient-tailbud stage (A) until the early-tailbud (A’). 
In later stages, we only detected expression in the epidermis, but not in the cardiac precursors (A’’-A’’’). Hand1/2 was 
specifically expressed in the cardiac progenitors from late-tailbud to hatchling stages (B-B’’’). We did not detect expression of 
FoxF, Gata1/2/3b, nor Gata1/2/3d in cardiac precursors, but they were expressed in different epidermal domains (C-E’’’). 
Incipient- and early-tailbud stages correspond to ventral views oriented anterior towards the top. Late-tailbud and early-
hatchling stages correspond to lateral views oriented anterior towards the left and dorsal towards the top. White arrows 
indicate coexpression of ActnM1 with the corresponding gene in cardiac progenitors.  
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out of those 25 cell-specific gene markers were 
absent in the genome of O. dioica (Sup. table 3). 
Using the human genome as an outgroup, the 
BRBH results were compatible with 4 gene losses 
in O. dioica (3 and 1 for FHP and SHP specific 
gene markers, respectively), and 8 ascidian 
specific gene duplications (6 and 2 for FHP and 
SHP markers, respectively). Altogether, our 
results highlights that during the deconstruction 
of the cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network 
the loss of Tbx1/10 and the loss of subfunctions of 
Dach, Islet1, Ebf and MyoD might represent the 
loss of a late module of multipotent states that in 
ascidians are responsible of the differentiation of 
the SHF and atrial muscle, structures that 
appeared to have been lost during the evolution of 
appendicularians. 

Finally, to investigate how the daughter cells 
of the cardiac progenitors differentiated into 
myocardium and pericardium in hatchling stages, 
we analyzed the expression patterns of some of 
the CTFs we had found in O. dioica such as 
Hand1/2, Rapostlin (FNBP1), and Nk4 as well as 
some structural genes that code for motor proteins 
such as ActnM1, Myosin, FilaminC (FlnC), and 
Troponins T (TnnT) (Fig. 5A-I’’). WMISH 
experiments revealed that the expression of 
Hand1/2, that started after the downregulation 
of Nk4, was specifically maintained in the heart 
throughout all hatchling stages (Fig. 5A-A’’). 
Despite the first heart beatings did not occur until 
late-hatchling (8,5 hpf), in the early-hatchling 
stage (5 hpf), in addition to ActnM1, we also 
observed the first expression signals of some 
motor genes such as FilaminC and TnnT7 (Fig. 
5F, I). By mid-hatchling stage (6,5 hpf), in 
addition to Hand1/2, we observed expression 
signals of the CTF Raspostlin, as well as 
additional motor genes such as Myosin, TnnT1, 
and TnnT4 (Fig. 5B’, E’, G’, H’). Finally, by late-
hatchling stage (8 hpf), we observed a second 
wave of Nk4 expression, which had been 
downregulated since mid-tailbud stage (Fig. 
4A’’). The ventral view of late hatchlings, in which 
the expansion of internal cavities allowed us to 
clearly differentiate the myocardium and 
pericardium, revealed that some of the analyzed 
genes were expressed both in the pericardium and 
myocardium (Hand1/2, Rapostlin), while others 
only in the myocardium (Nk4, mAct1, TnnT1, 
TnnT4, Tnnt7, and FilaminC). These results 
suggest that despite the loss of the early and late 
modules, many downstream regulators and 
structural genes that characterize the cardiac 
program in ascidians and vertebrates were 
conserved in O. dioica, and our results provide the 

first insights into the spatio-temporal dynamics of 
the expression patterns of CTF and motor-genes 
that will be useful for further functional 
investigations of heart development in 
appendicularians. 
3.4 FGF and BMP signaling are not involved in 
the specification of cardiac progenitors cells in O. 
dioica 

In ascidians, the FGF/MAPK signaling via 
phosphorylation of Ets1/2a is essential for the 
onset of the pan-cardiac program in the 
cardiopharyngeal precursors (Davidson et al., 
2006). This induction event takes place only in the 
anterior pairs of B7.5 daughters turning them 
into TVCs, while the posterior B7.5 descendants 
become into ATMs (Davidson et al., 2006; Tolkin 
and Christiaen, 2012). The loss of Ets1/2a in 
appendicularians, the absence of Ets1/2b 
expression domains compatible with a cardiac 
function, and the loss of MEK1/2 in the 
FGF/MAPK pathway suggested the hypothesis 
that the determination of the FCP could have 
become FGF independent in O. dioica. To test this 
hypothesis, we performed FGF inhibitory 
treatments with SU5402, an inhibitor of FGF 
receptor (FGFR). Treatments with SU5402 
induced developmental alterations, whose 
severity depended on the concentration and 
duration of the treatment (Sup. Table 4). In 
treatments starting at 2-cell stage, SU5402 
concentrations at 50 µM induced obvious 
malformations at gastrula stage, affecting the 
proper formation of tailbud morphologies and 
arresting development before hatching (Sup. 
Table 4). In treatments starting after 
gastrulation at 32-cell stage, however, SU5402 
concentrations of 50 µM did not produce any 
obvious altered phenotype, and required 
concentrations of at least 100 µM to induce 
aberrant morphologies in hatchling stages (Sup. 
Table 4). WMISH experiments in embryos 
treated with SU5402 at 50 µM from the 2-cell 
stage revealed that a majority of the embryos 
showed aberrant or no ActnM1 signal, suggesting 
that the development of mesodermal derivatives 
such as the muscle lineage was severely affected 
(Fig. 6B-B’). Interestingly, those few embryos 
that were able to achieve incipient tailbud 
morphologies with two recognizable rows of tail 
muscle cells labeled by ActnM1, also showed the 
presence of presumptive cardiac progenitors, 
comparably to DMSO treated control embryos 
(Fig. 6B’’). In embryos treated with SU5402 at 
100 µM from the 32-cell stage, in which 
gastrulation was not affected, WMISH with Nk4 
revealed the presence of cardiac precursors in 
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most embryos, similarly to control DMSO 
embryos at incipient tailbud stage (Fig. 6D-D’). 
These results suggested that despite FGF 
appeared to be important for early development 
during gastrula stage, FGF was not essential for 
the specification of the cardiac progenitors at 
incipient tailbud stage. These results together 
with the loss of Mesp, Ets1/2a and MEK1/2 
support the hypothesis that the specification and 
induction of cardiac progenitors have become FGF 
independent in appendicularians, in contrast to 
ascidians. 

In ascidians, in addition to FGF, BMP 
signaling is also relevant for cardiac development 
contributing to the specification and migration of 
the TVCs. The migration, activated by FoxF, 
follows a gradient of BMP originated in the 
ventral epidermis (Christiaen et al., 2010). The 
increasing levels of BMP initiate the upregulation 
of cardiac kernel genes as Gata4/5/6 or Nk4, 
which sustains and arrests migration, 
respectively (Christiaen et al., 2010). Our results 
showing the loss of Gata4/5/6 and the apparent 
absence of expression of the migratory factor FoxF 
in the FCP of O. dioica suggested the hypothesis 
that the role of BMP in the cardiac gene 
regulatory network could have changed in 
appendicularians. To test this hypothesis, we 
performed BMP inhibitory treatments with LDN 
–a highly specific inhibitor of BMP receptors– 

during different time windows (Sup. Table 4). 
WMISH experiments using ActnM1 and Nk4 
probes in tailbud embryos that had been 
previously treated with 10 µM LDN from the 2-
cell stage revealed no differences in the formation 
of the FCPs nor in the onset of the cardiac kernel 
marker Nk4 in comparison to DMSO-control 
embryos (Fig. 6F, H). These results suggested 
that BMP was not necessary for the specification 
of the FCP nor the activation of the expression of 
the cardiac kernel as soon as the FCP split from 
the ATMs. 

We also checked for the convergence of cardiac 
progenitors in the ventral part of the trunk after 
treating embryos with FGF and BMP inhibitors. 
In early hatchling DMSO control embryos, 
ActnM1 revealed that cardiac progenitors were 
localized in a single domain near the trunk 
midline, while in SU5402 and LDN treated 
embryos cardiac precursors were bilaterally 
distributed far from the midline (Fig. 6J, J’’, K). 
Interestingly, both, BMP and FGF inhibitory 
treatments, also affected the elongation of the tail 
and its rotation relative to the trunk. Thus, while 
a ventral view of control embryos showed a row of 
muscle cells (Fig. 6I), most of the treated embryos 
showed two rows revealing that the rotation had 
not taken place (Fig. 6J, J’’, K). These results 

Fig. 5. Expression atlas of cardiac genes during hatchling stages of Oikopleura dioica development. Developmental 
expression analysis by whole mount in situ hybridization of O. dioica cardiac transcription factors (A-C’’) and motor proteins 
(D-I’’). Images correspond to lateral views oriented anterior to towards the left and dorsal towards the top. Detailed small 
images represent ventral optical section at the level indicated by white lines. Black arrows indicate expression in the heart. 
Blue arrows indicate expression in the pericardium. Yellow arrows indicate expression in the myocardium. 
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suggested that the inhibition of BMP- and FGF-
signaling could affect the positioning of heart 
precursors towards the midline, as well as other 
developmental processes such as the elongation 
and rotation of the tail. 

 

 DISCUSSION 

4.1 The hearts of appendicularians and ascidians 
are homologous 

The vast morphological variability among 
hearts and pumping organs across metazoans has 
made cardiac development a hot topic in the 
discussion of homologies and analogies in the field 
of EvoDevo (Xavier-Neto et al., 2007). In the case 

of chordates, numerous studies have provided 
strong evidence supporting that the hearts of 
vertebrates and ascidians are homologous despite 
the great morphological differences between the 
multichambered complex heart of vertebrates and 
the tubular simple heart of ascidians (Davidson, 
2007). At the beginning of our study, however, the 
striking morphological and physiological 
differences between the heart of ascidians and O. 
dioica casted doubt on whether these two organs 
were truly homologous, or on the contrary, could 
be analogous pumping organs. At the 
morphological level, the cylindrical V-shape heart 
of ascidians contrasts with the chamberless flat 
heart of O. dioica. At the physiological level, while 

Fig. 6. Effects FGF and BMP inhibitions in the development of the heart of O. dioica. Whole mount in situ 
hybridization of ActnM1 in DMSO-control (A) and treated embryos with SU5402 50µM starting at 2-cell stage (B-B’’), in which 
more than a half of the embryos showed no specific signal of ActnM1 (B). Whole mount in situ hybridization of Nk4 and 
Brachyury in DMSO-control (C) and SU5402 100µM starting at 32-cell stage (D-D’), in which more than a half of the embryos 
showed expression of Nk4 in the cardiac progenitors but alterations in the notochord development (D). Whole mount in situ 
hybridization of ActnM1 in DMSO-control (E) and LDN 10µM starting at 2-cell stage in which most of the embryos displayed 
an ActnM1 expression comparable to the DMSO control (F). Whole mount in situ hybridization of Nk4 and Brachyury in 
DMSO-control (G) and LDN 10µM from 2-cell stage in which most of the embryos displayed Nk4 expression in the cardiac 
progenitors (H). Whole mount in situ hybridization of ActnM1 in DMSO-control (I) and treated embryos with LDN 10µM (J-
J’’) and SU5402 100µM (K-K’’) starting at 32-cell stage, in which many embryos display separated cardiac progenitors (J, J’’, 
K, K’’), rather than one single domain in the midline such in DMSO-control (I). Tailbud embryos were stained using the cross-
hybridizing ActnM1 probe (Almazán et al., 2019). Hatchling embryos were stained with the specific ActnM1 probe (Almazán 
et al., 2019). Tailbud embryos images correspond to dorsal views with anterior to the top. Hatchling images represent ventral 
views with anterior to the top. Red arrowheads indicate cardiac precursors. 
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in ascidians the heart does not start beating until 
several days after the metamorphosis in juveniles, 
in O. dioica the heart starts beating against the 
stomach wall as soon as 8.5 hpf at late-hatchling 
stage. Despite these marked differences, our 
results provide strong evidence that both hearts 
are homologous by revealing that the cardiac 
precursor cells of O. dioica and C. robusta share 
the same cell fate map and the same ontogeny. In 
both organisms, the muscle/heart lineage 
descends from the B5.2 blastomere located in the 
posterior-vegetal hemisphere at 16-cell stage, 
which also gives rise to the germline lineage (Fig. 
7). In O. dioica, the division of B5.2 at the 32-cell 
stage splits the germline and muscle/heart 
lineages, being B6.3 the precursor of the later. In 
ascidians, however, the split of the germline and 
muscle/heart lineages occurs one cleavage later at 
the 64-cell stage, being B7.5 therefore, the 
muscle/heart precursor equivalent to B6.3 in O. 
dioica (Fig. 7). 

Moreover, the origin of the first cardiac 
precursors in O. dioica and C. robusta (FCP and 
TVCs, respectively) share the same ontogenic 
origin, since in both cases occurs through an 
asymmetric division at the interface between the 
trunk and tail, in which the anterior daughter cell 
will end up in the ventral part of the trunk giving 
rise to the heart, while the posterior daughter cell 
will remain in the tail giving rise to the ATMs. 
The common ontogenic origin of the cardiac 
lineage and the most anterior axial muscles can 
be therefore considered an ancestral 
synapomorphy of tunicates. The timing of the split 
between the cardiac and the axial muscle lineages 
between O. dioica and C. robusta occurs again one 
cleavage earlier in the appendicularian (after the 
division of B7.6 at the approximately 110-cell 
incipient-tailbud stage) than in the ascidian (after 
the divisions of B8.9 and B8.10 at the 
approximately 300-cell post-neurula stage). This 
timing difference is probably connected to the 
difference in the number of cardiac precursors 

Fig. 7. Cell lineage diagrams of C. robusta and O. dioica cardiopharyngeal progenitors. The hearts of Oikopleura 
and Ciona share the same cell fate map and the same ontogeny with minor differences. While ascidians comprise two TVCs 
and two ATMs per side, Oikopleura only comprises one FCP and one ATM per side. Moreover, in Oikopleura the germline 
(brown), the cardiac precursors (green), the ATM (purple), and the FHPs (red) appear one cleavage earlier than in ascidians. 
Genes and structures that do not play a role in cardiac development in O. dioica are represented in grey, absent genes are 
strikethrough. 
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between O. dioica and ascidians, with just one 
single FCP in each side in O. dioica in contrast to 
the two TVCs in each side in ascidians, as well as 
just one single row of muscle cells in each side of 
the tail of appendicularians in contrast to the two 
rows in the tail of ascidians  (Almazán et al., 2019; 
Nishino et al., 2000). 

The “one-cleavage earlier” trend of fate 
decisions observed in this work is consistent with 
the observations already made by Delsman back 
in 1910 (Delsman, 1910) when describing that cell 
ingression during gastrulation in O. dioica 
occurred one cleavage earlier than in ascidians. 
This idea that fate restriction occurs earlier in O. 
dioica than in ascidians has been corroborated by 
the characterization of the cell lineage fate map in 
O. dioica (Nishida and Stach, 2014; Stach et al., 
2008), as well as in expression analyses showing 
for instance that the onset of Otx (Cañestro and 
Postlethwait, 2007) and Brachyury (Bassham and 
Postlethwait, 2000) during early embryogenesis 
occurred “one-cleavage earlier” than in ascidians. 
This trend of “one-cleavage earlier” fate decision 
in O. dioica probably reflects a generalized 
feature of the evolution of the developmental 
program of appendicularians, which might have 
likely contributed to the acceleration of 
development, morphological simplification and 
cell number reduction of this group of tunicates. 
4.2 Modular deconstruction of the 
cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network 

One of the most striking findings of our work is 
the numerous losses of genes and 
cardiopharyngeal subfunctions that have suffered 
the cardiopharyngeal GRN in appendicularians. 
In agreement to the modular model for the control 
of heart cell identity proposed by Wang et al., 
(2019)(Wang et al., 2019), our comparative 
analysis between ascidians and appendicularians 
allows proposing an evolutionary scenario in 
which we can recognize how the modular 
deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN 
might have affected the evolution of the heart and 
siphon muscle in appendicularians (Fig. 7). In 
ascidians, the binary fate decision between the 
ATM and TVC lineages occurs in the trunk-tail 
interface, under the antagonistic posterior 
influence of retinoic acid signaling promoting the 
fate of ATMs in the tail, and the anterior influence 
of FGF signaling promoting the multipotent 
cardiopharyngeal fate of the TVCs in the trunk 
(Christiaen et al., 2008b; Davidson et al., 2006; 
Nagatomo and Fujiwara, 2003). FGF action is 
mediated by the phosphorylation of Ets1/2a, 
which had been previously upregulated by Mesp 

in the TVCs (Christiaen et al., 2008; Davidson et 
al., 2006; Nagatomo and Fujiwara, 2003). The 
multipotent state of the TVCs is maintained until 
the FoxF-dependent ventral migration of the 
TVCs, and the action of Gata4/5/6 and BMP-
signaling from the ventral epidermis that triggers 
the cardiogenic kernel upon the activation of Nk4 
(Beh et al., 2007; Davidson and Levine, 2003; 
Satou et al., 2004; Wang et al., 2019). In O. dioica, 
however, our results show that the binary fate 
decision between the ATM and FCP lineages 
occurs in a very different molecular context due to 
the gene losses of Mesp and Ets1/2a, the loss of 
MEK1/2 affecting the FGF/MAPK signaling 
pathway, and the loss of the retinoic acid 
signaling pathway (Fig. 7) (Martí-Solans et al., 
2016). Our results also show that, in contrast to 
TVCs, FCPs activate the expression of Nk4 as 
soon as B8.12 blastomeres are born from the 
division of B7.6, suggesting that the FCP is not 
multipotent and has already activated the 
cardiogenic kernel. This is the reason why we 
have termed these cells as FCPs instead of TVCs 
as in ascidians. Our results, moreover, show that 
the activation of Nk4 is independent of Gata4/5/6 
(which has been lost in appendicularians), 
independent of FoxF (which is not expressed in 
the FCP), and independent of FGF- and BMP-
signaling (as shown by our inhibitory treatments). 
In the light of these results, we propose an 
evolutionary scenario in which all these losses 
highlights the deconstruction of an “early-
multipotent” (EM) module of the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN that in ascidians 
contributes to the maintenance of the multipotent 
state in the TVCs, which in the FCP of O. dioica 
has been lost. 

In ascidians, the multipotent states of TVCs 
and STVCs allow the differentiation of the second 
heart field and the atrial siphon and longitudinal 
muscles. In appendicularians, however, our 
results revealing the ancestral loss of Tbx1/10, 
the loss of FGF and BMP cardiac inductive 
functions, together with the losses of expression of 
Dach in the heart and Islet1, Ebf and MyoD in 
muscles of O. dioica highlights the deconstruction 
of a “late multipotent” (LM) module of the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN that in ascidians is 
responsible for the maintenance of the 
multipotency in the STVC and fate specification 
of the SHP and ASMF (Fig. 7). These results 
suggest, therefore, an evolutionary scenario in 
which the heart of O. dioica might be homologous 
to the FHP of ascidians, while the homologous 
tissues to the SHP, atrial siphon muscles, and 
longitudinal muscles have been lost. 
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4.3 Evolution of pelagic appendicularians from a 
sessile ascidian-like ancestor 

The extensive losses affecting the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN suggest a parsimonious 
evolutionary scenario in which appendicularians 
might have suffered a process of evolutionary 
simplification from an ancestral ascidian-like 
condition. The modular deconstruction of the 
GRN is compatible with the adaptive evolution of 
three innovations that likely facilitated the 
transition from an ancestral sessile ascidian-like 
lifestyle to the pelagic house-based free lifestyle of 
appendicularians: an accelerated cardiac 
development, the formation of an open-wide 
laminar heart and the loss of siphon muscle. 

The “one-cleavage earlier” trend and the 
deconstruction of the EM module likely facilitated 
the earlier activation of the cardiac developmental 
kernel in appendicularians than in ascidians, 
causing an accelerated cardiac development that 
resulted in the activation of the beating of the 
heart by 8.5 hpf in O. dioica, in contrast to few 
days after metamorphosis in ascidians. 
Accelerated cardiac development, therefore, could 
have been plausibly selected as an adaptation to 

the high energetic demand of appendicularians 
associated with their intense and constant 
beating of the tail to power water circulation 
through the house right after the inflation of the 
first house as soon as 10 hpf (Ferrández-Roldán et 
al., 2019; Nishida, 2008). 

In addition to accelerated cardiac development, 
the profound re-modeling of the cardiac cell 
lineage development with the apparent loss of the 
SHP in appendicularians plausibly may have 
contributed to the transformation of an ascidian-
like tubular heart into an open-wide laminar 
structure that beats against the stomach like in 
O. dioica. Considering that hemolymph 
circulation in appendicularians is not only 
powered by the heart, but also by the movements 
of the tail (Fenaux, 1998), the adaptive innovation 
of a laminar cardiac structure likely offered a 
more efficient system to pump hemolymph waves 
propelled by the tail movements through an open-
wide structure than through the less accessible 
space of a tubular ascidian-like heart. 

Finally, the loss of muscles to propel fluid 
inside the organism is likely the result of adaptive 
evolution during the transition from a sessile 

Fig. 8. The deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN in appendicularians favored their transition from an ascidian-like 
ancestral condition to a free-living house-based life style. The loss of the siphon muscle, the development of an open-wide 
laminar heart, and the acquisition of an accelerated development can be considered adaptive consequences of the 
deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN that facilitated the innovation of the free-living life style of appendicularians 
based on the house filtrating device. GRN, gene regulatory network; STVCs, second trunk ventral cells; SHP, second heart 
progenitors; ASMF, atrial siphon muscle field; TVCs, trunk ventral cells; LM, late multipotent; EM, early multipotent.  
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filter-feeding ascidian-like strategy to a pelagic 
filter-feeding strategy based on the innovation of 
the house in appendicularians (Mikhaleva et al., 
2018). While in ascidians siphon muscles are 
responsible for water current throughout the 
organism during filter feeding, in 
appendicularians the water current is propelled 
by actively motile tail and the cilia in the gills 
(spiracles). Importantly, the loss of siphon muscle 
in appendicularians probably was not only the 
consequence of regressive evolution upon the 
innovation tail-beating propulsion of water 
through the house, but it plausibly facilitated the 
evolution of the capability of these tunicates to 
control the orchestrated movement of the cilia in 
the gills to efficiently reverse the direction of the 
water flow, inwards during feeding or outwards 
during the inflation of the house without the 
interference of graceless muscle contractions 
(Bassham et al., 2008; Conley et al., 2018). 

In conclusion, our results support an 
evolutionary scenario in which, independently of 
the phylogenetic relationship of appendicularians 
with the rest of tunicates, the last common 
tunicate ancestor had a sessile ascidian-like 
lifestyle, and appendicularians suffered a process 
of evolutionary simplification in which the 
modular deconstruction of their cardiopharyngeal 
GRN facilitated the transition to a pelagic free-
living style connected to the innovation of the 
house (Fig. 8). Future comparative studies of the 
cardiopharyngeal GRN responsible for the 
development of diverse cardiac structures among 
different ascidian and appendicularian species 
will be necessary to provide further insights into 
the evolution of the heart in tunicates and maybe 
reveal data that could help to better understand 
the phylogenetic relationship of appendicularians 
with the rest of tunicates. In particular, the 
sequencing of the genome of heartless 
appendicularian species of the Kowelevskia 
genera will be of special interest (Brena et al., 
2003), since it may represent a step beyond the 
evolutionary process of the complete dismantling 
of the cardiac GRN and it might help to better 
recognize GRN modules deconstructed during the 
evolution of this heartless appendicularian. 
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LŽcNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϭϱϮϬϮϵϯϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϭϱϮϬϱϮϰϱ͘ϭ NCBI
MeƌMaƚh SCLFϬϭϮϭϳϰϵϴ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MeƌNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLFϬϭϭϰϱϮϴϱ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽcciMaƚh MŽŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϲϰϳϴϴ͘gϬϲϮϯϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽcciMeƐƉ Sϭϰϱϭϲϱ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
MŽcciNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ MŽŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϰϳϴϳϳ͘gϮϵϴϱϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽccƵMaƚh MŽŽccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϬϮϯϱϭ͘gϯϲϲϲϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽccƵNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SϰϯϴϴϬϮ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
MŽcƵlMaƚh MŽŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϯϬϯϴϯ͘gϬϭϰϱϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽcƵlMeƐƉ MŽŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϵϮϯϯϯ͘gϬϳϰϮϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽcƵlNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ MŽŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϭϱϵϳϳ͘gϬϬϱϯϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽccƵMeƐƉ SϰϲϬϳϭϵ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
OalMaƚh SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϬϬϵ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OalNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϭϭϵ͘ϭ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OdiMaƚhϲ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϲϰϭϴϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϴϮϭϭϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OlŽMaƚh SCLDϬϭϬϱϵϮϴϯ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OlŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLDϬϭϭϰϰϯϵϮ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OlŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLDϬϭϬϵϬϴϰϴ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaMaƚh SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϳϴϭ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϰϵϰ͘ϭ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
PfƵMaƚ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϵϰϬ͘gϬϯϬϭϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵMeƐƉ Sϭϱ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PfƵNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϮϵϳϵ͘gϬϵϬϰϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMaƚh Ɖhŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϵϳ͘gϬϵϰϱϭ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMeƐƉ SϮϯϰ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PŵaNeƵƌŽgeŶeŶiŶ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮϵ͘gϬϱϳϰϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed

GeŶe Ŷaŵe GeŶe ID DaƚabaƐe
BfEƌg XPͺϬϬϮϲϭϯϭϭϭ NCBI
BflEƚƐ XPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϭϮϲ͘ϭ NCBI
BlaEƌg BLϭϰϲϵϱͺeǀŵϬ AŶiƐeed
BlaEƚƐ ϭϰϲϵϯ AŶiƐeed
BleEƌga SϮϯ͘gϬϱϰϬϭ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleEƌgb Sϯϵϭ͘gϬϴϵϮϴ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleEƌgc Sϳϰ ŵaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BleEƚƐϭͬϮa SϰϮϮ͘gϬϵϱϮϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BleEƚƐϭͬϮb Sϰϵϴ͘gϭϬϲϵϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƚ AŶiƐeed
BƐcEƌga chƌϳ͘gϮϲϴϰϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BƐcEƌgb chƌUŶ͘gϱϮϮϲϯ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐcEƌgc chƌUŶ͘gϬϵϴϵϮ͘Ϭϭ͘ƚ AŶiƐeed
BƐcEƚƐϭͬϮa ChƌUŶͺƉϯϴϭϰϬϱϰϮϳ ŵaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐcEƚƐϭͬϮb chƌϱ͘gϲϵϬϵϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BƐƉEƚƐϭͬϮbϮ SCLEϬϭϭϱϴϱϵϬ ŵaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
BƐƉEƚƐϭͬϮbϭ SCLEϬϭϯϬϳϮϳϮ͘ϭ ŵaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
CƌŽEƌga KH͘Cϰ͘ϱϯϵ͘ǀϭ͘A͘NDϭͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽEƌgbϭ KH͘CϭϬ͘ϭϰϴ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϲͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽEƌgbϮ KH͘CϭϬ͘ϰϮϬ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽEƌgc KH͘CϮ͘ϮϵϬ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽEƚƐϭͬϮa KH͘CϭϬ͘ϭϭϯ͘ǀϰ͘A͘SLϭͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽEƚƐϭͬϮb KH͘Cϭϭ͘ϭϬ͘ǀϭ͘R͘NDϭͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEƌga ϭϰϯϲϱϬϭͲϭϰϯϵϰϬϯ͘ϭϯϮϮϬ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEƌgbϭ ϭϳϮϳϰϳͲϭϴϮϬϲϮ͘ϬϲϴϮϮ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEƌgbϮ ϭϱϬϵϵϬͲϭϱϱϲϱϯ͘Ϭϲϴϭϱ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEƌgc ϯϰϯϲϳϬͲϯϰϴϮϴϵ͘Ϭϭϴϰϳ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEƚƐϭͬϮa Rϰϰ͘ϴϮϭϮϳϵͲϴϮϲϲϬϭ͘ϭϭϬϬϬ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEƚƐϭͬϮb Rϭϲ͘ϯϰϱϯϮϮͲϯϰϴϰϱϱ͘Ϭϴϰϱϯ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
FbŽEƚƐϭͬϮb SDIIϬϭϬϴϳϭϬϴ ŵaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
GgaEƌg NPͺϵϴϵϲϭϭ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaEƚƐϭ XPͺϬϭϱϭϱϯϰϱϰ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaEƚƐϮ NPͺϵϵϬϲϰϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HaƵEƌga SϮϬϳ͘gϬϯϯϭϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HaƵEƌgb SϴϬϲ͘gϬϲϳϮϵ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
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HaƵEƌgc Sϯϱϵϱ͘gϭϬϯϰϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HaƵEƚƐϭͬϮa SϮϴϳ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn AniƐeed
HaƵEƚƐϭͬϮb SϭϮϬ͘gϬϮϯϭϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌŽEƌga Sϯϳ͘gϭϱϮϳϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌŽEƌgb Sϭϱϲ͘gϬϬϱϯϯ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
HƌŽEƌgc Sϰϭϰ͘gϬϮϮϲϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌŽEƚƐϭͬϮa Sϯϲϭ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn AniƐeed
HƌŽEƚƐϭͬϮb Sϳ͘gϬϲϱϰϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƐaEƌg NPͺϴϵϭϱϰϴ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaEƚƐϭ NPͺϬϬϭϭϯϳϮϵϮ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaEƚƐϮ NPͺϬϬϱϮϯϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LchEƌg XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϮϱϴϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LchEƚƐϭ XPͺϬϬϱϵϴϵϴϳϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchEƚƐϮ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϮϱϵϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcEƌg XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϳϴϯϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcEƚƐϭ XPͺϬϭϱϭϵϮϵϵϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcEƚƐϮ XPͺϬϭϱϭϵϳϮϰϰ͘ϭ NCBI
MeƌϵEƚƐϭͬϮbϮ SCLFϬϭϳϬϰϵϯϵ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MeƌEƚƐϭͬϮbϭ SCLFϬϭϮϳϵϮϱϰ͘ϭ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MŽcciEƌga Sϱϭϭϯϭϵ͘gϭϵϯϭϳ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcciEƌgb SϮϰϰϳϬϱ͘gϬϱϱϯϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƚ AniƐeed
MŽcciEƌgc SϳϵϭϭϮ͘gϬϭϬϱϮ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcciEƚƐϭͬϮa SϲϯϮϲϳϯ͘gϮϳϲϱϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MŽccƵEƌga SϮϲϵϳϱϯ͘gϭϬϯϵϱ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽccƵEƌgb SϭϵϳϬϳϲ͘gϬϲϴϱϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MŽccƵEƌgc SϰϭϯϰϮϯ͘gϭϵϯϭϮ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽccƵEƚƐϭͬϮa Sϳϭϭϲϳϳ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn AniƐeed
MŽcƵEƌgc SϲϬϯϮϴ͘gϬϯϳϵϴ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlEƌga Sϱϭϱϵϴ͘gϬϮϵϴϮ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlEƌgb SϵϳϯϭϬ͘gϬϴϮϯϴ͘Ϭϭ͘ƚ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlEƚƐϭͬϮa Sϵϵϭϭϱ͘gϬϴϲϭϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
OalEƚƐϭͬϮbϭ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϬϬϯ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalEƚƐϭͬϮbϮ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϳϭϬ͘ϭ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OdiEƌg GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϰϰϭϭϬϬϭͺSϱϯ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn OikŽbaƐe
OdiEƚƐϭͬϮbϮ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϯϲϴϯϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiEƚƐϭͬϮbϭ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϲϳϵϮϬϬϭͺSϮϭϮ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn OikŽbaƐe
OlŽEƚƐϭͬϮbϭ SCLϬDϬϭϭϭϬϭϰϯ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽEƚƐϭͬϮbϮ SCLDϬϭϭϮϬϱϬϱ͘ϭ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaEƚƐϭͬϮbϭ SCLHϬϭϬϬϭϬϱϵ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaEƚƐϭͬϮbϮ SCLHϬϭϬϬϭϭϴϭ͘ϭ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
PfƵEƌga SϮϵϲϲͺSϮϬϲϲϴ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn AniƐeed
PfƵEƌgb SϯϯϰϬ͘gϬϱϲϯϰ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PfƵEƌgc Sϭϰϴϵ͘gϬϯϳϴϬ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
PfƵEƚƐϭͬϮa Sϵϯϵϲ manƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn AniƐeed
PfƵEƚƐϭͬϮb Sϯϱϳ͘gϬϭϴϰϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
PmaEƌga Sϰϵϭ͘gϬϵϯϲϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
PmaEƌgb Sϭϴ͘gϬϬϳϳϵ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaEƌgc Sϲϰ͘gϬϮϯϬϬ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
PmaEƚƐϭͬϮa Sϭϭϭϭ͘gϭϯϳϭϲ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
PmaEƚƐϭͬϮb Sϰϴϰ͘gϬϵϮϳϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed

GeŶe Ŷaŵe GeŶe ID DaƚabaƐe
BbeMEKϭϮ XPͺϬϭϵϲϭϵϱϲϯ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeMEKϯϲ XPͺϬϭϵϲϰϰϯϴϴ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeMEKϰ XPͺϬϭϵϲϰϮϬϮϭ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeMEKϱ XPͺϬϭϵϲϮϰϬϵϱ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeMEKϳ XPͺϬϭϵϲϰϯϲϯϭ͘ϭ NCBI
BflͺSTKINϮϱ XPͺϬϬϮϱϵϴϳϯϳ͘ϭ NCBI
BflͺSTKINϯ XPͺϬϬϮϱϴϵϬϲϰ͘ϭ NCBI
BflMEKϭϮ XPͺϬϬϮϲϬϭϲϯϯ͘ϭ NCBI
BflMEKϯϲ XPͺϬϬϮϱϵϱϲϵϴ͘ϭ NCBI
BflMEKϰ XPͺϬϬϮϲϬϳϮϱϱ͘ϭ NCBI
BflMEKϱ XPͺϬϯϱϲϲϲϴϲϰ͘ϭ NCBI
BflMEKϳ XPͺϬϬϮϱϴϵϲϯϬ͘ϭ NCBI
BlaMEKϭϮ BLϮϮϵϰϬͺcƵfϰ
BlaMEKϯϲ BLϭϵϮϴϭͺeǀmϬ
BlaMEKϰ BLϬϱϳϭϳͺeǀmϬ
BlaMEKϱ BLϬϯϲϭϱͺeǀmϭϭ
BlaMEKϳ BLϮϯϮϯϭͺeǀmϬ
BleMEKϭϮ BŽleac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘SϰϰϮ͘gϬϵϴϯϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BleMEKϯϲ BŽleac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘SϮϱ͘gϬϱϵϴϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
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BleMEKϰ Boleac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘Sϴϴ͘gϭϰϵϱϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BleMEKϱ Boleac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘Sϯϰ͘gϬϴϬϬϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BleMEKϳ Boleac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘SϭϬϬ͘gϬϬϰϬϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BƐcMEKϭϮ BoƐchl͘CG͘BoƚǌnikϮϬϭϯ͘chƌUn͘gϮϴϮϳϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BƐcMEKϯϲ chƌϮнchƌUN ManƵal annoƚaƚion AniƐeed
BƐcMEKϰ BoƐchl͘CG͘BoƚǌnikϮϬϭϯ͘chƌUn͘gϬϯϯϵϴ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉнBoƐchl͘CG͘BoƚǌnikϮϬϭϯ͘ ManƵal annoƚaƚion AniƐeed
BƐcMEKϱ BoƐchl͘CG͘BoƚǌnikϮϬϭϯ͘chƌϭϮ͘gϲϭϯϬϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BƐcMEKϳ BoƐchl͘CG͘BoƚǌnikϮϬϭϯ͘chƌUn͘gϮϳϬϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
BƐƉMEKϯϲ SCLEϬϭϰϯϵϬϰϱ͘ϭнSCLEϬϭϰϭϲϭϱϬ͘ϭнSCLEϬϭϰϱϵϰϯϵ͘ϭ
BƐƉMEKϳ SCLEϬϭϬϭϲϳϲϮ͘ϭнSCLEϬϭϰϮϲϲϰϯ͘ϭнSCLEϬϭϯϮϵϯϬϳ͘ϭнSCLEϬϭϬϰϲϵϰ
CƌoͺSTKINϮϱ KH͘Cϳ͘ϯϬϴ͘ǀϭ͘A͘nonSLϮͲϭ AniƐeed
CƌoͺSTKINϯ KH͘Cϱ͘ϯϰϭ͘ǀϭ͘A͘nonSLϭͲϭ AniƐeed
CƌoMEKϭϮ KH͘Lϭϰϳ͘ϮϮ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϭͲϭ AniƐeed
CƌoMEKϯϲ KH͘LϭϳϮ͘ϭ͘ǀϭ͘A͘NDϭͲϭ AniƐeed
CƌoMEKϰ KH͘Cϴ͘ϯϰϯ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͲϭ AniƐeed
CƌoMEKϱ KH͘Cϭϭ͘ϴϰ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϯͲϭ AniƐeed
CƌoMEKϳ KH͘LϮϮ͘ϰϰ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͲϭ AniƐeed
CƐaMEKϭϮ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘RϬ͘ϭϮϭϲϵϲϯͲϭϮϭϴϵϴϯ͘ϭϰϱϳϲ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
CƐaMEKϯϲ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘RϵϬϱ͘ϯϵϳϮͲϭϭϯϯϭ͘Ϭϲϯϭϲ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
CƐaMEKϰ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϭϯϰ͘ϰϭϭϲϭϴͲϰϭϴϰϲϬ͘ϬϴϳϰϬ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
CƐaMEKϱ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϭϲ͘ϭϲϰϵϬϭϲͲϭϲϱϮϯϴϮ͘ϭϰϯϲϱ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
CƐaMEKϳ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϱϴ͘ϮϴϵϭϮϰϮͲϮϴϵϵϱϳϳ͘ϭϳϱϴϬ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
FboMEKϯϲa SDIIϬϭϬϮϴϴϲϬ͘ϭ
FboMEKϯϲb SDIIϬϭϬϮϴϴϲϬ͘ϭ
GgaMEKϭ XPͺϬϭϱϭϰϳϱϴϮ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaMEKϮ XPͺϬϭϱϭϱϱϰϬϰ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaMEKϯ XPͺϬϮϱϬϭϬϴϰϴ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaMEKϰ XPͺϬϭϱϭϱϬϳϮϯ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaMEKϱ XPͺϬϭϱϭϰϳϱϴϰ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaMEKϲ XPͺϬϬϯϲϰϮϯϵϲ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaMEKϳ XPͺϬϮϱϬϬϭϳϯϬ͘ϭ NCBI
HaƵMEKϭϮ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϴϴ͘gϬϭϴϯϵ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HaƵMEKϯϲ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϮϳ͘gϬϳϰϮϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HaƵMEKϰ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϭ͘gϬϬϯϲϯ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉнHaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϭ͘gϬ ManƵal annoƚaƚion AniƐeed
HaƵMEKϱ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϳϱϳ͘gϬϵϴϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HaƵMEKϳ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮϴ͘gϬϯϰϵϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌoMEKϭϮ Haƌoƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϱϴ͘gϭϮϱϮϭ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌoMEKϯϲ Haƌoƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮ͘gϭϬϵϴϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌoMEKϰ Haƌoƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϮ͘gϭϮϬϯϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉнHaƌoƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϮ͘gϭ ManƵal annoƚaƚion AniƐeed
HƌoMEKϱ Haƌoƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϱϬ͘gϬϲϭϭϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƌoMEKϳ Haƌoƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϭ͘gϬϬϵϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
HƐaͺSTKINϮϱ NPͺϬϬϭϮϱϴϵϬϲ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaͺSTKINϯ NPͺϬϬϲϮϳϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
HƐaMEKϭ NPͺϬϬϮϳϰϲ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaMEKϮ NPͺϭϬϵϱϴϳ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaMEKϯ NPͺϲϱϵϳϯϭ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaMEKϰ NPͺϬϬϯϬϬϭ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaMEKϱ NPͺϬϬϮϳϰϴ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaMEKϲ NPͺϬϬϮϳϰϵ͘Ϯ NCBI
HƐaMEKϳ NPͺϬϬϭϮϴϰϰϴϱ͘ϭ NCBI
LchMEKϭ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϬϭϲϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LchMEKϮ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϵϭϯϯ͘ϭ NCBI
LchMEKϯ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϴϰϴϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LchMEKϰ XPͺϬϬϲϬϭϭϰϳϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LchMEKϱ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϭϴϰϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LchMEKϲ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϮϮϭϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
LchMEKϳ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϳϲϱϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LocMEKϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϴϳϵϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LocMEKϮ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϵϵϯϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LocMEKϯ XPͺϬϭϱϮϭϱϯϵϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LocMEKϰ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϱϭϴϰ͘Ϯ NCBI
LocMEKϱ XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϴϴϳϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LocMEKϲ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϱϮϯϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LocMEKϳ XPͺϬϭϱϮϬϰϱϰϰ͘ϭ NCBI
MeƌMEKϯϲ SCLFϬϭϱϳϴϳϳϰ͘ϭнSCLFϬϭϲϲϰϬϴϱ͘ϭнSCLFϬϭϬϵϳϰϴϳ͘ϭнSCLFϬϭϲϮϳϭϳϴ
MeƌMEKϳ SCLFϬϭϳϯϬϴϮϱ͘ϭнSCLFϬϭϭϰϭϰϲϲ͘ϭнSCLFϬϭϭϲϰϵϭϱ͘ϭ
MoocciMEKϭϮ Moocci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϬϬϯϵϬ͘gϮϰϲϱϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MoocciMEKϯϲ Moocci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϱϳϰϳϬ͘gϬϱϵϳϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MoocciMEKϰ Moocci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϲϯϯϲϲ͘gϬϲϭϴϱ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉSϯϬϭϳϵϰ AniƐeed
MoocciMEKϱ Moocci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϭϳϭϭϳϭ͘gϬϯϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MoocciMEKϳ Moocci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϰϲϬϳϭ͘gϮϵϱϯϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MooccƵMEKϭϮ MooccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϰϰϭϱϮϭ͘gϮϭϰϰϬ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉнMooccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϱϱϴ ManƵal annoƚaƚion AniƐeed
MooccƵMEKϯϲ MooccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϱϰϬϲϯϴ͘gϯϭϰϬϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
MooccƵMEKϰ MooccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϳϮϮϰϬϬ͘gϰϳϰϬϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AniƐeed
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MŽŽccƵMEKϱ MŽŽccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϳϮϭϲϬϵ͘gϰϳϮϳϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽccƵMEKϳ MŽŽccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϳϬϯϭϰϱ͘gϰϰϵϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉнSϳϬϯϭϰϱнSϲϲϱϱϵϴнSϳϬϯ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽcƵůMEKϭϮ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϵϭϵϵϰ͘gϬϳϯϮϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽcƵůMEKϯϲ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϮϬϴϵϯ͘gϬϬϴϬϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽcƵůMEKϰ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϯϭϴϮϯ͘gϬϭϱϰϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽcƵůMEKϱ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϬϲϰϯ͘gϭϭϳϬϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽŽcƵůMEKϳ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϬϭϲϴ͘gϬϱϴϴϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
OaůMEKϯϲ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϬϯϮ͘ϭ
OaůMEKϳa SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϱϰϰ͘ϭ
OdiͺSTKINϮϱ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϭϬϬϲϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiͺSTKINϰ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϯϮϰϱϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiMEKϯϲ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϱϬϱϯϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiMEKϳ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϬϵϰϯϬϬϭнScϯϳͺϮϯϭϯϯϲͲϮϯϭϵϭϬ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ OikŽbaƐe
OůŽMEKϯϲa SCLDϬϭϭϲϯϬϬϴ͘ϭ
OůŽMEKϯϲb SCLDϬϭϬϵϴϮϲϰ͘ϭ
OůŽMEKϯϲc SCLDϬϭϭϬϵϵϳϱ͘ϭ
OůŽMEKϳa SCLDϬϭϬϵϯϱϬϱ͘ϭ
OůŽMEKϳb SCLDϬϭϭϳϴϰϯϵ͘ϭ
OǀaMEKϯϲ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϳϲϵ͘ϭ
OǀaMEKϳ SCLHϬϭϬϮϮϳϰϴ͘ϭнSCLHϬϭϬϬϭϭϮϴ͘ϭнSCLHϬϭϬϰϱϲϳϲ͘ϭ
PfƵMEKϭϮ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϮ͘gϬϬϱϵϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵMEKϯϲ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮϯ͘gϬϭϰϱϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵMEKϰ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϭϬϴ͘gϬϯϮϳϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵMEKϱ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϴϯϱ͘gϬϮϴϮϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵMEKϳ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϰϬϵ͘gϬϰϴϮϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMEKϭϮ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϮϲϲ͘gϭϳϱϵϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMEKϯϲ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϵϱ͘gϬϱϭϯϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMEKϰ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϮ͘gϬϬϰϵϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMEKϱ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϲϵ͘gϬϵϬϴϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaMEKϳ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϳϵ͘gϬϰϴϯϲ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed

GĞŶĞ ŶĂŵĞ GĞŶĞ ID DĂƚĂďĂƐĞ
BbeGaƚaϭϮϯ XPͺϬϭϵϲϮϳϭϰϭ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeGaƚaϰϱϲ XPͺϬϭϵϲϭϴϳϵϮ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůGTFϭϮϯ ACRϲϲϮϭϰ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůGTFϰϱϲa ACRϲϲϮϭϲ͘ϭ NCBI
BůaGaƚaϭϮϯ AFJϳϵϰϵϬ͘ϭ NCBI
BůaGaƚaϰϱϲ AFJϳϵϰϵϭ͘ϭ NCBI
BůeGaƚaϭϮϯ Sϯϭϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BůeGaƚaϰϱϲ BŽůeac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘Sϭϰϳ͘gϬϮϴϳϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BƐcGaƚaϭϮϯ ChƌUŶͺChƌϭϬ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐcGaƚaϭϮϯ ChƌϭϬ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐcGaƚaϰϱϲ ChƌUŶ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐƉGaƚa SCLEϬϭϰϮϬϬϴϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
BƐƉGaƚa SCLEϬϭϰϬϴϵϱϳ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
BƐƉGaƚa SCLEϬϭϰϭϰϴϭϯ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
BƐƉGaƚa SCLEϬϭϮϭϭϮϮϮ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
CƌŽGaƚaϭϮϯ KH͘Sϲϵϲ͘ϭ͘ǀϭ͘R͘NDϭͺϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽGaƚaϰϱϲ KH͘LϮϬ͘ϭ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƐaGaƚaϭϮϯ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϰϭ͘ϮϭϮϭϵϵϮͲϮϭϮϵϮϴϰ͘ϭϰϭϱϯ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
CƐaGaƚaϰϱϲ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϳϳ͘ϮϵϵϲϵϮϲͲϯϬϬϴϴϭϴ͘ϭϰϰϭϲ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
FbŽGaƚa SDIIϬϭϬϵϳϴϰϲ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
FbŽGaƚa SDIIϬϭϬϳϴϴϳϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
GgaGaƚaϭ NPͺϵϵϬϳϵϱ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaGaƚaϮ NPͺϬϬϭϬϬϯϳϵϳ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaGaƚaϯ NPͺϬϬϭϬϬϴϰϰϰ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaGaƚaϰ NPͺϬϬϭϮϴϬϬϯϱ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaGaƚaϱ NPͺϵϵϬϳϱϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaGaƚaϲ NPͺϵϵϬϳϱϭ͘ϭ NCBI
HaƵGaƚaϭϮϯ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϰ͘gϬϬϲϵϮ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺSϮϰ AŶiƐeed
HaƵGaƚaϰϱϲ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϭϮ͘gϬϮϮϬϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƌŽGaƚaϭϮϯ HaƌŽƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϮ͘gϭϭϳϯϭ͘Ϭϭ͘ƚͺSϭϮ AŶiƐeed
HƌŽGaƚaϰϱϲ HaƌŽƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϱ͘gϬϰϯϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƐaGaƚaϭ NPͺϬϬϮϬϰϬ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaGaƚaϮ NPͺϬϬϭϭϯϵϭϯϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaGaƚaϯ NPͺϬϬϭϬϬϮϮϵϱ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaGaƚaϰ NPͺϬϬϭϮϵϱϬϮϮ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaGaƚaϱ NPͺϱϯϲϳϮϭ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaGaƚaϲ NPͺϬϬϱϮϰϴ͘Ϯ NCBI
LchGaƚaϭ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϴϱϵϴ͘ϭ NCBI
LchGaƚaϮ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϭϴϵϮ͘ϭ NCBI

GĂƚĂ
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LchGaƚaϯ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϯϵϯϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LchGaƚaϰ XPͺϬϭϰϯϱϭϴϱϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchGaƚaϱ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϰϮϮϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LchGaƚaϲ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϱϳϳϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcGaƚaϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϱϯϱϲ͘Ϯ NCBI
LŽcGaƚaϮ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϭϭϮϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcGaƚaϯ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϯϯϱϱ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcGaƚaϰ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϮϵϵϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcGaƚaϱ XPͺϬϭϱϮϮϬϰϵϯ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcGaƚaϲ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϯϵϮϯ͘ϭ NCBI
MeƌGaƚa SCLFϬϭϮϳϬϴϵϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MeƌGaƚa SCLFϬϭϰϭϱϭϮϬ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MeƌGaƚa SCLFϬϭϮϭϭϰϬϯͺϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MeƌGaƚa SCLFϬϭϱϯϬϮϭϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MeƌGaƚa SCLFϬϭϮϯϵϴϳϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽcciGaƚaϭϮϯ Sϰϴϳϭϱϲ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽcciGaƚaϰϱϲ Sϰϱϴϵϲϲ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽccƵGaƚaϭϮϯ SϳϮϯϱϳϮ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽccƵGaƚaϰϱϲ SϱϱϳϭϭϬͺSϮϬϵϴϭϴ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽcƵůGaƚaϭϮϯ SϵϳϮϯϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽcƵůGaƚaϰϱϲ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϰϰϱϭϮ͘gϬϮϯϱϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
OaůGaƚa SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϭϲϳ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OaůGaƚa SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϬϯϮϯ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OdiGBPϮ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϴϱϵϯϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiGBPϯa GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϬϬϬϰϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiGBPϯb GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϭϬϵϮϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiGTFb GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϳϵϮϭϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OůŽGaƚa SCLDϬϭϭϬϲϭϱϵ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OůŽGaƚa SCLDϬϭϭϳϮϳϳϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OůŽGaƚa SCLDϬϭϭϭϵϭϰϴ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OůŽGaƚa SCLDϬϭϭϮϲϱϲϬ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OůŽGaƚa SCLDϬϭϬϭϴϭϴϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaGaƚa SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϴϰϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaGaƚa SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϭϭϬ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaGaƚa SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϮϲϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaGaƚa SCLHϬϭϬϬϮϬϯϯͺF ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaGaƚa SCLHϬϭϬϬϮϬϯϯͺR ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
PfƵGaƚaϭϮϯ SϮϰϰͺSϭϭϯϰϮ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PfƵGaƚaϰϱϲ SϲϮϳϭͺϬͺSϮϮϮϮ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PŵaGaƚaϭϮϯ Sϱϯϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PŵaGaƚaϰϱϲ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϴϯϱ͘gϭϮϮϲϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed

GeŶe Ŷaŵe GeŶe ID DaƚabaƐe
BbeFŽǆF
BbeFŽǆQ XPͺϬϭϵϲϮϴϵϲϴ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůFŽǆF CAHϲϵϲϵϱ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůFŽǆQ XPͺϬϯϱϲϴϬϯϲϳ͘ϭ NCBI
BůaFŽǆF BLϬϮϯϭϭͺeǀŵϮ
BůaFŽǆQ BLϬϬϳϭϯͺeǀŵϬ
BůeFŽǆF SϮϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐcFŽǆF ChƌϵͺChƌUŶ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐƉFŽǆF SCLEϬϭϰϬϵϲϭϱ
CƌFŽǆQ KH͘Lϰϰ͘ϭϵ͘ǀϭ͘A͘ŶŽŶSLϰͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽFŽǆF KH͘Cϯ͘ϭϳϬ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϭͲϭ AŶiƐeed
CƐaFŽǆF CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϭϭ͘ϭϮϴϳϬϯϱͲϭϮϵϰϬϲϬ͘ϭϱϰϳϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
CƐaFŽǆQ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϭ͘ϭϮϮϲϭϰϬͲϭϮϮϵϰϳϵ͘ϭϭϲϭϱ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
FbŽFŽǆF SDIIϬϭϭϮϳϯϮϴ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
GgaFŽǆFϭ XPͺϰϭϰϭϴϲ͘ϱ NCBI
GgaFŽǆFϮ XPͺϬϭϱϭϯϳϲϳϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaFŽǆQ XPͺϬϭϱϭϯϳϲϳϭ͘Ϯ NCBI
HaƵFŽǆF HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϴϴϮ͘gϬϲϵϵϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƌŽFŽǆF HaƌŽƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰϴ͘gϬϴϴϬϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƐaFŽǆFϭ NPͺϬϬϭϰϰϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
HƐaFŽǆFϮ NPͺϬϬϭϰϰϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐFŽǆQϭ NPͺϭϱϬϮϴϱ͘ϯ NCBI
LchFŽǆFϭ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϱϵϰϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LchFŽǆFϮ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϭϭϵϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LchFŽǆQ XPͺϬϬϲϬϭϯϯϭϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcFŽǆFϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϭϮϬϯ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcFŽǆFϮ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϰϱϮϱ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcFŽǆQ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϰϲϮϭ͘ϭ NCBI
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MeƌFŽǆF SCLFϬϭϬϴϲϯϱϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
MŽccŝFŽǆ SϰϱϲϬϵϳ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽccƵFŽǆF SϲϴϱϳϮϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽcƵůFŽǆF MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϰϱϬϲ͘gϭϯϰϳϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶŝƐeed
OaůFŽǆF SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϯϭϵ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
OdFŽǆQ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϵϳϱϱϬϬϭ OŝŬŽbaƐe
OdŝFŽǆF GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϳϳϲϯϬϬϭ OŝŬŽbaƐe
OůŽFŽǆ SCLDϬϭϭϲϯϲϭϴ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
OǀaFŽǆF SCLHϬϭϬϬϭϳϵϮ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
PfƵFŽǆF PhfƵŵŝ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϬϭϮ͘gϬϯϭϮϮ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶŝƐeed
PfƵFŽǆQ PhfƵŵŝ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϯϱϬϱ͘gϬϱϳϱϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ
PŵaFŽǆF Sϯϳϭ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
PŵaFŽǆQ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϲϱϰ͘gϭϬϵϱϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ

GeŶe Ŷaŵe GeŶe ID DaƚabaƐe
BbeNŬǆϮ͘ϭ XPͺϬϭϵϲϰϴϬϭϬ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeNŬǆϮ͘Ϯ XPͺϬϭϵϲϰϳϵϴϵ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeNŬǆϰ XPͺϬϭϵϲϰϲϭϰϴ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůNŬǆϮ͘ϭ XPͺϬϬϮϱϴϵϭϵϰ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůNŬǆϮ͘Ϯ XPͺϬϬϮϱϴϵϭϵϵ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůNŬǆϰ XPͺϬϬϮϲϭϬϰϯϱ͘ϭ NCBI
BůaNŬǆϰ AWVϵϭϱϴϱ͘ϭ NCBI
BůeͺŶŬϰ Sϳ AŶŝƐeed
BůeNŬϮ Sϵϱϵ AŶŝƐeed
BƐcͺŶŬϰ chƌϵ AŶŝƐeed
BƐcNŬϮ ChƌUŶ AŶŝƐeed
BƐƚͺNŬϰ ϱΖůŽŶg ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
CƌŽNKϮa KH͘CϭϬ͘ϯϯϴ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϰ AŶŝƐeed
CƌŽNŬϰ KH͘Cϴ͘ϰϴϮ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͲϭ AŶŝƐeed
CƐaNKϮ ENSϴϭ͘Rϯϳ͘ϭϱϮϱϮϯϮ AŶŝƐeed
CƐaNŬϰ CŝƐaǀŝ͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘RϮϰ͘ϰϭϬϴϮϲͲϰϭϲϬϳϵ͘ϭϬϰϳϬ͘Ɖ AŶŝƐeed
FbŽNŬϮ SDIIϭϭϮϮϮϮϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
FbŽNŬϮ SDIIϬϭϬϰϱϬϰϯ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
GgaNŬǆϮ͘ϭ NPͺϵϴϵϵϰϳ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaNŬǆϮ͘Ϯ NPͺϬϬϭϮϲϰϲϰϳ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaNŬǆϮ͘ϯ NPͺϵϵϬϯϲϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaNŬǆϮ͘ϰ XPͺϬϭϱϭϯϴϵϭϲ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaNŬǆϮ͘ϱ NPͺϵϵϬϰϵϱ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaNŬǆϮ͘ϲ NPͺϵϵϬϰϲϴ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaNŬǆϮ͘ϴ XPͺϬϬϯϲϰϭϰϬϴ͘ϯ NCBI
HaƵ SϮϰϵRCͺSϱϰϱϵ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
HaƵNŬϮ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϲϱ͘gϬϯϴϯϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶŝƐeed
HƌŽͺNŬϰ SϰϭͺϯϯϯϮϬϴͲϯϲϴϰϲϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
HƌŽNŬϮ HaƌŽƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϯϮ͘gϬϭϳϭϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶŝƐeed
HƐaNŬϮ͘ϰ NPͺϭϰϵϰϭϲ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaNŬϮ͘ϲ NPͺϬϬϭϭϮϵϳϰϯ͘Ϯ NCBI
HƐaNKǆϮ͘Ϯ NPͺϬϬϮϱϬϬ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaNŬǆϮ͘ϯ NPͺϲϲϬϯϮϴ͘Ϯ NCBI
HƐaNŬǆϮ͘ϱ NPͺϬϬϰϯϳϴ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘ϭ XPͺϬϬϱϵϴϵϮϯϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘Ϯ XPͺϬϬϲϬϭϯϮϴϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘ϯ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϭϴϴϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘ϰ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϴϬϱϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘ϱ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϮϱϳϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘ϲ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϭϵϱϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNŬǆϮ͘ϴ XPͺϬϬϱϵϴϵϮϲϮ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘ϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϮϳϯϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘Ϯ XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϲϭϵϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘ϯ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϬϰϵϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘ϰ XPͺϬϭϱϮϬϴϰϲϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘ϱ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϭϳϰϯ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘ϲ XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϱϱϱϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNŬǆϮ͘ϴ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϮϳϲϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
MeƌͺNŬϰ ϱΖůŽŶg ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽccŝNŬϮ Sϳϳϯϯϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽccŝNŬϰ SϯϯϮϮϵϯ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽccƵNŬϮ SϲϵϬϬϯϰ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽccƵNŬϰ MŽŽccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϱϳϱϰϯ͘gϰϬϯϭϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶŝƐeed
MŽcƵůNŬϮ Sϭϭϯϰϵϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ AŶŝƐeed
MŽcƵůNŬϰ MŽŽcƵů͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϭϭϮϬϴϴ͘gϭϮϮϰϳ͘Ϭϭ͘ƉͺŵŽdŝfǇ AŶŝƐeed
OaůͺNŬϰ ϱΖůŽŶg ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚŝŽŶ
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OaůNkϮ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϬϴϴ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OdiͺNkϰ BCNͺϱůŽŶg ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OdiNKϮa GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϬϯϲϴϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiNKϮb GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϭϵϵϮϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OůŽͺNkϰ ϱΖůŽŶg ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaͺNkϰ ϱΖůŽŶg ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaNkϮb SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϳϮϳ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
PfƵNkϮ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϵϱϯ͘gϬϯϬϮϴ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵNkϰ Sϭϰϵϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PŵaNkϮ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱϵϳ͘gϭϬϰϭϵ͘Ϭϯ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaNkϰ ϭϴϱ ŵaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed

GĞŶĞ ŶaŵĞ GĞŶĞ ID DaƚabaƐĞ
BbeHaŶd XPͺϬϭϵϲϮϱϯϱϵ͘ϭ NCBI
BbeNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϭϵϲϯϱϰϰϴ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůHaŶd AELϭϯϳϳϬ͘ϭ NCBI
BfůNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ AAFϴϭϳϲϲ͘ϭ NCBI
BůaHaŶd AFJϳϵϰϵϯ͘ϭ NCBI
BůaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ ACEϳϵϳϭϳ͘ϭ NCBI
BůeHaŶd BŽůeac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘Sϭϱϰ͘gϬϯϭϯϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BůeHaŶdƌ Sϵϲ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BůeNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ BŽůeac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘SϲϮϯ͘gϭϮϱϬϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BůeNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ BŽůeac͘CG͘SBͺǀϯ͘Sϴϴϳ͘gϭϱϬϬϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BƐcHaŶd ChƌUŶ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
BƐcHaŶdƌ BŽƐchů͘CG͘BŽƚǌŶikϮϬϭϯ͘chƌϭϮ͘gϭϬϴϮϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BƐcNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ BŽƐchů͘CG͘BŽƚǌŶikϮϬϭϯ͘chƌϭϬ͘gϱϲϬϭϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
BƐƉHaŶd SCLEϬϭϰϯϳϬϳϮ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
BƐƉNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLEϬϭϰϯϮϳϮϰ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
CƌŽHaŶd KH͘Cϭϰ͘ϲϬϰ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϮͺϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽHaŶdƌ KH͘Cϭ͘ϭϭϭϲ͘ǀϭ͘A͘SLϭͺϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ KH͘Cϲ͘ϭϮϵ AŶiƐeed
CƐaHaŶd CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϰϵ͘ϮϮϲϭϰϵϴͲϮϮϲϮϵϵϰ͘ϭϲϭϮϰ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
CƐaHaŶdƌ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘Rϭϰ͘ϮϮϬϵϲϮͲϮϮϮϱϱϮ͘ϭϲϭϯϳ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
CƐaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ CiƐaǀi͘CG͘ENSϴϭ͘RϱϯϮ͘ϴϴϮϰϴͲϵϬϭϵϮ͘Ϭϱϴϲϯ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
FbŽHaŶd SDIIϬϭϬϲϱϴϰϵ
FbŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SDIIϬϭϬϳϭϲϯϱ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
FbŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SDIIϬϭϬϲϭϴϲϯ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
GgaHaŶdϭ NPͺϵϵϬϮϵϲ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaHaŶdϮ NPͺϵϵϬϮϵϳ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ NPͺϵϵϬϮϭϰ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϬϯϲϰϭϱϭϵ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ NPͺϵϵϬϭϮϳ͘ϭ NCBI
HaƵHaŶd HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϭϲϳ͘gϬϮϵϬϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HaƵHaŶdƌ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϳϮ͘gϬϭϲϭϯ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HaƵNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ HaaƵƌa͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϴϱϵ͘gϬϲϵϭϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƌŽHaŶd HaƌŽƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϰϬ͘gϬϵϭϳϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƌŽHaŶdƌ HaƌŽƌe͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϳϰ͘gϭϭϰϯϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƌŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϱ͘gϬϴϯϬϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
HƐaHaŶdϭ NPͺϬϬϰϴϭϮ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaHaŶdϮ NPͺϬϲϴϴϬϴ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ NPͺϬϳϲϵϮϰ͘ϭ NCBI
HƐaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ NPͺϬϲϲϮϳϵ͘Ϯ NCBI
HƐaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ NPͺϬϬϲϭϱϮ͘Ϯ NCBI
LchHaŶdϭ XPͺϬϬϱϵϴϴϯϳϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchHaŶdϮ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϯϬϯϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϯϱϯϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϰϵϵϮ͘ϭ NCBI
LchNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϬϲϬϭϭϰϭϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcHaŶdϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϮϬϭϮ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcHaŶdϮ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϬϬϮϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϭϱϮϬϮϵϯϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ XPͺϬϭϱϮϬϱϮϰϱ͘ϭ NCBI
MeƌHaŶd SCLFϬϭϬϬϰϮϵϭͺSCLFϬϭϳϮϳϯϭϴ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MeƌNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLFϬϭϭϰϱϮϴϱ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
MŽcciHaŶd SϰϵϮϲϲϳ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
MŽcciHaŶdƌ MŽŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϮϰϳϵϯ͘gϮϲϳϮϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽcciNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ MŽŽcci͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϲϰϳϴϳϳ͘gϮϵϴϱϴ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽccƵHaŶd MŽŽccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϱϰϲϴϮϬ͘gϯϮϯϱϰ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽccƵHaŶdƌ MŽŽccƵ͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϲϳϰϮϬϯ͘gϰϭϳϳϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽccƵNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SϰϯϴϴϬϮ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
MŽcƵůHaŶd SϭϭϮϳϱϳ MaŶƵaů aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed

HaŶd
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MŽcƵlHaŶdƌ MŽŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘SϴϮϰϯϳ͘gϬϲϭϱϬ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
MŽcƵlNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ MŽŽcƵl͘CG͘ELǀϭͺϮ͘Sϭϱϵϳϳ͘gϬϬϱϯϭ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
OalHaŶd SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϱϲϯ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OalNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϭϭϵ͘ϭ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OdiHaŶd GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϱϱϱϮϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϴϮϭϭϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OlŽHaŶd SCLDϬϭϭϰϰϭϬϰ
OlŽHaŶd SCLDϬϭϬϭϮϰϴϵͺSCLDϬϭϬϱϭϮϰϯ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OlŽHaŶd SCLDϬϭϬϲϮϲϲϳ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OlŽHaŶd SCLDϬϭϬϵϭϮϳϳ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OlŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLDϬϭϭϰϰϯϵϮ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OlŽNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLDϬϭϬϵϬϴϰϴ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaHaŶd SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϱϲϴ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
OǀaNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϰϵϰ͘ϭ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ
PfƵHaŶd PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϵϱϮ͘gϬϱϮϵϲ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PfƵHaŶdƌ SϱϮϲϬ MaŶƵal aŶŶŽƚaƚiŽŶ AŶiƐeed
PfƵNeƵƌŽgeŶiŶ PhfƵŵi͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϭϮϵϳϵ͘gϬϵϬϰϵ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaHaŶd Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϯϴϮ͘gϭϲϲϬϱ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaHaŶdƌ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘Sϰ͘gϬϬϭϳϭ͘ϬϮ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed
PŵaNeƵƌŽgeŶeŶiŶ Phŵaŵŵ͘CG͘MTPϮϬϭϰ͘SϮϮϵ͘gϬϱϳϰϳ͘Ϭϭ͘Ɖ AŶiƐeed

GeŶe Ŷaŵe GeŶe ID DaƚabaƐe
BflBƌachǇƵƌǇϭ XPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϯϵϭ͘ϭ NCBI
BflBƌachǇƵƌǇϮ XPͺϬϬϮϱϵϬϯϵϬ͘ϭ NCBI
BflTbƌϭ AAGϯϰϴϵϯ͘Ϯ NCBI
BflTbǆϭͬϭϬ AAGϯϰϴϴϳ͘Ϯ NCBI
BflTbǆϭϱ XPͺϬϬϮϱϵϵϬϱϳ͘ϭ NCBI
BflTbǆϮͺϯ XPͺϬϬϮϱϵϴϵϮϮ͘ϭ NCBI
BflTbǆϮϬ XPͺϬϬϮϲϭϮϯϱϬ͘ϭ NCBI
BflTbǆϰͺϱ ABUϱϬϳϳϵ͘ϭ NCBI
BflTbǆϲͺϭϲ XPͺϬϬϮϲϭϮϬϭϯ͘ϭ NCBI
BlaBƌachǇƵƌǇ BLϮϯϱϱϳͺeǀŵϬ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbƌϭ BLϬϴϵϮϱ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbǆϭͬϭϬ BLϬϭϵϴϴͺeǀŵϭ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbǆϭϱ BLϵϱϳϲϲͺeǀŵϬ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbǆϮͺϯ BLϭϮϱϬϮͺBLϬϮϯϯϭͺBLϭϮϳϱ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbǆϮϬ BLϭϲϬϮϴͺeǀŵϬ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbǆϰͺϱ BLϬϲϯϳϵͺeǀŵϬ AŶiƐeed
BlaTbǆϲͺϭϲ BLϬϰϲϳϳͺcƵfϭ AŶiƐeed
BleTbǆϭͬϭϬ SϲϬ͘gϭϮϭϵϲ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ Sϳϰϵ͘gϭϯϴϭϰ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ Sϯϴ͘gϬϴϲϴϴ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleTbǆϮͬϯ Sϱϱϯ͘gϭϭϱϱϴ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleTbǆϮϬ SϱϲϮ͘gϭϭϲϱϯ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BleTbǆϲ SϮϱϲ͘gϬϲϭϬϵ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐcTbǆϭͬϭϬ chƌUŶͺgϰϴϯϮϱ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐcTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ chƌϳ͘gϲϯϰϬϴ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐcTbǆϮͬϯ chƌϳ͘gϱϯϮϭϮ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐcTbǆϲ chƌϭ͘gϰϴϳϬϯ͘Ϭϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐƚBƌachǇƵƌǇͬTbǆϭϵ SCLEϬϭϮϮϴϬϬϯ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐƚTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SCLEϬϭϬϭϳϰϵϰ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐƚTbǆϮͬϯ SCLEϬϭϰϰϲϯϲϮ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐƚTbǆϮͬϯ SCLEϬϭϰϮϵϭϯϲ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
BƐƚTbǆϲͬϭϲͬϮϰͬVegT SCLEϬϭϰϯϰϳϬϬ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽEŽŵeƐͬTbƌϭ KH͘Cϯ͘ϳϳϯ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϭͬϭϬ KH͘Cϳ͘ϲϮϴ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ KH͘Sϱϴϵ͘ϰ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ KH͘SϭϰϬϰ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϮͬϯ KH͘Lϵϲ͘ϴϳ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϮϬ KH͘Cϭ͘ϮϮϰ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϲ͘ϭ KH͘Sϲϱϰ͘ϭ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϲ͘Ϯ KH͘Sϲϱϰ͘Ϯ AŶiƐeed
CƌŽTbǆϲ͘ϯ KH͘Sϲϱϰ͘ϯ AŶiƐeed
CƐaEŽŵeƐͬTbƌϭ RϭϬϳ͘ϯϮϰϭϭϳͲϯϯϭϵϭϴ͘ϬϯϮϰϲ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϭͬϭϬ RϭϮϱ͘ϵϯϬϵϯͲϭϬϴϰϱϱ͘ϬϭϰϭϮ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ Rϭϭϴ͘ϭϮϴϲϳϯͲϭϯϰϬϯϴϮ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ Rϯϴϴ͘ϮϱϴϬϴϬͲϮϲϰϯϯϴ͘Ϭϯϴϱϱ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϮͬϯ RϵϬ͘ϯϭϴϭϵϴͲϯϯϭϲϭϯ͘ϭϲϱϳϴ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϮϬ RϭϮϱ͘ϵϯϬϵϯͲϭϬϴϰϱϱ͘ϬϭϰϭϮ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϲ͘ϭ Rϭϲ͘ϱϬϭϮϳϮϬͲϱϬϭϰϵϳϬ͘ϮϬϬϰϯ AŶiƐeed
CƐaTbǆϲ͘ϭ Rϭϲ͘ϱϬϰϭϱϬϬͲϱϬϱϱϲϮϳ͘ϮϬϬϱϳ AŶiƐeed

Tbǆ
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FboBrachǇƵrǇͬTbǆϭϵ SDIIϬϭϬϲϮϳϬϰ͘ϭ ManƵal annotation
FboTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SDIIϬϭϭϭϲϲϮϮ͘ϭ ManƵal annotation
FboTbǆϮͬϯ SDIIϬϭϭϮϰϲϰϭ͘ϭ ManƵal annotation
FboTbǆϮϬ SCIIϬϭϭϯϭϰϲϮ͘ϭ ManƵal annotation
GgaBrachǇƵrǇ XPͺϬϭϱϭϯϵϱϯϭ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaEomes NPͺϬϬϭϯϬϴϰϴϰ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbrϭ XPͺϬϭϱϭϰϱϮϬϭ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϭ XPͺϬϮϱϬϭϭϰϴϭ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϭϱ XPͺϰϭϲϱϯϳ͘ϯ NCBI
GgaTbǆϭϴ NPͺϵϴϵϳϴϰ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaTbǆϭϵ NPͺϵϵϬϮϴϭ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϮ XPͺϬϬϭϮϯϱϯϮϭ͘ϰ NCBI
GgaTbǆϮϬ NPͺϵϴϵϰϳϱ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϮϭ XPͺϬϭϱϭϱϰϵϲϲ͘Ϯ NCBI
GgaTbǆϮϮ NPͺϵϴϵϰϯϳ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϯ NPͺϬϬϭϮϱϳϴϬϳ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϰ NPͺϬϬϭϬϮϱϳϬϴ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϱ XPͺϬϭϱϭϱϬϯϭϳ͘ϭ NCBI
GgaTbǆϲ XPͺϬϮϱϬϭϭϭϵϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HaƵEomesͬTbrϭ SϭϬϱϵ͘gϬϳϰϵϴ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HaƵTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ Sϰϵϰϯ͘gϭϬϴϮϭ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HaƵTbǆϭϵͬBrachǇƵrǇ SϯϮϰ͘gϬϰϯϬϳ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HaƵTbǆϮͬϯ Sϵ͘gϬϬϮϵϴ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HaƵTbǆϲ͘ϭ SϴϮϵ͘gϬϲϴϬϵ͘Ϭϯ Aniseed
HaƵTbǆϲ͘Ϯ Sϭϴϭϳ͘gϬϴϵϯϬ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HroEomesͬTbrϭ Sϳϴ͘gϭϰϳϰϵ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HroTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ Sϲϭ͘gϬϯϲϱϵ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HroTbǆϭϵͬBrachǇƵrǇ SϰϮ͘gϬϳϵϭϲ͘ϬϮ Aniseed
HroTbǆϮͬϯ SϭϮϬ͘gϭϮϳϰϯ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HroTbǆϲ͘ϭ Sϵϯϯ͘gϭϬϳϵϵ͘Ϭϯ Aniseed
HroTbǆϲ͘Ϯ Sϰϲϭ͘gϭϯϬϴϮ͘Ϭϭ Aniseed
HsaBrachǇƵrǇ NPͺϬϬϭϮϱϳϰϭϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaEomes NPͺϬϬϭϮϲϱϭϭϭ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbrϭ NPͺϬϬϲϱϴϰ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϭ NPͺϬϬϱϵϴϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϭϱ NPͺϲϴϵϱϵϯ͘Ϯ NCBI
HsaTbǆϭϴ NPͺϬϬϭϬϳϯϵϳϳ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϭϵ NPͺϬϬϱϭϰϬ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϮ NPͺϬϬϱϵϴϱ͘ϯ NCBI
HsaTbǆϮϬ NPͺϬϬϭϭϱϵϲϵϮ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϮϭ NPͺϬϯϳϰϴϯ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϮϮ NPͺϬϱϴϲϱϬ͘ϭ NCBI
HsaTbǆϲ NPͺϬϬϰϱϵϵ͘Ϯ NCBI
HsTbǆϭϬ NPͺϬϬϱϵϴϲ͘Ϯ NCBI
HsTbǆϯ NPͺϬϬϱϵϴϳ͘ϯ NCBI
HsTbǆϰ NPͺϬϬϭϯϬϴϬϰϵ͘ϭ NCBI
HsTbǆϱ NPͺϬϬϬϭϴϯ͘Ϯ NCBI
LchBrachǇƵrǇ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϯϰϭϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LchEomes XPͺϬϬϲϬϭϭϵϮϱ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbrϭ XPͺϬϬϲϬϭϬϰϲϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϭ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϬϲϯϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϭϱ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϰϴϴϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϭϴ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϱϭϭϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϭϵ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϲϬϬϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϮ XPͺϬϬϱϵϴϲϴϳϴ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϮϬ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϱϲϯϴ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϮϭ XPͺϬϬϱϵϵϬϭϮϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϮϮ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϳϲϬϰ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϯ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϳϴϵϯ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϰ XPͺϬϬϱϵϴϲϴϳϳ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϱ XPͺϬϬϲϬϬϳϴϵϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LchTbǆϲ XPͺϬϭϰϯϰϰϱϱϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LocBrachǇƵrǇ XPͺϬϭϱϮϭϴϮϰϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LocEomes XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϱϲϭϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbrϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϲϲϭϭ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϭ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϬϭϴϮ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϭϱ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϵϮϳϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϭϴ XPͺϬϬϲϲϮϱϴϵϴ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϭϵ XPͺϬϭϱϮϭϲϵϵϮ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϮ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϬϵϲϬ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϮϬ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϱϲϭϱ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϮϭ XPͺϬϭϱϮϭϳϳϱϲ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϮϮ XPͺϬϬϲϲϯϯϬϯϮ͘ϭ NCBI
LocTbǆϯ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϬϯϯϴ͘ϭ NCBI
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LŽcTbǆϰ XPͺϬϭϱϮϮϮϴϲϴ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcTbǆϱ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϬϯϯϵ͘ϭ NCBI
LŽcTbǆϲ XPͺϬϬϲϲϰϭϬϲϯ͘ϭ NCBI
MeƌBƌachǇƵƌǇͬTbǆϭϵ SCLFϬϭϭϱϮϰϮϭ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MeƌMŽdͺTbǆϮͬϯ SCLFϬϭϬϱϲϲϰϭ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MeƌTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SCLFϬϭϮϱϭϮϬϯ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MeƌTbǆϮͬϯ SCLFϬϭϬϮϲϯϳϮ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MeƌTbǆϮͬϯ SCLFϬϭϬϰϴϯϬϴ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MeƌTbǆϲͬϭϲͬϮϰͬVegT SCLFϬϭϬϯϲϲϯϯ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
MŽcciEŽmeƐͬTbƌϭ Sϰϳϳϵϭϲ͘gϭϲϳϬϴ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcciTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SϱϯϬϴϭϵ͘gϮϬϮϯϮ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcciTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ Sϲϯϰϵϳϵ͘gϮϳϵϬϰ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcciTbǆϮͬϯ SϰϳϵϬϲϱ͘gϭϲϴϭϴ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcciTbǆϲ Sϰϵϳϲϵϳ͘gϭϴϴϱϳ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽccƵEŽmeƐͬTbƌϭ SϳϭϲϴϮϯ͘gϰϲϲϭϴ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽccƵTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SϲϰϬϴϭϭ͘gϯϵϬϰϬ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽccƵTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ SϳϬϱϯϯϬ͘gϰϱϮϯϮ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlEŽmeƐͬTbƌϭ ϯϯϯϬϬ͘gϬϭϲϯϴ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SϭϬϵϮϵϮ͘gϭϭϭϳϱ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ SϵϬϴϴϲ͘gϬϳϮϮϰ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlTbǆϮͬϯ Sϵϵϭϭϱ͘gϬϴϲϭϱ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
MŽcƵlTbǆϲ SϲϵϱϬϰ͘gϬϰϱϵϰ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
OalBƌachǇƵƌǇͬTbǆϭϵ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϭϭϳ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϮϬϭ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalTbǆϮͬϯ SCLGϬϭϬϮϮϵϲϱ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalTbǆϮͬϯ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϭϱϳ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalTbǆϮͬϯ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϯϭϰ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalTbǆϮͬϯ SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϯϯϵ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OalTbǆϲͬϭϲͬϮϰͬVegT SCLGϬϭϬϬϬϬϭϰ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OdiBƌachǇƵƌǇͬTbǆϭϵ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϬϮϳϵϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϰϮϲϭϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϰϮϲϰϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϮͬϯ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϰϮϴϵϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϮͬϯ GSOIDPϬϬϬϭϭϱϴϮϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϮͬϯ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϰϵϵϵϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϮͬϯ GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϳϰϱϱϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OdiTbǆϲͬϭϲͬϮϰͬVegT GSOIDPϬϬϬϬϲϭϱϵϬϬϭ OikŽbaƐe
OlŽBƌachǇƵƌǇͬTbǆϭϵ SCLDϬϭϬϵϯϭϵϭ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SCLDϬϭϭϭϵϬϴϴ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SCLDϬϭϭϭϲϳϭϲ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϮͬϯ SCLDϬϭϬϵϴϳϵϵ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϮͬϯ SCLDϬϭϬϵϰϰϰϬ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϮͬϯ SCLDϬϭϭϭϲϳϱϬ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϮͬϯ SCLDϬϭϭϳϳϯϮϯ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OlŽTbǆϲͬϭϲͬϮϰͬVegT SCLDϬϭϬϯϴϭϰϮ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaBƌachǇƵƌǇͬTbǆϭϵ SCLHϬϭϬϬϭϲϮϬ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϮϴϰ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaTbǆϮͬϯ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϰϱϲ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaTbǆϮͬϯ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϭϲϵ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaTbǆϮͬϯ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϲϯϱ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaTbǆϮͬϯ SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϱϴϵ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
OǀaTbǆϲͬϭϲͬϮϰͬVegT SCLHϬϭϬϬϬϬϴϲ͘ϭ ManƵal annŽƚaƚiŽn
PfƵEŽmeƐͬTbƌϭ SϳϬ͘gϬϬϴϭϲ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PfƵTbǆϭͬϭϬ Sϱϴϲϭ͘gϬϳϭϯϯ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PfƵTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ SϭϮϴϯ͘gϬϯϱϮϭ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PfƵTbǆϮϬ SϮϭϵϬϲ͘gϬϵϳϵϯ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PfƵTbǆϲ͘ϭ Sϰϱϴϰ͘gϬϲϰϰϵ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PfƵTbǆϲ͘Ϯ Sϰϱϱϲ͘gϬϲϰϯϲ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaEŽmeƐͬTbƌϭ Sϲϯϭ͘gϭϬϳϯϳ͘ϬϮ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϭͬϭϬ Sϯϱϲ͘gϬϳϳϯϲ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϭϱͬϭϴͬϮϮ Sϰϵϳ͘gϬϵϰϰϳ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϭϵͬBƌachǇƵƌǇ SϯϬϱ͘gϬϳϬϬϱ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϮͬϯ Sϭϳ͘gϬϬϳϬϱ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϮϬ Sϭϳϱ͘gϬϰϳϱϱ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϲ͘ϭ Sϭϲϰϱ͘gϭϱϯϮϲ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
PmaTbǆϲ͘Ϯ Sϴϱϱ͘gϭϮϯϵϲ͘Ϭϭ AniƐeed
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Supplementary Table 4. Developmental effects of LDN and SU5402 at 

different concentrations and periods of incubations. 
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Sup. Fig. 1. 4D-reconstruction of a virtual cell tracing experiment based on nuclear 
position from the 30 cell stage to tailbud stages of O. dioica embryos (Modified from 

Stach, 2008). The fate of the blastomeres are indicated in different colors: muscle and 

heart (purple, pink), posterior tail muscle cells (yellow), anterior tail muscle cells (orange, 

green), heart (red), germ-line (blue). Circles and hexagons represent blastomeres derived 

from right and left sides of the embryo, respectively. Dashed lines indicate twin 

blastomeres. 
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Sup. Fig. 2. (A) ML phylogenetic analysis of Mesp, neurogenin and math revealing the loss of 

Mesp in Appendicularians. Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Bootstrap values are 

shown in the nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), Latimeria chalumnae 

(Lch), Lepisosteus oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. (Bsp). Botrylloides leachii 

(Ble), Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis 

(Fbo), Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi (Hro), Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus 

(Mer), Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), 

Oikopleura albicans (Oal), Oikopleura dioica (Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura 

vanhoeffeni (Ova), Phallusia fumigata (Pfu), Phallusia mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: 

Branchiostoma belcheri (Bbe), Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). 

Developmental expression pattern of O. dioica Math6 homolog (B-G). Whole mount in situ 

hybridization in different stages of O. dioica development showing expression in the notochord in 

tailbud and early-hatchling embryos (red arrowheads) (C, D), in epidermis (blue arrowheads) (C-
F), in the annal domain in hatchling stages (yellow arrowheads) (D-F), in later stages of neural 

system development (pink arrowheads) (E-F), and in later stages of digestive system 

development (green arrowheads) (E-F). Images from tailbud in advance correspond to left lateral 

views orientated anterior towards the left and dorsal towards the top.  
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Sup. Fig. 3. Phylogenetic analysis of the Ets family and developmental expression 
patterns of O. dioica Ets1/2b paralogs. (A) Phylogenetic analysis of the Ets and Erg protein 

families showed a high bootstrap value separating both protein families what corroborated 

the existence of two Ets1/2 proteins in appendicularians. Whole mount in situ hybridization 

of O. dioica Ets1/2b1 did not show any clear expression before hatchling stages (B-E). In 

early-hatchling stage Ets1/2b1 revealed expression in the migratory endodermal strand cells 

(blue arrowheads) (F). In late-hatchling the expression signal was restricted to the buccal 

gland (yellow arrowheads) (G). Ets1/2b2 did not show expression until tailbud stage (H, I). In 

tailbud embryos, expression signal was detected in tail muscle cells (red arrowheads), the 

notochord (green arrowheads) and the epidermis of the trunk (pink arrowheads) (J, K). In 

early-hatchling expression signal continued in the tail muscle and the notochord and 

increased in the anal domain (orange arrowheads) (L). In late hatchling stage, the Ets1/2b2 

expression covered the entire oikoplastic epithelium, and continued in the muscle cells of the 

tail (M). Large images from tailbud in advance correspond to left lateral views oriented 

anterior towards the left and dorsal towards the top. Inset images are dorsal views of optical 

cross sections at the levels of dashed lines. 
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Sup. Fig. 4. (A) ML phylogenetic tree of the MEK subfamilies in chordates revealing the 

loss of the MEK4, MEK5 and MEK1/2 subfamilies in appendicularians, but the surviving of 

MEK7 and MEK3/6 subfamilies. Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Bootstrap 

values are shown in the nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), 

Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), Lepisosteus oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. 

(Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona 

savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis (Fbo), Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi 

(Hro), Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus (Mer), Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula 

occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), Oikopleura albicans (Oal), Oikopleura dioica 

(Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura vanhoeffeni (Ova), Phallusia fumigata 

(Pfu), Phallusia mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: Branchiostoma belcheri (Bbe), 

Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). Developmental expression 

pattern of O. dioica ERK homolog (B-H). Whole mount in situ hybridization in different 

stages of O. dioica did not detect expression of ERK in any studied stage (B-G) until late-

hatchling stage when expression is detected in the oikoplastic epithelium (H). Images from 

tailbud in advanced correspond to left lateral views orientated anterior towards the left and 

dorsal towards the top. Red arrowheads indicate the expression in the oikoplastic 

epithelium.  
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Sup. Fig. 5. ML phylogenetic tree of the Gata subfamilies in chordates revealing the loss of the 

Gata4/5/6 in appendicularians, but the surviving and lineage specific duplications of Gata1/2/3 

in appendicularians. Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Approximate likelihood-ratio 

test (aLRT) values are shown in the nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens 

(Hsa), Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), Lepisosteus oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. 

(Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona 

savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis (Fbo), Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi (Hro), 

Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus (Mer), Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula occulta 

(Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), Oikopleura albicans (Oal), Oikopleura dioica (Odi), 

Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura vanhoeffeni (Ova), Phallusia fumigata (Pfu), Phallusia 

mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: Branchiostoma belcheri (Bbe), Branchiostoma floridae 

(Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). 
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Sup. Fig. 6. ML phylogenetic tree of the FoxF subfamily in chordates reveals the presence of 

an ortholog of FoxF in appendicularians. The sister FoxQ subfamily was used as outgroup to 

root the tree. Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Bootstrap values are shown in the 

nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), 

Lepisosteus oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. (Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), 

Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis 

(Fbo), Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi (Hro), Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus 

(Mer), Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), 

Oikopleura albicans (Oal), Oikopleura dioica (Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura 

vanhoeffeni (Ova), Phallusia fumigata (Pfu), Phallusia mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: 

Branchiostoma belcheri (Bbe), Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). 



 99 

  



 100 

  

Sup. Fig. 7. ML phylogenetic tree of the Nk4 and Nk2 subfamilies showing an ortholog of Nk4 

in O. dioica and two homologs of Nk2. Approximate likelihood-ratio test (aLRT) values are shown 

in the nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), 

Lepisosteus oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. (Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), 

Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis (Fbo), 

Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi (Hro), Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus (Mer), 

Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), Oikopleura 

albicans (Oal), Oikopleura dioica (Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura vanhoeffeni 

(Ova), Phallusia fumigata (Pfu), Phallusia mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: 

Branchiostoma belcheri (Bbe), Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). 
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Sup. Fig. 8. Preliminary ML phylogenetic tree of the Hand and Neurogenin subfamilies revealed 

the orthology between the Hand of appendicularians and ascidians. Scale bar indicates amino 

acid substitutions. Approximate likelihood-ratio test (aLRT) values are shown in the nodes. 

Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), Lepisosteus 

oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. (Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), Botrylloides 

schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis (Fbo), Halocynthia 

aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi (Hro), Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus (Mer), Molgula 

occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), Oikopleura albicans 

(Oal), Oikopleura dioica (Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura vanhoeffeni (Ova), 

Phallusia fumigata (Pfu), Phallusia mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: Branchiostoma 

belcheri (Bbe), Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). 
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Sup. Fig. 9. Phylogenetic analysis of the Tbx family and developmental expression 
patterns of O. dioica Islet, Ebf, and MyoD homologs. (A) ML phylogenetic tree of the 

Tbx subfamilies in chordates reveals the loss of Tbx1/10 and Tbx21/Eomes/Tbr1 

subfamilies in appendicularians and the ancestral loss of Tbx4/5 subfamily in tunicates. 

Scale bar indicates amino acid substitutions. Approximate likelihood-ratio test (aLRT) 

values are shown in the nodes. Vertebrates: Gallus gallus (Gga), Homo sapiens (Hsa), 

Latimeria chalumnae (Lch), Lepisosteus oculatus (Loc); Tunicates: Bathochordaeus sp. 

(Bsp). Botrylloides leachii (Ble), Botrylloides schlosseri (Bsc), Ciona robusta (Cro), Ciona 

savignyi (Csa), Fritillaria borealis (Fbo), Halocynthia aurantium (Hau), Halocynthia roretzi 

(Hro), Mesochordaeus erythrocephalus (Mer), Molgula occidentalis (Moocci), Molgula 

occulta (Mooccu), Molgula oculata (Moocul), Oikopleura albicans (Oal), Oikopleura dioica 

(Odi), Oikopleura longicauda (Olo), Oikopleura vanhoeffeni (Ova), Phallusia fumigata 

(Pfu), Phallusia mammillata (Pma); Cephalochordates: Branchiostoma floridae (Bfl), 

Branchiostoma lanceolatum (Bfl). Whole mount in situ hybridization of O. dioica Islet, Ebf 

and MyoD homologs (B-Q). 64-cell embryos did not showed expression of Islet (B) which 

was only detected in the developing nervous system from tailbud to hatchling embryos 

(C-F). Ebf (COE) did not showed expression in early stages (G-H). We detected 

expression in the nervous system from tailbud to mid-hatchling stage (I-K). Late-hatchling 

embryos showed expression in the epidermis (L). We did not detect expression of MyoD 

from 32-cell to hatchling embryos (M-P). In late-hatchling embryos MyoD was expressed 

in the oikoplastic epithelium (Q). Large images from tailbud in advance correspond to left 

lateral views oriented anterior towards the left and dorsal towards the top. Inset images 

are dorsal views of optical cross sections at the levels of dashed lines. Blue arrows 

indicate the developing nervous system. Red arrows indicate the oikoplastic epithelium. 
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Sup. Fig. 10. Developmental expression pattern of O. dioica Dach homolog. 

Whole mount in situ hybridization of O. dioica Dach homolog show expression 

in the developing nervous system in 64-cell and tailbud stages (A-C). In tailbud 

stages, Dach start expressing in the trunk epidermis which is maintain until late-

hatchling stages when it is expressed in the whole oikoplastic epithelium (B-F). 

In mid-hatchling stage, beside the epidermis, Dach expression is also detected 

in the endostyle (E). Images from tailbud in advance correspond to left lateral 

views oriented anterior towards the left and dorsal towards the top. Blue 

arrowheads indicate the nervous system. Red arrowheads indicate the 

epidermis. Green arrowheads indicate the endostyle. 
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Chapter 4
Oikopleura dioica: An Emergent Chordate
Model to Study the Impact of Gene Loss
on the Evolution of the Mechanisms
of Development

Alfonso Ferrández-Roldán, Josep Martí-Solans, Cristian Cañestro,
and Ricard Albalat

Abstract The urochordate Oikopleura dioica is emerging as a nonclassical animal
model in the field of evolutionary developmental biology (a.k.a. evo-devo) espe-
cially attractive for investigating the impact of gene loss on the evolution of
mechanisms of development. This is because this organism fulfills the requirements
of an animal model (i.e., has a simple and accessible morphology, a short generation
time and life span, and affordable culture in the laboratory and amenable experi-
mental manipulation), but also because O. dioica occupies a key phylogenetic
position to understand the diversification and origin of our own phylum, the chor-
dates. During its evolution, O. dioica genome has suffered a drastic process of
compaction, becoming the smallest known chordate genome, a process that has
been accompanied by exacerbating amount of gene losses. Interestingly, however,
despite the extensive gene losses, including entire regulatory pathways essential for
the embryonic development of other chordates, O. dioica retains the typical chordate
body plan. This unexpected situation led to the formulation of the so-called inverse
paradox of evo-devo, that is, when a genetic diversity is able to maintain a pheno-
typic unity. This chapter reviews the biological features of O. dioica as a model
animal, along with the current data on the evolution of its genes and genome. We pay
special attention to the numerous examples of gene losses that have taken place
during the evolution of this unique animal model, which is helping us to understand
to which the limits of evo-devo can be pushed off.
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4.1 Introduction

In 1872, the Swiss marine biologist Hermann Fol during his stay in Messina (Sicilia,
Italy) described a new planktonic species of Urochordates (a.k.a. Tunicates), the
appendicularian (a.k.a. Larvacean) Oikopleura dioica (Fol 1872). From the begin-
ning, O. dioica exhibited interesting biological features because, using Fol’s own
words, “Je n’ai jamais trouvé sur un meme individu les organes male et femelle.
Notre espece est réellement un tunicier a sexes distincts” (I have never found on the
same individual the male and female organs. Our species is really a tunicate with
distinct sexes) (Fol 1872). This was a remarkable finding because until then, it was
assumed that Urochordates were hermaphrodites. At the beginning of the twentieth
century, the Russian embryologist Vladimir Vladimirovich Salensky (commonly
known as W. Salensky) described the anatomy of different Appendicularia species
(Salensky 1903, 1904, 1905). Although in 1903 Richard Benedict Goldschmidt
provided a first brief description of the larva of O. dioica (Goldschmidt 1903), the
Dutch biologist Hendricus Christoffel Delsman can be considered the father of
O. dioica embryogenesis. He, analyzing embryos directly collected from the field,
was able to laboriously reconstruct its cleavage pattern with amazing exactitude
(Delsman 1910, 1912), which a century later has been confirmed by confocal
microscopy and live imaging (Fujii et al. 2008; Stach et al. 2008).

During the 1960s and 1970s, the O. dioica anatomy was described in deep detail,
paying special attention to some conspicuous structures such as the notochord or the
endostyle (Olsson 1963, 1965a, b; Welsch and Storch 1969) and to the organs
required for the construction and use of the “house,” a filtering complex structure
that traps the food (Galt 1972). Almost at the same time, the firstO. dioica cultures in
the laboratory were successfully maintained through numerous generations
(Paffenhöfer 1973), and over the next 30 years, numerous ecological and biogeo-
graphical studies were reported (e.g., Galt 1978; King et al. 1980; Gorsky et al. 1984;
Bedo et al. 1993; Acuña et al. 1995; Hopcroft and Roff 1995; Uye and Ichino 1995;
Nakamura et al. 1997; Hopcroft et al. 1998) along with multiple morphological,
anatomical, and physiological descriptions (e.g., Last 1972; Bone and Mackie 1975;
Olsson 1975; Fenaux 1976, 1986; Flood and Afzelius 1978; Fredriksson and Olsson
1981, 1991; Holmberg 1982, 1984; Fredriksson et al. 1985; Bollner et al. 1986;
Georges et al. 1988; Holland et al. 1988; Olsson et al. 1990; Nishino and Morisawa
1998; Lopez-Urrutia and Acuña 1999; Acuña and Kiefer 2000).

All this accumulated knowledge led O. dioica to the twenty-first century, when
shotgun sequencing techniques (Seo et al. 2001; Denoeud et al. 2010) together with
the establishment of protocols for gene expression analysis (Bassham and
Postlethwait 2000; Nishino et al. 2000) paved the groundwork for O. dioica as a
promising nonclassical model species for different biological disciplines, including
comparative genomics, molecular genetics, or evolutionary developmental biology
(evo-devo). Here, we will review the main biological features of O. dioica as
chordate model at the morphological, physiological, embryonic, ecological, meth-
odological, evolutionary, genetic, and genomic levels, paying special attention to the
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fact that O. dioica has shrunk and compacted its genome retaining the archetypical
chordate body plan. We will finish by analyzing the impact of gene loss, especially
the loss of genes related to embryonic development, on the evolution of O. dioica.

4.2 Oikopleura dioica as a Nonclassical Model System
for Evo-Devo

A model organism is a simplified and accessible system that represents a more
complex entity, based on the notion summarized by Jacques Monod: “what is true
for E. coli is true for the elephant.” This notion reflects the evolutionary principle that
all organisms share some degree of functional and genetic similarity due to common
ancestry. There are several classical model species in cell and developmental
biology, from non-vertebrates such as the roundworm Caenorhabditis elegans or
the fruit fly Drosophila melanogaster to vertebrates such as zebrafish and mouse.
The choice of a particular model organism depends, essentially, on the specific
scientific question that needs to be investigated, and new scientific questions usually
demand new model systems. Thus, when we became interested to understand the
impact of the gene loss on the evo-devo of chordates, we had to look for a new
“nonclassical” model system suitable for our studies. O. dioica was our first choice
because it has many technical and biological advantages that made it attractive for
our objectives: (1) O. dioica has a simple and accessible morphology, maintaining
the typical chordate body plan throughout its life; (2) its generation time and life
span is short with a fast, invariant, and determinative embryonic development;
(3) O. dioica is easily accessible and affordably cultured; (4) O. dioica can be
experimentally manipulated; (5) O. dioica occupies a privileged phylogenetic posi-
tion within the chordates to better understand the evolution of our own phylum; and
(6) its genome is small, compacted, and prone to lose genes. In the next sections, we
will summarize these technical and biological advantages.

4.2.1 O. dioica Is a Morphologically Simple Animal
with a Typical Chordate Body Plan

O. dioica has a simple but typical chordate body plan with organs and structures that
are unequivocally homologous to those in vertebrates and other chordates, including
a notochord anchoring muscle cells along a postanal tail, a hollow neural tube that
becomes a central nervous system (CNS) organized in two big ganglia and a nerve
cord, as well as a pair of gill slits and an endostyle in the pharyngeal region, which
connects with the digestive tract (Fig. 4.1). The body of O. dioica is divided in two
parts, the trunk (0.12–0.85 mm), which contains most of the organs, and the tail
(1.2–3.2 mm), which contains the notochord, the tail nerve cord, and two rows of
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paired muscle cells. The whole body is transparent so the inner structures can be
visualized by simply changing the focal plane of the microscope.

4.2.1.1 Nervous System

The CNS of O. dioica is made by only approximately 100 cells. Despite this
extremely simple structure, O. dioica CNS shows homology with the vertebrate
forebrain, hindbrain, and spinal cord of vertebrates (but not the midbrain) (Cañestro
et al. 2005). The CNS of O. dioica comprises a nerve cord running along the tail and
two big ganglia (i.e., the cerebral ganglion in the most anterior part of the trunk and
the caudal ganglion in the most proximal region of the tail) (Holmberg 1984). Both
ganglia secrete gamma-aminobutyric acid (GABA) (Soviknes et al. 2005). The
cerebral ganglion, proposed to be homologous to the vertebrate forebrain (Cañestro
et al. 2005), is made of approximately 70 neurons and includes a statocyst, a balance
sensory receptor in which a mineralized mass called statolith pushes a group of
ciliary cells in response to gravity, providing therefore feedback to the animal on

Fig. 4.1 Immature adult specimen of O. dioica. (a) Differential interference contrast (DIC)
micrograph in right lateral view with anterior to the left and ventral down. (b) Magnification of
the trunk showing the main organs and structures. Bar: 0.1 mm
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change in orientation (Holmberg 1984) (Fig. 4.1). The cerebral ganglion connects
with sensory cells in the mouth, the pharynx, and the ventral organ (a simple
structure of about 30 cells homologous to the olfactory placode and the pituitary
of vertebrates) (Bollner et al. 1986; Cañestro et al. 2005) and integrates the infor-
mation received from the sensory cells. The cerebral ganglion also connects to the
caudal ganglion through the trunk nerve cord, which turns to the right before
entering the tail. Caudal ganglion and trunk nerve cord have been proposed to be
homologous to at least part of vertebrate hindbrain (Cañestro et al. 2005). The caudal
ganglion and the nerve cord that runs along the tail consist of approximately
30 neurons. Along the nerve cord, neuronal nuclei are collected in groups of two
to four forming small ganglia. Small fibers arising from these ganglia innervate the
symmetric musculature of the tail with cholinergic motoneurons and coordinate its
movements (Galt 1972; Soviknes and Glover 2007).

4.2.1.2 Epidermis and Secreted “House”

The epidermis is a monolayered epithelium without any underlying mesodermal
tissue that covers the whole body of O. dioica (Nishida 2008). The epidermis of the
trunk, called oikoblast or oikoplastic epithelium, contains a fixed number of cells
(approximately 2000) organized in different domains defined by the shape of the
cells and the morphology of their nuclei and showing a complex bilateral symmetric
pattern (Thompson et al. 2001; Kishi et al. 2017; Mikhaleva et al. 2018) (Fig. 4.2a).
The oikoplastic epithelium secretes the so-called house, a filter-feeding device made
of glycopolysaccharides, mucopolysaccharides, and cellulose (Fig. 4.2b, c) (Kimura
et al. 2001; Spada et al. 2001; Thompson et al. 2001). The distribution of the
epidermal cells of the trunk has a direct correlation with the different architectonic
structures of the house (Fig. 4.2a) (Spada et al. 2001; Thompson et al. 2001; Kishi
et al. 2017). The adult specimens of O. dioica live inside this mucous house
(Fig. 4.2b, c) that works as a food-trapping device by filtering picoplankton particles
of different sizes (from 0.1 to 50 μm) from the water stream propelled by stylish and
grooving tail movements (Fenaux 1986; Thompson et al. 2001). The house is
abandoned when the filters are obstructed, and a new one is immediately inflated,
which happens between four and ten times a day increasing with higher water
temperatures (Flood and Deibel 1998; Sato et al. 2003). This energetically
exhausting strategy has been proposed as an evolutionary adaptation to poor food
environments (Acuña et al. 2002).

4.2.1.3 Pharyngeal Region and Digestive Tract

The food particles caught by the house enter through the mouth situated at the
anterior region of the trunk to the pharynx, thanks to the water flux generated by the
spiracles, a pair of gill slits with beating cilia that generate a water stream into the
body to draw the food (Fenaux 1998a) (Fig. 4.3). Within the pharynx, food particles
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are trapped by the mucus that covers its walls. The mucus is secreted by the
endostyle, an organ homologous to the thyroid of vertebrates, and localized on the
ventral side of the pharynx (Olsson 1963; Cañestro et al. 2008). This mucus is
conducted to the digestive tract by two symmetric rows of cilia at the lateral walls of
the pharynx that finally meet at the superior region (Fenaux 1998a). The digestive

Fig. 4.2 The O. dioica epidermis and the secreted house. Lateral view of an O. dioica trunk, in
which the main domains of the oikoplastic epithelium that correlate with the different architectonic
structures of the house are depicted (a): AC anterior crescent, AE anterior elongated region, AR
anterior rosette, AV anterior ventral domain, CO circumoral domain, E Eisen giant cells, EY Eisen’s
yard, GF giant Fol, MA martini, ML mid-lateral domain, MD middorsal domain, N nasse, OL
oblique line, PF posterior fol, PV posterior ventral domain, SO sensory organ, VL ventrolateral
domain, VM ventromedial domain. AC, AE, GF, N, and PF form the fol domain (Kishi et al. 2017).
Anterior is to the left and ventral down. The asterisk indicates the mouth. Frontal (b) and lateral (c)
views of the O. dioica house, which is visible thanks to the algae trapped in the structure. The trunk
of the animal inside the house is also visible (arrowhead)
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tract is composed of an esophagus, two gastric lobes (right and left stomachs), and a
bent intestine divided in vertical, mid, and distal intestine (or rectum) (Burighel and
Brena 2001; Cima et al. 2002) (Fig. 4.3). Although the absorption of liquids, ions,
and small molecules takes place all over the digestive system (Burighel and Brena
2001), different compartments have different functions. Digestive enzymatic activ-
ity, for instance, is led mainly by the left gastric lobule where different enzymes such
as α-amylase, acid phosphatase, nonspecific esterase, 50-nucleodidase, and amino-
peptidase M are released (Cima et al. 2002). In contrast, accumulation of lipid
droplets in ciliated cells of the right gastric lobule and the vertical and
mid-intestines indicates a storage role for these compartments (Cima et al. 2002).
Finally, fecal pellets are formed in the vertical intestine and transit along the intestine
allowing protein absorption by the rectal granular cells (Burighel and Brena 2001;
Cima et al. 2002), until reaching the anus where they are released. Functional
compartmentalization is further supported by spatiotemporal differences in the
onset of gene expression during the development of the digestive system (Mart-
í-Solans et al. 2016), likely reflecting processes of functional differentiation and
specialization of digestive cells.

Fig. 4.3 Pharyngeal region and digestive system in the O. dioica trunk. Diagrams of the trunk and
anatomy of the pharyngeal region and digestive tract of O. dioica from left (a) and dorsal (b) views.
DIC micrographs of the trunk of an O. dioica adult specimen in left lateral view (c), dorsal views at
two different focal planes (d, e), and ventral view (f). Anterior is to the left. Anus (a), buccal gland
(bg), endostyle (en), esophagus (e), left gastric lobe (lgl), mid-intestine (mi), mouth (m), pharynx
(ph), rectum (r), right gastric lobe (rgl), spiracles (s), and vertical intestine (vi)
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4.2.1.4 Notochord and Subchordal Cells

The notochord is a synapomorphic structure of the chordate phylum (Satoh et al.
2012) that has a dual function: providing structural support to the developing
embryo and secreting patterning signals required for tissue specification and organ-
ogenesis (Cleaver and Krieg 2001). In O. dioica, the notochord is a row of cells or
“stack of coins” that runs along the tail (Figs. 4.1 and 4.4). During larval develop-
ment, notochord cells form vacuoles that eventually coalesce to form a hollow lumen
(Soviknes and Glover 2008). In the adult, the notochord is a tube of cells with thin
walls, whose cells secrete proteins rich in sulfur to the extracellular media to keep the
stiffness of the notochord, but also flexible enough to facilitate swimming and other
movements (Olsson 1965a). The genetic toolkit to build the notochord in O. dioica
has been investigated, revealing not only similarities but also significant differences
in the complement of genes employed by different chordates (Ferrier 2011; Kugler
et al. 2011). The evolutionary origin of the notochord is a hot topic of discussion, and
the analysis of the O. dioica notochord has contributed to corroborate that the
urochordate noncontractile actin-expressing notochord may represent the ancestral
condition in stem chordates (Almazán et al. 2019; Inoue and Satoh 2018).

At the right side of the notochord, there is a pair of conspicuous cells, the
so-called subchordal cells (Fol 1872; Delsman 1910; Lohmann 1933) (Fig. 4.1).
These cells migrate during O. dioica development from the trunk to the tip of the
tail, after the endodermal strand cells enter the trunk following the same path but in
opposite directions (Kishi et al. 2014). Subchordal cells together with endodermal
strand cells and oral gland cells are three cell populations exhibiting long-distance
migration during O. dioica development (Kishi et al. 2014), two of them—the
subchordal and the endodermal strand cells—likely sharing the same origin
(Fredriksson and Olsson 1991). The function of the subchordal cells remains elusive,
although it has been proposed that they may be involved in the exchange of materials

Fig. 4.4 Notochord and tail musculature in an O. dioica larva. These two tissues stand out over the
general phalloidin staining of the actin filaments (in red), and they spread from the base of the trunk
to the posterior tip. In lateral view, notochord is in the center of the tail flanked by two strips of
striated muscle cells located on dorsal and ventral sides (a). In ventral view, sarcomeres are
distinguished as repeated structures all along the strip of muscle cells (b). Nuclei are stained with
Hoechst (in blue). Anterior is to the left
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with the body fluid, from which they pick and transform substances in a hepatic-like
process (Fredriksson and Olsson 1991). These substances can either be changed into
low molecular weight products merely for detoxification of harmful substances or be
metabolized into new, useful molecules that are released back to the hemolymph
(Fredriksson and Olsson 1991; Fenaux 1998a).

4.2.1.5 Heart and Tail Musculature

In O. dioica, muscle cells are only found in the heart and in the tail. They are in both
cases striated muscle cells showing the characteristic repeating functional units
called sarcomeres (Onuma et al. 2017; Almazán et al. 2019) (Fig. 4.4b), while the
existence of smooth muscle cells in O. dioica has not been established so far.
O. dioica heart is the simplest chordate heart, and assisted by the tail movement, it
contributes to the circulation of the hemolymph between the ectoderm and the
internal organs in an open circulatory system (Fenaux 1998a). The heart consists
of a posterior ventral bag wedged between the left stomach wall and the intestine
(Fig. 4.1). The internal lumen of this bag is the only coelomic space inO. dioica, and
it is completely lined by two types of flat mesodermal tissues, the myocardium
composed by muscle fibers and the nonmuscular pericardium (Stach 2009; Onuma
et al. 2017). Myocardial cells are connected by cell junctions, and their cytoplasm is
full of actin filaments (Stach 2009; Onuma et al. 2017; Almazán et al. 2019). This
muscle-structured tissue produces peristaltic contractions that periodically reverse,
causing the hemolymph to course between the myocardium and the stomach wall
reaching the rest of the organs in the trunk and circulating through the tail (Fenaux
1998a).

The muscular tissue of the tail spreads posteriorly from the base of the trunk in
two strips of striated cells distributed in the dorsal and ventral sides of the notochord
(Nishino et al. 2000; Nishino and Satoh 2001; Almazán et al. 2019) (Fig. 4.4). This
paraxial musculature, combined with the notochord, provides the ability to drive
movement to the tail, which is fundamental not only for locomotion but also for
O. dioica feeding. The tail musculature of O. dioica consists of only ten
multinucleated striated cells on the dorsal and ventral sides of the notochord
(Nishino et al. 2000; Nishino and Satoh 2001; Soviknes et al. 2007; Almazán
et al. 2019). In just hatched larvae, eight mononucleated muscular cells are easily
recognizable along the anterior–posterior axes of the tail. Along the larval develop-
ment, two additional small muscle cells appear at the tip of the tail although their
origin remains unknown (Nishino and Satoh 2001).

Structurally, the actomyosin contractile complexes of the muscle cells in
O. dioica have not been fully characterized, but actin and myosin genes can be
identified in the O. dioica database (Almazán et al. 2019). O. dioica has four
muscular-actin genes that appear to be expressed only in the muscle cell lineage
(Almazán et al. 2019). The four muscular actins show differences in their expression
domains during embryonic development, which suggests differences in their spatio-
temporal regulation (Almazán et al. 2019). Muscular actin expression can be

4 Oikopleura dioica: An Emergent Chordate Model to Study the. . . 71



 118 

detected as early as at 64-cell stage, although muscle fibers are formed later in the
larvae. They are restricted to the inner part of the cell, while the epidermal side is full
of mitochondria generating the energy for the tail movement (Nishino et al. 2000;
Almazán et al. 2019). Comparative analyses among different chordate species,
including O. dioica, have suggested that muscular actins originated from a cytoplas-
mic actin at the base of chordates, which was followed by the recruitment of the
myosin motor-machinery that conferred contractile capability to muscle cells
(Kusakabe et al. 1997; Almazán et al. 2019; Inoue and Satoh 2018).

4.2.1.6 Reproductive System

O. dioica is the sole dioecious species so far reported in the urochordate subphylum
(Fol 1872; Nishida 2008). The gonad is localized in the posterior region of the trunk
and is the only apparent character that allows us to differentiate males from females:
male gonad is full of sperm and homogenously brown and dark, whereas the female
one is yellowish and refringent as it is full of eggs (Fig. 4.5). The growth of the
gonad is parallel to the growth of the animal, acquiring their final size and maturity in
only some hours, when gametogenesis occurs (Nishino and Morisawa 1998; Ganot
et al. 2007). Spermatogenesis takes place in the testicle, a syncytium with a

Fig. 4.5 Maturation of male and female gonads. DIC micrographs and schematic representations of
dorsal (a–a’) and lateral (b–b’) views of a premature male gonad. The sperm duct appears as a small
protuberance in the most dorsal part of the male gonad (arrowhead). DIC micrographs and
schematic representations of dorsal (c–c’) and lateral (d–d’) views of a premature female ovary.
Pro-oocytes can be distinguished inside the gonad (dashed circles). DIC micrographs of mature
male (e) and female (f) gonads. Mature male gonads become brown and opaque as spermatogenesis
progresses, while female gonads become yellowish and refringent until the round eggs are clearly
visible (g–k)
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substantial number of identical nuclei that become individual spermatozoa
(Martinucci et al. 2005; Onuma et al. 2017). The ovary has also an initial phase of
syncytial nuclear proliferation. Then, it becomes a coenocyst where half of the nuclei
enter meiosis, whereas the other half became highly polyploid nurse nuclei (Ganot
et al. 2007). Inside the coenocyst, a ramified structure composed of filamentous actin
surrounds each of the pro-oocytes that are connected to the common cytoplasm via
intercellular bridges termed also ring canals (Ganot et al. 2007). During oogenesis a
subset of pro-oocytes grows by transferring the cytoplasm through the ring canals
while the others degenerate (Ganot et al. 2007). Typically, a mature female spawns
between 100 and 400 eggs, although as a clutch manipulator, O. dioica females
might increase or decrease the oocyte number depending on favorable or unfavor-
able environmental conditions, respectively (Troedsson et al. 2002). This feature can
be useful to manipulate the clutch size in laboratory conditions.

4.2.2 O. dioica Has a Short Generation Time
and a Determinative Embryonic Development

A convenient characteristic shared by many model organisms is that their generation
time (i.e., the time between two consecutive generations) is short, facilitating genetic
analyses through generations. The generation times of D. melanogaster and
C. elegans, for instance, are of only 9 and 3 days, respectively. The generation
time of O. dioica is also short, from 5 days at 19 !C to 10 days at 13 !C (Nishida
2008; Bouquet et al. 2009; Martí-Solans et al. 2015). After the external fertilization,
the zygote starts embryonic development, which lasts 3.5–6.0 h at 19 !C and 13 !C,
respectively, and terminates when a larva hatches breaking the chorion (Fig. 4.6).
Next, larval development starts; it takes 6–13 h (at 19 !C–13 !C, respectively) and
terminates with a 120! twist of the tail at the tailshift stage. Ten minutes later, the
juvenile makes its first house and starts feeding. During the next few days, animals
filtrate water and feed arriving to the 1.5–4.0 mm of body size for an adult animal. At
that point, the gonads complete their maturation, and males and females spawn the
gametes and, as semelparous animals, die afterwards (Fig. 4.6).

In vitro fertilization protocols (Fenaux 1976; Holland et al. 1988; Nishino and
Morisawa 1998) have enabled the understanding of processes that lead the egg to
become a larva. Cleavage patterns, cell lineages, and morphogenetic movements,
which are especially important for the understanding of the embryology of organ-
isms that follow an invariant and determinative embryonic development such as
those of O. dioica, have been extensively studied (reviewed in Nishida and Stach
2014). Thus, fate maps from one cell to the tail bud stage have been established
(Fig. 4.7), similarly to what has been made in other organisms as the nematode
C. elegans or the ascidian Ciona robusta (formerly C. intestinalis) (Sulston et al.
1983; Nishida 1987; Fujii et al. 2008; Stach et al. 2008; Nishida and Stach 2014;
Stach and Anselmi 2015). After fertilization, the surface of the egg becomes rough,
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Fig. 4.6 Schematic representation of O. dioica life cycle. Embryonic development starts with the
fertilization of the oocyte and ends when a larva hatches breaking the chorion (!3.6 hpf at 19 "C).
Larval development lasts for !6 h (at 19 "C) and ends when the tail of the larva changes 120" its
orientation in a process called tailshift. Notice the change of the position of the mouth (asterisk)
relative to the tail in juvenile animals. During the next !4.5 days (at 19 "C), juvenile animals feed,
grow, and become mature males or females, which spawn the gametes closing the cycle. Scale bar
represents 100 μm for all stages except for day 2 and mature adults (1 mm)

Fig. 4.7 Cell-lineage tree of O. dioica embryos. The tree is bilaterally symmetric, and therefore,
only one-half is shown. The nomenclature agrees with that of Delsman (1910) and reviewed in
Nishida (2008). The ascidian nomenclature system is shown in gray according to Stach et al. (2008)
and Nishida and Stach (2014). Developmental fates of cells at 32-cell stage are indicated. CNS,
central nervous system
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and 9 min later, two polar bodies appear as an obvious signal of successful fertili-
zation (Fig. 4.6) (Fenaux 1998a; Fujii et al. 2008). At 19 !C, the first division takes
place after 23 min postfertilization (mpf), generating two morphologically equal
cells that correspond to the right and left sides of the animal. At 32 mpf, another
symmetric division takes place. This division is meridional and perpendicular to the
previous one giving place to the anterior and posterior hemispheres. The third
division (at 40 mpf) is asymmetric and leads to the formation of 8 cells, 4 big cells
in the animal pole and 4 small cells in the vegetal pole. The morula stage appears
52 mpf, after the fourth division generates an embryo composed of 16 cells. Gas-
trulation starts 67 mpf, at 32-cell stage, and it consists in the ingression of the vegetal
blastomeres that remain covered by the animal blastomeres (Nishida 2008). Neuru-
lation starts at the 64-cell stage 80 mpf, when 8 cells from the anterior region are
aligned in two rows of 4 cells that form a matrix that is internalized. Tail bud stage
starts 135 mpf, when tail and trunk differentiate. During this stage, the tail elongates,
and the embryo bents ventrally. Notochord cells align in a single row and become
evident at 180 mpf. At 3.6 h postfertilization (hpf), a larva hatches, and embryogen-
esis terminates (Fig. 4.6) (Delsman 1910; Cañestro et al. 2005; Fujii et al. 2008;
Nishida 2008; Stach et al. 2008).

Larval development is subdivided into six stages (I–VI) (Nishida 2008) that last
6 h at 19 !C, from the hatchling until the juvenile stage (Fig. 4.6). At stage I, the larva
elongates and occasionally moves by tail beats. At stage II, the boundaries of the
organs begin to appear, and at stage III, the organs are perceptible. At stage IV,
organs are clearly recognizable, mouth opens, and the cilia of the digestive system
and the ciliary rings of the gill slits start moving. Buccal glands locate at each side of
the endostyle, and the heart starts beating. Notochord vacuoles fuse, and the tail
flattens to form the lateral fins. At stage V, water current starts inside the larva, the
lumen of all organs is continuous, and the trunk epidermis (oikoplastic epithelium)
secretes house materials (pre-house). Swimming movements are vigorous. At stage
VI, after a few seconds of intense movement, the tail changes its orientation 120!

during a process called tailshift (Delsman 1910; Galt and Fenaux 1990; Fenaux
1998b; Nishida 2008). The tailshift event occurs when the larva reaches the juvenile
stage, and it is thought comparable to metamorphosis in other urochordates
(Fig. 4.6), although in O. dioica the definitive organs develop earlier than in ascidian
species (Galt and Fenaux 1990).

After the tailshift, juvenile animals inflate the first house and start to feed. During
the next days, animals filtrate water and feed at the time that they grow and their
gonads mature. From day 1 to day 3, the trunk grows from 0.17 to 0.35 mm (Bouquet
et al. 2009), and the gonad expands in the posterior and ventral part of the trunk to fill
the whole posterior region (Fig. 4.5). On day 4, the gonad increases its size
becoming wider than the trunk and becomes visible to the unaided eye. At day
5, the trunk of O. dioicameasures almost 1 mm and the whole animal between 3 and
4 mm (Bouquet et al. 2009). At that time, the gonad is fully developed, and males
and females are easily distinguishable as the gonad is full of sperm or eggs,
respectively (Figs. 4.5 and 4.6).
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4.2.3 O. dioica Is Easily Accessible, with a Wide Geographic
Distribution and Suitable for Lab Culturing

4.2.3.1 Geographic Distribution and Abundance

O. dioica is a semi-cosmopolite free-swimming species present in the Atlantic,
Pacific, and Indian Oceans as well as in the Mediterranean and Red Seas, but not
in extreme latitude oceans as Arctic or Antarctic (Fenaux et al. 1998) (Fig. 4.8).
Although O. dioica is a widespread species, its populations may vary in a seasonal
way (Essenberg 1922; Raduan et al. 1985; Uye and Ichino 1995; Fenaux et al. 1998;

Fig. 4.8 O. dioica culture and geographic distribution. Animals might be collected in the coast
using a plankton net or directly with a bucket (a) and maintained in the laboratory at 19 !C using a
standard air conditioning device (b). Seawater is filtered through 10–0.5 μm polypropylene filters to
remove major particles and organisms and sterilized using 0.2 μm filters (c). Three algal species and
a cyanobacteria are individually cultured in a 13 !C incubator with a 12 h light/dark photoperiod
and used to feed the animals (d). O. dioica animals are cultured at 19 !C in polycarbonate backers
and maintained in suspension by the rotation (5–15 rpm) of a paddle driven by an electric motor
mounted on the lid of the backer (e). A new animal culture starts by mating 20 females and 10 males
close to spawn (D0) in a baker with 1.5 L of sterilized seawater (f, top). Next 2 days (D1 and D2),
the culture is just diluted adding 1.5 and 3 L of sterilized seawater, respectively (f, right). At day
3 (D3), "100 animals are transferred to a new backer with 4 L of fresh sterilized seawater (f, left-
down), and at day 4 (D4), cultures are diluted adding 2 L of sterilized seawater and moved to a
13 !C incubator (f, left-top). In the morning of day 5 (D5), most of the animals are mature and ready
to set a new mating for new generation (f, top). For additional details, see Martí-Solans et al. (2015).
Geographic distribution of the O. dioica species in the coast of most of the oceans (blue line)
(reviewed in Fenaux et al. 1998, and supplemented with Bary 1960; Fenaux 1972; Costello and
Stancyk 1983; Larson 1987; Gaughan and Potter 1994; Hwan Lee et al. 2001; Aravena and Palma
2002; Walkusz et al. 2003; Menéndez et al. 2011) (g)
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Tomita et al. 2003). In the west Mediterranean Sea, for instance, its maximum
abundance is found during spring and autumn seasons (Raduan et al. 1985).
O. dioica along with other appendicularian species are so abundant that they occupy
an important trophic position in food webs. Appendicularians are the second most
abundant species, after copepods, in marine mesozooplankton (Gorsky and Fenaux
1998; Captanio et al. 2008), and they graze about 10% of the ocean’s primary
production (Acuña et al. 2002). Acting as an important short-circuit that allows a
rapid energy transfer from colloidal carbon and phytoplankton primary producers to
zooplanktivorous predators such as fish larvae (Flood and Deibel 1998; Fernández
et al. 2004), they contribute to at least 8% of the vertical carbon transport to the deep
ocean (Davoll and Youngbluth 1990; Robison et al. 2005; Troedsson et al. 2013).
Appendicularians are, indeed, a major contributor of “marine snow” (i.e., biological
debris that originates from the top layers of the ocean and drifts to the seafloor) in
euphotic and mesopelagic zones through the production of discarded houses and
fecal pellets (Robison et al. 2005). Those particles, full of nutrients, contribute to
28–39% of total particulate organic carbon export to the deep oceans (Alldredge
2005). The ecological relevance of appendicularians is so high that human activities
affecting their populations [e.g., global warming or an increase of toxins in oceans
(Bouquet et al. 2018; Torres-Aguila et al. 2018)] might impact on marine food webs
and in vertical carbon flux at a world scale. Therefore, the O. dioica populations
might be valuable sentinels for monitoring marine ecosystems. In summary,
O. dioica is an ecological relevant organism, abundant in the neritic zone in almost
all marine costs, and easily accessible using ordinary plankton nets (Fig. 4.8a, g).

4.2.3.2 O. dioica Lab Culturing

In addition to its accessibility directly from nature, O. dioica cultures can be
maintained in the laboratory (Fig. 4.8b, f). O. dioica was first cultured by
Paffenhöfer in 1973, but the bases for a long-term maintenance system were
developed by Fenaux and Gorsky (1985). Nowadays, to our knowledge, the pro-
cedures to culture O. dioica in the laboratory all year around have been published
from three facilities in the world located in Norway, Japan, and Spain (our facility)
(Nishida 2008; Bouquet et al. 2009; Martí-Solans et al. 2015). We culture the
animals at 19 !C in 8 L polycarbonate backers containing 6 L of seawater and
10 grams of activated charcoal (see legend of Fig. 4.8 for details). Animals are
maintained in suspension by the rotation of a polyvinyl carbonate paddle connected
to an electric motor (5–15 rpm). We add 2 or 3 pearls of 1-hexadecanol to reduce
surface tension and therefore avoiding that animals get trapped by the surface of the
water. For feeding, a cocktail of three different species of algae (Chaetoceros
calcitrans, Isochrysis sp., Rhinomonas reticulata) and a cyanobacterium
(Synechococcus sp.) is added to the animal cultures every day. Because growing
O. dioica specimens can trap only foods of a proper size, the amount of each alga and
of the cyanobacterium in the cocktail is adjusted according to their cell sizes along
the O. dioica life cycle. Animal cultures are a source of mature male and female
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specimens from which developmentally synchronic embryos can be obtained using
several in vitro fertilization protocols (Clarke et al. 2007; Martí-Solans et al. 2015;
Mikhaleva et al. 2015). Embryos and larvae at different developmental stages can be
thereby easily collected, fixed, and stored for experiments on demand.

4.2.4 O. dioica Can Be Experimentally Manipulated

4.2.4.1 Pharmacological Treatments

Pharmacological treatments are a powerful tool to perform functional studies due to
its experimental simplicity, and embryos are just transferred to a solution with the
drug. The fact that we can easily obtain hundreds of synchronously developing
O. dioica embryos by in vitro fertilization allows us to perform numerous treatments
at different drug concentrations in a fast, simple, and reproducible way. The small
size of theO. dioica embryos facilitates the diffusion of the drugs to the inner tissues,
and their transparency allows the observation of the phenotypic effects of the
treatments by DIC microscopy in live developing specimens without the need to
perform histological sections. In addition, gene expression responses might be
investigated by whole-mount in situ hybridization techniques or by high-density
tiling arrays. Pharmacological treatments have been performed, for instance, with
developmental morphogens such as all-trans-retinoic acid (RA), which yielded a
range of morphological abnormalities, from mild to severe, depending on develop-
mental stage, duration, and concentration of RA exposure (Cañestro and
Postlethwait 2007). Treatments with xenobiotic compounds such as the carcinogenic
polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbon BaP or with the lipid-lowering agent clofibrate
have been also assayed to investigate the transcriptional regulation of the xenobiotic
defense mechanisms and to identify theO. dioica chemical defensome (Yadetie et al.
2012). Finally, treatments with biotoxins such as trans,trans-2,4-decadienal, a
model for polyunsaturated aldehydes produced during diatom blooms, have been
used to analyze the impact on marine food webs of possible future intensification of
algal blooms associated with climate change (Torres-Aguila et al. 2018).

4.2.4.2 Techniques for Altering Gene Function by Morpholino, dsRNA,
or dsDNA Injections

Different knockdown approaches for altering gene function have been developed in
O. dioica by injecting morpholinos (Sagane et al. 2010), double-stranded RNA
(dsRNA; RNA interference-RNAi) (Omotezako et al. 2013; Mikhaleva et al.
2015), or double-stranded DNA (dsDNA; DNA interference-DNAi) (Omotezako
et al. 2015, 2017), and new techniques for genome editing based on CRISPR-Cas9
are currently being developed (Deng et al. 2018). Most techniques rely on the
injection of a given molecule into the gonad of premature females, when it is still
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a syncytium of meiotic nuclei surrounded by common cytoplasm (Ganot et al. 2007).
Then, the injected molecule might spread along the forming oocytes, generating tens
of knockdown embryos with a single injection (Fig. 4.9). Alternatively, injections in
spawned eggs are also possible (Mikhaleva et al. 2015, 2018; Deng et al. 2018),
though they are more difficult and less productive.

Injection of morpholinos, synthetic molecules of approximately 25 nucleotides in
length that bind to complementary sequences of RNA blocking translation or
altering splicing, was the first knockdown approach in O. dioica (Sagane et al.
2010). Morpholinos were used to knock down a cellulose synthase gene necessary
to build the house, obtaining different phenotypes related to the production of

Fig. 4.9 Knocking down by dsDNA injection into the gonad of premature females. A dsDNA
against the brachyury gene is injected into a premature female gonad (syncytium) (a–c), along with
phenol red and pSD64Flife-act-mCherry-mRNA. Phenol red allows us to visualize the injected
solution (red dot in panels b and c), while mCherry fluorescence highlights the embryos containing
mRNA and, therefore, most likely also dsDNA after the cellularization process. In this regard,
notice that malformed embryos showing the brachyury-dsDNA phenotype are fluorescent (compare
panels d–f)
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cellulose fibrils (Sagane et al. 2010). In 2013, RNA interference by dsRNA injection
was used to investigate the development of the tail and the function of the CNS in tail
movement (Omotezako et al. 2013; Mikhaleva et al. 2015). Finally, in 2015, DNA
interference by dsDNA injection, a gene silencing technique reported in plants,
ciliates, and archaea, was successfully assayed in O. dioica, being the first case
reported in any metazoan organism (Omotezako et al. 2015). Although the molec-
ular bases for DNAi are unknown, O. dioica experiments suggest that dsDNA can
induce sequence-specific transcription blocking and mRNA degradation.

4.2.5 O. dioica Occupies a Privileged Phylogenetic Position
Within the Chordate Phylum

The urochordates (or tunicates), group to which the appendicularian O. dioica
belongs, are the sister subphylum of the vertebrates, which together with basally
branching cephalochordates form the chordate phylum (but see Satoh et al. (2014)
for the chordate superphylum hypothesis) (Fig. 4.10). Urochordates are an extremely
diverse taxonomic group that appears to have undergone a rapid evolution and

Fig. 4.10 Comparison of genome size, gene number, gene density, and biological complexity
among selected chordate species arranged according to their phylogenetic relationships. Bar plots
illustrate thatO. dioica has the smallest chordate genome but has a number of genes rather similar to
other chordate species, which implies that O. dioica gene density is the highest one. As a rough
estimate of biological complexity, we plotted the number of neurons of each organism in logarith-
mic scale. Lines represent the overall tendency within each plot. Urocho, urochordates
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speciation, spreading over many marine habitats, from shallow waters to deep sea
(Holland 2016). Urochordates are classically divided into three classes,
Appendicularia (larvaceans, !70 species including O. dioica), Ascidiacea (sea
squirts, !3000 species), and Thaliacea (salps, doliolids, and pyrosomes, !100
species), although it has been recently proposed that Thaliacea species are nested
within the Ascidiacea class (Delsuc et al. 2018; Kocot et al. 2018). In any case,
Appendicularians—also known as Larvaceans because they maintain the larval
morphology, including the chordate synapomorphies, throughout the entirely life
cycle—appear to be the sister clade of all other urochordates, representing a branch
of the subphylum that split from all other urochordates 450 million years ago (Delsuc
et al. 2018). Appendicularians are divided into three families. The Fritillariidae
family that includes 3 genera and 30 species, the Kowalevskiidae family, the
smallest one with just 1 genus and 2 species, and the Oikopleuridae family, the
most diverse group with 11 genera and 37 species (Bone 1998).

O. dioica occupies a privileged phylogenetic position within urochordates for
evo-devo studies because it can be morphologically, functionally, genetically, and
genomically compared with many other urochordate species (more than 10 ascidians
have been totally or partially sequenced; http://www.aniseed.cnrs.fr/; http://octopus.
obs-vlfr.fr/public/botryllus/blastbotryllus.php), including well-studied ascidian spe-
cies of the Ciona or Halocynthia genera (Corbo et al. 2001; Dehal et al. 2002;
Nishida 2002; Cañestro et al. 2003; Satoh 2003; Satoh et al. 2003; Brozovic et al.
2016, 2017). In addition, from a more general perspective, comparisons of O. dioica
and ascidians with diverse vertebrate species (there are more than 100 vertebrate
genome projects) are relevant for detecting subphylum-specific traits, which might
be classified as evolutionary innovations or losses depending on their presence in the
external cephalochordate subphylum (there are three Branchiostoma genome pro-
jects and one Asymmetron RNA-Seq project).

4.2.6 O. dioica Has a Small and Compacted Genome

With only 70 Mb, O. dioica genome is the smallest chordate genome and one of the
smallest genomes in metazoans (Seo et al. 2001; Denoeud et al. 2010; Danks et al.
2013), only surpassed by the small genomes of some parasite animals (Burke et al.
2015; Chang et al. 2015; Mikhailov et al. 2016) (Table 4.1) (Fig. 4.10). The small
size of the O. dioica genome is the result of a process of compaction mostly due to
three factors: (1) a reduction of the length of intergenic regions, partly because of
numerous operons; (2) a reduction of the abundance of transposable elements; and
(3) the reduction of the size of introns (Denoeud et al. 2010; Berna and Alvarez-
Valin 2014; reviewed in Chavali et al. 2011). As a result of the genome compaction,
the gene density in O. dioica genome (1 gene per 3.9 kb) has become very high,
3 times higher than in ascidian C. robusta, 6 times higher than in cephalochordate
amphioxus, and 35 times higher than in human genome (Table 4.1) (Fig. 4.10).
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4.2.6.1 Intergenic Regions and Operons

O. dioica genes are densely packed, with 53% of their intergenic sequences smaller
than 1 kb (Table 4.1). Contributing to the intragenic reduction, manyO. dioica genes
are organized in polycistronic transcription units (operons). The majority of operons
are bicistronic (60%), but a substantial proportion contains three or more genes, and
some have up to 11 genes. Operon organization reduces the intergenic space because
it reduces the DNA segments containing transcription initiation and regulation
signals. The fact that 27% of O. dioica genes are predicted to be organized in around
1800 operons (Denoeud et al. 2010), together with the observation that most genes
have relatively small intergenic spaces, may favor the genome compaction of this
species (Table 4.1).

4.2.6.2 Transposable Elements

Transposable elements (TEs or transposons) are main components of eukaryote
genomes that can replicate and change to new locations. O. dioica genome is
relatively poor in TEs, in terms of quantity and diversity, and most of the so-called
pan-animal transposon families, many of them even present in C. robusta (Cañestro
and Albalat 2012), are absent (Denoeud et al. 2010). O. dioica genome contains TEs
of only six superfamilies—Ty3/Gypsy, DIRS1, and Penelope-like retrotransposons
(Volff et al. 2004) and Tc-Mariner, PyggyBac, and Maverik DNA transposons
(Chalopin et al. 2015)—plus a new family of non-LTR retrotransposon named
Odin (Volff et al. 2004) (Table 4.1). Although the copy number of each TE is low

Table 4.1 Main features of O. dioica genes and genome (Volff et al. 2004; Denoeud et al. 2010;
Chalopin et al. 2015)

Genome
Size 70 Mb
Size of intergenic regions 53% of intergenic distances <1 kb
Population mutation rate θ ¼ 4Neμ ¼ 0.0220
Conserved synteny Negligible
Diversity of transposable elements 4 class I retroelements + 3 class II DNA transposons
Abundance of transposable
elements

10–20% genome (at most few hundreds of each TE)

Genes
Number 18,020 predicted genes
Density 1 gene per 3.9 kb (257 genes per Mb)
Genes in operons 27% (1800 operons)
Number of introns per Gene 4.1
Intron size <50 nt in 62% of the genes; >1 kb in 2.4% of the genes
Intron position 76% intron positions specie-specific
Noncanonical splicing sites In 12% introns (9% GA-AG, 2.7% GC-AG, 0.7%

GG-AG)
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(at most few hundreds), LTR retrotransposons appear to be the most abundant
(>60%), while non-LTR retrotransposons and DNA transposons represent less
than 20% each. The extent of TEs on the O. dioica genome size has been estimated
about 10–20% (Chalopin et al. 2015). In summary, a massive purge of pan-animal
TEs has occurred inO. dioica genome probably associated with an intense process of
genome compaction. Some TEs show a low level of sequence corruption, suggesting
a rather recent activity, but their low copy number and uneven genome distribution
indicate that TE expansion in O. dioica is under tight genetic control (Denoeud et al.
2010).

4.2.6.3 Introns

Another factor contributing to O. dioica genome compaction is the small size of the
introns of the majority of the genes (Table 4.1). Despite O. dioica having a typical
number of introns per gene (4.1) as in other vertebrates, it has reduced the size of the
introns to less than 50 nucleotides in 62% of the genes, and only 2.4% of the introns
being larger than 1 kb (Seo et al. 2001; Denoeud et al. 2010). O. dioica shows a high
intron turnover: 76% of the introns are in positions unique to O. dioica (newly
acquired introns) and only 17% are in ancestral positions (7% remain unclassified)
(Denoeud et al. 2010) (Table 4.1). Several mechanisms have been proposed for the
gain and loss of introns in O. dioica (Denoeud et al. 2010), but since newly acquired
introns tend to be shorter than old introns, intron turnover might have favored
genome compaction. Surprisingly, canonical splicing signal (GT-AG intron bound-
aries) is not observed in about 12% of introns (1% in other species), which mostly
(9%) have noncanonical GA-AG (GC-AG, 2.7%, or GG-AG, 0.7%) sequences
(Edvardsen et al. 2004; Denoeud et al. 2010). Because O. dioica lacks the minor
spliceosome and only has one type of each spliceosomal component (Denoeud et al.
2010), a single major spliceosome, permissive in terms of splicing signals, would
take care of all splicing processes. It has been proposed that such permissive splicing
could favor the intron turnover (Denoeud et al. 2010) and, hence, the compaction of
the O. dioica genome.

4.3 Evolution of O. dioica Genes

The O. dioica genome project did not only reveal that this species has an extremely
compacted genome with small intergenic regions, tiny introns, and few TEs, but that
its genes have suffered many evolutionary changes affecting the conservation of the
sequence, organization, and number of genes.
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4.3.1 Gene Sequence Evolution: High Evolutionary Rates

The sequencing of the genome confirmed that O. dioica is a very fast evolver and its
genes always show surprisingly long branches in phylogenetic tree reconstructions
(Edvardsen et al. 2005; Denoeud et al. 2010). This high rate of sequence evolution
appears to be the result of two independent evolutionary forces acting at different
levels and with different strength.

First, affecting at a global genome scale with a moderate strength, we found that
most genes show a high evolutionary rate (Table 4.1) as a result of a combination of
a high population mutation rate and a reduced negative (purifying) selection. An
estimate of O. dioica population mutation rate (θ ¼ 4Ne, μ ¼ 0.0220) shows it is
high, which is consistent with a large effective population size (Ne) and/or a high
mutation rate per generation (μ) (Denoeud et al. 2010). In addition, the short
generation time of this species implies that the effective mutation rate per year is
substantially increased. A reduced negative selection for O. dioica has been pro-
posed based on the homogeneity of its amino acid rates that is a symptom of
relaxation of selective—structural and/or functional—constraints (Berna et al.
2012; Berna and Alvarez-Valin 2014). Relaxation of selective constraints associated
with rapid rates of sequence evolution has been actually proposed for other fast-
evolving animal species such as Ciona robusta and Caenorhabditis elegans (Hol-
land and Gibson-Brown 2003).

Second, some particular genes have even a higher evolutionary rate due to
positive selection that contributes to the adaptation to new environments or to new
challenges (Berna and Alvarez-Valin 2014). Many of these genes with this higher
evolutionary rate have been described to be involved in regulatory and developmen-
tal functions (Berna et al. 2012; Berna and Alvarez-Valin 2014).

4.3.2 Evolution of Gene and Genome Organization

4.3.2.1 Negligible Synteny Conservation

Conserved synteny describes the colocalization of homologous genes on homolo-
gous chromosomic regions of different species. O. dioica genome appears to have
suffered numerous chromosomal rearrangements during evolution, and thereby, it
lacks any chromosomal synteny conservation with other animal genomes (Denoeud
et al. 2010). Conservation of local synteny is also almost negligible since local gene
order is indistinguishable from random for distances smaller than 30 genes, and a
low level of conserved synteny is only detectable at a wider distance span (Denoeud
et al. 2010; Irimia et al. 2012). These observations suggest that constraints that
maintain gene order in metazoans may actually be relaxed in O. dioica.
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4.3.2.2 Disintegration of Hox Cluster

Another significant feature of O. dioica genome is the disintegration of the cluster of
Hox genes, which is generally well conserved in all bilaterians. Hox genes are a
subset of homeobox genes involved in establishing morphological identities along
the anterior–posterior axis, and although the biological significance of Hox cluster-
ing remains unclear, functional and structural explanations leading to a spatiotem-
poral coordinated transcriptional regulation of Hox genes have been proposed
(Kmita and Duboule 2003). In many species, the position of the Hox genes in the
cluster correlates with their temporal and spatial sequential expression along the
anterior–posterior axis (reviewed in Duboule 2007). O. dioica does not have a Hox
cluster since its complement of nine Hox genes—three anterior Hox genes (Hox1,
Hox2, and Hox4) and six posterior genes (Hox9A, Hox9B, Hox10, Hox11, Hox12,
and Hox13)—is totally dispersed in its genome (Seo et al. 2004). The disorganiza-
tion of the Hox cluster in O. dioica has been related to the lineage-driven mode of
development of O. dioica, in which Hox genes would contribute to tissue specifica-
tion with separated domains of Hox expressions, rather than to axial patterning with
overlapping Hox expressions (Seo et al. 2004).

4.3.2.3 Evolution of Operon Organization

A third important genomic feature in the organization of O. dioica genes is their
grouping in operons (Table 4.1). The operons do not only contribute to the com-
paction of the genome (see above) but might also serve to group genes that have to
be either efficiently coregulated—repressing or activating them as a group—or
ubiquitously expressed with a low degree of transcriptional regulation (Blumenthal
2004). O. dioica has around 1800 operons transcribed as polycistronic pre-mRNAs,
most of them processed to mature monocistronic mRNAs via spliced-leader RNA
(SL RNA) trans splicing (Ganot et al. 2004; Denoeud et al. 2010). Functional
annotation of the gene set in operons shows that they are significantly enriched for
genes involved in housekeeping functions or general metabolic processes such as
RNA, protein, DNA, lipid, and carbohydrate processing and transport. Genes
involved in developmental processes such as morphogenesis and organogenesis
are, in contrast, significantly underrepresented in the operon gene set (Denoeud
et al. 2010).

4.3.3 Gene Number Evolution

Despite its reduced size, O. dioica genome contains 18,020 predicted genes, a
similar number to other urochordates (e.g., C. robusta !15,300 genes) and only
slightly below other chordates such as the cephalochordate Branchiostoma floridae

4 Oikopleura dioica: An Emergent Chordate Model to Study the. . . 85



 132 

(!22,000 genes) or the vertebrate Fugu rubripes (!18,300 genes) (Table 4.1)
(Fig. 4.10). The current number of genes is the result of the balance between gene
gains and losses impacting a certain set of ancestral genes, and because O. dioica
appears to be prone to lose genes (see next section), it has to be also prone to
gain them.

Gene duplications have been proposed to be a major driving force for gene gains
(Ohno 1970; Cañestro et al. 2013), and O. dioica seems to have retained many
lineage-specific duplicates. For instance, among homeobox genes, O. dioica shows a
high incidence of retention of lineage-specific duplicates of genes such as Irx, Not,
and Pax3/7 (Edvardsen et al. 2005). Additional examples of such duplicates are
found in g-type lysozyme genes (Nilsen et al. 2003), caspase genes (Weill et al.
2005), metallothionein genes (Calatayud et al. 2018), notochord Noto15 and Noto9
genes (Kugler et al. 2011), RdhE2 and Cco genes (Martí-Solans et al. 2016), and
actin as well as other muscle structural genes (Almazán et al. 2019; Inoue and Satoh
2018), among many others predicted from the genome project analysis (Denoeud
et al. 2010). Lineage-specific duplicates might contribute to both general evolution-
ary adaptations of the organisms or to innovations associated to the unique biology
of the lineage. For example, homeobox genes expressed—and possibly patterning—
in the oikoplastic epithelium, which represents a significant novelty of
appendicularians for secreting the mucous house, mostly belong to the duplicated
groups (Denoeud et al. 2010; Mikhaleva et al. 2018), while gene families with cell
adhesion roles are overrepresented in O. dioica, most likely because of the extensive
and assorted interactions required for building the house (Chavali et al. 2011).

4.4 Evolution by Gene Loss: O. dioica as a Model System
for Evo-Devo Studies

Urochordate genomes (e.g., C. robusta) appear to have a “liberal” evolutionary
pattern of gene loss (Dehal et al. 2002; Holland and Gibson-Brown 2003; Hughes
and Friedman 2005; Somorjai et al. 2018), which contrasts with the “conservative”
pattern of cephalochordates and vertebrates (Somorjai et al. 2018). O. dioica appears
to have pushed this urochordate trend to its limits (Ferrier 2011) by having lost many
genes or entire genetic pathways (Table 4.2). In this section, we review these losses
grouped into three categories: Sect. 4.4.1, losses of genes involved in general
characteristics of gene/genomic structure and expression, Sect. 4.4.2, losses of
genes related to particular cellular and physiological functions, and Sect. 4.4.3,
losses of genes essential for embryonic development in chordates.
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Table 4.2 Absent genesa in O. dioica genome

Category Genes References

cNHEJ
repair system

Xrcc5 (Ku80), Xrcc6 (Ku70), Xrcc4, Lig4,
NHEJ1 (Xlf), DNA-PKc, Dclre1c

Denoeud et al. (2010)

Epigenetic
machinery

Dnmt1, Dnmt3, Mbd4/MeCP2, Gcn5/
PcaF, Hat1, Mll1, Ash1, Rnf1, Suz12,
Pcgf, Scmh1, Kdm2b

Albalat et al. (2012), Navratilova
et al. (2017)

Spliceosome
machinery

snRNA U11, snRNA U12, snRNA
U4atac, snRNA U6atac

Denoeud et al. (2010)

Caspase
family

Csp1/4/5, Csp6, Csp2/9, Csp8/10 Weill et al. (2005)

Immune
system

NLRs, RLHs, MyD88-like, Sarm1-like,
Tirap-like, Ticamp2-like

Denoeud et al. (2010)

Defensome
system

AhR, AhRR, Nr1C (Ppar), CYP1 genes Yadetie et al. (2012)

Peroxins Pex1, Pex2, Pex3, Pex5, Pex6, Pex7,
Pex10, Pex11, Pex12, Pex13, Pex14,
Pex16, Pex19, Pex26

Zarsky and Tachezy (2015)

Retinoic acid
signaling

Rdh10, Rdh16, Bco1, Aldh1a, Cyp26,
RAR, PPAR

Cañestro et al. (2006), Cañestro and
Postlethwait (2007), Martí-Solans
et al. (2016)

Homeobox
genes

Hox3, Hox5, Hox6, Hox7, Hox8, Gbx,
Nk3, Nk6, TGIF, POU VI, Lhx6/7, Vax,
Cux, SATB, ZFH1, Sax, Xlox, Mox, Hlx,
Bsh, Chox10, Otp, Prx, Goosecoid, Prox,
Tlx

Seo et al. (2004), Edvardsen et al.
(2005)

Sox genes SoxC, SoxE, SoxF, SoxH Heenan et al. (2016)
miRNA miR-9, miR-29, miR-33, miR-34, miR-96,

miR-126, miR-133, miR-135, miR-153,
miR-182, miR-183, miR-184, miR-196,
miR-200, miR-216, miR-217, miR-218,
miR-367

Wang et al. (2017)

Notochord
genes

Entactin, Fibrinogen-like, Multidom,
Myomegalin, Noto1, Noto2, Noto3,
Noto4, Noto5, Noto6, Noto7, Noto8,
Noto11, Noto12, Noto13, Noto14, Noto16,
Perlecan, Ptp, Slc, Swipi, Tropomyosin-
like, Tune, Ube2

Kugler et al. (2011)

General
repair system

Polb, Apex2, Lig3, Msh3, Atm, Chek2,
Aptx, Nbn, Rad52

Denoeud et al. (2010)

Apoptotic
genes

Bax, Bak, BCL-XL Robinson et al. (2012)

Cyclins and
CDK

Cyclin J, Cyclin G, Cyclin F, Cdk14/15 Campsteijn et al. (2012)

Rab GTPases Rab4, Rab7L1, Rab9, Rab15, Rab19/43,
Rab20, Rab21, Rab22, Rab24, Rab26/37,
Rab28, Rab30, Rab32LO, Rab40, Ift27,
Rasef, EFcab44/Rab44, RabX1, RabX4,
RabX6

Coppola et al. (2019)

aGenes do not found in O. dioica, and, thereby, likely lost during the evolution of the O. dioica
lineage
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4.4.1 Loss of Genes Involved in Gene/Genomic Structure
and Expression

4.4.1.1 Loss of Non-homologous End Joining Repair Genes

All organisms have the ability to repair the double-strand breaks (DSBs) that
normally happen in DNA due to numerous external and internal factors. One
fundamental mechanism present in all eukaryotes to repair these breaks is the
canonical non-homologous end joining (cNHEJ) repair system. Unexpectedly,
O. dioica (Denoeud et al. 2010) and other six species of appendicularians (Deng
et al. 2018; Ferrier and Sogabe 2018) do not have the cNHEJ machinery (Table 4.2),
meaning this repair system became dispensable during the evolution of this chordate
lineage. In fact, O. dioica seems to use the alternative NHEJ (aNHEJ) system
(a.k.a. alternative end joining, aEJ, Pannunzio et al. 2018) as a compensatory system
that overcomes DSBs, although the existence of another so far undescribed pathway
cannot be excluded (Deng et al. 2018). Because the aNHEJ system seems to be less
faithful than cNHEJ (it often involves deletion of some intervening nucleotides and
commonly leads to chromosome rearrangements, for example, translocations,
(Deriano and Roth 2013)), the loss of the cNHEJ system might have had important
consequences in the genome architecture. It may have contributed, for instance, to
the compaction of the O. dioica genome by either favoring the deletions caused by
the aNHEJ repair system or by restricting replication of autonomous
retrotransposons that uses the cNHEJ system for their propagation (Deng et al.
2018). In addition, this loss may have also contributed to the reorganization of the
genome through accumulated rearrangements, leading to negligible synteny conser-
vation (Deng et al. 2018) that may be associated with modifications of the mecha-
nisms of gene regulation, changing from long-range mechanisms acting on
topologically associated genomic blocks that include several genes to short-range
and gene-specific systems for gene regulation (Cañestro et al. 2007; Ferrier and
Sogabe 2018).

4.4.1.2 Loss of Genes of the Epigenetic Machinery

Histone modifications and DNA methylation are epigenetic marks mainly associated
with regulation of gene expression, replication, DNA repair, recombination, chro-
mosome segregation, and other meiotic and mitotic processes. Histone proteins,
responsible of packing DNA into nucleosomes, provide multiple sites for posttrans-
lational modifications by evolutionarily conserved histone modifiers that establish
the so-called histone code. Among the proteins that modify histones, O. dioica has
lost several genes for histone acetyltransferases such as Gcn5/Pcaf and Hat1
(Navratilova et al. 2017) (Table 4.2). In addition, homologs of core components of
the canonical Polycomb complexes (Rnf1, Suz12, Pcgf, and Scmh1) and genes for
several proteins of the trithorax group (Mll1, Ash1, and Kdm2b) have neither been
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found inO. dioica’s genome (Navratilova et al. 2017). Regarding DNA methylation,
O. dioica has lost the two main DNA methyltransferases Dnmt1 and Dnmt3, and one
of the two Mbd genes, Mbd4/MeCP2 (Cañestro et al. 2007; Albalat et al. 2012)
(Table 4.2). Overall, it is through that the loss of components of the epigenetic
machinery might have favored changes in the genome architecture and modifications
of the mechanisms of gene regulation, leading to compacted regulatory spaces,
reduced chromatin state domain widths, evolution of operons, and loss of synteny
and dispersion of the Hox cluster (Cañestro et al. 2007; Navratilova et al. 2017).

4.4.1.3 Loss of Minor Spliceosome Genes

While the major spliceosome containing the snRNAs U1, U2, U4, U5, and U6
removes introns with canonical GT-AG boundaries, the minor spliceosome, which
contains the snRNAs U11, U12, U4atac, U5, and U6atac, mainly acts on
noncanonical AT-AC boundaries (Patel and Steitz 2003; Sheth et al. 2006). Both
major and minor spliceosomes are present across most eukaryotic lineages tracing
them back to the origin of eukaryote evolution. Although O. dioica has many
noncanonical introns (see above), no AT-AC introns have been detected in cDNA
resources (Denoeud et al. 2010), which may explain that none of the minor
splicesomal snRNAs are found in O. dioica (Table 4.2). It seems therefore that in
the absence of AT-AC introns, the components of the minor spliceosome became
dispensable and lost during O. dioica evolution and at the same time that the major
spliceosome became permissive and able to remove all—canonical and
noncanonical—O. dioica introns, although with different efficiency (Denoeud
et al. 2010). Whether these differences in splicing efficiency could reflect specific
usage of noncanonical introns for gene expression regulation and what evolutionary
impact these changes had needs further investigation.

4.4.2 Loss of Genes for Cellular and Physiological Functions

4.4.2.1 Loss of Genes of the Caspase Family

Caspases are a family of protease enzymes that play an important role not only in
apoptosis but also in maturation of different immunity system proteins and in the
control of the proliferation and differentiation of specific cell types (Weill et al.
2005). Caspases are present in all kingdoms (Uren et al. 2000), but their number has
a taxon-dependent diversity ranging from 3 members in C. elegans to 10–13 in
vertebrates and 17 in C. robusta (Weill et al. 2005). O. dioica has only three caspase
genes deriving from a single founder distantly related to Caspase 3/7 (Weill et al.
2005) (Table 4.2). O. dioica seems, therefore, to have lost all of the components of
the caspase family except one. The reduced complexity of the caspase family might
be associated with a low cell number at the adult stage, the absence of a major
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metamorphosis event, and a minimized immune system in this species (Weill et al.
2005).

4.4.2.2 Loss of Genes of the Immune System

As a marine organism, O. dioica should have an innate immune system prepared to
fight against viruses and bacteria present in high amounts in seawater, but its short
life span along with the absence of hemolymph cells—hemocytes or macrophages—
points to a rapid immune system based on transcriptional upregulation response or
on constitutively expressed effectors, rather than to a more slow system reliant on
cell proliferation triggered by immune receptors (Denoeud et al. 2010). In agree-
ment, O. dioica has lost almost all genes with domains corresponding to typical
immune receptors or immune effectors and lacks homologous genes to interleukins
or cytokines involved in the immunity response of more complex chordates
(Denoeud et al. 2010) (Table 4.2). Interestingly, it has been proposed that a simpli-
fied immune system may be compensated by the antibacterial function of some
oikosins with phospholipase A2 domains, which hydrolyze glycerophospholipids
present in bacterial cell walls (Hosp et al. 2012). In summary, O. dioica seems to
have a highly derived and simplified strategy of defense that together with its high
fertility, short life cycle, and high polymorphism contributes to the survival of the
O. dioica populations (Denoeud et al. 2010).

4.4.2.3 Loss of Cyp Genes for Xenobiotic Defensome Systems

The first step for elimination or inactivation of xenobiotic compounds often involves
the oxidative modification of the toxic chemicals, mostly performed by enzymes of
the cytochrome P450 (CYP) family, some of which are also required for embryonic
development (Goldstone et al. 2006). Due to its variable functions, Cyp enzymes are
quite abundant in animal genomes—up to 120 Cyp genes in sea urchin (Goldstone
et al. 2006), 94 in zebrafish (Goldstone et al. 2010), or 236 in amphioxus (Nelson
et al. 2013). O. dioica, however, has lost many Cyp genes, and with only 23 Cyp
genes, this species has the smallest Cyp repertoire among sequenced metazoan
genomes (Yadetie et al. 2012). O. dioica lacks, for instance, the CYP1 family
genes, which play a central role in the metabolism of environmental toxicants
(Table 4.2). O. dioica also lacks the aryl hydrocarbon receptor (AhR) gene (and its
repressor AhRR) (Yadetie et al. 2012), which is the transcriptional regulator of CYP1
family genes and a major xenobiotic sensing receptor activated by pollutants.
Overall, these data suggest the absence of an AhR-mediated xenobiotic biotransfor-
mation signaling pathway in O. dioica and suggest the evolution of alternative
mechanisms of response to environmental xenobiotic compounds (Yadetie et al.
2012).
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4.4.2.4 Loss of Peroxin Genes and Absence of Peroxisomes

Peroxisomes are single membrane-bound organelles with important functions in
detoxification of reactive oxygen species, long-chain fatty acid beta-oxidation,
plasmalogen synthesis, amino acid degradation, and purine metabolism. Peroxisome
biosynthesis and protein import is mediated by a group of 13 highly conserved
eukaryotic proteins called peroxins (Gabaldon et al. 2006; Schluter et al. 2006;
Zarsky and Tachezy 2015). Peroxisomes are ubiquitous in eukaryotes, and only
some groups of anaerobic protist and parasitic helminths lack peroxisomes (Schluter
et al. 2006; Gabaldon and Capella-Gutierrez 2010). It is therefore extraordinary that
O. dioica has lost all peroxin genes (Table 4.2), becoming the only known aerobic
non-parasitic organism that does not have peroxisomes (Zarsky and Tachezy 2015).
The evolutionary and physiological conditions in which O. dioica was able to lose
the peroxisomes are still a matter of debate as this organism has high oxygen
consumption and oxidizes fatty acids for ATP synthesis, unlike the anaerobic
parasitic lineages missing these organelles (Zarsky and Tachezy 2015). It has been
proposed that the loss of peroxisomes might be evolutionary adaptive, since it has
been associated with reduced genomes and traits of r-reproductive strategies such as
high fecundity, early maturation, and simplified ontogenesis, which O. dioica shares
with parasite organisms as well as with some selective advantages by rendering
organisms resistant to xenobiotics that become activated in the peroxisomal lumen
by redox reactions (Zarsky and Tachezy 2015).

4.4.3 Loss of Genes Essential for Embryonic Development
in Chordates

4.4.3.1 Loss of the RA Genetic Machinery

All-trans-RA is a vitamin A-derived compound that acts as a crucial signaling
system involved in the differentiation and outgrowth of neurons in many metazoans
(reviewed in Albalat 2009), which was adopted for Hox-controlled anterior–poste-
rior patterning in the chordate phylum (Handberg-Thorsager et al. 2018). Despite the
crucial role of RA in chordate axial patterning, it has been shown that O. dioica has
lost most of the genes for RA production, degradation, and signaling (i.e., the RA
genetic machinery, including Rdh10, Aldh1a, Cyp26, and RAR genes) (Cañestro
et al. 2006, 2007; Cañestro and Postlethwait 2007; Martí-Solans et al. 2016)
(Table 4.2) (Fig. 4.11). In the absence of mutational robustness (i.e., alternative
pathways) capable of compensating them, these gene losses were accompanied by
the loss of the RA signaling in this species (Martí-Solans et al. 2016).

The loss of the RA genetic machinery in O. dioica probably took place in the
context of regressive evolution associated with the disintegration of the Hox cluster
that, as mentioned in Sect. 4.3.2, has been related with the shift to a determinative
mode of development. This shift would have released the restrictions to maintain the
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integrity of the Hox cluster (Seo et al. 2004) and led extracellular signals such as RA
that establish embryonic coordinates and regulate the expression of Hox genes by
gradually increasing the portion of the cluster exposed to transcription machinery
over time to become dispensable and eventually lost (Cañestro and Postlethwait
2007; Cañestro et al. 2007).

4.4.3.2 Loss of Homeobox Gene Families

Homeobox genes encode transcription factors involved in many developmental
processes in eukaryotes. Homeobox genes are classified into 11 classes and over
100 gene families/groups (Holland et al. 2007), some of them vertebrate innovations.
O. dioica has lost 36 homeobox groups, 12 of which probably lost during the early
urochordate evolution and 14 specifically lost in the O. dioica lineage (Edvardsen
et al. 2005) (Table 4.2). Noteworthy, among the homeobox families, O. dioica has
lost the anterior Hox3 and all the central Hox genes of the cluster (Seo et al. 2004). In
parallel with the losses, homeobox genes have also duplicated during the evolution
of O. dioica lineage (Edvardsen et al. 2005). Interpreting these gains and losses in
terms of the evolution of developmental mechanisms remains difficult until the
function of O. dioica homeobox genes is revealed. It has been proposed that family
losses may be the result of a relaxed selective pressure to conserve the full set of
homeobox families in the O. dioica (or in the urochordate) lineage due to a
simplification of its body plan in comparison with that of the chordate ancestor
(Edvardsen et al. 2005). On the other hand, the preservation of duplicates in some

Fig. 4.11 The loss of the retinoic acid genetic machinery inO. dioica exemplifies how functionally
linked genes are co-eliminated during evolution. In the absence of mutational robustness capable of
compensating the loss, the co-elimination was accompanied by the loss of the RA signaling.
O. dioica has lost genes for the Rdh10, Rdh16, Bco1, Aldh1a, and Cyp26 enzymes, as well as
genes for the RAR and PPAR nuclear receptors (strikethrough in lighter boxes). The surviving
genes (i.e., Adh1/4, RdhE2, Aldh8a1, and Cco in dark boxes) (Cañestro et al. 2010; Martí-Solans
et al. 2016) do not constitute an alternative pathway for RA synthesis because neither RA nor RA
precursors have been detected at concentrations that are likely to play any role in developmental or
physiological processes of this species (strikethrough)
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families might be the result of a re-diversification of homeobox genes after major
group losses (Edvardsen et al. 2005).

4.4.3.3 Loss of Sox Genes

Sox (Sry-type HMG box) genes are a family of transcription factors defined by a
conserved sequence called the high-mobility group (HMG) box. Sox genes are
involved in a number of essential functions during embryonic development, includ-
ing sex determination and neuronal development (Wegner 2010). Ten different Sox
groups have been described (A to J), some of them (B, C, D, E, F) conserved in
almost all metazoans, and some groups being specific of certain lineages (A, G, and I
of vertebrates, H of chordates, and J of nematodes) (Bowles et al. 2000; Heenan et al.
2016). O. dioica, however, has only four Sox genes, two of them belonging to the
SoxD group and the other two to the SoxB group (Heenan et al. 2016; Torres-Aguila
et al. 2018). These results imply that O. dioica has lost three ancient metazoan Sox
groups (C, E, F) and the chordate Sox group (H) (Heenan et al. 2016) (Table 4.2). As
in other examples reviewed above, the evolutionary impact of the gains and losses in
the Sox family on the developmental mechanisms remains difficult to interpret since
the expression of only two SoxB genes has been described (Torres-Aguila et al.
2018).

4.4.3.4 Loss of miRNAs

MicroRNAs (miRNAs) are noncoding RNAs of about 22 nucleotides involved in the
regulation of different biological processes, including embryo development, cell
differentiation, and growth. miRNA innovation has been correlated with increased
developmental complexity during animal evolution (Hertel et al. 2006). Analysis of
the miRNA repertoire of O. dioica has shown that this species has lost (or derived to
the point they cannot be recognized anymore) at least eighteen highly conserved
bilaterian miRNA families (Fu et al. 2008; Wang et al. 2017) (Table 4.2). On the
other hand, at least 29 new miRNA families would have appeared in
appendicularians (Fu et al. 2008), suggesting a profound reorganization of the
miRNA repertoire due to recurrent events of gene losses and gains during
O. dioica evolution. This scenario is consistent with the general notion that animal
miRNAs are poorly conserved between distant taxa (Wang et al. 2017) and, there-
fore, that changes in miRNA repertoires have been important in shaping animal
evolution (Fu et al. 2008). It is thought that the reorganization of O. dioica miRNA
repertoire might have impacted on the temporal robustness of the rapid develop-
mental program of this urochordate lineage (Fu et al. 2008), which would be in
agreement with the idea that modifications in the miRNA repertoires have been
important in adapting radically different life-history strategies from a common larval
body plan (Fu et al. 2008).
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4.4.3.5 Loss of Notochord Genes

The notochord, one of defining features of the chordate phylum, is a stiff rod of
tissue located ventral to the neural tube that provides a rigid, but still bendy, structure
for muscle attachment, as well as an important source of embryonic developmental
signals (Stemple 2005). Actually, developing chordate embryos require a notochord
as an organizer for secreting signals that pattern several organs such as the somites,
heart, or pancreas. Comparison of a set of notochord genes known to be targets of the
notochord-specific Brachyury transcription factor revealed that from 50 notochord
genes of C. robusta used as a reference, 24 are absent in O. dioica (likely lost, e.g.,
Noto2), and 15 are not expressed (8 genes, e.g., Asak) or expressed at low levels
(7 genes, e.g., Noto10) in the notochord (Kugler et al. 2011) (Table 4.2). Taken
together, these results suggest a considerable divergence in the genetic toolkit for
notochord development in O. dioica, which would have been impacted by events of
gene loss or by the loss of the notochord function of some genes. Considering the
morphological similarities between urochordate notochords, the divergence in the
genetic toolkits used to develop them is surprising.

4.4.4 O. dioica, Gene Loss, and the Inverse Paradox

The original paradox in the field of evo-devo arose by the discovery that similar
genetic toolkits were able to build a wide variety of morphologies in disparate
animals, implying that the same genes (genetic unity) were used to build such
different forms (phenotypic diversity) (Jacob 1977). The discovery of the pervasive-
ness of gene loss along evolution (Albalat and Cañestro 2016) affecting relevant
developmental genes led to the formulation of the so-called inverse paradox of
evo-devo. This hypothesis proposes that organisms might develop fundamentally
similar morphologies (phenotypic unity) despite important differences in their
genetic toolkits (genetic diversity) (Cañestro et al. 2007) (Fig. 4.12). Because
differences between the genetic toolkits are often a consequence of the loss of
some of their crucial genes, the study of O. dioica has become fundamental to
build the new conceptual framework as this species has been able to maintain a
phylotypic chordate-body plan after having lost many genes thought to be crucial for
the archetypal chordate development (see Sect. 4.4.3). In this regard, the character-
ization of the O. dioica “lossosome” (the complete catalogue of gene losses in a
phylogenetic context; Cañestro and Roncalli 2018) and the analysis of its functional
consequences should provide the framework to investigate how gene loss might
have been an important evolutionary force for generating differences in the devel-
opmental genetic toolkits of chordates and, thereby, to understand the evolution of
the mechanisms of development of our own phylum.
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4.5 Future Directions

The tiny planktonic chordate Oikopleura dioica appears as an emerging nonclassical
animal model, not only attractive to better understand the radiation of our own
phylum in the field of evo-devo but also attractive in many other biological fields,
such as ecology, environmental toxicology, biomedicine, or basic research. In
ecology and toxicology, for instance, the relevance of O. dioica and other larvacean
species in the marine food webs makes the study of its defense and detoxification
mechanisms significant for understanding the impact of industrial pollutants or the
effect of the climate change on marine environments, trophic webs, and ocean
production. Monitoring O. dioica populations has been proposed to be used as
valuable sentinels for following the health of marine ecosystems and the expression
of its defensome genes as molecular biosensors that marine biologists could use to

Fig. 4.12 In contrast to the original paradox, the inverse paradox in evo-devo proposes that
organisms might develop fundamentally similar morphologies (phenotypic unity) despite important
differences in their genetic toolkits (genetic diversity). Because differences in the genetic toolkits
often are the consequence of the gene losses, the study of O. dioica has been fundamental to build
this new conceptual framework
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monitor stress situations of natural populations. For biomedical applications, the
chordate condition of O. dioica makes it closer to humans than classical model
animals such as fruit flies or worms, but genetically and functionally more tractable
than classical vertebrate models as mouse or zebrafish. The homology of organs,
tissues, and structures between O. dioica and vertebrates (i.e., human) is unques-
tionable and therefore a good proxy to understand the genetic bases of many human
disorders. In addition, the genetic, functional, and structural similarities of O. dioica
and vertebrates make this species a promising model system for pharmacological
screenings and other functional tests by amenable knockdown systems such as RNAi
or DNAi approaches. Moreover, the relative small and compact genome of O. dioica
makes it a good system for basic research in genetics. In the field of gene regulation
analysis, for example, its small intergenic regions should facilitate the identification
of cis-regulatory elements that control gene transcription. And in the field of
evolutionary biology, the high mutation rate of O. dioica, its propensity to lose
genes, and its miniature genome that can be affordably sequenced in many individ-
uals should facilitate studies of population genomics for better understanding evo-
lutionary forces in natural populations, searching for adaptive interpopulation
differences, or investigating microevolution processes. Thus, O. dioica research
has a brilliant present, but an even more promising future.
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Diatom bloom-derived biotoxins cause aberrant
development and gene expression in the
appendicularian chordate Oikopleura dioica
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Investigating environmental hazards than could affect appendicularians is of prime ecological

interest because they are among the most abundant components of the mesozooplankton.

This work shows that embryo development of the appendicularian Oikopleura dioica is

compromised by diatom bloom-derived biotoxins, even at concentrations in the same range

as those measured after blooms. Developmental gene expression analysis of biotoxin-treated

embryos uncovers an aberrant golf ball-like phenotype affecting morphogenesis, midline

convergence, and tail elongation. Biotoxins induce a rapid upregulation of defensome genes,

and considerable delay and silencing of zygotic transcription of developmental genes. Upon a

possible future intensification of blooms associated with ocean warming and acidification, our

work puts an alert on the potential impact that an increase of biotoxins may have on marine

food webs, and points to defensome genes as molecular biosensors that marine ecologists

could use to monitor the genetic stress of natural populations exposed to microalgal blooms.

DOI: 10.1038/s42003-018-0127-2 OPEN

1 Departament de Genètica, Microbiologia i Estadística and Institut de Recerca de la Biodiversitat (IRBio), Facultat de Biologia, Universitat de Barcelona. Av.
Diagonal 643, 08028 Barcelona, Catalonia, Spain. 2 Department of Biology and Evolution of Marine Organisms, Stazione Zoologica Anton Dohrn, Villa
Comunale 80121, Napoli, Italy. 3 Department of Integrative Marine Ecology, Stazione Zoologica Anton Dohrn, Villa Comunale, 80121 Napoli, Italy.
Correspondence and requests for materials should be addressed to R.A. (email: ralbalat@ub.edu) or to C.C. (email: canestro@ub.edu)

COMMUNICATIONS BIOLOGY | �(2018)�1:121� | DOI: 10.1038/s42003-018-0127-2 |www.nature.com/commsbio 1

12
34

56
78

9
0
()
:,;



 156 

C limate change impact on ecosystems is complex and often
with no direct relationship. Nevertheless, it is conceivable
that pressures such as ocean warming and acidification

may potentially intensify the severity and frequency of harmful
algal blooms, globally influencing marine planktonic systems1.
Harmful algal blooms include diatoms, which are among
the most important photoautotrophic organisms that drive
marine food web dynamics2. Diatoms can produce different
biotoxins, some of which may act as a defense mechanism against
grazers3–6. Among diatom-derived biotoxins, oxylipins are of
prime interest because of their negative effects on the reproduc-
tion of copepods4, the main grazers of these algae and one of the
most abundant components of the mesozooplankton7. Oxylipins,
which include polyunsaturated aldehydes (PUAs), are secondary
metabolic end-products of a lipoxygenase/hydroperoxide lyase
pathway that are toxic when released to the environment8.
During algal blooms, cell membranes are broken by cellular
friction, massive grazing or senescence at the end of the bloom,
generating oxylipin-rich microzones that can alter the biology of
neighboring organisms9.

Oxylipin toxicity does not only affect copepods, but recent
studies have shown that several marine species are compromised,
including sea urchins9–13, ascidian urochordates14–16, as well as
mollusks and annelids10,17,18. Despite the fact that analyses of
different organisms have shown that PUA’s toxicity can affect
a wide range of physiological processes, including oocyte
maturation, sperm motility, fertilization, cell proliferation,
embryogenesis, hatching, metamorphosis and apoptosis
(reviewed in the ref. 19), the molecular bases of PUA’s toxicity
remain often unclear. Studies in copepods and ascidians have
revealed, for instance, that PUAs affect the expression of stress
response genes (i.e., defensome20) associated with the metabolism
of the glutathione system (e.g., Gclm, Ggt, and Gst)15,16,21,22. The
expression of defensome genes related to aldehyde detoxification
derived from lipid peroxidation (e.g., Aldh2 and Aldh8) are also
altered by PUAs, suggesting that these compounds may also
induce oxidative stress21,23,24.

While the physiological effects of PUA’s toxicity have been
investigated, the developmental genetic mechanisms affected by
PUAs causing embryo malformations remain largely unknown.
In sea urchins and ascidians, expression analyses by qRT-PCR of
developmental genes related to embryo patterning (e.g., Hox,
Parahox) or signaling pathways (e.g., Wnt and nitric oxide/Erk)
have revealed differences in the expression levels15,16,24. The
mechanism by which PUAs induced those differences remains
uncertain. Moreover, to our knowledge, there is no data
describing what developmental processes and germ layers are
altered by PUAs.

In this work, we study if PUAs affect the embryonic develop-
ment of the appendicularian urochordate specie Oikopleura
dioica for two main reasons. First, from an ecological perspective,
appendicularians (a.k.a. larvaceans) are relevant because they are
cosmopolitan pelagic filter-feeding organisms, considered the
second most abundant after copepods in marine
mesozooplankton25,26. Appendicularians graze about 10% of the
ocean’s primary production27. The appendicularian capability of
trapping a wide range of particle sizes thanks to their unique
filter-feeding apparatus house makes them to occupy an impor-
tant trophic position in food webs. Appendicularians act as an
important short-circuit that allows a rapid energy transfer from
colloidal carbon and phytoplankton primary producers to zoo-
planktivorous predators such as fish larvae28,29, contributing at
the same time to at least 8% of the vertical carbon transport to the
deep ocean30–32. Therefore, the study of PUAs toxicity on the
biology of appendicularians is fundamental from an ecological
perspective to better understand the potential effect of increased

amount of oxylipins on marine food webs and carbon cycle, upon
potential intensification of harmful diatom blooms in the context
of ocean warming and acidification.

Second, from an evolutionary and developmental biology
(evo-devo) perspective, the chordate O. dioica is an attractive
animal model because it has undergone a process of genetic
and morphological simplification during the evolution of
urochordates33–36. The low genetic redundancy of O. dioica
genome, in comparison with the twice-duplicated vertebrate
genome (reviewed in the ref. 37), together with the extra-
ordinary amount of gene losses36, make that its functional
redundancy is lower than in other animal species (e.g., verte-
brates). Some gene losses have led this organism to be con-
sidered as an evolutionary knockout that can facilitate the
dissection of complex genetic networks36,38–41. O. dioica has
lost, for instance, the retinaldehyde dehydrogenase Aldh1a and
most of the components of the metabolic pathway of retinoic
acid (RA)42, a signaling molecule that in all other chordates
plays a fundamental role in the regulation of embryo devel-
opment, adult organ homeostasis and gametogenesis43–45. The
loss of the Aldh1a in O. dioica is particularly relevant for the
present work because it has been proposed that PUAs such as
trans,trans-2,4-decadienal (DD) can compete with retinalde-
hyde for the substrate binding site of the Aldh1a46. This
finding suggested the hypothesis that the teratogenicity of DD
could be due to its interference with RA-synthesis, impairing
thereby normal RA signaling during embryo development.
Thus, our work aims to study O. dioica as an Aldh1a evolu-
tionary knockout to test this hypothesis, because DD should
produce minor or no alterations on O. dioica embryo devel-
opment if RA signaling is the main developmental pathway
targeted by DD. On the contrary, if DD severely affects the
development of O. dioica, it would imply that other develop-
mental mechanisms, distinct from RA signaling, are affected by
DD exposure.

This work reveals that oxylipins can induce aberrant devel-
opment and gene expression of appendicularians, even at con-
centrations in the same range than those measured after blooms,
and puts an alert on the potential impact that an increase of
biotoxins may have on marine food webs.

Results
Dose-dependent effects of DD on embryo development of
O. dioica. To investigate the possible teratogenic effects and dose-
response of DD on O. dioica embryo development, we analyzed,
at the time of hatching, embryos derived from eggs treated with
DD at different concentrations (from 0.05 to 2.5 µg mL−1, this is
from 0.33 to 16.42 µM). In contrast to DMSO-control conditions,
DD-treatments altered embryo development in a dose-dependent
manner, in which the severity of the phenotypic aberrations and
the proportion of affected embryos depended on the concentra-
tion of the DD (Fig. 1). We classified the aberrant phenotypes in
three categories: abnormal hatchlings, pre-tailbud arrested
embryos with golf ball morphology, and 1-cell arrested zygotes
(Fig. 1a–d). According to the differences in the proportions of
aberrant phenotypes (statistical analyses are provided in Supple-
mentary Fig. 1), we classified DD concentrations in four cate-
gories (Fig. 1e): innocuous (≤0.05 μg mL−1), in which no
significant differences were observed in comparison with DMSO-
controls (P-value 0.998); mild (from 0.075 to 0.125 μg mL−1), in
which most embryos did hatch, but the presence of aberrant
morphologies with shorten or kinked tails was higher than in the
DMSO-control condition; moderate (from 0.25 to 2.0 μg mL−1),
in which most animals did not hatch, remaining arrested in
a pre-tailbud stage with the appearance of a golf ball; severe
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(≥2.5 μg mL−1), in which most zygotes remained at 1-cell stage
with no cleaving.

One-cell arrest embryos by severe DD concentrations. To test if
the absence of cell divisions at severe concentrations could be
due to fertilization impairment, we scored for the formation of
polar bodies after fertilization in the presence or absence of DD
in 760 and 610 embryos, respectively (Fig. 2a–c). Results
showed no significant difference in the number of oocytes with
polar bodies between DMSO-controls and DD-treatments
(ANOVA test, P-value= 0.432), suggesting therefore that DD
was not impairing oocyte fertilization. Careful inspection of
oocytes by differential interference contrast (DIC) microscopy
did not reveal any evident morphological difference, neither in
the shape and size of the internal granules of the oocytes, nor in
the changes of membrane surface rugosity that normally occurs
during fertilization (Fig. 2b, c). To investigate if the internal
organization of the cytoplasm of oocytes could be affected by

DD, we performed whole-mount in situ hybridizations to detect
maternal Wnt11 transcripts (Fig. 2d, e). In DMSO-control two-
cell stage embryos at 30-min post-fertilization (mpf), maternal
Wnt11 signal appeared asymmetrically distributed, mostly
accumulated near the cell membrane that will form the pro-
spective posterior vegetal pole of the embryo (yellow arrow-
heads in Fig. 2d, and unpublished data). In DD treated embryos
at 30-mpf, maternal Wnt11 signal also appeared asymmetrically
distributed near the membranes of the putative posterior
vegetal pole, despite the absence of embryo cleavage, suggesting
no changes of cellular architecture that drives the primary axial
polarity (Fig. 2e).

Golf ball pre-tailbud arrested embryos. At moderate DD con-
centrations (e.g., 1 μg mL−1), the majority of embryos proceeded
normally with embryo cleavage, but most of them never devel-
oped a normal tailbud morphology (Figs. 1c, 3a). Comparison
between the development of DMSO-control and DD-treated
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Fig. 2 Characterization of 1-cell arrest phenotype caused by severe DD concentrations (2.5 µg mL−1). a Percentage of fertilized embryos assessed by the
formation of polar bodies do not show significant differences (P-value= 0.432) between DMSO-control (blue circles in the plot) (b) and DD-treated
embryos (orange circles in the plot) (c), in which moreover no morphological differences in the presence of internal granules nor surface rugosity are
observed. Maternal Wnt11 signal appeared asymmetrically distributed, mostly accumulated near the cell membrane (yellow arrowheads) that will form the
prospective posterior vegetal pole both in DMSO-control (d) and DD-treated embryos despite the absence of the first cleavage (e), suggesting that DD
does not alter the cellular architecture of the oocyte that drives primary axial polarity. Number of analyzed embryos (n) and number replicates (r) are
indicated on top of each treatment. Reported means and standard deviations are represented in the plot with horizontal line and error bars, respectively.
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embryos revealed no obvious differences up to the incipient-
tailbud stage about 3 h post-fertilization (hpf). At that stage,
however, while control embryos showed a clear indentation at the
initial demarcation of the trunk and tail, DD-treated embryos did
not show that indentation, and their morphology looked like a
golf ball (Fig. 3a). During tailbud stages, while control embryos
continued with the progressive differentiation of their trunk and
tail until the hatch, DD-treated embryos maintained the golf ball
morphology in an apparently arrested pre-tailbud stage, in which
no trunk nor tail could be distinguished (Figs. 1c, 3a).

To test if the failure to proceed to tailbud stages was due to the
arrest of cell divisions, we counted the number of nuclei in
control and DD-treated embryos, (Fig. 3b), we found no
significant differences (P-values > 0.05, Fig. 3c), suggesting that
the absence of trunk and tail differentiation, and the lack of
obvious internal structures were not due to a slow-down or
blockage of development caused by a deceleration or arrest of
nuclear divisions, but to the failure of the process of
morphogenesis that normally start at incipient-tailbud stage.

DD causes zygotic expression delay of developmental genes.
The fact that O. dioica has lost RA signaling42 allowed us to
discard that these abnormalities were due to alterations of this
signaling pathway. To uncover what genetic mechanisms could be
affected by DD resulting in a failure of morphogenesis and

organogenesis, we performed expression analyses by whole-
mount in situ hybridization with eight specific gene markers
across different embryonic germ layers comparing six develop-
mental stages between DMSO-control and DD-treated embryos
(Fig. 4a). With the exception of Brachyury (Bra)47,48, Actin (Act)
49, and Nkx2.3/5/6 (ID comp20628 in50), all other O. dioica genes
used in this work have not been described yet, and here they have
been used as makers of derivatives of the three germ cell layers
(Fig. 4b).

Expression analyses by whole-mount in situ hybridization
revealed that the main alteration produced by DD exposure was
that most embryos showed a systematic delay in the expression
onset of all developmental genes analyzed. For instance, the first
signal corresponding to the expression onset of Bra, Act, Tis11a,
and SoxBa was delayed from 32-cell to at least 64-cell stage, the
zygotic expression onset of Wnt11 was delayed from 64-cell to at
least to 200-cell stage, and the expression onset of SoxBb was
delayed from 200-cell stage to an embryo with a golf ball
appearance equivalent to a mid-tailbud stage in the control
condition (Fig. 4a). This delay was maintained during develop-
ment since expression domains at later developmental stages in
DD-treated embryos reminded those at earlier stages of control
embryos (Fig. 4a). The fact that the total number of cells at each
stage did not significantly differ between control and DD-treated
embryos (Fig. 3b, c) suggested that the delay of expression could
not be explained by an overall developmental slowdown due to a
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COMMUNICATIONS BIOLOGY | DOI: 10.1038/s42003-018-0127-2 ARTICLE

COMMUNICATIONS BIOLOGY | �(2018)�1:121� | DOI: 10.1038/s42003-018-0127-2 |www.nature.com/commsbio 5



 160 

 

decrease of the rate of cell divisions, but rather to alterations in
the regulatory mechanisms of the transcription of these genes.

When we scored the number of DD-treated embryos that
showed or not expression signal in each stage, we found that the
delay of the expression onset could reach extreme situations of
detecting no signal at all in a majority of DD-treated embryos at
stages in which gene expression was already detected in 100% of
their control counterparts (Fig. 4a). Remarkably, while the
proportion of DD-treated embryos with no expression between
32-cell and 200-cell stages was high (73%, 210 out of 288), this
proportion decreased in golf ball embryos equivalent to tailbud
stages (31%, 58 out of 190). To determine whether the absence of
signal was due to RNA degradation or repression of zygotic
transcription, we focused on the expression signal of Wnt11 gene,
which has both maternal and zygotic components. Results
revealed that while signal from the maternal component was
observed up to the 64-cell stage in control embryos, time at which
zygotic transcription started, in DD-treated embryos, however,
only signal from the maternal component was observed and no
signal from zygotic expression of Wnt11 was detected until the
200-cell stage (Fig. 4a). This finding suggested that the absence of
expression signal in DD-treated embryos was not due to
transcript degradation, but it was consistent with a considerable
delay and silencing of zygotic transcription of developmental
genes, which was more conspicuous at earlier stages up to 200-
cell stage than at later stages equivalent to tailbud in control
embryos.

DD alters midline convergence and posterior elongation. To
test if the delay of the expression of developmental genes caused
by DD was also accompanied by a delay of the onset of cell
invagination during gastrulation, we analyzed Bra expression,
which in agreement with previous reports47 labeled one pair of
blastomeres (A21) at the surface in embryos at 32-cell stage, and
two pair of cells that already occupied an internal position (A211
and A212) after invagination as gastrulation proceeded at 64-cell
stage in control embryos (Fig. 4a). In DD-treated embryos,
however, no signal was detected at 32-cells stage, and the first Bra
signal was observed in only one pair of internal cells rather than
two pairs as expected at the 64-cell stage (Fig. 4a). The fact the
first two cells expressing Bra were already located in an internal
position of the embryo (rather than the surface) suggested that
DD did not delay the process of gastrulation, but simply altered
the time at which Bra started to be expressed.

Analyses of the temporal dynamics of markers such Bra and
Act revealed that the process of midline convergence seemed to be
clearly delayed in DD-treated embryos. For instance, while the
processes of notochord intercalation and muscle midline
bilateral-convergence were completed by 2 hpf at 200-cell stage
in control embryos (Fig. 4a), in DD-treated embryos these
processes were not completed up to 2 h later by the time at which
normal animals were already hatching (Fig. 4b). Moreover, the
length of the Bra and Act expression domains appeared to be
much shorter in DD-treated embryos than control ones,
suggesting that not only the midline convergence was affected,
but also posterior elongation was impaired.

DD alters morphogenesis but no axial patterning or cell fate.
Analysis of expression of eight developmental markers in DD-
treated embryos with golf ball phenotypes revealed that the setup
of the embryonic axes had been already established, and the fate
determination of tissues derived from the three germ layers did
not appear to be affected. For instance, the setup of the anterior-
posterior (AP) axis in embryos with golf ball morphology was
revealed by the presence of Bra, Act, and SoxBb expression

domains restricted to the presumptive posterior half of the
embryo, (labeling the mesodermal precursor of the notochord,
muscle cells and the ectoderm of the tail, respectively, Fig. 4a, b),
as well as SoxBa, SoxBb, Tis11a, and Nkx2.3/5/6 expression
domains restricted to the presumptive anterior half of the embryo
(labeling the endoderm, and the ectoderm of the trunk Fig. 4a, b).
The setup of the dorso-ventral (DV) axis was revealed by the
restricted expression of Nkx2.3/5/6 to the presumptive ventral
epidermal domain of the trunk (Fig. 4a, b). In addition to the
endodermal, mesodermal and ectodermal precursors labeled with
the aforementioned markers in DD-treated embryos, the presence
of ectodermal SoxBb and Wnt11 expression domains in precursor
cells of the Langerhans receptors in the tail-trunk transition area
and in the most anterior part of the embryo (Fig. 4a, b) suggested
that the cell fate commitment of placode and neural cell pre-
cursors was not affected by DD. Thus, despite that DD seems to
block morphogenesis and the formation of the trunk and tail in
embryos with a golf ball phenotype, the setup of the embryonic
axes, as well as the fate determination of tissues derived from the
three germ layers, seemed not to be altered by DD.

Developmental genetic response of the defensome against DD.
Previous works on sea urchins had revealed the existence of a
defensome, a set of stress response genes that activates their
expression during development to protect embryos upon envir-
onmental stress20. To test if DD upregulates defensome genes
during O. dioica development, we have analyzed the expression
pattern of four defensome genes—three previously described
dehydrogenase genes Adh351, Aldh252, and Aldh842, and a here
newly described glutathione-related gene (Glutamate-cysteine
ligase modifier subunit; Gclm)—in six developmental stages from
eight-cell stage to late hatchling of DMSO-control and DD-
treated embryos at mild concentrations (e.g., 0.1 µg mL−1)
(Fig. 5). In control embryos, the expression signal of all four genes
was almost negligible at early developmental stages, and it was
only detected in mid/late hatchling stages, in which Gclm and
Adh3 showed obvious expression domains restricted to digestive
compartments (e.g., mouth, pharynx, esophagus, and stomach
lobes), and Aldh2 and Aldh8 showed either no signal or a weak
and scattered signal (Fig. 5). In DD-treated embryos, however, the
expression of all four genes was upregulated since very early
developmental stages, showing broader and stronger staining
than control embryos (Fig. 5). The obvious up-regulation of these
four genes in response to DD, therefore, suggested that DD was
able to trigger a genetic response of members of the defensome
involved in aldehyde detoxification, and especially members that
respond to alterations of the metabolism of the glutathione sys-
tem such as Gclm, which was the gene that showed a stronger
level of upregulation in response to DD (Fig. 5). Moreover, the
fact that the expression of defensome genes was already notice-
ably upregulated by eight-cell stage, a time at which normal
zygotic expression of most genes had not started yet, suggested
that these genes had an immediate response capability upon DD
challenge (Fig. 5).

Effects of diatom extracts on O. dioica embryogenesis. To test if
similar developmental abnormalities induced by DD on O. dioica
could be also caused by natural PUAs or other oxylipins pro-
duced by diatoms frequently involved in algal blooms, we tested
the effect of the extracts from different microalga species on
O. dioica embryogenesis. These species included Skeletonema
marinoi (Sm), which has been characterized by its high content of
the PUAs heptadienal and octadienal and the lack of
decadienal5,53; Chaetoceros affinis (Ca), which produces other
oxylipins different from PUAs8; Prorocentrum minimum (Pm), a
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dinoflagellate species used as a negative control that does
not produce oxylipins8; and Chaetoceros calcitrans (Cc), a
diatom included in the diet used to feed O. dioica in our animal
facility41, but for which the capability to produce PUAs was
unknown. First, we studied the dose-response of O. dioica
development at different concentrations of S. marinoi extracts
(from 5 to 100 μg mL−1). Results revealed that the most con-
centrated extracts reproduced the same phenotypes observed
during DD treatments (Supplementary Fig. 2). Our results from
treatments with S. marinoi extracts at 100 μg mL−1—which
according to previous studies53 contained PUAs at a concentra-
tion of approximately 2.4 μg mL−1 (20.3 μM assuming an average
MW of 117.17 for heptadienal and octadienal most abundant
PUAs described in S. marinoi)—revealed that the golf ball mor-
phology of pre-tailbud arrested embryos was the most abundant

phenotype, suggesting that the effects of the PUAs in 100 μg mL−1

S. marinoi PUAs were comparable with the moderate, but not
severe, condition observed in DD-treatments (Fig. 1 and Sup-
plementary Fig. 2). These results were consistent with previous
observations showing that higher concentrations of heptadienal
and octadienal, the main PUAs of S. marinoi, were required to
cause similar teratogenic effects to those of DD during sea urchin
embryonic development12.

To test whether treatments with S. marinoi extracts were also
capable to trigger a defensome response as observed with DD, we
performed in situ hybridization experiments with Gclm. Results
revealed that Gclm expression was upregulated even after
treatments with extracts at concentrations of only 10 μg mL−1,
in which no significant difference was observed in the proportion
of aberrant phenotypes between Sm-extract treated embryos and
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the DMSO-control condition (P-value= 0.261; Fig. 6a and
Supplementary Fig. 2). We concluded therefore that potential
secondary metabolites produced by S. marinoi were also capable
to activate the expression of the defensome.

Finally, we tested whether O. dioica development was also
affected by extracts of other microalgae that produce other
secondary metabolites different from those of S. marinoi, using
diatom extracts of C. affinis and C. calcitrans, as well as the
dinoflagellate P. minimum as negative control. In all cases, with
the exception of the negative control P. minimum, extracts
affected O. dioica development giving rise to the same phenotypes
as observed with DD and S. marinoi extracts (Fig. 6b and
Supplementary Fig. 2). Results revealed that the proportion of
normal embryos in C. affinis extract treatments seemed even
lower than those observed with S. marinoi extracts, suggesting
that O. dioica development could be even more sensitive to the
toxicity of other oxylipins different than PUAs (Fig. 6b). In the
case of C. calcitrans, a diatom whose production of PUAs or other
oxylipins had not been investigated to our knowledge, we
observed that embryo development was similarly affected by
treatments with S. marinoi extracts (Fig. 6b). To our knowledge
this is the first finding suggesting that C. calcitrans is able to
produce toxic secondary metabolites, which indeed is consistent
with personal observations during the feeding strategy in our
O. dioica facility in which excess of this alga in the diet made
O. dioica cultures to decline41.

Discussion
Understanding the potential impact that global climate change
may have on oceans’ health, and particularly how the potential
increase of harmful algal blooms may impact marine trophic
webs is one of the main challenges that our Society is currently
facing1 (see focus areas and agenda of UNESCO-IOC). In this
context, results from this work reveal that biotoxins from the
oxylipin family that are abundantly released at the end of diatom
blooms can compromise embryonic development of appendicu-
larian species, and therefore their reproduction. This finding is
ecologically relevant because appendicularians together with
copepods, which are also affected by these biotoxins4, represent
the two most abundant components of the mesozooplankton

around the globe, playing a crucial role in the global dynamics of
marine food webs25. Our analysis of the development of O. dioica
embryos exposed to DD, which is the most investigated PUA
among those synthesized by some bloom-forming diatoms
species3,54, reveals a characteristic set of embryonic aberrant
morphologies with frequencies that follow a defined dose-
response pattern (Fig. 1). Our work, furthermore, reveals that
the same set of embryonic aberrant morphologies is also induced
by treatments with extracts from diatom species that produce
high levels of heptadienal and octadienal (S. marinoi5,53), or other
oxylipins different from PUAs (C. affinis8). Also extracts from
species such as C. calcitrans, whose oxylipin content is still
unknown, affect O. dioica embryogenesis.

At present, our understanding of how PUAs toxicity released
after blooms affect marine organisms in their natural habitats
remains uncertain. Previous studies have quantified dissolved PUAs
after blooms events in a range from 7.61× 10−6 to 0.02 µgmL−155,
questioning laboratory experiments in which the concentrations of
PUAs are of an order of magnitude higher than those described in
the field5,54. Although in our study the most dramatic embryonic
malformations mostly appear at concentrations of orders of mag-
nitude higher than in the field (i.e. one-cell arrest at > 2.5 µgmL−1

or golf ball morphology at >0.25 µgmL−1), we want to remark that
we observe lethal embryonic abnormalities at concentrations as low
as 0.075 µgmL−1, which is in the same order of the maximum value
measured in the field after diatom blooms (e.g., 0.02 µgmL−1 after a
bloom of S. marinoi in the northwestern Adriatic Sea55). Thus,
despite we do not see apparent abnormalities in embryos exposed
during 4hpf to DD at concentrations lower than 0.05 µgmL−1, we
cannot exclude that long or repeated exposure of appendicularians
to peaks of PUAs released after blooms (see ref .54,56), or even
synergistic effect of simultaneous exposure to multiple PUAs may
have detrimental effects on appendicularians’ biology in natural
habitats. This possibility is especially important considering the
outstanding ability of appendicularians to concentrate microalgae.
Moreover, our finding that longer exposures before fertilization,
which facilitate eggs to accumulate DD through the chorion
(Supplementary Fig. 3), increase the sensitivity of appendicularian
development to DD toxicity makes plausible to suggest that adult
animals exposed to DD throughout generations may accumulate
this biotoxin in their gonads and become, therefore, more
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vulnerable to its detrimental effects. This possibility might explain
the observation that overfeeding O. dioica cultures with the diatom
C. calcitrans appears to lead culture declining41. Considering the
ecological relevance of appendicularians in marine food webs and
ocean carbon cycle, future experiments are urged to better under-
stand the threat that oxylipins and other biotoxins can cause on the
biology of appendicularians in natural environments. For instance,
longer exposure regimes of O. dioica adults at low DD doses or
overfeeding with excess of oxylipin-producing diatoms will be
necessary to further investigate the vulnerability of appendicularians
to the accumulation of these biotoxins throughout multiple
generations.

Finally, our finding that Gclm and other defensome genes show
highly sensitive expression responses to low concentrations of
PUAs and other oxylipins (Figs. 5, 6) opens the possibility to use
Gclm and other defensome markers as biosensors to test for
genetic stress of natural appendicularian populations that may
have been exposed to algal blooms in their habitats. Interestingly,
increased expression of Gclm has been also reported in Ciona
intestinalis larvae treated with DD16, suggesting that the use of
Gclm expression as a biosensor can be used in other urochordates,
and possibly other organisms, to monitor ecosystems with dif-
ferent exposures to blooms, thus providing a better understanding
and a prediction of the potential impact of harmful algal blooms
associated for instance to ocean warming and acidification.

Despite PUAs and other oxylipins produced by diatoms can
interfere with a wide spectrum of physiological processes in many
marine animals9–18, the genetic pathways altered by these bio-
toxins remain unclear, especially during embryo development.
The fact that PUAs such as DD had been described to be able to
compete with retinaldehyde for the substrate binding site of the
Aldh1a enzymes had led us to hypothesize that genetic alterations
due to a disruption of RA signaling could be a potential expla-
nation for the physiological and developmental alterations caused
by DD46. Although many studies have reported the teratogenic
effect of DD on different marine organisms11,16,57–61, the direct
effect of DD on RA signaling pathway has never been investigated
in vivo, and whether changes detected by RT-PCR of the
expression levels of some typical RA-target genes such Hox1,
Hox12, and Cdx in ascidians was due to RA or some other sig-
naling pathway remained unknown15. Our study, taking advan-
tage that O. dioica is a natural evolutionary knockout of RA
signaling42, demonstrates for the first time that DD can cause
dramatic developmental alterations independently of RA
signaling.

To our knowledge, this work is the first general attempt to fill
the gap between the teratogenic phenotypes and the develop-
mental genetic responses induced by oxylipins by expression
analyses of whole-mount in situ hybridization. Our results show
which developmental processes are altered and which ones are
not affected by DD. Indeed, early developmental processes, such
as cleaving pattern, gastrulation, and cell division rate do not
seem to be affected by the exposure to moderate concentrations of
this biotoxin. DD-treated embryos, however, fail to begin the
process of morphogenesis, and develop a golf ball morphology in
which the indentation that normally separates the trunk from the
tail at incipient-tailbud stage never appears. Molecular char-
acterization of DD-treated embryos reveals a systematic delay of
the onset of the expression of developmental genes, completely
abolishing in many cases zygotic expression until late develop-
mental stages. The fact that defensome genes highly upregulate
their expression as a quick response to the presence of DD, even
as early as at the eight-cell stage, when most genes have not yet
started normal zygotic transcription, indicates that down-
regulation of developmental genes does not result from a general
transcriptional repression. On the contrary, it points to the

activation of a silencing mechanism for developmental genes,
especially during early stages, that could be part of the embryonic
response to environmental challenges.

Despite the absence of morphogenesis, the expression of spe-
cific cell markers in golf ball reveals a correct cell fate differ-
entiation of the main derivatives of the ectodermal, mesodermal
and endodermal germ layers, as well a correct establishment of
AP and DV axes that confer a correct spatial regionalization in
DD-treated embryos (Fig. 4b). Analyses of the position and size
of expression domains of developmental markers show that
midline convergence and tail elongation are notably affected in
DD-treated embryos, suggesting that genes regulating these two
developmental processes may be linked to the formation of the
golf ball morphology. Future transcriptomic profiling by RNAseq
and functional approaches will be necessary to uncover the entire
set of defensome genes that respond to DD exposure, as well as
the developmental gene pathways altered by DD which are
responsible of the failure of morphogenesis in O. dioica.

Methods
Animal culture and embryo collection. Oikopleura dioica embryos were obtained
by in vitro fertilization from adults cultured in our animal facility at the University
of Barcelona as described in the ref. 41. Briefly, animals were originally collected in
the Mediterranean coast of Barcelona (Catalonia, Spain), and kept in the facility
with a life cycle of five days at 19 °C. Animals are cultured in sterile seawater (sSW)
filtered by 0.22 µm (VacuCap PF Filters 4622, Pall Corporation), and fed with four
microalgae (Isochrysis sp., C. calcitrans, R. reticulata and Synechococcus sp). Mature
females and males were collected at day 5, and after natural spawning, eggs were
in vitro fertilized, and raised in petri dishes in sterile sea water until the desired
stage.

Decadienal treatments. Previous studies about the effect of trans,trans-2,4-dec-
adienal (DD, Sigma-Aldrich®, W313505) on ascidians embryos had shown that the
chorion could act as a barrier that slow down the access of DD to embryos14,15.
Since our experience had shown that dechorionation is not possible in O. dioica
embryos because it lethally affects development, to test if the chorion of O. dioica
could also be a barrier against DD, we scored the hatching success of embryos that
had been pre-incubated in DD previous to fertilization during different times
(Supplementary Fig. 3). Thus, we empirically determined that despite the chorion
of O. dioica also act as a barrier for exogenous DD, 10 min (min) of pre-incubation
with DD before fertilization was enough to overcome the barrier. We therefore
implemented a 10-min egg pre-incubation as the standard procedure in all our DD
treatment experiments.

For DD treatments, pools of O. dioica eggs were incubated before fertilization
and during development with nine increasing concentrations of DD 0.05, 0.075,
0.1, 0.125, 0.25, 0.5, 1.0, 2.0, and 2.5 µg mL−1 (0.33, 0.49, 0.66, 0.82, 1.64, 3.28, 6.57,
13.14, and 16.42 µM, respectively). Stock solution of 15 mgmL−1 of DD was
prepared in dimethyl sulfoxide (DMSO), avoiding light exposure. To minimize the
toxic effect of DMSO in the development of O. dioica, the stock solution was
diluted 1:500 (30 µg mL−1; 0.2% DMSO) in sSW. This diluted stock was used to
create each incubation solution containing the corresponding concentration of DD.

Eggs were pre-incubated for 10 min before fertilization into 900 µL of DD
incubation solution. Then eggs were fertilized by adding 100 µL of sperm dilution
(the sperm of two males diluted into 1 mL of sSW). Five minutes after the in vitro
fertilization, fertilized eggs were transferred into a 50 mm-diameter-glass dish with
3 mL of the corresponding incubation solution. Control embryos were incubated in
DMSO at 0.02%(v/v) without DD, which corresponded to the experimental
condition at the maximum concentration of 2.5 µg mL−1 of DD. In experiments to
obtain treated embryos for in situ hybridization, we added DMSO to have the same
final concentration of 0.02%(v/v) in all experimental conditions. Embryos were
cultured at 19 °C until hatching (≈4 hpf), time at which the effects of DD were
scored. At least three replicates (r) containing hundreds of embryos (n) were
analyzed for each condition.

Expression analyses and nuclear staining. Developmental gene markers in O.
dioica were identified by in silico screening of the Oikobase62, using Ciona intes-
tinalis proteins as starting queries for tBLASTn searches against EST and genomic
databases. The orthology of proteins was deduced by reciprocal best BLAST search
against the Ciona genome (KH from Aniseed database). Whole-mount in situ
hybridizations using probes of the genes of interest, which were generated by PCR
amplification of cDNA with gene-specific primers (Supplementary Table 1), were
performed as described in42. Embryos were fixed in 4% paraformaldehyde in fix
buffer (0.1 M MOPS, 0.5 M NaCl, 2 mM MgSO4, 1 mM EGTA) for 1 h at room
temperature, dehydrated in 70% ethanol and stored at −20 °C. Fixed embryos were
dechorionated manually in petri dishes with poly-lysine as described in the ref. 63.
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For nuclear staining, fixed whole embryos were rehydrated by washing in PBST
during 10 min and were incubated in staining solution (1 µM Hoechst-33342
Invitrogen-62249 in PBST) for 5–10 min. ProLong Live Antifade Reagent
(Invitrogen-P36975, dilution 1:100) was added to prevent photobleaching during
fluorescence image capture. Nuclei were manually counted by analyzing the images
of 10–15 optical sections for each embryo.

Diatom extracts and treatments. Cultures of one liter of the diatoms Skeletonema
marinoi, Chaetoceros affinis, Chaetoceros calcitrans and the dinoflagellate Pro-
rocentrum minimum were grown up to stationary state to obtain extracts as
described in the ref. 53 with minor modifications: microalgal pellets were frozen in
liquid nitrogen and stored at −80 °C until cell lysis was performed by sonication.
Stock solutions of 500 mgmL−1 of each extract were prepared in DMSO, avoiding
light exposure. To minimize the toxic effect of DMSO in the embryo development
of O. dioica, the stock solution was diluted 1:100 in sSW, which was used to create
three incubation solutions at 5, 10, and 100 µg mL−1. Treatments were performed
as described for DD. Considering the total number of cells of S. marinoi calculated
from their concentration (i.e., 1 L at 1,650,000 cells mL−1) we perform an
approximate calculation of how much PUAs could be present in the extract
according to Barreiro et al.53, in which it has been reported that the total carbon
content per cell is 20.7 pg C cell−1 and PUAs concentration is 8.5 µg PUAs mg
C−1. Dry weight of total organic extracts were weighted in order that treatments
could be referred in µg mL−1 (i.e., S. marinoi culture rendered 12.2 × 103 µg of
extract).

Statistical analysis. Statistical analysis was performed using RStudio Version
0.98.507 for Mac OS X. The results were reported as means ± SD (standard
deviation) and analyzed by Tukey HSD (honest significant difference) test for
multiple comparisons between control and treatments and between treatments,
and by ANOVA the pairwise comparisons. Prism GraphPad software (v. 7.0c) was
used to generate plots showing the frequencies of the phenotypes in each replicate
after treatments with DD and algal extracts.

Data availability. All data generated or analyzed during this study are included in
this published article and its supplementary information. The identification
numbers of the sequences used to generate the probes for the in situ hybridization
analyses listed in Supplementary Table 1 (GSOIDG00000279001,
GSOIDG00000756001, GSOIDG00015222001, GSOIDG00010386001,
GSOIDG00013526001, GSOIDG00011688001, GSOIDG00003812001,
GSOIDG00017080001, GSOIDG00006303001, GSOIDG00000110001,
GSOIDG00002220001, GSOIDG00021101001) correspond to the publicly available
database Oikobase: https://www.oikoarrays.biology.uiowa.edu/Oiko/
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Supplementary Figure 1. Frequency of Oikopleura dioica embryo phenotypes after 
treatments with DD at different concentrations. (A) normal hatchling, (B) aberrant 
hatchling, (C) pre-tailbud arrest with a “golf-ball” phenotype, and (D) 1-cell arrest. For each 
condition, circles represent the frequency of the phenotype in each replicate individually 
analyzed (see Fig 1E). Reported means and standard deviations are represented with 
horizontal line and error bars, respectively. DD concentration at 0.05 µg/mL was 
considered innocuous, since no significant difference was observed in the amount of 
normal hatchlings in comparison with the DMSO-control condition (ns, P-value 0.99843). At 
higher concentrations than 0.05 µg/mL we started to observe severe abnormalities that 
normally we do not observe in DMSO-control conditions (see Fig 1B; P-values 0.1522 and 
<0.001, for 0.075 and 0.125 µg/mL, respectively).

CHAPTER IV: SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION 
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Supplementary Figure 2. Effects and dose-response of Skeletonema marinoi extracts on Oikopleura dioica embryo 
development. (A) After 4.5 hours of treatment with extracts of S. marinoi (Sm) at different concentrations (5, 10 and 100 µg/mL, 

which may correspond to PUAs approximate concentrations of 1, 2 and 20 µM, respectively), abnormal embryo phenotypes were 

the same as those obtained after DD-treatments (see Fig 1: normal hatchling (blue), aberrant hatchling (yellow), Pre-tailbud arrest 

with a golf ball phenotype (salmon), and 1-cell arrest (cherry)). The frequency of each abnormal phenotype depended on the 

extract concentration of the treatment. Number of analyzed embryos (n) and number replicates (r) are indicated on top of each 

treatment. (B) Plots of phenotype frequencies throughout treatments at different concentrations of S. marinoi. For each condition, 

circles represent the frequency of the phenotype in each replicate individually analyzed in (A). Reported means and standard 

deviations are represented with horizontal line and error bars, respectively. No significant differences were observed between 

embryos developed in sSW or DMSO (P-value 0.9996). Extracts at 5 and 10 µg/mL did not show significant differences with 

DMSO-control (ns, P-value 0.0573 and 0.2301 for normal hatchling phenotype, respectively). (C) The developmental progression 

of embryos treated with S. marinoi extract at 100 µg/mL reproduced the same alterations observed with DD at moderate 

concentrations (see Fig 2). Thus, no obvious abnormalities are observed until 3 hpf, time at which morphogenesis starts during 

the formation of tailbud stages in DMSO-control embryos, but a golf ball phenotype appears in arrested pre-tailbud stage of 

treated embryo. Scale bar 50 µm. (D) Plots of phenotype frequencies throughout treatments with different microalgal extracts at 

100 µg/mL – S. marinoi (Sm), C. affinis (Ca), C. calcitrans (Cc) and P. minimum (Pm), and DD at ��ȝJ�P/. For each condition, 

circles represent the frequency of the phenotype in each replicate individually analyzed in Fig 6B. Reported means and standard 

deviations are represented with horizontal line and error bars, respectively.

ns 

ns 
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Supplementary Figure 3. Determination of the requirement of pre-incubation time of oocytes during 
DD treatments. Using a DD concentration of 0.28 µg/mL (1,84 µM), oocytes were pre-incubated with DD 
during 0, 5, 10 and 20 minutes before fertilization, in at least 2 replicates, and at least 100 embryos 
analyzed (n) in each condition. After fertilization and continuous DD-treatment, we scored the percentage of 
animals that hatched (blue), and from those what proportion had a normal morphology (red). Error bars 
correspond to standard deviations. Results showed that the relative abundance of animals that hatched and 
those that had normal morphology in relation to non-treated embryos (negative control) was significantly 
lower when pre-incubations were shorter than 10 minutes. No significant (n.s.) decrease of hatch or normal 
morphologies was observed with longer pre-incubation times (P-values 1.0 and 0.99992, respectively). We 
therefore always used pre-incubation times of 10 minutes as the standard procedure in our treatment 
experiments.
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Supplementary Table 1. Developmental and defensome gene markers. 

Oikobase IDs (http://oikoarrays.biology.uiowa.edu/Oiko), names and sequences. 

Gene Gene ID Primer name SeqXence (5¶- 3¶) 

Brachyury GSOIDG00000279001 
OdiT_F3 GGTTCGCACTGGATGAAACAGCC 
OdiT_R3 TATCCGTTCTGACACCAGTCGTTC 

Actin GSOIDG00000756001 
Actin_5'_F GTCCCCGCCATGTACGTCTG 
Actin_3'_R GCATCGGAATCGCTCGTTACCA 

Tis11a GSOIDG00015222001 
ZFC3Ha_e5_F GGGTACTGCCCATATGGCG 
ZFC3Ha_e7_R GCTCGAAGTTGGGCAGCTG 

SoxBa GSOIDG00010386001 
SoxBa_e6_F GCAGAAGTACCCAGCAAGGA 
SoxBa_e6_R GTGACCACTTTCGGGCTTGT 

SoxBb GSOIDG00013526001 
SoxBb_e4_F GTTGTCGCTGGAAATGGCGA 
SoxBb_e8_R CTCGACACGGACGCTCTGAT 

Wnt11 GSOIDG00011688001 
Wnt_s4_atgF ATGAAGATTTCAGTCACCCTTTTCTCTG 
Wnt_s4_stopR GTTATTTGCATATATGAGTGACAGTCG 

Nkx2.3/5/6 GSOIDG00003812001 
Nk[_5¶VWarW_F GACCGAAAAATTACAACTATGAGC 
Nkx_ex_3_R GCTGTAGCGCCGAGCTCAC 

Tis11b GSOIDG00017080001 
ZFC3Hb_e2_F GGCCAAATGAACGACGAAATCG 
ZFC3Hb_e4_R GCACTCGGAGAGCGAGAG 

Glcm GSOIDG00006303001 
Glcm_e2_F GCAATAATTATCCAAGATGCCATG 
Glcm_e5_R GTTCAGTCCTGCAAAGTATCC 

Adh3 GSOIDG00000110001 
Adh3_F1 CGTCGGTAAAGTGATCACGTGCA 
Adh3_R1 GCGCCCTGTGTAGCTCGGAC 

Aldh2 GSOIDG00002220001 
Aldh2_F TGGAACTTCCCTCTCCTCATGCA  
Aldh2_R TTATTTGGCGTATTGAGGAAGTTTCAT  

Aldh8a1 GSOIDG00021101001 
Aldh8_F GATTTAAACAAAAAATGGAGCCGATTG 
Aldh8_R TTTATTGCTTGCTAATTGTATTAGCTTGAAG 
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D I S C U S S I O N 

 

1 EVOLUTIONARY STUDY OF 
GENE LOSS 

he overall objective of this PhD project 

has been to better understand the 

impact of gene loss on the evolution and 

the generation of biodiversity, in particular, 

on the evolution of the mechanisms of 

development in the field of EvoDevo and 

comparative genomics in chordates. 

In the past, the influential work by Susumo 

Ohno proposed gene gains by gene 

duplication as one of the most important 

evolutionary driving forces (Ohno, 1970). 

However, upon sudden changes of 

selective pressures on a population, it has 

been shown that loss of function mutations 

are more likely to happen than gene 

duplications, suggesting therefore that 

gene loss could also be a major driving 

force of evolution (Olson, 1999). The 

fixation of null-mutations has traditionally 

been considered selectively neutral in a 

context of gene redundancy after an event 

of gene duplication or in a context of 

regressive evolution. However, many 

studies in bacteria and yeast provide solid 

evidence that gene loss can be a major 

adaptive evolutionary force specially 

relevant when populations are exposed to 

sudden changes of environmental 

conditions (rev. in Albalat and Cañestro, 

2016). The pervasiveness of gene loss 

revealed by the bloom of genomics, 

therefore, suggests that gene losses can 

play a major adaptive role during the 

evolution and divergence of different 

species and major taxonomical groups 

(Albalat and Cañestro, 2016; De Robertis, 

2008). Despite the many examples of gene 

losses in animal species (reviewed in 

Albalat and Cañestro, 2016), animals have 

always been less suitable for 

comprehensive studies than bacteria or 

yeast. Therefore, our overall understanding 

of the impact of gene loss in the context of 

animal EvoDevo is still scarce. 

In this thesis, as a case study, we have 

focused on how gene losses have 

impacted the evolution of the 

cardiopharyngeal gene regulatory network 

(GRN) in Oikopleura dioica, a successful 

gene loser (Ferrández-Roldán et al., 2019). 

One of the major problems we have faced 

during this project is that the inference of a 

gene loss is based on the negative 

evidence of the presence of a gene in the 

genome database of the analyzed species. 

Genome surveys are fundamentally based 

on BLAST searches, and therefore the first 

problem to address has been to test if any 

of the first hits were indeed homologous or 

not to the queried gene. Establishing gene 

T 
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homologies is not trivial, and it requires 

distinguishing orthologs, originated by 

speciation, from paralogs, originated by 

gene duplication, or even a combination of 

both that would give rise to co-orthologs 

and pro-orthologs. Moreover, many 

evolutionary processes can obscure the 

recognition of true relationships of 

homology, especially if gene duplications 

and losses are both simultaneously 

involved in the evolution of a gene family. 

For instance, complementary gene loss of 

two paralogs in two different lineages could 

result in apparent orthologs, while indeed 

they are paralogs. Even genes from two 

different families could appear as orthologs 

if they share a conserved domain common 

to an ancestral gene superfamily. To 

overcome these problems and to try to 

distinguish different types of homologies 

between the query and the blast results, it 

has been necessary to combine best 

reciprocal blast hits (BRBH) (Fig. D1), using 

an outgroup species outside the targeted 

group (e.g. tunicates and vertebrates) with 

an exhaustive phylogenetic reconstruction 

of the gene family of interest using close 

related gene families as outgroups. 

A second problem of the study of gene 

losses is the quality and completeness of 

genome databases. Low-quality 

assemblies or shallow databases in which 

part of the genome might not have been 

assembled could lead to mistakenly infer 

false gene losses. To overcome this 

problem, it is recommendable to combine 

searches of both independent genome and 

transcriptomic databases, as well as 

databases of phylogenetically related 

species that may share the same ancestral 

gene loss. A wide sampling of species, 

moreover, is also useful to overcome the 

limitation due to sequence divergence, 

specially to recognize variable regions 

outside conserved domains. 

In our genome survey to find the homologs 

of O. dioica to the members of 

cardiopharyngeal GRN (Chapter 1 and 2), 

we initially did BLAST searches in the 

reference genome made from specimens 

from Norway (http://oikoarrays.biology. 

uiowa.edu/Oiko/). In cases in which we did 

not find any significant match or the BRBH 

results between O. dioica, C. robusta, and 

H. sapiens or the phylogenetic analyses 

suggested the possibility of gene loss, we 

performed additional searches in other 

Fig. D1. Example of the BRBH done between C. 
robusta, O. dioica and H. sapiens. (A) BRBH of 
FoxF (yellow ball), in which we identified orthologs 
in all three species. (B) BRBH of Mesp (red ball) 
that shows orthologs in C. robusta and H. sapiens 
but its loss in O. dioica because the best hit in the 
latter is Math6 (black ball) that maintains orthologs 
in all three species. Arrows represent the searches 
between genomes. Circles represent the genomes 
of the different species. 
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databases such as transcriptomic data 

from Norway, as well as newly assembled 

genomes and transcriptomes generated by 

our team and collaborators in Luscombe’s 

lab from specimens collected in Barcelona, 

Okinawa, Oregon, and Osaka. Moreover, 

during the course of my thesis, the 

genomes of six other appendicularian 

species were sequenced (Naville et al., 

2019) and 11 ascidian genomes were 

available in Aniseed (https://www.aniseed. 

cnrs.fr). BLAST searches in these new 

genomes corroborated the gene losses we 

had originally found in O. dioica, and they 

extended the absence of the genes to all 

other appendicularian species, at the same 

time that confirmed the presence of all 

cardiopharyngeal genes in all analyzed 

ascidian species, validating our 

methodological approach of our genome 

survey. These results provided therefore 

robust evidence supporting gene losses 

and allowed us to conclude that in most 

cases the losses had occurred at the base 

of the appendicularian lineage after their 

split from ascidians and before the radiation 

of appendicularian species. 

Phylogenetic analyses in tunicates were 

difficult in general due to their high 

evolutionary rates that generated long 

branches as well as the artifactual 

phenomena of long-branch attraction, 

which in some cases resulted in low 

support of some nodes of the trees 

(Felsenstein, 1978; Hendy and Penny, 

1989). The wide sampling of tunicate 

species (7 appendicularians and 11 

ascidians) not only facilitated the 

identification of divergent gene regions and 

the reannotation of errors in the reference 

genome of O. dioica, but it also rendered 

nodes with a higher support. Including 

three species of cephalochordates in the 

phylogenetic analyses, as well as slow 

evolving vertebrates such as the 

coelacanth (L. chalumnae) and the spotted 

gar (L. oculatus), besides H. sapiens, also 

improved the support values in the 

phylogenetic inferences. When needed, we 

also surveyed and included genes from the 

nearest gene families, which could be 

ancestral paralogous families or other 

families within the same superfamily, to 

provide a wider phylogenetic perspective 

and evaluate potential cases of long-

branch attraction artifacts. Interestingly, the 

phylogenetic analyses revealed some 

cases in which gene losses had been 

accompanied by the duplication of 

paralogs (e.g., the loss of Gata4/5/6 was 

accompanied by the duplications of the 

Gata1/2/3 up to four paralogs a-d in 

appendicularians, or the loss of Ets1/2a 

was accompanied by the duplication of 

Ets1/2b into Ets1/2b1 and Ets1/2b2 in 

appendicularians). These findings added 

additional complexity to our study of gene 

losses because we had to test for the 

possibility that the loss of the gene could be 

accompanied by a function shuffling 



 174 

among paralogs of related gene families 

(Cañestro et al., 2009). In our case, 

however, we did not detect any case of 

functions shuffling that could have allowed 

another related gene to provide the 

cardiopharyngeal function of the lost gene 

(Chapter 2). 

The identification of so many gene losses in 

the cardiopharyngeal GRN made us 

wonder if these losses were not stochastic, 

but they could be the result of a process of 

gene co-elimination (Aravind et al., 2000; 

Koonin et al., 2004; Martí-Solans et al., 

2016). Co-elimination can be the result of 

the dismantling of a functionally linked 

pathway within a gene network, except for 

those occupying ‘hubs’ of the network due 

to their pleiotropic roles involved in other 

functions. In such cases, pleiotropic ‘hub’ 

genes are not lost, but they lose their 

subfunctions related to the co-eliminated 

pathway, becoming less pleiotropic. In our 

case, the detection of so many losses of 

cardiopharyngeal genes (e.g., Mesp, 

Ets1/2a, MEK1/2, Gata4/5/6, Tbx1/10, 

Raldh1a, Cyp26, RAR) and 

cardiopharyngeal subfunctions (FoxF, 

Dach, MyoD, Ebf, and FGF- and BMP-

signaling) prompted us the hypothesis that 

we had discovered a phenomenon of gene 

co-elimination (Chapter 2). During this PhD, 

we have shown that the study of gene 

losses can be useful to recognize 

functionally linked genes and modules 

within the cardiopharyngeal GRN as well as 

to understand how the dismantling (or 

deconstruction as I discuss in the next 

section) of the GRN has impacted on the 

evolution of appendicularians and the 

biodiversification of tunicates.  
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2 THE STUDY OF EVENTS OF 
EVOLUTIONARY 
DECONSTRUCTION ALLOWS 
US TO UNDERSTAND GRN 
ARCHITECTURE AND TO 
IDENTIFY FUNCTIONAL 
MODULES 

econstruction is not synonymous 

with destruction. Deconstruction is a 

concept that was first coined by the French 

philosopher Jacques Derrida arguing that 

the different meanings of a text (or body of 

knowledge) can be discovered by 

dissecting or breaking down the structure 

into pieces. This way, one can recognize 

“binary” and “hierarchical” relationships, 

and therefore to infer how each part or 

“module” contributes to the construction of 

the whole. Since the 60s, this term has 

inspired a wide variety of humanity 

disciplines including, law, historiography, 

sociolinguistics, or anthropology. Even the 

idea behind this concept has been adopted 

by architecture, in which deconstructivism 

current designed buildings giving the 

impression of fragmentation (Fig. D2 A); or 

by cuisine, in which chefs like Ferran Adrià 

pioneered a new style by boiling down a 

traditional dish to the core parts to then 

rebuild it again in a physical way unlike the 

original but preserving its flavors (Fig. D2 B); 

or even by Woody Allen in his acclaimed 

movie Deconstructing Harry (1997), in 

which the plot tells the story of the main 

character in broken events describing 

different episodes of his life to become 

alienated from himself (Fig. D2 C). Outside 

humanities, in the field of developmental 

biology, the concept of deconstruction has 

been also used (Hogan, 2004), becoming 

for instance the focus of attention in a 

Keystone conference on vertebrate 

organogenesis in Santa Fe (February 2004), 

in which under the topic of “Deconstructing 

the genesis of animal form” each session 

was subdividing different anatomical 

systems. In this conference, the keynote 

speaker Mark Krasnow (Stanford 

University) and others argued that the only 

way to identify all the genes controlling the 

development of a complex organ is to 

break the process down into simpler 

events, evoking the concept of 

D 

Fig. D2. (A) The Guggenheim building in Bilbao an 
example of deconstructivism (https://www. 
Guggenheim-bilbao.eus/el-edificio). (B) 
Deconstruction of a potato omelet (https:// 
macrecetas.wordpress.com/2013/12/23/tortilla-
de-patata-deconstruida/). (C) Theatrical release 
poster of the film deconstructing Harry. 
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deconstructing embryonic development 

into simple morphometric modules. In this 

thesis, I will extend the use of the concept 

of deconstruction to the field of EvoDevo to 

describe the process of the dismantling of 

modules of a GRN by the co-elimination of 

genes and subfunctions intimately related 

to a particular developmental function that 

has profoundly changed or even lost during 

the evolution of a particular lineage. We 

propose, moreover, that the study of 

evolutionary deconstructions can be useful 

to recognize modules of GRN related to 

specific developmental functions that might 

have diverged during the evolution of 

different lineages. 

Our results characterizing the 

deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

GRN in appendicularians have helped us to 

recognize two different genetic modules 

implicated in the cardiopharyngeal GRN of 

tunicates: the early multipotent (EM) 

module and the late multipotent (LM) 

module (Fig. 7 in Chapter 2). In 

appendicularians, the clear pattern of gene 

co-elimination (Raldh1a, Cyp26, RAR, 

MEK1/2, Mesp, Ets1/2a, Gata4/5/6) 

affecting the early cardiopharyngeal GRN 

helped us to define the EM module (Fig. 7 

in Chapter 2). In ascidians, the EM module 

is responsible for the separation of ATM 

from the trunk ventral cells (TVCs) that are 

maintained as multipotent 

cardiopharyngeal state and finally migrate 

to the ventral part of the trunk (Fig. D3). The 

EM module functions at the interface of tail 

and trunk, under the posterior influence of 

RA on the differentiation of the axial muscle 

fate, and the anterior influence of the 

FGF/MEK1/2 signaling that phosphorylates 

Ets1/2a, previously upregulated by Mesp in 

the TVCs (Christiaen et al., 2008; Davidson 

et al., 2006; Nagatomo and Fujiwara, 

2003). This phosphorylation starts a 

Gata4/5/6 and FoxF-dependent ventral 

migration of the TVCs, which follows a 

gradient of BMP originated in the trunk 

ventral epidermis and culminates with the 

activation of Nk4 and TVCs divisions (Beh 

et al., 2007; Bernadskaya et al., 2019; 

Christiaen et al., 2010; Ragkousi et al., 

2011). In O. dioica, this co-elimination 

Fig. D3 Schematic representation of the co-
elimination of the Early Multipotent module in O. 
dioica.  In C. robusta, the antagonism between RA 
and FGF determine the fate of B7.5 
granddaughters. At the beginning of migration of 
the TVCs, Ets1/2a and low levels of BMP activate 
the expression of Gata4/5/6 that together with 
FoxF prompt migration. At the end of migration, 
Gata4/5/6 and high levels of BMP activates Nk4 
that inhibits migration. The genes lost in O. dioica 
or not expressed in cardiac precursors (FoxF) are 
crossed out. Blue arrows represent interactions at 
the beginning of the migration. Green arrows 
indicate interactions at the end of migration. 
TVCs, trunk ventral cells; ATMs, anterior tail 
muscle cells. 
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pattern, together with the loss of the FoxF 

subfunction in cardiac development, the 

early activation of Nk4 in the newborn first 

cardiac precursors (FCPs) close to the tail 

muscle cells instead of the ventral 

epidermis, and the FCPs divisions before 

meeting the ventral region of the trunk 

suggest alternative mechanisms to induce 

cardiac development and to position 

cardiac progenitors in the ventral region of 

the trunk (Fig. D3). First, regarding the 

induction mechanism in charge of Nk4 

activation in O. dioica, our inhibitory results 

suggest that neither FGF nor BMP signaling 

pathways are involved, which opens two 

scenarios: either there are other signaling 

pathways as Wnt or Notch implicated as 

happening in other chordates (Krieg and 

Warkman, 2015), or FCPs have become 

self-autonomous for Nk4 activation. 

Second, regarding an alternative 

mechanism for cardiac precursors 

migration, due to the small distance 

between the anterior region of the tail and 

the ventral region of the trunk in such a 

small organism, cardiac precursors might 

cover that small distance by cellular 

rearrangements during cell divisions in a 

process similar to gastrulation (Stach et al., 

2008). This hypothesis would agree with 

the results showed by the FGF and the 

BMP inhibitory treatments. In most of the 

cases in which the cardiac progenitors 

were bilaterally distributed, the tail 

elongation and its rotation relative to the 

trunk were also affected. All these 

phenotypes could indicate alterations in the 

morphogenesis of the embryo that could 

affect the normal cell divisions and, 

therefore, the rearrangements of the 

cardiac progenitors towards the ventral 

midline. 

In addition to the EM module, we have also 

recognized a LM module characterized by 

the loss of Tbx1/10 and the loss of multiple 

cardiopharyngeal subfunctions of 

pleiotropic genes that may have been 

preserved likely because they may be 

involved in other functions, and therefore 

occupying hubs of intersections with other 

gene pathways (Fig. 7 in Chapter 2). In 

ascidians, Tbx1/10 is expressed in the 

second trunk ventral cells (STVC) that are 

the multipotent daughters of the TVCs. 

Tbx1/10+ STVCs originate second heart 

precursors (SHPs) expressing the key 

regulator Dach, and the atrial siphon 

muscle field (ASMF) expressing the 

pharyngeal muscle markers MyoD, Ebf, 

and Islet1 (Hirano and Nishida, 1997; Stolfi 

et al., 2010; Wang et al., 2019). Our results 

in appendicularians suggest that the loss of 

Tbx1/10 correlates to the loss of the atrial 

siphon and longitudinal muscles, which 

contrast to the conservation of Dach, 

MyoD, Ebf, and Islet1. Expression analysis 

of these genes in O. dioica did not show 

expression in the cardiac nor in muscle 

domains, but in other organ primordia as 

the nervous system and the oikoplastic 
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epithelium, suggesting that their 

conservation was due to their pleiotropic 

roles. 

In conclusion, our study provides a 

comprehensive catalogue of the extensive 

losses of genes and subfunctions that have 

contributed to the evolutionary 

deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

GRN in appendicularians. This catalogue 

has provided us a unique opportunity to try 

to understand how these losses might have 

affected the diversification of 

appendicularians and ascidian lifestyles, 

and in special, how these losses might have 

impacted the evolution of heart in both 

lineages until adopting such divergent 

morphologies. 

A future challenge to better understand the 

development of the heart of O. dioica will 

be to identify the inductive mechanisms to 

activate Nk4 transcription, the mechanism 

to relocate the cardiac progenitors from the 

tail/trunk interface to the ventral region of 

the trunk, new genes involved in 

cardiogenesis in this organism, or new 

insights into the genetic base of human 

cardiomyopathies. To address these 

issues, we will need to perform functional 

analysis by knockdown, knockout, or gene 

reporter assays. All these techniques 

require the introduction of a molecule inside 

the oocyte, and in O. dioica two different 

approaches have been described, gonad 

and oocyte microinjection (Mikhaleva et al., 

2018; Omotezako et al., 2017). 

During my thesis, besides developing the 

fluorescent in situ hybridization in O. dioica 

we have also developed the gonad and 

oocyte microinjection techniques in our 

facility (Fig. D4 A). Along with its maturation, 

the female gonad of O. dioica goes through 

a syncytial phase in which meiotic nuclei 

are surrounded by common cytoplasm 

(Ganot et al., 2007). Injected molecules in 

Fig. D4. (A) Injection facility for O. dioica animals 
in the University of Barcelona. (B) Injection of the 
gonad of a premature female of O. dioica, phenol 
red allows us to visualize the injected solution (red 
dot in panel B). (C) Recently spawned oocyte of O. 
dioica immobilized by a holding needle just before 
being injected. (D-F) Knockdown embryos by 
dsDNA injection into the gonad of a premature 
female. (D) Optical image of knockdown embryos. 
(E) Fluorescent image of knockdown embryos, 
mCherry fluorescence highlights embryos 
containing mRNA and, therefore, most likely also 
dsDNA. In this regard, notice that malformed 
embryos showing the brachyury-dsDNA 
phenotype are fluorescent (F). 
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this maturing phase spread along the 

forming oocytes generating tens of altered 

embryos with a single injection (Fig. D4 B). 

After instigating this technique from 

scratch, we were able to obtain Brachyury 

knockdown embryos by DNA interference 

(DNAi) that showed malformations in the tail 

(Fig. D4 D-F). To correlate the severity of 

the phenotype with the amount of injected 

solution, we co-injected the dsDNA with 

mRNA-H2-mCherry, which is translated in 

vivo into a protein fusion of mCherry with 

the O. dioica histone H2 (Chapter 3). 

However, the wide variability in the number 

of knockdown embryos per clutch, the 

indeterminate concentration of the injected 

product on each embryo, and the difficulty 

in detecting mCherry fluorescence made us 

try oocyte microinjection. 

Oocyte injection is a much more 

sophisticated technique that required new 

equipment and experience, but it solved 

the problems derived from gonad injection 

(Fig. D4 C). Oocyte microinjection provided 

more accurate traceability of the amount of 

the injected product in correlation to the 

severity of the phenotype moreover it made 

it easier to identify correct injected embryos 

by the co-injection of a fluorescent dextran 

brighter than fusion proteins. Both gonad 

and egg microinjection techniques are now 

ready to operate in our lab and open the 

possibility to perform genetic functional 

analyses by the generation of knockdowns 

by RNA interference (RNAi) or DNAi 

(Mikhaleva et al., 2018; Omotezako et al., 

2017), knockouts by CRISPR-Cas9 (Deng 

et al., 2018), or gene reporter assays.  
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3 THE HEART OF O. DIOICA 
AND ASCIDIANS ARE 
HOMOLOGOUS  

t the beginning of this PhD project, we 

had no information about the 

development of the heart in 

appendicularians. The hearts of ascidians 

and appendicularians maintain a distinct 

anatomical organization with a tubular 

close structure in the case of ascidians and 

a flat open structure in the case of 

appendicularians. Moreover, they also 

present enormous temporal differences in 

their developmental times. While the heart 

of ascidians takes many days after 

metamorphosis until it becomes functional, 

the heart in O. dioica is functional and starts 

beating as soon as 8.5 hours post-

fertilization. Therefore, the first challenge 

we had to face was to test if the two hearts 

were truly homologous organs, or on the 

contrary, they could be analogous pumping 

organs that have evolved independently in 

both lineages. Indeed, the study of the 

evolution of the vast variety of hearts and 

pumping organs across metazoans has 

made this organ to be a hot topic in the 

discussion of homologies and analogies in 

the field of EvoDevo (Xavier-Neto et al., 

2007). 

The historical concept of homology 

formulated by Mayr, 1970 and reformulated 

by Bock, 1973 says that “Features in two 

or more organisms are homologous if they 

stem phylogenetically from the same 

feature in the immediate common ancestor 

of these organisms.” According to this 

definition, all pumping organs could be 

considered homologous if the protostome-

deuterostome ancestor would have already 

had some kind of pumping organ from 

which present organs would have evolved 

from. The absence of pumping organs in 

many animal phyla would therefore indicate 

that hearts were secondary loss during 

metazoan evolution, and also open the 

possibility that they could have been 

independently innovated in the different 

phyla. Other researches, however, 

especially those interested in 

developmental biology rather than in 

taxonomy, conceived homology as a 

relation between traits that share the same 

developmental causes or generative 

mechanisms (e.g. traits that share the same 

genetic bases) (rev. in Minelli and Fusco, 

2013). According to this definition, all the 

hearts would be homologous since, from 

arthropods to vertebrates, all use the same 

ancestral genetic network (Nk4, Gata, Tbx, 

Hand) (Olson, 2006). However, many 

studies have shown that the relationship 

between genotype and phenotype is so 

plastic that homologies at the gene level are 

not necessarily linked to homologies at the 

anatomical or evolutionary level. For 

example, Notch is used in the development 

of the wing imaginal disc of Drosophila as 

well as neural cells in chordates (Baguna 

and Garcia-Fernandez, 2003). Or for 

A 



 181 

instance, the Otx/Pax/Hox1 genetic 

cassette has been independently recruited 

to provide anterior-posterior regionalization 

in the central nervous system, the digestive 

system, or the thyroid (Cañestro et al., 

2008). Moreover, the similar design 

between pumping organs of distant animal 

species (tubular hearts of arthropods and 

ascidians or chambered hearts of 

cephalopods and vertebrates) suggests 

that the hearts were independently created 

by convergence, as happen with the wings 

from insects and birds. All these theories 

were grouped in a new hypothesis 

proposed by Xavier-Neto et al., 2007. This 

hypothesis asserts that the prototype of all 

circulatory pumps presented in the 

protostome and deuterostome common 

ancestor may have been an organized layer 

of contractile cells presumably lined to the 

external wall of primitive vessels that may 

have evolved to acquire different designs in 

the different phyla (Xavier-Neto et al., 

2007). In the case of chordates, numerous 

studies have provided strong evidence 

supporting that the hearts of vertebrates 

and ascidians are homologous despite the 

great morphological differences between 

the multichambered complex heart of 

vertebrates and the tubular simple heart of 

ascidians (Davidson, 2007). 

To know if the hearts of appendicularians 

and ascidian are homologous, we have 

performed an ontogenetic analysis of the 

heart development of O. dioica following 

the behavior of cardiac precursors. In 

ascidians, cardiopharyngeal progenitors 

are easy to trace using the expression of 

Fig. D5. Cardiopharyngeal precursors in O. dioica and C. robusta have the same ontogeny and 
behavior. Comparison between confocal micrographs of C. robusta (A-C) and O. dioica (D-F) show 
cardiac progenitors and anterior tail muscle cells (ATMs) together in the midline of the embryo at early-
tailbud stage (A, D). At late-tailbud stage, ATMs are maintained in the anterior region of the tail while 
cardiac precursors have moved to the ventral region of the trunk (B, E) where they rest in hatchling stages 
(C, F). In red, cells expressing fluorescent proteins under the control of Mesp enhancer. In green, in situ 
hybridization of ActnM1. In C. robusta phalloidin in blue stains actin filaments, in O. dioica Hoechst in blue 
stain nuclei. Early-tailbud embryos are dorsal views. Late-tailbud and hatchling embryos are lateral views. 
Anterior is always to the left. CPs, cardiac progenitors; FCPs, first cardiac progenitors; TVCs, trunk ventral 
cells. 
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Mesp (Davidson, 2007). The loss of this 

gene in appendicularians made us look for 

other markers for cardiac precursors in this 

organism. We tried using actins due to 

previous analyses with Oikopleura 

longicauda and C. robusta had described 

actin expression in cardiac precursors  

(Nishino et al., 2000; 

https://www.aniseed.cnrs.fr/). Our 

genomic survey and phylogenetic analysis, 

together with the intron position and the 

Diagnostic-Actin-Values (DAVs) analyses, 

identified seven actin genes in O. dioica, 

three cytoplasmic and four muscular, 

originated by independent gene 

duplications during the evolution of the 

appendicularian lineage. The expression of 

the seven actin genes revealed a highly 

dynamic tissue-specific expression pattern 

of the different actin genes, but only the 

ActnM1 was expressed in the heart 

(Chapter 1). 

Following ActnM1 expression throughout 

the development of O. dioica, we detected 

that the FCPs share the same ontogenetic 

origin and behavior than the TVCs of 

ascidians. They originate from an 

asymmetric division at the interface 

between the trunk and the tail and finish 

their development in the ventral region of 

the trunk (Fig. D5). Integration of the 

expression data of ActnM1 with the 4D-

nuclear tracing from 16-cell stage up to 

tailbud stage (Stach et al., 2008) revealed 

that the development of the heart in O. 

dioica also shares the same cell lineage fate 

map as ascidians. However, the split 

between the cardiac and the axial muscle 

lineages happens one cleavage earlier in O. 

dioica, probably related to the fact that O. 

dioica only has a cardiac precursor on each 

side against the two present in C. robusta 
(Chapter 2). 

Therefore, although the hearts of ascidians 

and O. dioica are anatomically so different, 

our results reveal several criteria that 

provide solid evidence that both pumping 

organs are homologous: (1) they share the 

same pre-cardiac lineage fate map, in both 

cases coming from the same blastomere 

B5.2; (2) the appendicularian FCP and their 

ascidian counterparts TVCs both originate 

from an asymmetric division at the same 

position in the interface of the trunk and tail 

at the time of the split between the lineages 

towards axial tail muscle or cardiac fate; (3) 

the final position of the cardiac primordium 

in the ventral part of the trunk at tailbud 

stage is shared by appendicularians and 

ascidians; (4) the cardiac primordium 

express homologous cardiogenic genes 

such as Nk4 and Hand1/2; (5) hearts of 

both appendicularians and ascidians 

develop into a similar double-layered 

structure with a myocardium and a 

pericardium. Therefore, despite the many 

losses of cardiopharyngeal genes and 

subfunctions, and despite the great 

architectural differences of the adult heart 

of appendicularians and ascidians, our 
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results provide strong evidence that both 

organs are homologous, and discard the 

possibility that they could have 

independently evolved by a process of 

convergence that could make them to be 

analogous. Indeed, the findings of this 

thesis provide a paradigmatic case of the 

“inverse-paradox” of EvoDevo (Cañestro et 

al., 2007) how two homologous structures 

can be developed with important 

differences in their genetic toolkit, in this 

case due to massive losses of genes and 

subfunctions.  
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4 FREE-LIVING 
APPENDICULARIANS 
REPRESENT DERIVED FORMS 
OF THE ANCESTRAL SESSILE 
TUNICATE 

nce demonstrated that hearts of 

appendicularians and ascidians were 

homologous, and once our results had 

revealed the massive losses of 

cardiopharyngeal genes and subfunctions, 

the major challenge of this PhD project was 

to infer the impact of the deconstruction of 

the cardiopharyngeal GRN in the evolution 

of appendicularians. Considering the 

relevance that cardiopharyngeal structures 

on the evolution of free-living or sessile 

styles, the findings of this project has 

allowed us to propose an evolutionary 

scenario (for the sake of clarity, Fig. D6 

reproduces here Fig. 8 from Chapter 2) to 

better understand the adaptive potential of 

the deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

GRN in appendicularians, paying special 

attention to infer the condition of the last 

common ancestor (LCA) of tunicates. 

The traditional view of chordate evolution 

proposed by Garstang (1928) suggested 

that the LCA of chordates had a sessile 

ascidian-like adult lifestyle and free-living 

dispersal larva, from which the fully motile 

style was later acquired during the evolution 

of cephalochordates and vertebrates by 

paedomorphosis (Garstang, 1928). The 

discovery that tunicates (a.k.a. 

urochordates) are the sister group of 

O 

Fig. D6. The deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN in the ancestor of appendicularians favored their 
transition to a free-living life style. According to the deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN, the free-
living life style of appendicularians represent a derived condition instigated by the innovation of the house, 
the loss of the siphon muscle, the development of an open-wide laminar heart, and the acquisition of an 
accelerated development. GRN, gene regulatory network; STVCs, second trunk ventral cells; SHP, second 
heart progenitors; ASMF, atrial siphon muscle field; TVCs, trunk ventral cells; LM, late multipotent; EM, early 
multipotent.  
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vertebrates, and therefore that the 

cephalochordate branching is basal within 

chordates (Bourlat et al., 2006; Delsuc et 

al., 2006), has radically changed our 

understanding of the evolution of our own 

phylum by providing a novel perspective in 

which the last common ancestor of 

chordates was a free-living organism. This 

novel view has brought renewed interest in 

appendicularians, whose complete free-

living style could parsimoniously represent 

the ancestral condition of tunicates (Berrill, 

1950; Braun et al., 2020; Swalla et al., 

2000) considering their most accepted 

position as the sister group of the remaining 

tunicates (Braun et al., 2020; Delsuc et al., 

2018; Kocot et al., 2018; Wada, 1998). 

Under the assumption that the LCA of 

tunicates was free-living, the sessility of 

ascidians should be considered a derived 

trait within tunicates that could have 

evolved with the innovation of the drastic 

metamorphosis that characterizes 

ascidians, but absent in appendicularians 

(Braun et al., 2020; Delsuc et al., 2018; 

Kocot et al., 2018). The results from this 

project, however, are in conflict with the 

assumption that the LCA of tunicates was 

free-living and provide evidence supporting 

that the LCA of tunicates had a sessile 

ascidian-like style and that the 

deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

GRN can be interpreted as an evolutionary 

adaptation that may have contributed to 

the transition from an ancestral sessile to 

the innovation of a house-based free-living 

lifestyle. Particularly, the loss of the EM and 

LM during the deconstruction of the 

cardiopharyngeal GRN can be linked to: 1) 

an adaptive acceleration of the heart 

developmental program; 2) an adaptive 

transition from a close tubular architecture 

to an open wide laminar structure; and 3) 

the loss of the atrial and longitudinal muscle 

related with water circulation in ascidians 

that are replaced by action of tail beating 

and ciliary gills in appendicularians (Fig. D6). 

ADAPTIVE ACCELERATION OF CARDIAC 
DEVELOPMENT UNDER HIGH ENERGETIC 
DEMAND OF JUVENILES 

The loss of the EM and LM modules in 

appendicularians could correlate to the 

early activation of the cardiac markers Nk4 

and Hand1/2 just after FCPs separate from 

the ATMs. In fact, the onset of Hand1/2 

could be regulated by Nk4 as it takes place 

some minutes later than Nk4. Upcoming 

functional analysis will accept or refute this 

hypothesis. The early activation of the 

cardiac kernel would have been decisive to 

make a functional heart in just 8.5 hours 

post-fertilization, which could have been 

adaptive by favoring an early distribution of 

the hemolymph in juveniles before making 

its first house and start beating actively the 

tail, which supposes a high energetic 

demand. 
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ADAPTIVE OPEN LAMINAR HEART 
FACILITATES THE CIRCULATION OF THE 
HEMOLYMPH BY TAILBEATING 

The loss of the LM module has been 

accompanied by the loss of the SHPs as 

we did not detect the SHPs marker Dach 

(Wang et al., 2019) expressed in cardiac 

precursors in O. dioica. Therefore, our 

results suggest that the cardiac cells in the 

heart of O. dioica might be homologous to 

the ascidians FHPs. The loss of the SHPs 

could be correlated to a reduction in the 

number of cells that finally comprise the 

heart, which could have favored the 

transition from a tubular to an open laminar 

shape. This open cardiac architecture 

could have been adaptive due to it would 

facilitate the circulation of the hemolymph, 

also propelled by the tail movements, to go 

through the heart. 

THE PRESERVATION OF THE TAIL 
CORRELATES TO THE LOSS OF THE SIPHON 
MUSCLES 

Besides affecting the SHPs, the loss of the 

LM module can be also correlated to the 

loss of the atrial and longitudinal siphon 

muscles present in the trunk of ascidians, 

but absent in the trunk of O. dioica, where 

the heart is the only muscle structure 

present in the trunk. As siphons are used in 

ascidians to propel the water inside the 

organism, we correlate this loss to the 

preservation of the tail in the adult phase. 

During the transition from a sessile to a 

planktonic lifestyle, the conservation of the 

tail would have been positively selected 

becoming the system to propel water 

circulation, scenario in which muscles of 

the siphons could have disappeared by 

regressive evolution. Consistent with this 

view, the absence of body-wall actins, that 

would have been present in the tunicate 

ancestor, would be related to the loss of the 

muscles of the adult sessile form. 

Importantly, the loss of siphon muscle in 

appendicularians probably might not have 

been only the consequence of regressive 

evolution upon the innovation of the house, 

but it plausibly facilitated the evolution of 

the capability of appendicularians to control 

the orchestrated movement of the cilia in 

the gills to efficiently reverse the direction of 

the water flow, inwards during feeding or 

outwards during the inflation of the house 

without the interference of graceless 

muscle contractions (Bassham et al., 2008; 

Conley et al., 2018). 

In conclusion, our results suggest an 

evolutionary scenario in which the 

deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

GRN in appendicularians could have been 

an adaptive process that facilitated the 

innovation of a free-living style from an 

ancestral ascidian-like style and makes very 

unlikely that ascidians had evolved from a 

free-living ancestor similar to 

appendicularians. This evolutionary 

scenario is consistent with the observation 

that appendicularians maintain a U-shape 

intestine typical of sessile organisms 
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(Stach, 2007; Williams, 1996), which in past 

comparative morphological studies had 

been used to classify appendicularians as 

the sister group of aplousobranchia 

ascidians, also favored by the observation 

that appendicularians and aplousobranch 

larvae share the common derived character 

of the rotation of the swimming tail through 

90 degrees to the left (Stach et al., 2008). 

Our conclusions that the LCA of tunicates 

was sessile is consistent with the 

interpretation of our findings independently 

of the phylogenetic position of 

appendicularians, either as basally 

divergent as the sister group of all other 

ascidians, or in the case that they were 

related to aplousobranch ascidians.  
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5 THE CONCEPT OF 
EVOLUTIONARY KNOCKOUT 
MODEL: THE PARADIGMATIC 
CASE OF THE LOSS OF THE 
RETINOIC ACID IN O. DIOICA 

he recent bloom of sequenced 

genomes has discovered that gene 

loss is not occasional or insignificant, but a 

process that is abundant in all life 

kingdoms. The considerable research 

interest generated by gene loss 

encouraged us to propose the novel 

concept of “evolutionary knockout” (eKO) 

model. This concept, in contrast to 

“genetically-engineered knockout” models, 

consists of species that during their 

evolution have naturally lost genes. 

Therefore, they can be investigated as 

model systems to better understand, the 

evolution of GRNs, mechanisms of embryo 

development, or any physiological 

adaptation in the absence of any given 

gene of interest. There are already 

notorious examples of projects taking 

advantages of eKO models to better 

understand, for instance, the genetic bases 

of human diseases, such as the study of 

icefish species that have lost the 

development of bones as an adaption to 

artic low temperatures as a model to better 

understand osteoporosis or the study of 

Mexican cavefish that has lost vision and 

pigmentation as a model to better 

understand human forms of blindness and 

albinism (Albertson 2008, Maher 2009). 

The great advantage of using eKO models 

rather than genetically-engineered 

knockout models is that while the latter 

normally generates large phenotypes or 

perturbs the normal development, eKO 

organisms integrate the gene loss into their 

established developmental and 

physiological systems allowing us to study 

the increasing genetic variation related to 

that phenotype. 

During my PhD, our study of gene losses 

affecting the cardiopharyngeal GRN has 

contributed to extend previous work to use 

O. dioica as an eKO (Chapter 3). With a 

small compact genome full of gene losses, 

O. dioica has become an attractive model 

to study the impact of gene losses on 

animal EvoDevo. In particular, O. dioica has 

lost all the key genes involved in the 

classical retinoic acid (RA) synthesis 

pathway, and it does not have any 

alternative pathway to synthesize this 

developmental morphogen (Cañestro et al., 

2006; Cañestro and Postlethwait, 2007; 

Martí-Solans et al., 2016). Therefore, the 

loss of RA makes O. dioica a unique case 

of an eKO model for RA signaling among 

chordates which has provided an attractive 

system to investigate the impact of gene 

loss on the evolution of the development of 

structures that require RA in other 

chordates as the development of the 

cardiopharyngeal field in appendicularians, 

deeply studied in this thesis. Moreover, 

during the course of this PhD project, we 

T 
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have taken advantage of the use of O. 

dioica eKO for RA signaling to study genetic 

responses alternative to RA pathways that 

could be affected by environmental threats 

(Chapter 4). Polyunsaturated aldehydes 

(PUAs) and oxylipins are two environmental 

xenobiotic compounds produced naturally 

by diatom-blooms, which due to climate 

change and ocean warming are becoming 

alarmingly abundant. Many studies have 

suggested that the teratogenic effects of 

these compounds shown in a wide variety 

of marine organisms could be due to 

interference with RA-synthesis since PUAs 

can compete with retinaldehyde for the 

substrate-binding site of the Aldh1a (Bchini 

et al., 2013). To test this hypothesis, we 

have taken advantage of O. dioica to check 

if those toxic compounds did indeed not 

affect O. dioica development due to its 

condition of eKO for RA, or on the contrary, 

to investigate for other alternative genetic 

pathways that could mediate the response 

to the environmental threat. O. dioica 

embryos treated with PUAs showed 

arrested phenotypes in pre-tailbud stage 

that looked like a golf ball. Moreover, those 

golf ball embryos manifested an expression 

delay of developmental genes and an 

increased expression of defensome related 

genes demonstrating that those biotoxins 

could cause dramatic developmental 

alterations independently of RA. 

Consequently, PUAs can alter other 

genetic pathways in addition to the RA 

synthesis pathway previously described. 

The work of this thesis, therefore, has 

helped to further extend the study of O. 

dioica as a successful gene loser, in 

particular, revealing this organism as a 

useful eKO model that has lost the genetic 

modules related to multipotent cellular 

states in the cardiopharyngeal GRN. Future 

functional investigations in O. dioica could 

help to identify the minimal genetic toolkit 

for the development of a heart in chordates, 

and thanks to its simplicity could also 

provide an attractive model to better 

understanding heart developmental 

aspects that are difficult to study in 

complex models, such as the differentiation 

between myocardium and pericardium, or 

to investigate the genetic bases of some 

human cardiomyopathies. 
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C O N C L U S I O N S  

 

1. The massive loss of cardiopharyngeal genes (Mesp, Ets1/2a, Gata4/5/6, Mek1/2, 

Raldh1a, Cyp26, RAR) and subfunctions (FoxF, Isl, Ebf, Mrf, Dach, FGF signaling, BMP 

signaling) reveal the evolutionary deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal gene 

regulatory network (GRN) in appendicularians. 

2. The development of the heart in appendicularians became independent of Mesp, the 

cardiopharyngeal master gene in ascidians and vertebrates. 

3. The study of the evolutionary deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN in 

appendicularians reveals the dismantling of two developmental modules related to the 

early and late multipotent cardiopharyngeal states.  

4. The dismantling of the early module, including the loss of FGF and RA signaling and the 

loss of Mesp and Ets1/2, led to the loss of the multipotential state observed in the trunk 

ventral cells (TVCs) of ascidians, implying the early activation of the cardiac kernel as 

revealed by Nk4 first, followed by Hand1/2 in the first cardiac progenitors (FCP) of 

appendicularians by the incipient- and mid-tailbud stage, respectively. 

5. The early onset of Nk4, the loss of Gata4/5/6, the loss of FoxF subfunction, and the 

lack of BMP activity in the cardiac progenitors of O. dioica indicate a change in the 

developmental mechanism to modify the final position of FCPs compared to the 

migratory behavior observed in the TVCs of ascidians. 

6. The loss of Tbx1/10 and the cardiopharyngeal subfunctions of many genes (Dach, 

Islet1, Ebf, and MyoD) reveal de dismantling of the late multipotent (LM) module which 

in ascidians is responsible for the specification of SHPs and pharyngeal muscle.  

7. ActnM1 is the only actin gene expressed in cardiac progenitors, which allows us to 

trace back cardiac development until the 64-cell stage showing the same ontogenetic 

process as in ascidians and enabling us to conclude that both hearts are homologous. 

8. The evolutionary impact of the loss of the early multipotent (EM) module led to the 

acceleration of the onset of the cardiac program. 

9. The evolutionary impact of the loss of the LM module plausibly led to the remodeling of 

the cardiac structure from tubular to laminar and to the loss of the pharyngeal muscles. 

10. The evolutionary impact of cardiopharyngeal gene losses was adaptative for the 

innovation of a free-living house-based lifestyle favoring the development of an active 

and open heart that facilitated the hemolymph circulation and favoring the loss of the 
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pharyngeal muscle that allowed the water flux reversal during feeding or the inflation of 

the house. 

11. Independently of the phylogenetic relationship of the appendicularians and the rest of 

tunicates, our results suggest that the last common ancestor of tunicates had a sessile 

ascidian-like lifestyle, being the evolutionary deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal 

GRN pivotal for the adaptation to a free-living lifestyle based on the innovation of the 

house. 

12. Our results related to the deconstruction of the cardiopharyngeal GRN and the effect 

of toxic compounds in O. dioica development have contributed to developing the eKO 

model concept with O. dioica as a paradigmatic example of the advantages of using 

species that along their evolution has suffered extensive gene losses. 
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